
 

*Individuals wishing to provide public comment are asked to sign in prior to the start of the meeting, provide 
contact information and the topic(s) to be discussed. 

AGENDA 
 

CAMPBELL COUNTY BOARD OF COMMISSIONERS 
 

DG REARDON, Chairman 
RUSTY BELL 
BOB MAUL 

DEL SHELSTAD 

COLLEEN FABER 

JUNE 16, 2020 
 

Due to the COVID-19 Pandemic crisis, there will be limited seating available in the 
Commissioners Chambers to allow for proper social distancing. Citizens are 
encouraged to submit public comment via email to boc@ccgov.net by Noon on June 
15th and view the meeting on GPA Channel 192 or through the County website at 
www.ccgov.net.    
  
09:00 MEETING CALLED TO ORDER 
 PLEDGE OF ALLEGIANCE 

CONSENT AGENDA  

A. Consent Agenda   

PUBLIC COMMENT 

B. 9:05 For the Good of the County*  

OPEN GOVERNMENT 

C. 9:15 County Information   

REGULAR BUSINESS 

D. 9:20 Funding Request, Save the 4th of July Gillette Joseph Terry 

E. 9:25 Second Amendment Sanctuary County Resolution Carol Seeger 

F. 9:30 Certificate of State Aid, 2020 Aviation Encouragement Shelly Besel 

G. 9:33 Certificate of State Aid, 2020 Marketing Shelly Besel 

H. 9:35 JAG Supplemental Funding 2018 Sheriff Matheny 

I. 9:40 Position Vacancy Justification, Detention Officer Sheriff Matheny 

J. 9:45 Position Vacancy Justification, Deputy County Attorney Kelly Wallem 

K. 9:50 Position Vacancy Justification, Custodian I Bill Beastrom 

L. 9:55 Position Vacancy Justification, Maintenance Tech Bill Beastrom 

M. 10:00 Coronavirus Emergency Supplemental Funding Program FY2020 Beth Raab 

N. 10:05 FamCare Contract, Global Vision Technologies Andreah Kramer/Phil Harvey 

O. 10:10 Contract to Provide Juvenile & Family Drug Court Services Jim Lyon 



 

*Individuals wishing to provide public comment are asked to sign in prior to the start of the meeting, provide 
contact information and the topic(s) to be discussed. 

P. 10:15 Contract to Provide Adult Treatment Court Services Chad Beeman 

BREAK 

REGULAR BUSINESS II 

Q. 10:25 Chapter 4 Rules Proposed Amendments Jed Holder 

R. 10:35  Professional Services Contract, West EcoSystems Technology Megan Nelms 

S. 10:40 Improvement Agreement & Letter of Credit, Ft. Union Industrial Park Megan 
Nelms 

T. 10:45 District Support Grant, Little Thunder I&S  Kevin King 

U. 10:50 Balboa Peaks Software Agreements Carol Seeger 

V. 10:55 Consulting Services Agreement, Waypoints Wyoming LLC Carol Seeger 

W. 11:00 Resolution for Special Prosecution Jenny Staeben 

X. 11:05 Urban Farming Lease Agreement, Westwood Property Jenny Staeben 

Y. 11:10 Board Appointments, Childrens Developmental Services Board  Carol Seeger 

Z. 11:12 Board Appointments, Corrections Board  Carol Seeger 

AA. 11:14 Board Appointment, Fire Board Carol Seeger 

BB. 11:16 Board Appointments, Parks & Recreation Board Carol Seeger 

CC. 11:18 Board Appointments, Planning Commission Carol Seeger 

DD. 11:20 Board Appointments, Public Health Board Carol Seeger 

EE. 11:22 Board Appointments, Public Land Board Carol Seeger 

FF. 11:24 Board Appointment, Public Library Board Carol Seeger 

GG. 11:26 Board Appointments, Rockpile Museum Board Carol Seeger 

HH. 11:28 Board Appointment, Senior Center Board Carol Seeger 

II. 11:30 CARES Act Funding, CSBG Beth Raab 

JJ. 11:40 Budget Amendments FY2020-21 Susan Saunders 

KK. 11:35 Adoption of Budget FY2020-21 Susan Saunders 

LL. 11:45 Budget Message FY2020-21 Carol Seeger 

BOARD OF EQUALIZATION 

MM. 12:00 Order Dismissal Appeals  Carol Seeger 

ADJOURN  



 

*Individuals wishing to provide public comment are asked to sign in prior to the start of the meeting, provide 
contact information and the topic(s) to be discussed. 

Consent Agenda 

MINUTES 
Board of Commissioners Directors Workshop, June 1, 2020  
Board of Commissioners Regular Meeting, June 2, 2020  
 

MONTHLY REPORTS 
Clerk of District Court – May 2020  
County Clerk – May 2020  
Sheriff’s Office, Detention Center – May 2020  
Treasurer’s Office – May 2020  
 

PAYROLL PAYMENTS 
May 30, 2020  
May 31, 2020  
 

CANCELLATION/REBATE OF TAXES 
#4109 – 4114 

EMERGENCY SICK LEAVE BANK REQUESTS 
Request transfer of 64 hours from ESLB to Employee #676086  
Request transfer of 60 hours from ESLB to Employee #617342  
Request transfer of 60 hours from ESLB to Employee #548551  
 

CATERING PERMITS 

LINE ITEM TRANSFERS 
Airport  
Transfer $20,000.00 from 751.6023 Fulltime-OT to 751.6022 Full-Time Regular  
Transfer $500.00 from 751.7323 Crash Fire Rescue to 751.6517.6 Crash Fire Rescue  
Transfer $742.00 from 751.6517.1 Plane, Train, Bus to 751.6517.2 General Supplies  
Transfer $1,904 from 751.6283 Meals & Lodging to 751.6748 Other Operating Supplies  
Transfer $1,000 from 751.6323 Water/Sewer Eng. to 751.6789 Fuel Farm Mn  
Transfer $500 from 751.6118 Satellite TV/Music to 751.6789 Fuel Farm Mn  
Transfer $281 from 751.6116 Garbage to 751.6789 Fuel Farm Mn  
Transfer $288 from 751.6052 Drug Testing Svc to 751.6763 Radio Equipment  
Transfer $500 from 751.6777.1 Terminal Mn to 751.6777.6 General Aviation Bldg.  
Transfer $500 from 751.6777.6 GA Bldg. Mn to 751.6777.1 Terminal Maintenance  
  
Commissioners   
Transfer $1,850.92 from 012.6023 Fulltime – OT to 012.6022 Fulltime – Regular  
Transfer $1,254.28 from 013.6517.4 Travel & Transportation to 013.6517.2 Staff 
Development  
Transfer $770.56 from 013.6517.5 Meals & Lodging to 013.6517.2 Staff Development  
Transfer $259,723.83 from 013.6140 Legal to 013.6145 Consulting   



 

*Individuals wishing to provide public comment are asked to sign in prior to the start of the meeting, provide 
contact information and the topic(s) to be discussed. 

Transfer $94.50 from 013.7539 Other Misc. to 013.7538.1 Advanced Energy Economy  
  
Emergency Management   
Transfer $300.00 from 411.6517.4 Travel & Transportation to 411.6233 Computer Main 
Contracts  
Transfer $30.89 from 411.6517.4 Travel & Transportation to 411.6734 Response/Relief 
Supplies  
  
Fleet   
Transfer $111.25 from 086.6532 Computer Supplies to 086.6531 General Supplies  
Transfer $160.00 from 086.6517.3 Conference/Seminar/Wrk to 086.6517.2 Staff 
Development  
  
Museum  
Transfer $228.08 from 721.6948 Other Insurance to 721.6531 General Supplies  
Transfer $25.65 from 721.6517.2 Staff Development to 721.6531 General Supplies   
Transfer $125.00 from 721.6517.3 Conf/Seminar/Wrk. To 721.6531 General Supplies  
Transfer $435.56 from 721.6517.5 Meals and Lodging to 721.6531 General Supplies  
Transfer $307.77 from 721.6303 Meals and Lodging to 721.6531 General Supplies   
Transfer $1,500.00 from 721.6112 Electricity to 721.6092 Advertising  
  
Parks & Recreation  
Transfer $3,500 from 7703.6024.302 Lifeguards to 7703.6024.314 Receptionists  
Transfer $3,000 from 7705.6024.302 Lifeguards & General Staff to 7705.6024.310 Facility 
Monitor  
  
Public Works  
Transfer $836 from 083.7271.16 Pool Slide Repair to 083.7271.16 Service Rec Cen 
Dehumidifiers  
Transfer $1,438 from 083.7271.16 Pool Slide Repair to 083.7271.16 Replace Water Softener  
 

OATH OF OFFICE  
Dallas Lamb – Part-Time Assistant Public Defender for Campbell County, 6th Judicial District, 
Appointment by Governor Mark Gordon 

OFFICIAL BOND AND OATH 
Troy A. Collins – Los Caballos Service & Improvement District 

HAND WARRANTS 
CCCBT $210,309.52 
 AMOUNT 
CCEHBTA  Health 579,362.99  
CCEHBTA  Dental 43,116.20  
Delta Dental Plan of Wyoming 2,123.80  
Campbell County Clerk Tax Account 20,803.06  
Campbell County Treasurer  HSA/FLX 2,437.49  
Campco Federal Credit Union 950.00  



 

*Individuals wishing to provide public comment are asked to sign in prior to the start of the meeting, provide 
contact information and the topic(s) to be discussed. 

Great West Trust Company 4,525.00  
Campbell County Clerk Tax Account 307,379.99  
Campbell County Parks & Recreation Activity Fund 31.00  
Campbell County Treasurer  HSA/FLX 42,884.59  
Campco Federal Credit Union 276.01  
Circuit Court of Campbell County 776.90  
Great West Trust Company 35,606.66  
Wyoming Child Support 1,688.38  
WAG  Division of Criminal Investigation 30.00  
First National Bank  Visa 1,500.00  
Pearson Oil Co. Inc 26,431.22  
Gillette College Foundation 2,800.00  
 
 



 

*Individuals wishing to provide public comment are asked to sign in prior to the start of the meeting, provide 
contact information and the topic(s) to be discussed. 

 
 
The following page(s) contain the backup material for Agenda Item: Consent Agenda 





































































































 

*Individuals wishing to provide public comment are asked to sign in prior to the start of the meeting, provide 
contact information and the topic(s) to be discussed. 

 
 
The following page(s) contain the backup material for Agenda Item: 9:20 Funding Request, Save the 4th of July 
Gillette 





 

*Individuals wishing to provide public comment are asked to sign in prior to the start of the meeting, provide 
contact information and the topic(s) to be discussed. 

 
 
The following page(s) contain the backup material for Agenda Item: 9:25 Second Amendment Sanctuary County 
Resolution 







 

*Individuals wishing to provide public comment are asked to sign in prior to the start of the meeting, provide 
contact information and the topic(s) to be discussed. 

 
 
The following page(s) contain the backup material for Agenda Item: 9:30 Certificate of State Aid, 2020 Aviation 
Encouragement 









 

*Individuals wishing to provide public comment are asked to sign in prior to the start of the meeting, provide 
contact information and the topic(s) to be discussed. 

 
 
The following page(s) contain the backup material for Agenda Item: 9:33 Certificate of State Aid, 2020 Marketing 









 

*Individuals wishing to provide public comment are asked to sign in prior to the start of the meeting, provide 
contact information and the topic(s) to be discussed. 

 
 
The following page(s) contain the backup material for Agenda Item: 9:35 JAG Supplemental Funding 2018 











 

*Individuals wishing to provide public comment are asked to sign in prior to the start of the meeting, provide 
contact information and the topic(s) to be discussed. 

 
 
The following page(s) contain the backup material for Agenda Item: 9:40 Position Vacancy Justification, 
Detention Officer 





 

*Individuals wishing to provide public comment are asked to sign in prior to the start of the meeting, provide 
contact information and the topic(s) to be discussed. 

 
 
The following page(s) contain the backup material for Agenda Item: 9:45 Position Vacancy Justification, Deputy 
County Attorney 





 

*Individuals wishing to provide public comment are asked to sign in prior to the start of the meeting, provide 
contact information and the topic(s) to be discussed. 

 
 
The following page(s) contain the backup material for Agenda Item: 9:50 Position Vacancy Justification, 
Custodian I 







 

*Individuals wishing to provide public comment are asked to sign in prior to the start of the meeting, provide 
contact information and the topic(s) to be discussed. 

 
 
The following page(s) contain the backup material for Agenda Item: 9:55 Position Vacancy Justification, 
Maintenance Tech 





 

*Individuals wishing to provide public comment are asked to sign in prior to the start of the meeting, provide 
contact information and the topic(s) to be discussed. 

 
 
The following page(s) contain the backup material for Agenda Item: 10:00 Coronavirus Emergency 
Supplemental Funding Program FY2020 



































































 

*Individuals wishing to provide public comment are asked to sign in prior to the start of the meeting, provide 
contact information and the topic(s) to be discussed. 

 
 
The following page(s) contain the backup material for Agenda Item: 10:05 FamCare Contract, Global Vision 
Technologies 































































 

*Individuals wishing to provide public comment are asked to sign in prior to the start of the meeting, provide 
contact information and the topic(s) to be discussed. 

 
 
The following page(s) contain the backup material for Agenda Item: 10:10 Contract to Provide Juvenile & Family 
Drug Court Services 













































































 

*Individuals wishing to provide public comment are asked to sign in prior to the start of the meeting, provide 
contact information and the topic(s) to be discussed. 

 
 
The following page(s) contain the backup material for Agenda Item: 10:15 Contract to Provide Adult Treatment 
Court Services 

















































































 

*Individuals wishing to provide public comment are asked to sign in prior to the start of the meeting, provide 
contact information and the topic(s) to be discussed. 

 
 
The following page(s) contain the backup material for Agenda Item: 10:25 Chapter 4 Rules Proposed 
Amendments 



 

Department of Public Works     Kevin C. King, P.E., Director 

500 S. Gillette Avenue, Suite 1400, Gillette, WY 82716   ●   307-685-8061   ●   Building 307-682-1970   ●   Solid Waste/Recycle 307-682-9499 

 

 

M E M O R A N D U M  

TO:  Board of Commissioners 

FROM: Jed Holder, Building Code Official 

DATE:  June 16, 2020 

SUBJECT: Amendments to Chapter 4, Rules Regulating Construction  

 
The Building Division has finalized amendments to Chapter 4. The State of Wyoming adopted 

the 2020 National Electric Code (NEC) effective January 1, 2020.  Per WY §35-9-121(ii), the 

County is required to adopt the same version by July 1, 2020. Staff is also taking this opportunity 

to make minor modifications to the text of other sections, propose easing plumbing requirements 

for mandatory drinking fountains, and take over authority from the Wyoming Department of 

Environmental Quality (DEQ) to include permitting for commercial small wastewater systems. 

The last update to Chapter 4 occurred in 2018.  

 

A summary of the proposed amendments: 

 

• Update the NEC from the 2017 model code edition to the 2020 edition. 

• Amend and clarify language to the International Building Code ‘Roof Snow Load’ 

requirements. This does not change any requirements, it simply makes the language more 

concise, easier to read, and eliminates an error found in the original text.  

• Clarify Section 12(A)(11)(a) so that the wording is clear that this section for septic 

systems applies only to un-zoned properties. This does not change the intent or the 

administration of this section.  

• Add commercial small wastewater systems to the County’s permitting authority, 

eliminating the need for constituents to apply to the DEQ. This will streamline and 

simplify processes for local developers.  

• Amend the International Plumbing Code to ease requirements of when drinking fountains 

are mandatory for certain establishments.  

 

A 45-day public comment period and a public hearing are required prior to adoption of the 

amended rules. Copies of the rule amendments are available from the Public Works office in the 

Courthouse, and online on the County website.  

 

Staff recommends the Board put the proposed amendments to Chapter 4 out for 45-day public 

comment and set a public hearing date for August 4, 2020. 

 

 



 

 

500 South Gillette Avenue 
Suite 1500 
Gillette, Wyoming 82716 
(307) 682-1970 
(307) 687-6468 Fax 

Department of Public Works 

 

 

 

 NOTICE OF INTENT TO AMEND 

 CHAPTER 4, CAMPBELL COUNTY RULES REGULATING CONSTRUCTION 
 

 PLEASE TAKE NOTICE that the Board of Campbell County Commissioners hereby gives notice of its 

intent to adopt amendments to the Chapter 4, Campbell County Rules Regulating Construction in accordance with 

W.S.S. 18-5-201. 

 

 A copy of the proposed amendments to the referenced regulations are available at the Department of Public 

Works, Campbell County Courthouse, 500 S. Gillette Ave., Ste. 1500, Gillette, Wyoming 82716 or may be viewed 

on the county website at www.ccgov.net/publicworks.  Any interested person may present their views regarding this 

intended action by submitting written comments to the Board no later than 5 p.m. on the 24th day of July 2020 by 

delivering your comments to the address listed above via United States mail or by hand delivery. 

 

 The proposed amendments to Chapter 4 include: repealing the 2017 National Electric Code (NEC) and 

replacing with the 2020 NEC as required by the State of Wyoming, easing regulations in the plumbing code; 

rewording current language to roof snow load requirements to make that section easier to understand, add clarifying 

language to the small wastewater systems standards to eliminate ambiguity and making it easier to understand and 

adding commercial small wastewater systems to the County’s permitting authority, eliminating the need for 

constituents to apply to the State Department of Environmental Quality for most commercial systems.  

 

 Any person wishing to present their views orally may attend a public hearing scheduled for August 4th, 2020 

at 10:30 a.m. in the Campbell County Courthouse, Commissioner’s Chambers, 500 S. Gillette Ave., Gillette, 

Wyoming. 

 

 Following the time allotted for public comment and the public hearing, the Board intends to take official 

action regarding the adoption of the proposed amendment at their regularly scheduled meeting on August 4th, 2020.  

              

 Dated this ________ day of June 2020. 

 

       SUSAN SAUNDERS 

       CAMPBELL COUNTY CLERK 

 

       By:________________________________________ 

 

Publish: June 27, July 18 



 

 
To view the full regulations with proposed amendments or to learn more, visit our website! 

 

 

SUMMARY OF PROPOSED AMENDMENTS TO CAMPBELL COUNTY RULES REGULATING CONSTRUCTION 

 SUBJECT PROPOSED AMENDMENTS REASON FOR CHANGES 

 
 

1. 

 
 

2018 International Building Code 
(IBC) 

 

• Amend IBC Section 1608.2. ‘Ground Snow Load’. This proposed 
amendment simplifies previous language making the section 
easier to understand. (See Ch. 4 pages 4-12 through 4-15) 

 

• The previous amendment addressed the need for stronger roof systems to 
accommodate for snow and ice accumulation here in Campbell County; 
however, the text contained a mistake and was confusing. The proposed 
changes simply clarify the language making it easier to understand for both 
design professionals and staff. 

 
 
 

2. 

 
 
 

NEC Code Update 

 
 

• Adopt the 2020 edition of NFPA 70, The National Electric Code 
(NEC) (See Ch. 4 pages 4-18, 4-21) 

 

• The State of Wyoming adopted the 2020 edition of the NEC effective 
January 1, 2020.  

• Per WY Statute 35-9-121(ii), the County is obligated to adopt the 2020 
edition no later than July 1, 2020. The most significant impact appears to be 
an expanded section on the requirements for Ground Fault Circuit 
Interrupters. The result is more locations in homes will now require 
receptacles to have GFCI protection where water might be encountered. 

 

 
 
 

3. 

 
 
 

2018 International Plumbing Code 
(IPC) 

 

• Amend IPC Section 410.2.  This Section requires drinking 
fountains for buildings that have a design occupant load of over 
15 persons. Staff proposes amending that requirement to a 
design occupant load over 30. (See Ch. 4 page 4-21) 

 

• Based on feedback from constituents, requiring drinking fountains for small 
occupancies seems to be too restrictive for rural Campbell County.  A more 
reasonable threshold seems to be an occupant load of greater than 30. This 
would allow most repair shops, warehouses, and small office spaces to omit 
this requirement, while still addressing larger occupancies like stores or 
similar where providing drinking fountains for customers and a greater 
number of employees is more appropriate.  
 



 

 
To view the full regulations with proposed amendments or to learn more, visit our website! 

 

 

SUMMARY OF PROPOSED AMENDMENTS TO CAMPBELL COUNTY RULES REGULATING CONSTRUCTION 

 

 
 
 
 
4. 

 
 
 
 
 

Small Wastewater Systems 

 

• Amend language in affected Chapter 4 Sections to include 
permitting authority for commercial small wastewater 
systems. Previously, the County only permitted residential 
systems. 
 

• Two appendices to Chapter 4 were created for the purpose 
of codifying and simplifying permit process and procedures. 
(See Ch. 4 pages 4-2, 4-8, 4-23, and 4-28 for specific 
sections) 

 

• Per the County’s previous Delegation Agreement with the WY Department 
of Environmental Quality (DEQ), the County only regulated Small 
Wastewater Systems (SWWS) for residential homes. Per DEQ standards, 
any system servicing 2000 gallons or less of domestic sewage per day is 
considered a SWWS, regardless if it is generated by a residence or business 
such as an office space or similar.  

• Because there are no differences in the design or installation, it follows that 
Campbell County should be able to administrate the installation of all 
SWWS’s. 

• The proposed changes to Chapter 4 reflect that expanded authority. The 
benefits to County constituents are many. Among them include faster 
permitting processes for developers, working face to face with local 
authorities, and making most building projects a ‘one-stop’ shop for 
permitting.   

 
 
 
 
 

5. 

 
 
 

Section 12-11(a): Wyoming DEQ, 
Water Quality Rules and 
Regulations, Chapter 25, 

supplements 

 
 

• Amend Chapter 4, Section 12(A)(11)(a) to include the word ‘un-
zoned’ for clarity. (See Ch. 4 page 4-23) 

 

 
 

• This section of Chapter 4 governs how many septic systems can be placed 
on a given section of land and minimum distance between multiple 
systems.         

• This has always been administered as it applies to un-zoned properties.      
Chapter 7 - Zoning Regulations already defines minimum development 
standards for zoned properties. The intent of adding the word ‘un-zoned’ is 
to remove any ambiguity and make this section easier to read for staff and 
the public. 



 

4-1 

 

CHAPTER 4 

RULES REGULATING CONSTRUCTION 

Amended December, 2018 

 

 

Section 1. Authority. 

 

This Chapter is adopted pursuant to the authority granted by W.S. 18-5-105, W.S. 35-9-121 and 

W.S. 35-11-304 and supersedes all previous Rules Regulating Construction. 

 

Section 2. Definitions. 

 

As used in this Chapter, the following definitions apply: 

 

A. “Applicant” means the owner or authorized agent making application for a permit. 

 

B. “Automatic Sprinkler System” is an integrated system of a water source, piping, and heat 

activated fire suppression devices designed in accordance with fire protection engineering 

standards as fully defined in 2015 IFC Chapter 2. 

 

C. “Average Daily Demand” means the total annual water use divided by the number of days 

the system was in operation.  A minimum average daily demand of four hundred (400) 

gallons per day per Water Service Connection shall be used, unless the annual water use is 

available.  Comparable records may be used if approved by the Building Code Official.  

 

D. “Building Division” means the division of the Campbell County Department of Public Works 

responsible for issuing Building, Electrical, Mechanical and Plumbing Permits and 

performing inspections on that work.  

 

E. “Building Code Appeals Board” means a Board created by the Campbell County 

Commissioners (Resolution 1449) to hear and decide appeals of orders, decisions or 

determinations made by the Building Code Official or Fire Code Official relative to the 

application and interpretation of this code.  

 

F. “Building Code Official” means the officer or other designated authority or a duly authorized 

representative charged with the administration and enforcement of this code.  The position of 

Building Code Official is also referred to as the “Administrative Authority”, “Authority 

Having Jurisdiction”, “Code Official”, and “Fire Code Official” as those titles are used to 

refer to the individual responsible for administration and enforcement of the codes adopted in 

this Chapter. 

 

G. “Building Permit” means an official certificate of authorization by the Building Division for 

construction, enlargement or alteration of a building in accordance with Section 6. 

 



 

4-2 

 

H. “Central Stations” means a system or a group of systems in which the operations of circuits 

and devices are transmitted automatically to, recorded in, maintained by, and supervised 

from a listed central station that has competent and experienced servers and operators who, 

upon receipt of a signal, take such action as calling the local dispatch (fire or law 

enforcement).   

 

I. “Commercial Building” means all buildings not included in the definition of Residential 

buildings.  

 

J. “Community Water System” means a water supply system that has no more than nine (9) 

Water Service Connections and serves fewer than twenty-five (25) individuals with water for 

human consumption, which is permitted through the Campbell County Public Works 

Department and Chapter 4, Rules Regulation Construction.  

 

K. “Cross Connection” means any actual or potential connection between a potable water supply 

and any other source or system through which it is possible to introduce contamination into 

the system.  

 

L. “Delegation Agreement” means the current agreement between the Wyoming Department of 

Environmental Quality and Campbell County in accordance with W.S. 35-11-304 by which 

Campbell County has assumed authority for the enforcement and administration of the 

permitting of Residential Small Wastewater Systems, publicly owned and controlled sewage 

collection facilities, and publicly owned and controlled water distribution facilities. 

 

M. “Electrical Wiring Permit” means an official certificate of authorization issued by the 

Building Division in accordance with W.S. 35-9-120(e) and 35-9-121 and Section 7.  

 

N. “Engineer” means a professional engineer licensed with the State of Wyoming Board of 

Professional Engineers and Professional Land Surveyors.  In Section 13, any item required to 

be completed by an Engineer may also be completed by a professional geologist licensed 

with the Wyoming State Board of Professional Geologists.  

 

O. “Farm or Ranch Operation” means that the primary use of the property where the structures 

are located, along with any leased or owned property adjacent to or in close proximity to the 

subject parcel, is to produce agricultural products or to graze livestock for monetary profit as 

a primary source of income.  

 

P. “Flood Damage Prevention Resolution” is a resolution adopted by the Campbell County 

Commissioners on January 2, 2008 for the purpose of minimizing losses due to flooding in 

specific areas of the county.  

 

Q. “Looped Water System” means a water distribution system whereby any Water Service 

Connection can receive water from two (2) directions.  

Commented [SGP1]: We are proposing to strike the word 

‘residential’, just leaving the term ‘small wastewater 

systems’. Small Wastewater Systems as defined by DEQ 

already encompasses residential. By striking the word 

‘residential’ here, it removes that limitation and leaves the 

scoping authority to the delegation agreement that is in effect 

at the time.   



 

4-3 

 

 

R. “Mechanical Permit” means an official certificate of authorization by the Building Division 

for heating, ventilation, air conditioning and gas line work in accordance with Section 8.  

 

S. “Meter Pits” must be Mueller single or double meter pits or an approved equal and shall 

contain backflow prevention and shut-off valves.  Approval shall be made by the Building 

Code Official.  

 

T. “Owner” means the person holding title to real property.  

 

U. “Platted Subdivision” means any parcel or lot created through the subdivision plat process 

and where a map, drawn to scale by a licensed surveyor, showing how a portion of land is 

divided into blocks and lots, and showing streets, alleys and easements, common areas, 

dedications and other attributes, pursuant to the requirements of Campbell County Chapter 6, 

Subdivision Regulations and W.S. 18-5-306, is recorded in the land vault of the County 

Clerk’s Office.  Parcels created through a Record of Survey or subdivision exemption 

process shall not be considered part of a platted subdivision.  

 

V. “Plumbing Permit” means an official certificate of authorization issued by the Building 

Division in accordance with Sections 9 and 10 for domestic or commercial water supplies, 

sewage disposal, and all piping and materials necessary to complete these activities.  

 

W. “Potable Water” means water meeting EPA Primary Drinking Water Standards.  

 

X. “Remodeling” includes repairing, altering, or expanding a building or its plumbing, 

mechanical or electrical systems.  

 

Y. “Residential” means a building where more than half of the floor area is used for dwelling 

purposes.  

 

Z. “Rules Regulating Construction” means this document as adopted by the Board of 

Commissioners.  

 

AA. “Small Wastewater System” means any sewage system, disposal system, or treatment       

works having simple hydrologic and engineering needs which is intended for wastes 

originating from a single Residential unit serving no more than four (4) families or which 

distributes two thousand (2,000) gallons or less of domestic sewage per day.  

 

BB. “Water Service Connection” means any water line or pipe connected to a distribution 

supply main or pipe for the purpose of conveying water to a water user’s system.  

 

 



 

4-4 

 

Section 3. Applicability of Rules Regulating Construction.  

 

A. The provisions of this Chapter shall apply to any construction or installation for which an 

application for a Building Permit, Electrical Wiring Permit, Mechanical Permit or Plumbing 

Permit is required by the Building Division.  

 

B. The provisions of this Chapter shall not apply to any construction or installation that 

Campbell County is preempted by state or federal law from regulating or permitting. 

 

C. This Chapter shall supersede all previous rules and regulations, resolution, or building codes 

adopted by Campbell County.   

 

Section 4. Enforcement of Rules Regulating Construction.  

 

A. The Building Division shall enforce the Rules Regulating Construction prescribed in Chapter 

4 for that portion of Campbell County lying outside of the corporate limits of the City of 

Gillette and the Town of Wright.  

 

B. The Building Code Official shall have the authority to render interpretations and enforce the 

Rules Regulating Construction.  

 

C. Violation penalties, re-inspection fees, and appeals.  

 

1. Persons who violate a provision of any of the Rules Regulating Construction or fail to 

comply with any of the requirements thereof or who shall erect, install, alter, repair or do 

work in violation of the approved construction documents or directive of the Building 

Code Official, or of a permit or certificate issued under provisions of any of the Rules 

Regulating Construction, shall be subject to a fine of $250 per day.  Each day that a 

violation continues after due notice has been served shall be deemed a separate offense.   

 

2. Upon issuance of a stop work notice from the Building Code Official, work that is being 

done contrary to the provisions of any of the Rules Regulating Construction or in a 

dangerous or unsafe manner shall immediately cease.  Such notice shall be in writing and 

shall be given to the owner of the property, or to the owner’s agent, or to the person 

performing the work.  The notice shall state the condition under which work is authorized 

to resume.  Where an emergency exists, the Building Code Official shall not be required 

to give a written notice prior to stopping the work.  Any person who shall continue any 

work in or about the structure after having been served with a stop work order, except 

such work as the person is directed to perform to remove a violation or unsafe condition, 

shall be subject to the penalties set forth in Section 4.C.1. 

 

3. The first two (2) inspections for each portion of construction or type of work are 

performed free of charge.  Each additional re-inspection that is needed due to incorrect 

work will be assessed a fee of $60.  The fee must be paid in person at the Building 

Division office prior to scheduling the reinspection.   

 



 

4-5 

 

4. The first two (2) commercial plan reviews will be completed free of charge.  A $250 fee 

will be assessed and added to the cost of the Building Permit for each subsequent review 

which is needed due to incorrect material.   

 

5. A $60 fee will be assessed when any work commences prior to obtaining a required 

permit. 

 

6. Appeals from the decision or actions of the Building Code Official shall be to the 

Building Code Appeals Board in accordance with its established rules and procedures. 

 

7. The Building Code Official reserves all other rights and remedies available under the law 

to enforce the Rules Regulating Construction.  

 

Section 5. General Permit Requirements. 

 

A. All applications for permits under this Chapter require the following:  

 

1. Zoning Certificate.  For zoned parcels, an approved Zoning Certificate from the Planning 

and Zoning Division shall be required prior to issuance of any permit.  Refer to Chapter 

7, Zoning Regulations for requirements. 

 

2. An approved site plan.  The site plan shall be a drawing, to scale or clearly dimensioned, 

showing the uses and structures (existing or proposed) for a parcel of land.  The plan 

shall include a north arrow, property lines, streets, location of all buildings, wells (water 

and methane), septic tank and leach field, as well as the location for a future replacement 

leach field, easements/rights-of-way, and the location of utilities including electrical 

service lines, water lines, sewer/septic lines, natural gas and propane & LPG lines, etc. 

(existing and proposed).  The Building Code Official, per IBC 107.2.5, may also require 

a grading plan and/or spot elevation to address topographical and drainage issues on a site 

by site basis.  

 

a) Culverts are required for new driveway approaches that cross drainage ditches.  

Culvert installation shall be as specified in the subdivision disclosure statement, or as 

approved by the Building Code Official.  Minimum size is twelve (12) inches in 

diameter.  Driveway and culvert installation may be subject to approval by the 

subdivision Improvement and Service District or Homeowners Association. 

 

3. Plans to verify compliance with the Rules Regulating Construction.  Plans shall be 

drawings that show the shape, size, and location of important details relating to the 

construction of all buildings.  The plans shall clearly indicate the nature and extent of the 

work proposed and show, by details or other means, that the work will conform to the 

Rules Regulating Construction.   

 

B. The Building Code Official shall issue permits under this Chapter after determining that the 

proposed project will comply with the Rules Regulating Construction.  

 



 

4-6 

 

C. The applicant shall maintain a copy of all permits, approved plans, job sign off sheet, and 

plan review documents available on the job site.  

 

D. Per the current Campbell County Chapter 8, Addressing Standards, all properties must 

display the assigned address with address numbers which are clearly visible from the 

roadway.  Inspection by the Building Division will not be performed upon the property until 

those assigned address numbers are posted.  

 

1. Campbell County Public Works shall issue a new address for all properties not currently 

assigned a valid address, and shall re-assign property addresses as applicable, upon 

review.  No properties shall obtain a building permit without a valid County issued 

address. 

 

Section 6. Building Permits.  

 

A. Except as provided in subsection C of this section, before performing any work, any person 

constructing or remodeling a residential dwelling, public, commercial, or industrial building 

shall apply to the Building Division to obtain a Building Permit.  

 

B. For all public, commercial or industrial buildings, a Commercial Site Plan Review 

application and meeting shall be required prior to applying for a Building Permit.  The 

application and submittal schedule for Commercial Site Plan Review meetings can be found 

in the Public Works Office or on the county website.  

 

C. A Building Permit shall not be required for:  

 

1. A public, commercial, or industrial building associated with the extraction of oil, gas, 

coal or other minerals. 

 

2. Structures located o parcels used exclusively for Farm and Ranch Operations as defined 

within Section 2. Definitions of this document.   

 

3. One- and two-family residential dwelling located outside a Platted Subdivision. 

 

4. Any Manufactured home designed and constructed per HUD Standards. 

 

D. A $250 fee will be charged for all new Commercial Building Permits.  Reinspection fees may 

apply per Section 4(C)(3).   

 

E. For homes built off site to IRC standards, onsite inspections are required per Section 11.  In 

addition, a third-party inspection report is required from the manufacturer.  

 

 

 



 

4-7 

 

Section 7. Electrical Wiring Permits.  

 

A. Except as provided in subsection B. of this section, before performing any work, any person 

installing electrical equipment in new construction or remodeling of a building, mobile home, 

or premises shall apply to the Building Division to obtain an Electrical Wiring Permit.  

 

B. An Electrical Wiring Permit shall not be required for:  

 

1. Structures located on parcels used exclusively for Farm and Ranch Operations as defined 

within Section 2, Definitions of this document.  Electrical contractors performing work 

on parcels of deeded land forty (40) acres or greater shall comply with W.S. 35-9-123(b). 

 

2. Any installation associated with the extraction of oil, gas, coal or other minerals.   

 

Section 8. Mechanical Permits. 

 

A. Except as provided in subsection B. of this section, before performing any work, any person 

installing a heating or air conditioning system or gas lines in a building or structure shall 

apply to the Building Division to obtain a Mechanical Permit.  

 

B. A Mechanical Permit shall not be required for:  

 

1. Structures located on parcels used exclusively for Farm and Ranch Operations as defined 

within Section 2. Definitions of this document.  

 

2. Buildings and structures associated with the extraction of oil, gas, coal, or other minerals. 

 

Section 9. Plumbing Permits. 

 

A. Except as provided in subsection B. of this section, before performing any work, any person 

installing plumbing in a building or structure, or modifying or installing a Community Water 

System, or Small Wastewater System, shall apply to the Building Division to obtain a 

Plumbing Permit.  

 

B. A Plumbing Permit shall not be required for: 

 

1. Structures located on parcels used exclusively for Farm and Ranch Operations as defined 

within Section 2, Definitions of this document. 

 

2. Buildings or structures associated with the extraction of oil, gas, coal, or other minerals. 

 

C. No Plumbing Permits for new Residential or any Commercial construction will be issued 

until the applicant provides proper verification that a potable water source will be provided to 

the project.   

 



 

4-8 

 

1. For on-lot wells a copy of the valid State Engineer’s Office well permit for the proposed 

use shall be required.  

 

2. For shared wells, a valid Shared Well Agreement shall be submitted along with a copy of 

the State Engineer’s Office well permit for the proposed use.  

 

3. For connections to Community or Public Water Systems, written verification shall be 

submitted from the owner of the system indicating the system has adequate capacity and 

that permission is granted to make the connection.  

 

Section 10. Plumbing Permit for Residential Small Wastewater Systems.  

 

A. Before permitting any work, aAny person installing a Residential Small Wastewater System 

shall apply to the Building Division to obtain a Plumbing Permit prior to starting work.  All 

wastewater systems shall comply with Appendix 2 to Chapter 4 Regulations. the Delegation 

Agreement.  

 

1. All Small Wastewater Systems for residential dwellings shall be permitted, inspected, 

and approved through the Building Division.  If the percolation rate is less than one 

minute per inch, or more than 60 minutes per inch, the Small Wastewater System must be 

designed and sealed by an Engineer. 

 

2. A complete application is required prior to inspection in the field.  The application shall 

clearly identify the location and results of the percolation tests, the location and materials 

for the proposed leach field, the length of the individual legs, depth to the base of the 

infiltrator or the leach field and the location of a replacement field.  

 

 

1. Any system that is not a Small Wastewater System for a Residential dwelling shall be 

permitted through the Wyoming Department of Environmental Quality Any system 

for which Campbell County does not have current delegated authority from DEQ to 

permit shall be permitted through DEQ. 

 

2.  Prior to re-energizing any home or business on a parcel where no information on the 

Small Wastewater System is on file, the septic tank shall be pumped to verify a 1000 

gallon minimum capacity as required by Appendix 2 to Chapter 4 Regulations. Wyoming 

DEQ for single family dwellings with 4 bedrooms or less. 

 

Section 11. Inspections. 

 

A. The Building Division shall perform required inspections during the normal course of 

construction and notify the Owner and builder of any violations found during any inspection. 

 

B. If an inspection reveals that a life-threatening code violation exists, or that a project has 

commenced before the required permits have been obtained, the Building Division or 

Building Code Official shall issue a violation notice and a stop work order to the Owner.  

 

Commented [SGP2]: The wording in this section is 

modified to include any Small Wastewater System for 

domestic sewage, whether from a home or a business as 

found in the definition for Small Wastewater Systems on 

page 4-3. The word ‘residential’ is struck throughout here in 

Section 10 where it might conflict with our delegated 

authority agreement with DEQ. 

 

 

Commented [SGP3]: Appendix 2 is a new document 

created for the purposes of permitting and design of Small 

Wastewater Systems. The intent is to provide all information 

in one easy to understand document. 

Commented [SGP4]: Items 1 and 2 here are struck 

because they are addressed in Appendix 2 to Chapter 4, 

thereby reducing redundancy and confusion. 

Commented [SGP5]: This section is struck in its’ entirety 

and reworded. 

 

Our delegated authority as agreed upon between Campbell 

County and the DEQ defines what we can and cannot permit. 

The proposed change here is intended to simplify the text 

and point the user to our delegated authority agreement for 

guidance on scope of authority.  

Commented [SGP6]: We have added the word ‘business’ 

to reflect that small wastewater systems are not limited to 

only residential homes. We propose to strike certain words 

here that are already addressed in Appendix 2 to Chapter 4 to 

eliminate redundancy and avoid confusion. 



 

4-9 

 

C. Upon completion of a project requiring a permit under this Chapter, and prior to occupancy, 

the Building Division shall perform a final inspection to determine conformance with the 

approved plans and codes.  When there are no violations, a certificate of occupancy shall be 

issued.   

 

Section 12. Adoption of Rules Regulating Construction. 

 

A. The following documents are adopted by reference into Chapter 4, Rules Regulating 

Construction for Campbell County, Wyoming: 

 

1. International Fire Code, 2018 Edition, including Appendices A, D, E, F, G and B (B only 

applies in certain circumstances as outlined below). 

 

Appendix B only applies in areas with access to a water supply capable of supplying the 

required fire flows. 

 

a) The following amendments to the International Fire Code, as adopted by Section 

12(A)(1) above, are hereby made a part of this rule. 

 

(1) Section 101.1 of the International Fire Code is amended to read as follows: 

 

101.1 Title.  These regulations shall be known as the Fire Code of Campbell 

County hereinafter referred to as “this code”.   

 

(2) Section 108, Board of Appeals, is repealed in its entirety. 

 

(3) Section 401.3.2 Alarm Activations, the following is added: 

 

401.3.2.1 Central Stations.  Central stations shall immediately notify the 

Campbell County Sheriff’s Office Dispatch for dispatch of the fire department of 

alarm signals initiated by any fire alarm, fire extinguishing system or equipment.  

Supervisory signals shall be relayed to the Campbell County Sheriff’s Office 

Dispatch for dispatch of the fire department.  The fire department must be notified 

by faxed or electronic report of all trouble signals which exist for greater than a 

single 6-hour time period.  Campbell County Sheriff’s Office Dispatch, for the 

fire department, shall be contacted prior to notification of the subscriber.  

 

(4) Section 505.1, Address Numbers, amended to read as follows: 

 

505.1 New and existing building shall have approved address numbers, building 

numbers or approved building identification placed in a position that is plainly 

legible and visible from the street or road fronting the property.  If the structure is 

not visible from the roadway because of terrain, trees or other obstruction, the 

address numbers shall be posted on both sides of a post which shall be a minimum 

of four (4’) feet and maximum of seven (7’) feet in height above the ground in a 

visible location within twenty (20’) feet of a public road at the Access Drive to 

the structure.  These numbers shall contrast with their background.  Address 



 

4-10 

 

numbers shall be Arabic numerals or alphabet letters.  Numbers shall be a 

minimum of 4 inches high with a minimum stroke width of 0.5 inch. 

 

Exceptions:  Structures within twenty-five (25’) feet of a public road may place 

the addresses on the structure.   

 

(5) Section 506.1, Where Required.  Delete the first sentence and amend the section 

as follows: 

 

Key boxes (Knox Box) shall be provided for Fire Department entry for all 

Commercial occupancies.  The key boxes shall be installed on all new businesses 

before occupancy is granted.  Any existing business that obtains a permit to do 

any work or change of use or occupancy shall be required to install a key box 

before the work can be completed and approved and occupancy resumed.  The 

key box shall be located within 10 feet of the front doors, a minimum of 6 feet 

above the ground level and not to exceed 7 feet in height unless approved in 

writing by the Building Code Official.  The Building Division has the ordering 

forms for key boxes.  The key box shall be of an approved type and shall contain 

items necessary to gain access as required by the Fire Department.   

 

(6) Section 507.1, Required water supply.  Amended to read as follows: 

 

For areas with access to a water supply capable of supplying the required fire 

flows, fire protection shall be provided.  For areas that do not have a water supply 

capable of providing fire flows, the Campbell County Fire Department tanker-

shuttle system will be utilized as the fire protection method.   

 

(7) Section 507.1.1, Building, or portions of buildings which are hereafter constructed 

or moved into the jurisdiction which are required to be equipped with an 

Automatic Sprinkler System shall have access to an approved water system 

capable of providing the required Automatic Sprinkler System fire flows or shall 

provide an approved on-site water storage and delivery system capable of 

providing such flows. 

 

(8) Section 507.5.1, Where Required.  Amended to read as follows: 

 

For areas with access to a water supply system capable of supplying required fire 

flows, fire hydrants providing the required fire flows shall be located within 500 

feet of the building as measured by an approved route around the exterior of the 

facility or building.  

 

(9) Section 901.4.6.1, Clearances of the International Fire Code, a new section is 

added to read as follows: 

 

901.4.6.1  Clearances.  Fire Protection Equipment shall not be obstructed or 

concealed.  Fire Protection Equipment includes, but is not limited to, the 

following:  fire sprinkler control valves, risers, hose stations, standpipes, and fire 

alarm panels.  A minimum of eight (8”) inches on each side and a clear access 



 

4-11 

 

width of three (3’) feet shall be maintained in front of the fire protection 

equipment. 

 

(10) Section 903.2.8 is amended to include an exception to read as follows:  Group 

R-3 (one- and two-family dwellings) shall not be required to install an automatic 

sprinkler system.   

 

2. International Building Code; 2018 Edition, including Appendixes C and J; 

 

a) The following amendments to the International Building Code, as adopted by Section 

12(A)(2) above, are hereby made a part of this rule:  

 

(1) Section 101.4.1 Gas.  The provisions of the International Fuel Gas Code shall 

apply to gas piping systems extending from the point of delivery to the inlet 

connections of appliance and installation and operation of residential and 

commercial gas appliances and related accessories.  

 

(2) Section 101.42 Mechanical.  The provisions of the International Mechanical Code 

shall apply to the installation, alterations, repair and replacement of mechanical 

systems including equipment, appliances, fixtures, fittings and/or appurtenances, 

ventilation, heating, cooling, air-conditioning and refrigeration systems, 

incinerators and other energy-related systems.   

 

(3) Section 101.4.3 Plumbing.  Amended to read as follows:   

 

The provisions of the International Plumbing Code shall apply to the installation, 

alteration, repair and replacement of plumbing systems including equipment, 

appliances, fixtures, fittings and appurtenances where connected to a water or 

sewage system, and all aspects of a medical gas system.  The provisions of the 

Delegation Agreement shall apply to private sewage disposal systems.   

 

(4) Section 101.4.4 Property Maintenance.  Amended to read as follows:  

 

The provisions of the International Property Code are adopted; only to the extent 

as it applies to fire and life-safety issues for Commercial and Residential 

Structures. 

 

(5) Section 101.4.5 Fire Protection.  The provisions of the International Fire Code 

shall apply to matters affecting or relating to structures, processes and premises 

from the hazard of fire and explosions arising from storage, handling or use of 

structures, materials or devices; from conditions hazardous to life, property or 

public welfare in the occupancy of structures or premises; and from the 

construction, extension, repair, alteration or removal of fire suppression, 

automatic sprinkler systems and alarm systems or fire hazards in the structure or 

on the premises from occupancy or operation. 

 

(6) Section 101.4.6 of the International Building Code is repealed.   



 

4-12 

 

 

(7) Section 102.6 Existing Structures.  Amended to read as follows:   

 

The legal occupancy of any structure existing on the date of adoption of this code 

shall be permitted to continue without change, except as is specifically covered in 

this code, the International Fire Code, or as is deemed necessary by the Building 

Code Official for the general safety and welfare of the occupants and the public. 

 

(8) Section 103.3 Deputies.  Amended to read as follows:   

 

In accordance with the prescribed procedures of this jurisdiction and with the 

concurrence of the appointing authority, the Building Code Official shall have the 

authority to appoint a deputy-building official, related technical officers, 

inspectors, plan examiners, and other employees.  Such employees shall have 

powers as delegated by the Building Code Official.   

 

(9) Section 109 Fees is repealed. 

 

(10) Section 113 Board of Appeals is repealed in its entirety.   

 

(11) Section 114.3 Prosecution of Violation is repealed in its entirety. 

 

(12) Chapter 13 Energy Efficiency is repealed in its entirety. 

 

(13) Section 1608.2 Ground Snow Load.  Repeal in its 

entirety and replace with: 

 

Minimum roof snow loads:  1:12 pitch 

and flatter roofs (4.76 degrees) shall be designed for a minimum balanced roof 

snow load of 35 pounds per square foot with no reductions.  

The effects of unbalanced snow, drifting, sliding snow, and ponding shall be 

The effects of unbalanced snow, drifting, sliding snow, and ponding shall be 

The effects of unbalanced snow, drifting, sliding snow, and ponding 

shall be considered in addition to the balanced snow load 

where applicable.   

 

Greater than 1:12 pitch roofs (4.76 degrees) shall be designed for a minimum 

balanced roof snow load of 30 pounds per square foot with no reductions.  

The effects of unbalanced snow, drifting, sliding snow, and ponding shall be 

The 

effects of unbalanced snow, drifting, sliding snow, and ponding shall be 

considered in addition to the balanced snow load where applicable.   

 

(14) Section 1609.3 Basic Design Wind Speed.  Amended to read as follows: 

 

Basic Design Wind Speed 115, Nominal Wind Speed 90 Exposure C 

Commented [SGP7]: The changes to this section do not 

change the requirements or intent of the previous version. 

The previous language was confusing. The new language 

was developed with the aid of  both private local and county 

staff structural engineers who helped make the language 

more precise and clear utilizing terminology common to 

design professionals.  



 

4-13 

 

 

 

               Climatic and Geographical Design Criteria 
Minimum 

Roof Live 

Snow 

Load (psf) 

Basic 

Design 

Wind 

Speed 

Per IBC 

1609.3 

Wind 

Speed 

115 

Nom. 

90 mph 

Seismic 

Design 

Category 

Subject to Damage From Winter 

Design 

Temp 

(°f) 

Ice Barrier 

Underlayment 

Requirements 

Flood 

Hazards 

Air 

Freezing 

Index 

Mean 

Annual 

Temp 

(°f) 

Weathering Frost 

Line 

Depth 

(in.) 

Termite 

30-35* Exp.C B Severe 42 Slight / 

moderate 
-5 Yes Jan. 02 

2008 

2000 45 

*See Section 12.A.2.a.(12)1:12 pitch and flatter, 35 psf. 1:12 pitch and greater, 30 

psf.  

 

 

(15) Section 1612 Flood Loads is repealed in its entirety and replaced with the 

 following: 

 

The Flood Damage Prevention Resolution.  All new construction of buildings, 

structures, and portions of buildings and structures, including substantial 

improvements and restoration of substantial damage to buildings and 

structures shall comply with the above document.   

 

(16) 1803.5.3 Expansive Soils. 

 

The Building Code Official shall require soil tests to be performed for all 

commercial and industrial buildings.   

 

(17) Section 1809.4 Depth of Footings.  Amended to read as follows:  

 

The minimum depth of footings below the undisturbed ground surface shall be 

42” inches; or protected from frost with an approved method.   

 

(18) 1904.3 Sulfate exposures is added and reads as follows: 

 

Concrete that will be exposed to sulfate-containing solutions or soils shall 

comply with the maximum water-cementitious materials ratios, minimum 

specified compressive strength and be made with the appropriate type of 

cement in accordance with the provisions of ACI 318, Section 4.3. 

 

Exception:  Unless the owner or applicant supplies results from a soils 

investigation containing data on sulfates, the owner or applicant must use a 

concrete mix design meeting the following specifications:  

 

Use Type V cement or increase the amount of Type II Modified cement in 

concrete to obtain a maximum water-to-cement ratio of 0.45 (by weight, 



 

4-14 

 

normal weight concrete) and a minimum compressive strength fc of 4000 

pounds per square inch (psi). 

 

 

 

(19) Section 2901.1 Scope.  Amended to read as follows:   

 

The provisions of this Chapter and the International Plumbing Code shall 

govern the erection, installation, alteration, repairs, relocation, replacement, 

addition to, use or maintenance of plumbing equipment and systems.  Toilet 

and bathing rooms shall be constructed in accordance with Section 1209 of the 

IBC 2018.  Plumbing systems and equipment shall be constructed, installed, 

and maintained in accordance with the International Plumbing Code.  

Residential Small Wastewater Systems shall conform to the Delegation 

Agreement. 

 

3. International Residential Code, 2018 Edition, including Appendixes A, B, C and E. 

 

The International Residential Code (IRC) is adopted for the purpose of providing 

standards for residential construction, including plumbing and mechanical codes on 

Platted Subdivision Lots.  Electrical provisions are obtained from the currently adopted 

NEC.  To obtain a Certificate of Occupancy all applicable portions of the IRC shall 

apply.  

 

(a) The following amendments to the International Residential Code, as adopted by 

Section 12(A)(3) above, are hereby made a part of this rule:   

 

(1) Section R104.10.1 Areas Prone to Flooding is repealed and replaced with the 

following: 

 

All residential construction in areas prone to flooding shall comply with Flood 

Damage Prevention Resolution.  
 

(2) Section R105.2 Work Exempt from Permit is amended to read as follows:  

 

Work Exempt from Permit. 

 

Exemption from permit requirements of this code shall not be deemed to grant 

authorization for any work to be done in any manner in violation of the provisions 

of this code or any other laws or ordinances of this jurisdiction.  

 

Permits shall not be required for the following:  

 

Building:  Numbers 1 through 10 remain unchanged, add number 11 as follows:  

 

(11) Non-habitable accessory structures including, but not limited to, pole 

barns and similar structures that meet the following requirements: 

 

Commented [SGP8]: We are proposing to strike the word 

‘residential’, just leaving the term ‘small wastewater 

systems’.  

 

Again, this is meant to remove limitations on our authority 

and rely on our current delegation agreement as stated here.   



 

4-15 

 

1. There shall be clear separation distance of seven (7’) feet between the 

structure and any dwelling;  

 

2. The structure shall not be attached to a dwelling with a breezeway or other 

form of connecting structure; and 

 

   3. The clear roof span is less than 61 feet.   

 

(3) Section R108 Fees is repealed. 

 

(4) Section R109.1.3 Flood Plain Inspections.  Amended to read as follows:  

 

For construction in areas prone to flooding, as established in Flood Damage 

Prevention Resolution.   

 

(5) Section R112 Board of Appeals is repealed. 

 

(6) Section 112.2 is added to read as follows:   

 

Criteria for issuance of a variance for areas prone to flooding shall be in 

accordance with Article IV, Section C of the Flood Damage Prevention 

Resolution.   

 

(7) Section R114.2 Unlawful Continuance is repealed. 

 

(8) Table R301.2(1) replaced with the following:   
 

  

               Climatic and Geographical Design Criteria 
Minimum 

Roof Live 

Snow 

Load (psf) 

Basic 

Design 

Wind 

Speed 

Per IBC 

1609.3 

Wind 

Speed 

115 

Nom. 

90 mph 

Seismic 

Design 

Category 

Subject to Damage From Winter 

Design 

Temp 

(°f) 

Ice Barrier 

Underlayment 

Requirements 

Flood 

Hazards 

Air 

Freezing 

Index 

Mean 

Annual 

Temp 

(°f) 

Weathering Frost 

Line 

Depth 

(in.) 

Termite 

30-35* Exp.C B Severe 42 Slight / 

moderate 
-5 Yes Jan. 02 

2008 

2000 45 

*1:12 pitch and flatter, 35 psf. 1:12 pitch and greater, 30 psf.See Section 

12.A.2.a.(12) 

 

 

(9) Table R302.1(2) of the International Residential Code is repealed.  

 

(10) Section R302.13 of the International Code is repealed. 

 

Commented [SGP9]: Language in this table was amended 

to reflect the changes to Ground Snow Load found in Section 

12.A.2.a.(13), page 4-12. 



 

4-16 

 

(11) Section R309.5 of the International Residential Code is repealed. 

 

(12) Sections R310.2.3.2 & R310.3.2.1 Drainage of the International Residential 

Code is amended to read as follows: 

 

R310.2.3.2 & R310.3.2.1 Drainage.  Window wells and Bulkhead enclosures 

shall be designed for proper drainage by connecting to the building’s 

foundation drainage system required by Section 405.1 or by an approved 

alternative method.   

 

(13) Section R313.1 & R313.2 of the International Residential Code is repealed.  

 

(14) Sections R313.1.1 & R313.2.1 of the International Residential Code is 

amended to read as follows:   

 

Sections R313.1.1 & R313.2.1  When provided, automatic residential fire 

sprinkler systems for buildings covered under the International Residential 

Code shall be designed and installed in accordance with IRC Section P2904 or 

NFPA 13D. 

 

 

(15) R401.4 Soil tests. 

 

In areas likely to have expansive, compressible, shifting or other unknown soil 

characteristics, the Building Code Official shall require a soil investigation to 

determine the soil’s characteristics at a particular location. 
 

Exception:  In lieu of a soil investigation, the owner shall submit to the 

Building Code Official a signed and sealed letter from an Engineer stating that 

the soils are adequate for the proposed application.  The letter shall reference 

Table R401.4.1 from the International Residential Code and specify the 

appropriate Class of Material to be used for the foundation design. 

 

(16) Chapter 11 Energy Efficiency is repealed in its entirety.   

 

(17) M1411.8 Locking access port caps is repealed in its entirety.   

 

(18) M1502.4.2 Duct Installation repealed in its entirety and replaced with: 

 

Duct Installation.  Dryer exhaust ducts shall be supported at intervals not to 

exceed 4 feet and shall be secured in place.  The insert end of the duct shall 

extend into the adjoining duct or fitting in the direction of airflow.  Exhaust 

duct joints shall be sealed in accordance with Section M1601.4.1.  Ducts shall 

not be joined with screws or similar fasteners. 

 



 

4-17 

 

(19) M1701.2.1 Exhaust and ventilation system, add a new section to the IRC.  All 

dwellings shall have make-up air for the exhaust systems provided in the 

following manner: 

 

Piping for the make-up air shall come from the exterior of the dwelling to the 

return-air duct of the HVAC system, or to an opening in a laundry room or 

other acceptable location.  A four (4”) inch minimum diameter pipe shall be 

used.   

 

(20) Section G2406.2 Prohibited Locations.  Exceptions 3 & 4 are repealed and 

replaced with the following:   

 

Unvented fuel burning equipment shall not be installed, used, or maintained 

within a dwelling unit. 

 

(21) Section G2444.1 Unit Heaters.  This section is repealed.   

 

(22) Section G2445.2 Prohibited Use.  Amended to read as follows:   

 

Unvented room heaters shall not be used in attached or detached garages 

unless protected by a carbon monoxide detection system and equipped with an 

oxygen-depletion safety system.   

 

(23) Section G2445.4 Unvented Room Heaters, Prohibited Locations.  Amended to 

read as follows:   
 

The location of unvented room heaters shall comply with Section G2406.2 as 

amended in this document.   

 

(24) Section P2503.5.1 Rough Plumbing.  Drain, waste and venting systems shall 

be tested on completion of the rough piping installation by water or by air with 

no evidence of leakage.  Either test shall be applied to the drainage system in 

its entirety or in sections after rough piping has been installed, as follows: 

 

1. Water test.  Each section shall be filled with water to a point not less than 

10 feet above the highest fitting connection in that section, or to the highest 

point in the complete system.  Water shall be held in the section under test 

for a period of 15 minutes.  The system shall prove leak free by visual 

inspection.   

 

2. Air Test.  The portion under test shall be maintained at a gauge of 5 pounds 

per square inch (psi).  This pressure shall be held without introduction of 

additional air for a period of 15 minutes.   
 

(25) Section P2601.3 Flood Hazard Area.  Amended to read as follows:   

 



 

4-18 

 

In areas prone to flooding as established by Flood Damage Prevention 

Resolution, plumbing fixtures, drains, and appliances shall be located or 

installed in accordance with Article V Section A of the above document.   

 

(26) Section P2602.2 Flood Resistant Installation.  Amended to read as follows:  

  

In areas prone to flooding as established by the Flood Damage Prevention 

Resolution:  Remainder of the section unchanged.   

 

(27) Section P2603.5.1 Sewer Depth.  Amended to read as follows:   

 

Building sewers that connect to private sewage disposal systems shall be a 

minimum of thirty-six (36”) inches below finished grade at the point of septic 

tank connection.  All building sewer piping shall be a minimum of thirty-six 

(36”) inches below grade. 

 

(28) Section P2603.5 Freezing.  Amend the last sentence to read:   

 

All water service lines and exterior water pipes shall be installed not less than 

five-foot six (5’6”) inches below grade.   

 

Exception:  Lawn watering systems need not be installed at the above depth.   

 

Add the following language to the end of this section:   

 

Water services for mobile/manufactured homes shall use a Woodford 

Thermaline, or equivalent water connector, or shall be placed in a 12” diameter 

by 5 ft. deep pipe located up under the home.  

 

(29) Section P2705.1 Installation, item #3 is repealed.   

 

(30) Section P3001.3 Flood-resistant Installation.  Amended to read as follows:   

 

In areas prone to flooding as established by the Flood Damage Prevention 

Resolution, drainage, waste, and vent systems shall be located and installed to 

prevent infiltration of floodwaters into the systems and discharges from the 

systems into floodwaters. 

 

(31) Delete Chapters 34 through 42 (Electrical Provisions) of the International 

Residential Code and replace with the 2020 NEC. 

 

(32) Add Appendix E, Section AE101 General.  Amended to read as follows:   

 

Section AE101.1 General.  These provisions shall be applicable to all 

manufactured homes used as a single dwelling unit and shall apply to the 

following:  Remainder of this section unchanged.   

 

Commented [SGP10]: Amending to the 2020 NEC as 

required by Wyoming State Statute. See page 4-21 for full 

explanation. 



 

4-19 

 

(33) Section AE304 Fees is repealed.  There are no fees for plan review or 

inspections.  Re-inspection fees may apply per Section 4. C. 3. 
 

4. International Mechanical Code, 2018 Edition, including Appendix A. 

 

a) The following amendments to the International Mechanical Code, as adopted by 

Section 12(A)(4) above are hereby made a part of this rule.   

 

(1) Section 106.5 Fees is repealed.  There are no fees for plan review or inspections.  

Re-inspection fees may apply per Section 4. C. 3. 

 

(2) Section 108.4 Violation Penalties is repealed. 

 

(3) Section 108.5 Stop Work Order is repealed.   

 

(4) Section 109 Means of Appeal is repealed in its entirety.   

 

(5) Section 301.2 Energy Utilization is repealed.  

 

(6) Section 303.3 Prohibited Locations.  Amended to read as follows:   

 

Except in attached or detached garages protected with a carbon monoxide 

detection system and equipped with an oxygen-depletion safety system, unvented 

fuel burning equipment shall not be installed, used, maintained, or permitted to 

exist in any building. 

 

(7) Table 403.3.1.1 shall be amended to include footnote i.  Footnote i shall read as 

follows:  For repair garages, the required 0.75 cfm per square ft. of exhaust 

airflow may be achieved by providing 0.25 cfm of continuous airflow per sq. ft. 

with an additional 0.50 cfm of intermittent airflow per sq. ft. when installed in 

accordance with Section 404.   

 

(8) Section 501.3 Outdoor Discharge.  The air removed by every mechanical exhaust 

system shall be discharged at a point where it will not cause a nuisance and from 

which it cannot again be readily drawn in by a ventilating system.  An attic not 

used for make-up air may have exhaust ducts terminate in the attic.  The exhaust 

duct shall extend to a minimum of six (6”) inches above the insulation.   

 

(9) Section 604.1 General.  Delete the reference to the International Energy 

Conservation Code.  The rest of the section to remain as is.   

 

5. The International Plumbing Code, 2018 Edition, including Appendix A and B: 

 

a) The following amendments to the International Plumbing Code, as adopted by 

Section 12.A.5 above, are hereby made a part of this rule.  



 

4-20 

 

 

(1) Section 106.6 Fees is repealed.  There are no fees for plan review or inspections.  

Re-inspection fees may apply per Section 4.C.3.   

 

(2) Section 108.4 Violation Penalties is repealed. 

 

(3) Section 108.5 Stop Work Orders is repealed. 

 

(4) Section 109 Means of Appeal is repealed in its entirety. 

 

(5) Section 305.4 Freezing.  The last sentence is amended to read as follows: 

 

Exterior water supply system piping shall be installed below the frost line and not 

less than five-foot six (5’6”) inches below grade. 

 

Exception:  Lawn watering systems need not be installed at the above depth. 

 

Add the following language to the end of this section:   

 

Water services for mobile/manufactured homes shall use a Woodford Thermaline, 

or equivalent water connector, or shall be placed in a 12” diameter by 5 ft. deep 

pipe located up under the home.   

 

(6) Section 305.4.1 Sewer Depth is amended to read as follows:  

 

Building sewers that connect to private sewage disposal systems shall be a 

minimum of 36” inches below finished grade at the point of septic tank 

connection.  Building sewers shall be a minimum of 36” inches below grade.  All 

sewer lines will be required to have a full-size end of line cleanout.   

 

(7) Section 312.3 Drainage and Vent air test.  Drain, waste, venting systems shall be 

tested on completion of the rough piping installation by water or by air with no 

evidence of leakage.  Either test shall be applied to the drainage system in its 

entirety, or in sections after the rough piping has been installed, as follows:   

 

Water test.  Each section of piping shall be filled with water to a point not less 

than 10 feet above the highest fitting connection in that section, or to the highest 

point in the completed system.  Water shall be held in the test section (under test) 

for a period of 15 minutes.  The system shall prove leak free by visual inspection.  

 

Air Test.  The portion under test shall be maintained at a gauge of 5 pounds per 

square inch (psi).  This pressure shall be held without introduction of additional 

air for a period of 15 minutes.  A contractor using air to test plastic pipe shall be 

aware of the risk.   

 

(8) 602.1 General.  WATER REQUIRED is amended to read as follows:   



 

4-21 

 

 

602.1 General. 
 

Every structure equipped with plumbing fixtures and utilized for human 

occupancy or habitation shall be provided with a potable supply of water in the 

amounts and at the pressures specified in this Chapter.  All shared wells shall be 

required to install a dual check valve on each water service line.  If all 

Community Water System regulations are met, the system requirements in 

Section 13 of this document may be used in place of those prescribed in the 2018 

International Plumbing Code.  

 

(9) Section 701.2 Sewer Required is amended to read as follows:  

 

Every building having plumbing fixtures installed and all premises having 

drainage piping shall be connected to a public sewer, where available, or an 

approved private sewage disposal system in accordance with the Delegation 

Agreement.  

 

(10) Section 708.1.1.2 Base of stack is added to read as follows:   

 

A full-size cleanout shall be provided at each end of the line base waste or soil 

stack. 

 

(11) Section 903.2 Frost Closure shall be amended to the following:   

 

Vent extensions through a roof or wall shall not be less than 3 inches in 

diameter.  Any increase in size of the vent shall be made not less than 1 foot 

below the roof line.  

 

(12) Section 410.2 Small Occupancies shall be amended as follows: 

 

Drinking fountains shall not be required for an occupant load of 30 or fewer. 

 

6. The National Electrical Code, 2020 Edition; as copyrighted by the National Fire 

Protection Association, including Article 80, also known as Annex H.  

 

a) The following amendments to the National Electrical Code, as adopted by Section 

12(A)(6) above, are hereby made a part of this rule.  

 

(1) Section 80.1(2) of the National Electric Code is repealed.  

 

(2) Section 80.15 Electric Board of the National Electric Code is renamed Building 

Code Appeals Board. 

 

(3) Section 80.15(A) of the National Electric Code is repealed. 

 

Commented [SGP11]: This is a proposed new amendment 

to Chapter 4.  

 

The original text exempts drinking fountains for buildings 

with design occupant loads of 15 or fewer. This amendment 

expands that exemption to a more lenient requirement.   

 

This proposed change is intended to address a code 

requirement that may not necessarily apply to structures 

located in a rural setting. 

 

 

Commented [SGP12]: The State of Wyoming adopted the 

2020 edition of the NEC effective January 1, 2020. By state 

statute, Campbell County must update our ordinance to 

match the States’ adoption of the 2020 NEC no later than 

July 1, 2020. 



 

4-22 

 

(4) Sections (B) through (H) of Section 80.15 of the National Electric Code are 

repealed. 

 

(5) Sections 80.23(B)(3) of the National Electric Code is repealed.  

 

(6) Section 80.27 Inspectors Qualifications: 

 

(a) Inspectors qualifications as required by Statue Statute 35-9-121(a)(iv) for 

Home Rule requirements only.  For Local enforcement, all Inspectors 

employed by Campbell County can/will do Electrical Inspections.   

 

(b) Sections 80.27(B), (C) and (D) are repealed. 

 

(7) Sections 80.33 and 80.35 are repealed.  

 

(8) Section 230.70(A)(1) Readily Accessible Location is amended to read as follows: 

 

The service disconnecting means shall be installed at a readily accessible location 

outside of a building or structure.  (Note:  Mobile Homes and Manufactured 

Homes shall comply with Article 550 of the National Electrical Code.) 

 

(9) Section 230.79(C) of the National Electrical Code is amended to read as follows: 

 

(a) One- and Two-Family Dwellings and Townhouses.  For a one-family, two-

family or townhouse dwelling, the service disconnecting means shall have a 

rating of not less than 200 amperes, 3-wire.   

 

(10) Section 250.53(A)(2) Exception shall be repealed in its entirety.   
 

7. The International Existing Building Code 2018; 

 

a) The following amendments to the International Existing Building Code, as adopted 

by Section 12.A.7 above, are hereby made a part of this rule.   

 

(1) Section 101.4.2 Building previously occupied, reference to the International 

Property Maintenance Code is removed.  

 

(2) Section 1401.2 Conformance, reference to the International Property Maintenance 

Code is removed.  

 

8. The International Fuel Gas Code 2018 Edition, including all Appendices;  

 

a) The following amendments to the International Fuel Gas Code, as adopted by Section 

12(A)(8) above, are hereby made a part of this rule. 

 



 

4-23 

 

(1) Section 106.6, Fee Schedule, is repealed.  There are no fees for plan review or 

inspections.  Re-inspection fees may apply per Section 4.C.3. 

 

(2) Section 108.4, Violation Penalties is repealed. 

 

(3) Section 108.5, Stop Work Orders is repealed. 

 

(4) Section 109, Means of Appeal is repealed in its entirety.   

 

(5) Section 303.3, Exceptions #3 and #4 are deleted.   

 

(6) Section 621.4 Prohibited Locations is amended to read as follows:  

 

Except in attached or detached garages protected with a carbon monoxide 

detection system and equipped with an oxygen-depletion safety system, unvented 

room heaters shall not be installed with occupancies in Groups A, B, E, F, H, I, M 

or R. 

 

 

9. The Liquefied Petroleum Gas Code (NFPA 58), 2014 Edition, including all Appendices. 

 

10. The Flood Damage Prevention Resolution. 

 

11. Wyoming DEQ, Water Quality Rules and Regulations, Chapter 25 as amended in 

Appendix 1 to Chapter 4, and supplemented as follows: 

 

a) There shall be a maximum of one (1) septic system per any un-zoned parcel 10 acres 

or less in size and no more than one (1) septic system per each un-zoned ten (10) 

acres area on larger parcels.  Multiple septic systems shall be spaced a minimum of 

600 feet apart. 

 

b) The current Campbell County Public Works Building Division Small Wastewater 

System Record shall be used for percolation test procedures, leach field sizing, 

system design, installation parameters and documentation.  

 

c) Remove Sections 5 and 8 – use Small Wastewater System Record.   

 

d) Remove Sections 10c, 10d, 14, 15 16, 17, 19 and Appendix B.  DEQ to regulate these 

items. 

 

 

 

 

Commented [SGP13]: DEQ Chapter 25 as amended is 

now being added to Chapter 4 as an appendix, rather than a 

separate document apart from Chapter 4, ‘Rules for 

Construction’. This is more appropriate and reduces 

confusion for administration. 

Commented [SGP14]: The addition of the term ‘un-

zoned’ is intended to eliminate confusion over the 

administration of this section.  

 

Chapter 7 ‘Zoning Regulations’ already addresses minimum 

requirements for land development within any zoning 

district.  

 

This section was always intended to apply to un-zoned 

parcels and has been administrated as such. The added 

language simply removes any ambiguity and gives greater 

clarity to the original intent.  



 

4-24 

 

Section 13. Community Water Systems. 
 

A. Scope.  The provisions of this section shall apply to the minimum design and installation 

requirements for a Community Water System. 

 

B. Purpose.  The purpose of these standards is to:   

 

1. Protect the health, safety, and welfare of the users of the water system. 

 

2. Provide an alternative method for providing water in lieu of using Chapter 6 of the 

2018 International Plumbing Code.  

 

C. Applicability. 

 

1. The system must have no more than nine (9) Water Service Connections and must 

serve fewer than twenty-five (25) individuals with water for human consumption.   

 

2. A Community Water System shall not be used when serving an average of at least 25 

people with water for human consumption for at least 60 days a year.  These systems 

qualify as Public Water Systems per EPA (Environmental Protection Agency) and 

requirements related to them are found in Wyoming DEQ Water Quality Rules and 

Regulations Chapter 12.   

 

3. For all new systems with four (4) or more Water Service Connections, a Community 

Water System is required.   

 

4. For multi-unit apartment complexes on single parcels, the requirements in Section 13 

based on numbers of Water Service Connections regarding flow, pressure, pipe 

sizing, etc. do not apply as written and must be modified accordingly.   

 

D. Design Parameters and System Requirements.   

 

1. Community Water Systems shall comply with Wyoming DEQ Water Quality Rules 

and Regulations, Chapter 12, except as amended below:   

 

(a) Level of Treatment.  Treatment shall be provided to produce a potable water 

supply that is bacteriological, chemically, radiologically, and physically safe as 

determined by an Engineer.   

 

(b) Surface Water Supplies.  Surface water shall not be used for potable water 

sources. 

 

(c) Ground Water Supplies.  Disinfection equipment shall not be required unless the 

above level of treatment cannot be obtained.  When disinfection equipment is 

necessary it shall be designed by an Engineer. 



 

4-25 

 

 

(d) Treatment.  When treatment is required, one treatment unit capable of the 

maximum demand shall be required and shall be designed by an Engineer. 

 

(e) Equipment Providing Required Flows.  Multiple pumping and/or treatment 

equipment shall not be required.  However, equipment needs shall be determined 

by an Engineer.  

 

(f) Alternative Power.  Alternative power shall not be required unless fire protection 

is provided.   

 

(g) Flow and Pressure Requirements.   

 

(1) Pressure shall be reviewed by an Engineer and included in the design report.   

 

(2) The design flow for the system shall be 7 gallons per minute (gpm) for each 

Water Service Connection plus an additional 10 gpm. 

 

(3) When the design flow from (2) is proportioned to the 1/3 of the locations with 

the highest head loss, a minimum of forty (40) psi shall be met at those 

locations.  

 

(4) When the design flow rate from (2) is proportioned to the ½ of the locations 

with the highest head loss, a minimum of twenty-five (25) psi shall be met at 

those locations. 

 

(h) Finished Water Storage.  

 

(1) Storage shall not be required if a twenty-four (24) hour pump test of the yield 

and drawdown of the well taken as described in DEQ Chapter 12 

demonstrates the well can produce a minimum of ten (10) gpm per Water 

Service Connection and that a submersible pump has been installed which can 

provide pressures as called for in g(3) and g(4). 

 

(2) When the above criteria cannot be met, finished water storage shall be 

provided in the amount of two (2) times the average daily demand for the 

system. 

 

(i) Pumping Units.  Single pumping units as necessary shall be provided.  Alarms are 

not required at attended pump stations.   

 

2. A design report, plans, and hydraulic analysis shall be provided by an Engineer.   

 



 

4-26 

 

3. The Community Water System shall be subject to all applicable codes, permits, and 

inspections required by the Building Division.  

 

4. Backflow prevention in accordance with the 2018 International Plumbing Code shall 

be installed. 

 

5. Piping material shall be any material allowed for potable water piping in Table 605.4 

of the 2018 International Plumbing Code.   

 

6. When providing potable water to four (4) to six (6) Water Service Connections, a 

looped supply line of no smaller than two (2) inches in diameter shall be provided.  A 

water service line shall be extended to the property line for each parcel.  

 

7. When providing potable water to seven (7) to nine (9) connections a looped supply 

line no smaller than three (3”) inches in diameter shall be provided.  A water service 

line shall be extended to the property line for each parcel.  

 

8. Pressure tanks shall be provided in accordance with pump manufacturers 

recommendations.  Minimum volumes shall be three (3) gallons per Water Service 

Connection for variable speed drive pumps and fifteen (15) gallons per Water Service 

Connection for conventional pumps. 

 

9. In addition to the above requirements, forty (40’) feet of surface casing shall be 

installed and the annual space between the borehole and the surface casing shall be 

filled with cement, grout, or bentonite slurried material.  The well bore shall not 

continue until the surface casing is installed.   

 

10. Flushing hydrants shall be provided as determined by an Engineer.  

 

11. Water wells shall be placed at a maximum density of two (2) per forty (40) acres and 

shall provide a minimum of two (2) gpm per Water Service Connection.  

 

E. Construction Requirements. 

 

1. Permitting is required.  Contract Public Works Engineering Division for permit forms 

and general requirements prior to construction.   

 

2. During construction, inspections are required by an Engineer to verify that the project 

is being built according to the approved and permitted design, and that all 

requirements are being met.   

 



 

4-27 

 

3. During construction, inspection is required by Campbell County Public Works 

Engineering Division.  Forty-eight (48) hour notice must be given prior to any work 

being done.   

 

4. The entire Community Water System shall be disinfected and flushed in accordance 

with the Wyoming Public Works Standard Specifications prior to water samples 

being taken.   

 

5. Water samples shall be taken at the curb stop for each Water Service Connection and 

shall be tested.   

 

F. Closeout and Documentation Requirements. 

 

1. The Engineer shall provide ‘as constructed plans’ for the Community Water System 

within thirty (30) days of completion.  

 

2. Maintenance of a Community Water System shall be provided for by a water well 

agreement or home/landowner association documents filed at the Campbell County 

Clerk’s Office.   

 

3. Access and utility easements shall be provided for the water well and storage tanks.  

Easements shall be filed at the Campbell County Clerk’s Office.  

 

4. A copy of the U.W.5 Water Well Permit from the State Engineer’s Office shall be 

provided. 

 

5. Water well ‘as-constructed’ data shall be provided by an Engineer demonstrating the 

water well was constructed in accordance with the current Wyoming State Engineer’s 

Office Water Well Minimum Construction Standards.  

 

6. At a minimum, water quality testing shall be conducted and reviewed by an Engineer 

for the following:  Total Dissolved Solids (TDS), Nitrate & Nitrite as N, Total 

Coliform, Sulfates, Calcium, Magnesium, Sodium, Chloride, Iron, Zinc, Lead, 

Fluoride, Manganese, Copper, Arsenic, pH, and E-Coli.  SAR (Sodium Absorption 

Rate) and/or other constituents to be reviewed as considered as necessary.  

 

7. The test results from the water samples taken at each Water Service Connection shall 

be submitted with the record documents.  

 

8. A written report from an Engineer analyzing EPA Primary Drinking Water Standards 

is required.  

 



 

4-28 

 

9. A map from an Engineer or professional land surveyor shall be provided for all 

Community Water Systems that identifies bearings & distances from property corners 

to the distribution lines. 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

List of Appendices 

 

Appendix 1: DEQ Chapter 25 Amended 

 

Appendix 2: Campbell County Small Wastewater System Permit Workbook and Application 

Commented [SGP15]: The List of Appendices is an 

addition to Chapter 4 for the purposes of codifying all 

technical and permitting requirements for Small Wastewater 

Systems into one location. 



 

*Individuals wishing to provide public comment are asked to sign in prior to the start of the meeting, provide 
contact information and the topic(s) to be discussed. 

 
 
The following page(s) contain the backup material for Agenda Item: 10:35  Professional Services Contract, West 
EcoSystems Technology 



 

Engineering   Building    Planning    Surveying  Solid Waste  Facilities  

 
 

 

    

    

TO: Campbell County Board of Commissioners  

 

FROM: Megan Nelms, Planner & Zoning Administrator 

 

DATE: June 8, 2020 

 

SUBJECT: WEST Consulting Contract – Natural Resource Land Use Plan Update 

 

        

Summary:  Attached is the proposed contract with WEST Consulting to review and 

update the 2016 Campbell County Natural Resource and Land Use Plan (NRLUP).  

 

The County’s NRLUP was last updated and adopted in June of 2016. Recent review of 

the plan identified areas which could be improved upon based on new policy and legal 

guidance, new issues of interest or topics which have been previously omitted and 

should be included, as well as needed updates to baseline data.  

 

In 2018, House Bill 54 amended Wyoming Statute §9-4-218 to include financial 

assistance of up to $50,000 to counties to create or update their natural resource & land 

use plans. The County has received approval from the Governor’s Natural Resource 

Office for funding of up to $50,000 to update our plan.  

 

The NRLUP Committee sent a request for proposals to consultants to assist the county 

with the plan updates. Of the four proposals received, the committee chose WEST, Inc., 

who previously assisted the County with the 2016 update. WEST will review and revise 

the plan to ensure the most up-to-date and current statistics and information are provided 

to substantiate and validate the County’s policies and goals. WEST’s review will also 

include GIS mapping integration within the plan.  

 

The timeline of work for this project is through the end of 2020, with adoption of the 

plan by the Board of Commissioners to follow in the winter/spring of 2021.  

 

Staff Recommendation:   Staff recommends the Board of Commissioners accept the 

contract with WEST consulting for work on the 2016 Campbell County Natural 

Resource Land Use Plan update.  



Professional Services Contract   1 | P a g e  
 

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES CONTRACT 
 
This Professional Services Contract (“Contract”) is made and entered into this _____ day of June, 

2020 between Campbell County Department of Public Works, (“Client”) and Western EcoSystems 

Technology, Inc. (“Contractor”). In consideration of the mutual covenants and contracts contained 

herein, the sufficiency of which is hereby acknowledged, Client and Contractor do hereby agree 

as follows: 

 

1 Definitions: For purposes of this Contract, the following terms shall be defined as 

follows: 

 

1.1 “Contract” Shall mean the terms and conditions contained directly and specifically 

in this instrument including all exhibits and attachments hereto and incorporated 

herein. 

 

1.2 “Work” shall mean the services to be performed or provided by Contractor pursuant 

to Paragraph 4 of this Contract. 

 

1.3 “Party” or “Parties” shall mean Client and/or Contractor. 

 

1.4 “Project” shall mean all Work being performed by Contractor pursuant to 

Paragraph 4 of this Contract. 

 

2. Relationship of the Parties:  The Contractor is providing professional services for the 

Project. Funding for those services is provided by Client. The Contractor is acting as an 

independent contractor to Client and not as an employee, agent, partner or joint venturer for Client. 

Neither party to this contract may obligate the other to any expense or liability except upon written 

consent of the other. Any assignment of rights or delegation of duties, including subcontracting, 

under this Contract shall be void without prior written approval by Client. 

 

3. Term:  Unless earlier terminated in accordance with the terms contained in Paragraph 9 

below, the term of this Contract (the “Term”) shall begin on the date hereinabove written and shall 

continue until February 25, 2021, unless renewed or extended by written agreement of the parties. 

 

4. Scope of Work:  Contractor shall perform the following Work at the direction of, and in 

coordination with Client, as outlined in Attachment “A” Proposal for Campbell County Natural 

Resource Land Use Plan Update, a copy of which is attached hereto and incorporated herein by 

this reference.  Additional Work in accordance with this agreement shall be outlined in consecutive 

proposals. 

 

5. Compensation:  As consideration for the Work to be performed herein, Client shall pay 

Contractor’s hourly rates identified in Attachment “B” Campbell County Natural Resource Land 

Use Plan Update – Budget Estimate.  The cost not to exceed amount under this contract is Forty 

Nine Thousand Four Hundred and Forty Dollars and 00/100 ($49,440.00 USD).  Contractor shall 

invoice Client only for services actually performed and expenses actually accrued.  

 



Professional Services Contract   2 | P a g e  
 

6. Payment of Fees:  Client shall make payment of fees monthly, according to Invoices 

submitted by Contractor and approved by the project manager or his supervisor. Invoices will be 

considered as due within 45 days of receipt of invoice. Client’s failure to pay Invoices pursuant to 

this Paragraph shall be deemed a material breach of the terms and conditions contained in this 

Contract.  In the event Client is deemed to be in material breach of this contract pursuant to this 

Paragraph Contractor may, upon notice to Client, issue a stop work order on the Project which 

shall remain in full force and effect until the breach outlined in this Paragraph is remedied by 

Client to the satisfaction of Contractor. 

 

7. Insurance Requirements:  The minimum kinds and amounts of insurance to be carried by 

the Contractor shall be as set forth below: 

   

  TYPE     COVERAGE 

Comprehensive Auto Liability  $1,000,000 combined single limit 

Comprehensive General Liability  $1,000,000 per occurrence; 

      $2,000,000 aggregate 

Workers Compensation   Statutory 

 

8. Termination:  This contract may be terminated by Client in whole or in part in writing for 

convenience upon thirty (30) days written notice sent by certified mail to the Contractor at its usual 

place of business. In the event of such termination, payment shall be made to the Contractor for 

the amount of satisfactory work performed or services rendered to date of termination as well as 

all expenses incurred by Contractor prior to the date of termination. Payment will not exceed the 

fixed lump sum or not-to-exceed amount set forth herein. 

 

In the event this Contract is terminated prior to completion as a result of conditions beyond the 

control of the Contractor, the total amount of the fixed payment shall be prorated in the proportion 

to the work performed to date of such termination. Payment of the prorated amount shall be within 

thirty (30) days. 

 

The Contractor, upon receipt of a termination notice, shall promptly discontinue all services 

affected (unless the notice directs otherwise), and deliver or otherwise make available to Client all 

data, drawings, specifications, reports, estimates, summaries, project file, and other information 

and materials as may have been accumulated by the Contractor in performing this contract, 

whether completed or in process. 

 

9. Disputes:  In the event of a dispute to or arising out of this Contract, the Parties shall meet 

and confer and negotiate in good faith to attempt to resolve the dispute.  In the event the Parties 

are unable to resolve the dispute after such good faith negotiation, then the Parties shall be free to 

pursue all remedies, whether legal or equitable, which may exist. The law of the State of Wyoming 

shall govern all matters arising under or in connection with this Agreement.  Courts of Campbell 

County, Wyoming shall have jurisdiction of all suits, actions, or other legal proceedings with 

respect to or arising out of this Agreement. 

  



Professional Services Contract   3 | P a g e  
 

10. Address of the Contractor: Western EcoSystems Technology, Inc. 

415 W. 17th Street, Suite 200 

Cheyenne, WY  82001 

Telephone: (307) 634-1756 

Fax: (307) 637-6981 

Email: dyoung@west-inc.com 

Attn: David Young, CEO 

 

11. Address of Client:  Campbell County 

Department of Public Works 

500 S. Gillette Avenue, Suite 1400 

Gillette, Wyoming 82716 

Telephone: (307) 685-8061 

Email: MBL08@ccgov.net 

Attn: Megan Nelms 

 

12. Severability:  If any part of this Contract is found to be unenforceable or in conflict with 

applicable laws, such part shall be inoperative, null and void, insofar as it is unenforceable or in 

conflict with applicable laws but the remainder of this Contract shall remain in full force and effect. 

 

13. Entire Agreement:  Contractor and Client understand that this is the entire agreement 

between the Parties.  This agreement shall be binding upon the Parties, their heirs, executors, legal 

representatives, successors and assigns. 

 

14. Counterparts; Facsimile and PDF Signatures:  This Agreement may be executed in 

counterparts, each of which shall be deemed to be an original, all of which together shall be deemed 

to be one and the same instrument.  Facsimile or PDF transmission of any signed original 

document, and retransmission of any facsimile or PDF transmission, will be the same as delivery 

of any original document.  At the request of a Party, the other Party will confirm facsimile or PDF 

signatures by signing an original document. 

 

15. No Waiver:  No delay or omission in the exercise of any right under this Agreement shall 

impair any such right or shall be taken, construed or considered as a waiver or relinquishment 

thereof, but any such right may be exercised from time to time and as often as may be deemed 

expedient.  In the event that any provision hereof shall be breached and thereafter waived, such 

waiver shall be limited to the particular breach so waived and shall not be deemed to waive any 

other breach hereof.  The rights and remedies provided by this Agreement shall be in addition to 

those rights and remedies available to the Parties in both law and equity. 

 

16. Captions:  The captions contained in this Contract and in each Attachment attached hereto 

are for convenience and reference only and in no way define, describe, extend or limit the scope 

or intent of such document or the intent of any provision contained therein. 

 

  



Professional Services Contract   4 | P a g e  
 

IN WITNESS WHEREOF, Client and Contractor have executed this Agreement as of the 

date and year first written above. 

 

 

CLIENT:    Campbell County 

 

     By:  ____________________________ 

      Signature 

 

      ____________________________ 

      Print Name 

 

      ____________________________ 

      Title 

 

 

CONTRACTOR:   Western EcoSystems Technology, Inc. 

 

     By:  ____________________________ 

      Signature 

 

      ____________________________ 

      Print Name 

 

      ____________________________ 

      Title 

 

 

 

 

  



Professional Services Contract   5 | P a g e  
 

 

 

Attachment “A” 

 

  



Campbell County Natural Resource Land Use Plan 

 

 1 April 28, 2020 

 

Campbell County 

Natural Resource 

Land Use Plan 

Update 
 

 

  



 

 

Table of 
Contents 

 Of 

  Contents 

 

Qualifications .............................................................. 1 

Project Experience ................................................. 3 

References .............................................................. 5 

Project Team .......................................................... 5 

Team Member Commitment .................................. 7 

Project Proposal .......................................................... 8 

Timeline .................................................................... 10 

Attachment A – Resumes of Key Personnel ............. 11 



 Converse County Natural Resource Plan 

 

 1 April 28, 2020 

 

 

Qualifications

Western EcoSystems 

Technology, Inc. (WEST) 

was established by Dale 

Strickland and Lyman 

McDonald in 1990 in Cheyenne, Wyoming and 

has grown to include offices across the US and 

a Canadian subsidiary. The growth of WEST is 

a direct result of our company’s mission 

statement to provide outstanding professional 

consulting services combining field ecology 

and statistics to create original solutions to 

wide range of natural resource problems. 

Additionally, many of the original employees 

still work at WEST along with over 100 other 

professionals that have become long term 

WEST employees illustrating the quality of the 

company for professional growth as well as 

retained expertise and institutional knowledge.  

 

WEST specializes in a common sense, 

defensible and professional approach to the 

solution of natural resource challenges. The 

WEST client base includes private companies, 

state agencies, and federal agencies that are 

involved in renewable energy development, oil 

and gas development, pipeline construction, 

water supply and management, wildlife and 

vegetation issues, listed species, and permitting 

processes. This vast base of clients and 

industries results in WEST employees having a 

unique understanding and perspective for the 

challenges that our clients face while making 

project planning and development decisions as 

they relate to natural resources.  

 

WEST is pleased to team with Harvey 

Economics (HE), Wenck, and an attorney from 

Pence and MacMillan for this project.  

HE was founded in 2002 by 

Ed Harvey to provide 

focused, applied economic 

research and consulting 

services to business and 

government clients. Mr. Harvey has served 

public and private sector clients in the western 

U.S. for more than four decades. In addition to 

Mr. Harvey, HE’s three other economists bring 

decades of experience and specialized 

knowledge. Given their experience and 

expertise, Susan Walker and Jessica Harvey 

share ownership of the firm with Mr. Harvey. 

HE has an outstanding record of employee 

retention which facilitates our working 

relationships, communication and workforce 

planning.  

 

The bulk of HE’s work focuses on resource-

based markets or economic sectors, including 

energy and minerals; water and wastewater; 

agriculture; tourism and recreation; land use 

and other resources. Their client base is wide 

ranging, including county governments, 

municipalities, utilities, special districts, state 

and federal agencies, law firms, agricultural 

entities and private industry.  

  

Wenck has established 

itself as a market leader in 

the Air Quality Services 

arena through responsive 

service, technically sound 

solutions, and credible representation of its 

clients before regulatory agencies. Our staff 

includes several engineers with significant 

regulatory agency employment experience, 

including a former Wyoming Air Quality 

Division New Source Review Program 

employee. We also ensure that our permitting 

and modeling staff receives ongoing training 



Campbell County Natural Resource Land Use Plan 

 

 2 April 28, 2020 

to stay abreast of developments at state and 

federal levels. We maintain a complete library 

of computer models and industry-leading 

supporting software programs. Our clients 

continue to draw on our timely and successful 

negotiation of reasonable permits, modeling 

submittals and other regulatory actions. 

Wenck’s air team has worked on projects in 

49 states. As a result, we are familiar with 

many variations of state and local air 

regulations, in addition to the federal 

programs administered by the U.S. EPA. 

 

Pence and 

MacMillan 

was founded 

over 60 years 

ago by Alfred Pence in Laramie, Wyoming. 

Thus began the proud tradition of Pence and 

MacMillan: Wyoming attorneys serving the 

people of the state since 1945. Pence and 

MacMillan have been providing quality legal 

services to a diverse client base around the 

country from our home here in Wyoming, 

with offices located in Laramie, Cheyenne, 

and Sheridan. Services include civil litigation, 

criminal law defense, family law, probate and 

trust administration, estate planning and 

administration, business and financial law, 

real estate and landlord laws, municipal and 

governmental law, labor and termination law, 

oil and gas law, and more. The outstanding 

attorneys have diverse practices and expertise 

and take great pride in the legal service we 

provide the people of Wyoming. Pence and 

MacMillan is also the leading law firm for 

Wyoming under the SCG Legal Network. As 

such, they are the trusted legal resource for 

new and established companies across the 

country. 

Natural Resource and Planning  

The WEST let team is suited for this work 

because:  

 

WEST Team has extensive project experience 

related to land use planning efforts for local, 

state and federal agencies. Our experience 

includes evaluation of potential changes to 

natural resources, socioeconomic resources, 

recreational amenities, energy and minerals, 

agricultural activities, and land uses as part of 

many different types of work:  

 WEST lead of team of consultants, 

including HE, to produce the Amended 

Campbell County Natural Resource 

Land Use Plan. In addition to leading 

the project, WEST provided biological 

resource expertise while HE focused on 

socioeconomic and recreational 

resources. We reviewed the existing 

conditions as well as related County 

goals and priorities for public land 

management and coordination with 

other agencies. 

 HE’s experience includes generating 

long-term planning efforts and 

documents, such as the original Platte 

River Basin Plan, recent Platte River 

Basin Plan Update and the 

Environmental and Recreational Water 

Use Handbook, all completed for the 

Wyoming Water Development Office.  

 WEST has led and provided resource 

support to numerous Environmental 

Impact Statements and Environmental 

Assessments for many of the federal 

agencies including the Army Corps of 

Engineers (USACE), Bureau of Land 

Management (BLM), US Forest 

Service (USFS), US Fish and Wildlife 

Service (USFWS) and the National 

Park Service (NPS). Similarly, HE has 

completed socioeconomic, recreation 

and land use components of 

Environmental Impact Statements 

(EISs) and Environmental Assessments 

(EAs) for the same federal agencies 

listed above.  



Campbell County Natural Resource Land Use Plan 

 

 3 April 28, 2020 

 HE has been involved in special types 

of land use permits for county level 

decision making, including a recent 

Conditional Use Permit for a solar 

energy development on BLM land in 

Sweetwater County. 

 WEST and HE have both participated 

in and offered support to clients in the 

preparation of applications for 

industrial developments to various state 

level agencies, including the Wyoming 

Industrial Siting Commission.  

 

Specific knowledge about Campbell County. 

Our work in Campbell County, especially as 

related to the Amended Campbell County 

Natural Resource Land Use Plan, has led to an 

extensive knowledge of natural resources, 

socioeconomic, and other resource conditions  

across the County. For the development of the 

document, WEST and HE gathered detailed 

data related to the natural resources, 

population, economy, public facilities and 

services, culture and lifestyle, and recreational 

amenities in the County. As a result of this 

experience, our team is well versed in the 

potential issues and concerns faced by the 

County related to changes in regional energy 

development and other pressures related to use 

of public lands.  

 

Project Experience 
Amended Campbell County Natural 

Resource Land Use Plan, Wyoming  

The Commissioners of Campbell County hired 

a team of resource experts to update, expand 

and improve upon the County’s existing Land 

Use Plan. The purpose of the Plan revision was 

to refine, solidify and provide support for the 

extensive list of land use policies originally 

developed by the County several years earlier. 

The Commissioners intend to rely on the land 

use policies, along with other supporting 

information developed as part of the Plan, to 

provide input into potential future 

developments on state and federal properties 

within the County. WEST led a team of experts 

and contributed to the development of the 

natural resource materials presented in the 

document. Additionally, WEST was 

responsible for the development and 

production of the final document. HE took on 

the role of economic expert for this work, 

developing both the economic and recreational 

sections of the Plan. The HE Team developed 

extensive profiles of the County’s economic 

environment and recreational resources, 

providing context for the set of associated 

County policies. HE worked to clarify and 

revise the County’s goals, policies and 

objectives, with regard to economic activity, 

protection of private property rights and 

property values and recreational land uses. HE 

also developed a framework approach for 

evaluating the socioeconomic impacts of state 

or federal actions in the County.  

        

Converse County EIS Support, Wyoming 

WEST led a team of resource experts to support 

the Converse County Board of Commissioners 

in their role as a cooperating agency on the 

Converse County Oil and Gas Project 

Programmatic EIS. That project focused on the 

impacts of large-scale regional oil and gas 

development. WEST and HE assisted the 

commissioners in responding to draft elements 

of the EIS and participated in meetings with the 

BLM regarding alternatives development. As 



Campbell County Natural Resource Land Use Plan 

 

 4 April 28, 2020 

part of the scoping process, HE identified a 

wide range of socioeconomic characteristics 

likely to be affected by development activities, 

from housing availability and price to the 

demand and cost for public services. Potential 

changes to regional land use patterns and 

recreational activity were also identified. A 

detailed baseline socioeconomic report was 

created to describe existing demographic and 

economic conditions in the county and to 

provide the commissioners with feedback 

regarding the BLM’s proposed alternatives. In 

response to concerns expressed by the 

Commissioners, HE developed an additional 

alternative for BLM consideration that 

incorporated a phased approach to well 

development.  

 

As part of a related effort, HE worked with 

County Commissioners to develop a 

socioeconomic monitoring and mitigation plan 

and to propose specific mitigation activities to 

the BLM for incorporation into the Record of 

Decision and the final permit application. That 

monitoring and mitigation plan would be a 

collaborative effort with oil and gas operators 

to gather data on upcoming industry activities 

in order to support County and municipal level 

planning efforts. 

 

Nest Buffer Analysis Review 

Anadarko Petroleum Corporation contracted 

WEST to conduct an independent analysis of 

the Operator Group’s (OG) Year-round 

Development alternative within the Converse 

County Oil and Gas Supplemental Draft 

Environmental Impact Statement (SDEIS). The 

BLM developed a method to estimate the 

impacts of the Year-round Development on 

non-eagle nesting raptors. The purpose of our 

assessment was to review the BLM 

methodology for calculating impacts to active 

non-eagle raptor species and proposed 

minimization measures to minimize calculated 

impacts. A memo was prepared with the results 

and the OG submitted the results to the BLM 

for consideration in the Final EIS.  

 

WWDO Water GIS project 

WEST and Wenck Associates, Inc. performed 

a study to assess trends in water use and 

availability in the state of Wyoming for the 

Wyoming Water Development Office 

(WWDO). The study included an analysis of 

supplemental supplies, annual mapping of 

irrigated lands, development of a Water Use 

Index for all sectors (agricultural, industrial, 

domestic, and municipal), and a publication 

summarizing current conditions. The tools for 

analysis utilize readily available information 

and develop capacity within WWDO to update 

and report trends annually. 

 

Platte River Basin Water Plan Update, 

Wyoming.  

HE updated portions of the original Platte 

River Basin Plan for the Wyoming Water 

Development Commission. HE’s role in that 

effort was to develop water demand projections 

under three alternative future scenarios, 

including high, low and medium population 

growth and water use scenarios. The HE Team 

first created a profile of current economic and 

demographic conditions across the Basin and in 

each of the seven sub-basins, focusing on 

specific water use sectors, including 

agricultural, municipal, and industrial sectors. 

They then researched and projected future 

outlook scenarios for each of the Basin’s 

important economic sectors and ultimately 

projected water demands under each scenario 

for the Basin as a whole and for each sub-basin. 

Projecting agricultural water demands was a 



Campbell County Natural Resource Land Use Plan 

 

 5 April 28, 2020 

major focus of this work given the substantial 

amount of water use in this sector. This work 

also included evaluation of both consumptive 

and non-consumptive environmental and 

recreational water demands. HE researched all 

existing water-based recreation in the Basin, 

which contains a large stretch of the North 

Platte River and other important water-based 

recreation, and placed environmental and 

recreational surface water uses in context with 

traditional diversions for evaluation purposes. 

 

Air Quality Permitting and Compliance - 

Confidential Oil and Gas Client, Powder 

River Basin, Wyoming 

Since 2012, Wenck has been assisting with 

environmental compliance and permitting 

services associated with over 200 well sites in 

Wyoming. Services provided include air 

permitting and compliance, SPCC planning 

and inspections, and data management.  

 

Air Quality Permitting and Modeling – 

Wyoming Coal Mines 

Wenck staff have produced approximately 20 

air permit applications for coal mine 

modifications within Wyoming in the past 15 

years. Most of these applications were for 

Powder River Basin mines. Applications were 

prepared to revise mine plans or to incorporate 

new lease areas. Emission inventories, air 

modeling, and other analyses were performed 

for the applicant and neighboring mines as 

required by WDEQ. Other on-going coal mine 

permit-related activities include preparing 

triennial emission inventories and assistance 

with Regional Haze Rule implementation. 

Data and Inventory Management - Various 

Oil and Gas Clients, Wyoming 

Wenck is currently assisting numerous clients 

with data and inventory management services 

in response to the Wyoming Air Quality 

Division’s recent request for operators to 

populate production site facility inventories in 

their IMPACT data system. Wenck staff have 

editor level access to several clients’ IMPACT 

accounts and are efficiently updating their 

facility inventories. One client has over 500 

facilities in IMPACT. 

 

References 
We are proud of our previous work with both 

Campbell and Converse County Board of 

Commissioners. We have enjoyed working 

with these Boards of Commissioners as well as 

evaluating resources and issues related to these 

resources within these two counties. Therefore 

we offer the following two contacts for 

references for the quality of work WEST and 

HE have conducted in support of these 

counties.  

 

Campbell County Contact: Megan Nelms 

(307) 685-8061, MBL08@ccgov.net 

 

 Converse County Contact: Jim Willox (307) 

351-3242), jim.willox@conversecountywy.gov 

 

Project Team 
Please see Attachment A for resumes of the 

Project Team. 

 

Gretchen Norman, Project 

Manager and NEPA Team 

Leader - Gretchen has been 

with WEST for 16 years and is 

located at our headquarters 

office in Cheyenne, WY. She 

has been involved in NEPA analyses 

throughout the state involving water projects, 

transmission lines, pipeline construction, wind 

projects, solar projects, and oil and gas 



Campbell County Natural Resource Land Use Plan 

 

 6 April 28, 2020 

developments. These projects have been 

proposed on BLM, US Foreset Service and 

private property proivding her with a diverse 

background in the regulations and concerns of 

the federal, state and private landowners 

involved. Gretchen was the Project Manager 

for the Amended Campbell County Natural 

Resource Land Use Plan and she lead the team 

to support the Converse County Board of 

Commissioners participate as a cooperating 

agency in the Converse County Oil and Gas 

EIS process. Her previous work with both the 

Converse County and Campbell County Board 

of Commissioners equips her with a unique 

understanding of the challenges that face the 

Board of Comisssioners and residents of these 

counties. 

 

Ed Harvey, Principal - Mr. 

Harvey brings more than 

four decades of in-depth 

expertise to HE projects. His 

institutional knowledge and 

extensive experience 

performing economic and 

financial analyses, long-term resource 

planning, and evaluation of project 

development activities is a valuable asset to all 

HE projects. Mr. Harvey has worked with 

public entities, including many in Wyoming, as 

they adjust to changes in population, economic 

conditions, or other socioeconomic 

characteristics. Planning for major project 

developments, evaluating the effects of 

changes in regulations and collaboration with 

other entities are also a focus of Mr. Harvey’s 

work. Mr. Harvey has extensive experience 

working with County Commissioners, City 

Council members, State and Federal agencies 

and the public. He has worked continuously 

across the State of Wyoming for over 45 years, 

including recent project experience in 

Converse County. He is well versed in the 

issues facing Converse County related to public 

lands management and has the insight to 

address those challenges going forward.     

 

Susan Walker, Director  - 

In almost 15 years at HE, 

Ms. Walker has worked 

extensively with public 

entities and private clients 

across the Western US, 

including projects 

completed for Converse County, Campbell 

County, the City of Cheyenne, the Wyoming 

Water Development Office, and many 

conservation districts and private entities 

across Wyoming. Over that time, Ms. Walker’s 

work has focused on evaluating changes in 

socioeconomic resources; determining project 

effects on economic conditions, recreational 

amenities and land uses; planning for current 

and future resource demands; and assessing 

financial feasibility of project activities. Her 

work also requires interaction with a variety of 

public entities and stakeholder groups, 

incorporation of stakeholder inputs into 

planning documents and communication of 

project outcomes as part of reports and 

presentations. 

 

Gary Garman, Senior 

Environmental Project 

Manager - Mr. Garman joined 

Wenck Associates in July 

2019. He specializes in air 

permitting, air quality 

dispersion modeling, emission 

inventories, and the development of fugitive 

dust emission factors. He is a degreed scientist 

with over 30 years of professional experience 

in the environmental sciences. He is 

responsible for modeling and permitting of 



Campbell County Natural Resource Land Use Plan 

 

 7 April 28, 2020 

stationary sources, particularly those in the 

mining industry. Other duties include data 

analysis and quality assurance. He has also 

been responsible for installing, calibrating, and 

auditing air quality and meteorological 

monitoring systems.  

 

Kendall C. Necker, CCM, 

Senior Project Manager - Ms. 

Necker is an air quality 

meteorologist with over 30 

years of experience. Ms. 

Necker’s expertise includes 

dispersion modeling, 

permitting, emissions inventory development, 

and data management. She has worked with the 

air dispersion models AERMOD and 

CALPUFF, as well as a variety of other 

specialty models. She has performed both Class 

I and Class II analyses, as well as hazardous air 

pollutant analyses. Her air permitting 

experience involves minor sources, major 

sources, synthetic minors and Title V. Ms. 

Necker has developed emission inventories for 

various industries including coal and hard rock 

mining, manufacturing, grain ethanol, and gas 

compressor stations. Ms. Necker has managed 

data for both meteorological and air quality 

parameters and has developed databases and 

spreadsheet systems for various applications. 

 

M. Gregory Weisz, 

Attorney at Law -  a 

member of Wyoming bar 

since 1995, provides 

services in general civil 

litigation, business 

organizations, natural resources issues, real 

estate and easement law, business entity 

formation and representation of governmental 

and institutional clients. Greg’s practice has 

allowed him to represent a wide variety of 

institutional, corporate and governmental 

entities on issues related to liability exposure, 

risk management, taxing authority, 

governance, and compliance. Additionally, he 

has extensive experience in HIPAA 

compliance, insurance coverage, land use 

regulation and natural resources law. His areas 

of practice inlcude: Corporate law, 

Government/institutional law, Civil Litigation, 

Natural Resources, Real estate, and Easements. 

 

Team Member 
Commitment 
The WEST Team is committed to delivering 

quality products within an expected timeframe.  

The individuals identified have verified their 

availability and bandwidth for providing the 

services described in this proposal within the 

timeframe provided. WEST maintains a large 

staff connected with document production 

including technical editors and   a GIS 

department. We have the capabilities to shift 

workloads around between staff members to 

ensure document production deadlines are met.



 Converse County Natural Resource Plan 

 

 8 April 28, 2020 

 

 

 

 

 

 

Project Proposal

Scope of Work 

The following tasks are proposed to be 

completed to accomplish the work described 

in the Request for Proposal – Scope of Work. 

Costs associated with each task are provided in 

the Budget and Timeline section of the 

proposal. 

 

Task 1. Document Review and Scope 

Confirmation 

Gretchen Norman and Greg Weisz will review 

the existing plan to identify any changes in 

regulations or content that should be updated. 

Additionally, we will identify new topics that 

should be considered for inclusion in the 

updated plan. Topics may includee the split 

estate issue, State Trust Land use, reclamation 

components, right-of-ways for infrastructure 

development and  and dispute resolution 

language. Once reviewed, Gretchen and Greg 

will participate in a conference call (not to 

exceed three hours) to review our findings with 

the Board of Commissioners. The goal of the 

meeting will be to develop a clear 

understanding of the changes and updates that 

are requested by the Board of Commissioners. 

For budgeting purposes we assumed that only 

two new topics would be included to the 

updated plan.  

 

On this call we will also discuss the format for 

a public workshop to solicit input from the 

public about the plan. We will select potential 

dates for the workshop, request that the Board 

of Commissioners secure a venue, and review 

what needs to be prepared prior to the 

workshop (i.e., announcement in paper, 

presentations, and comment sheets). 

 

Task 2. Public Workshop 

The WEST Team will not be participating in 

the public workshops as determined through 

contract negoiations.  

 

Task 3. Document Revisions 

The existing Campbell County Amended 

Natural Resource Land Use Plan is a robust 

document that primarily needs updating and 

reorganization as suggested in the Request for 

Proposals. As mentioned above, we anticipate 

up to two new topics will need to be 

incorporated into the document. 

 

The WEST Team will prepare revisions to their 

respective sections as follows: WEST 

(Biological Resources), Harvey Economics 

(socio-economics, land use and recreation), and 

Wenck (Air Quality). Having developed the 

existing Natural Resource Land Use Plan, 

WEST and HE are familiar with the document 

content and where the data presented originated 



Campbell County Natural Resource Land Use Plan 

 

 9 April 28, 2020 

adding efficiencies to this process. WEST and 

HE will provide up to two additional resource 

analyses for new topics as determined in Task 

2 by the Board of Commissioners.  

 

Wenck has conducted several air quality 

projects in Campbell County and is familiar 

with the data that is presented in the existing 

plan. At this point, we assume Wenck will only 

need to update the air quality data found in 

Appendix B of the existing document. This data 

will be updated with the most current ten year 

dataset.  

 

Greg will conduct a final review of the policy, 

goal and objective statements for their 

applicability and legal accuracy.  

 

A Preliminary Draft document will be provided 

to the Board of Commissioners for one round 

of edits and revisions. After the review is 

completed, Gretchen will participate in a call 

with the Board of Commissioners to discuss 

any final revisions to the Draft document to be 

released for public review. 

 

Task 4. Second Public Meeting 

The WEST Team will not be participating in 

the public workshops as determined through 

contract negoiations.  

 

Task 5. Final Document Production 

When the public comment period closes 

Gretchen will conduct a call with the Board of 

Commissioners to discuss any final revisions 

that are necessary based on the input from the 

public at the meeting or through written 

comments. At this point, we assume there will 

be general support for the changes and no major 

alterations will be require.  

 

The WEST Team will make final minor edits 

to the document and provide a Final document 

to the Board of Commissioners for a final 

review. Upon approval of the final edits, the 

Board of Commissioners will announce to the 

public the availability of the Final document 

which will initiate a 30 day review period after 

which the Board of Commissioners will adopt 

the Final Campbell County Natural Land Use 

Plan. 

 

 



 Converse County Natural Resource Plan 

 

 10 April 28, 2020 

 

 

Timeline 

We developed a schedule that would allow the Board of Commissioners to adopt the Final Campbell 

County Natural Resource Land Use Plan no later than June 20, 2021. This timeline is a projection to 

achieve that goal. However, at the onset of the project, we can discuss the schedule and adjust the 

review periods to ensure sufficient time is provided for the Board of County Commissioner reivews. 

Additionally, this schedule assumes the Covid-19 is no longer affecting our social interactions.  

 

Task Date 
Project Initiation 5/1/20 

Task 1. Document Review and Scope Confirmation.  

Review document 5/1/20 -5/15/20 

Conference call with the Board of Commissioners 5/15/20 

Task 2. Public Workshop  

Public workshop 6/8/20 

Scoping comment period closes  6/30/20 

Conference call with Board of Commissioners to discuss public 
comments  

7/6/20 

Task 3. Document Revisions   

WEST Team revises document 7/9 – 9/1/20 

Board of Commissioners review Draft document  9/1/20 - 10/1/20 

WEST Team makes final edits to Draft 10/1/20 – 10/15/20 

Release Draft document to public  10/16/20 

Task 4. Second Public Meeting   

Public meeting 10/28/20 

Comment period on Draft plan closes 11/16/20 

Task 5. Final Document Production  

Conference call with Board of Commissioners to discuss public 
comments 

11/19/20 

WEST Team makes final revisions 11/19/20 – 12/14/20 

Board of Commissioners reviews final changes to the document 12/14/20 – 1/21/21 

Announcement of Availability of Final Campbell County Natural 
Resource Land Use Plan 

1/22/21 

Comment Period closes for Final Campbell County Natural 
Resource Land Use Plan 

2/18/21 

Board of Commissioners adopts Campbell County Natural 
Resource Land Use Plan  

2/25/21 

 



Campbell County Natural Resource Land Use Plan 

 

 11 April 28, 2020 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

Attachment A – Resumes of Key Personnel 



 
 Gretchen Norman, Ecologist/Project Manager 

 
PROFESSIONAL EXPERIENCE 

 2005-Present Ecologist/Project Manager, Western EcoSystems Technology, Inc., 
Cheyenne, Wyoming 

 2000-2005 Environmental Consultant, DDL Omni Engineering, White Sands Missile 
Range, New Mexico 

 2000 Environmental Consultant, Walcoff and Associates, Inc., White Sands 
Missile Range, New Mexico 

 1997-1999 Sr. Environmental Scientist, Walcoff and Associates, Inc., White Sands 
Missile Range, New Mexico 

 1993-1997 Environmental Scientist/Range Ecologist, Cortez III Service Corp., White 
Sands Missile Range, New Mexico 

 1991-1993 Graduate Assistant, New Mexico State University, Las Cruces, New Mexico 

EDUCATION 
M.S. 
New Mexico State University 
Las Cruces, New Mexico 
1993 
Range Science 
 
B.A.  
The Colorado College 
Colorado Springs, Colorado 
1989 
Biology 
 
SCIENTIFIC ORGANIZATION 
MEMBERSHIPS 
National Association of  
Environmental Professionals 
(NAEP) 
 
Member of the NAEP National 
NEPA Practice Group 
 
ADDITIONAL TRAINING 
U.S. Army Corps of Engineers 
Training Course - Environmental 
Impact Assessment 

SPECIALTY AREAS 
National Environmental Policy Act: Gretchen is a trained rangeland ecologist who has 
been involved in National Environmental Policy Act (NEPA) compliance for most of her 
professional career. Gretchen served as project manager or assistant project manager on a 
variety of NEPA projects for various industries including oil and gas, transportation, land 
conveyance, wind energy, agriculture, municipal water, and large scale water supply projects. 
She has worked with the Army Corps of Engineers, Bureau of Land Management, US Fish 
and Wildlife Service, National Park System, US Department of Agriculture, US Department 
of Defense, Wyoming Department of Transportation, Western Area Power Administration, 
Bonneville Power Administration on NEPA projects. She has experience in preparing all 
levels of NEPA documents and is adept at locating existing data, analyzing data in relation 
to potential impacts from proposed actions and alternatives, and recommending mitigation 
measures to minimize potential impacts.  

Large Scale Project Management: Gretchen specializes in large-scale projects at WEST 
utilizing her NEPA experience and education to track multiple aspects associated with 
complex projects. Her education in biology and rangeland ecology provides a foundation for 
her to evaluate various biological aspects involved in a project. Gretchen's NEPA experience 
provides her with the ability develop productive relationships with staff, sub-contractors and 
agency personnel to ensure large-scale project remain on track and communication is 
maintained between all personnel. 

Relevant Project Experience: 
Amended Campbell County Natural Resource Land Use Plan: Gretchen assembled 

and managed a team of resource specialists to assist the Campbell County Board of 
Commissioners in amending their Natural Resource Land Use Plan. The resource 
specialists provided narrative regarding existing environment. Gretchen drafted the 
vegetation; soils; weeds pests and invasive species; and predator sections. WEST 
established a GIS database with data specific for Campbell County and generated maps 
utilized in the document. The Commissioners adopt the document June 2016. 

Advisor to Board of Commissioners in Converse County: The Casper BLM Field Office 
requested the Converse County Board of to participate as a Cooperating Agency in the 
NEPA process for the Converse County Oil and Gas Programmatic EIS. The Board of 
Commissioners retained Gretchen as a NEPA advisor for this project. Gretchen was 
responsible for providing the Board of Commissioners with information as requested; 
reviewing the NEPA process and documents to ensure the County interests are 
considered; making recommendations to the Board; and seeking support from other 
resource specialists as necessary. Gretchen identified and contracted a team of 
specialists to assist in this project. The team provided input during the scoping process; 
participated in the alternative screening workshops organized by the BLM; and reviewed 
the Draft Programmatic EIS. 

Environmental Assessments for Chesapeake Operating LLC in Converse County, 
Wyoming: 
Gretchen has prepared EAs for Chesapeake Operating LLC to exercise their lease rights 
to drill wells north of Douglas, Wyoming. Gretchen evaluated the construction, operation 



 
and completion of these rights in an Applicant-prepared EA for the Casper BLM Field 
Office.  

Wyoming Pipeline Corridor Initiative EIS: Gretchen was the Project Manager for the 
preparation of four technical reports that will be used by the Wyoming Pipeline Authority 
(WPA) to prepare an EIS for the proposed pipeline corridor initiative project. The project 
proposed to establish 1,150 miles of pipeline corridors on primarily BLM lands crossing 
most Wyoming counties and involves nine BLM field offices. WEST conducted 
comparative analyses and suggest mitigation measures for water, vegetation, wildlife, 
fisheries and aquatic resources.  

USFWS EA for the Issuance of an ETP/ECP. Gretchen is managing the NEPA process 
for issuing an Eagle Take Permit (ETP) for an existing wind energy project located in 
Converse County, Wyoming. The EA is tiered to the Final Programmatic Environmental 
Impact Statement for the Eagle Rule Revision, December 2016. A preliminary draft of 
the EA was submitted to the USFWS in early December 2019 for review.  

Other Wyoming Project Experience: 
Silver Lake Irrigation District Dam Rehabilitation and Watershed Plan Environmental 

Assessment: Gretchen is the NEPA Project Manager for the Silver Lake Irrigation 
District dam rehabilitation project in Wyoming. The proposed action involves stabilizing a 
deteriorating dam. The reservoir is located in USFS Wilderness Area and involves both 
the USFS and the NRCS. This project is in the initial phases.  

New Fork Lake Irrigation District Dam Reconstruction for Increased Water Supply 
Environmental Assessment: Gretchen is the project manager for the NEPA process to 
evaluate the lowering of the outlet structure on an existing dam. Lowering the outlets 
would result in accessing water previously unavailable this increasing the supply in the 
reservoir. This project is in Wyoming and located on the USFS land.  

Westside Irrigation District (WID) Environmental Impact Statement (EIS): WEST was 
the lead contractor for the preparation of the EIS for a land transfer from the Worland 
BLM Field Office, Wyoming to the Westside Irrigation District. Gretchen joined this 
project to serve as the primary author for the biological sections of the EIS including the 
vegetation, wildlife, and species of concern, and was responsible for compiling the 
Preliminary Draft and Draft EIS documents, distribute the documents, address all 
comments submitted during the review process, and prepare the Final EIS. At the 
request of the BLM, she drafted the Record of Decision that was signed April 2011. 

Other Large Scale Project Experience: 
Halligan Water Supply Project EIS: The City of Fort Collins, Colorado is seeking a CWA 

404(b)(1) permit for the proposed enlargement of the Halligan Reservoir. WEST leads 
the Third-Party Contractor (3PC) team hired by the US Army Corps of Engineers 
(USACE) to prepare the EIS. Gretchen is the project manager and in this capacity she 
maintains the workflow among the 3PC team, participates in discussions with the 
USACE regarding scope and protocols for resource analyses, tracks the schedule, 
coordinates the 3PC team members, reviews documents, and oversees the 
development of the Draft EIS including preparing resource sections based on the 
Technical Reports. She assisted in selecting the methodologies for evaluating impacts 
related to vegetation, wildlife, and species of concern. The Draft EIS was released 
November 22, 2019. 

Western Area Power Administration (WAPA) Interconnect for Banner County Wind 
Environmental Assessment (EA) and Environmental Impact Statement (EIS) – 
Nebraska. Orion Wind Resources LLC proposes to construct the Banner County Wind 
Project in Nebraska. The EA Project would generate up to 115 mega-watts, with 
potential to expand up to 230 mega-watts under and EIS, and would interconnect to 
WAPA's existing Round Top-Stegall 115kV transmission line. Gretchen is the Project 
Manager for this EA and EIS.  

 



 

 

 
 

YEARS EXPERIENCE 

Total 47 

At Harvey       

Economics 18 

 

EDUCATION 

MSBA, Economics, 

University of Denver 

BA, Economics, 

University of Denver 

 

PROFESSIONAL 

AFFILIATIONS 

Colorado Commission 
for Judicial 
Performance 
 
AWWA 
 
AWRA 
 
Colorado Water 
Congress 
 
American Planning 
Association 
   

LOCATION 

Denver, CO 
  
 

Edward Harvey, Harvey Economics 

Ed Harvey has devoted the bulk of his career to studying the economic effects 
of energy, water, mineral and environmental resource changes in the western 
U.S. During his 45-year career, his primary focus has been on economic 
feasibility and impact, economic and demographic forecasting, resource 
economics and site assessment studies in the western United States.  

Select Project Experience 

Campbell County Socioeconomic Monitoring System, Wyoming. For the 

Campbell County Monitoring Association, Mr. Harvey designed and implemented a 

comprehensive socioeconomic monitoring program to evaluate impacts of energy industry 

expansion. Mr. Harvey projected impacts and financial effects of 13 mines, several power 

plants, oil and gas development and related activities in the Powder River Basin.  

Industrial Siting Permit Applications, Wyoming. Mr. Harvey performed the 

socioeconomic studies for eight Wyoming Industrial Permit Applications. These included 

applications for coal mines, power plants and energy conversion facilities For each 

Application, he examined demographic, economic, social and financial conditions and 

potential changes to towns, counties and the state.  

Wyoming River Basin Planning. Mr. Harvey directed the socioeconomic and water 

demand projections for original basin plans or updates for five Wyoming river basins 

(Platte, Wind/ Bighorn, Bear, Snake/ Salt and Green). HE thoroughly examines the each 

basic economic sector and the driving forces behind each; analysis of the energy sector is 

key to the basin planning efforts. HE’s work included an analysis of current water 

demands and projections for irrigated agriculture, M&I, industrial, including power 

generation, and recreation and environmental water use.  

Converse County Oil and Gas EIS Support, Wyoming. Mr. Harvey provided 

support services to the Converse County Board of Commissioners related to the 

development of an EIS focused on potential large scale regional oil and gas development. 

He participated in meetings with the BLM regarding alternatives development and led the 

development of an additional alternative. An evaluation of potential socioeconomic, 

recreation and land use impacts was completed and a potential approach to mitigation 

and monitiring was designed.  

 

Socioeconomic Analyses for Environmental Assessments (EAs) Environmental Impact 
Statements (EISs), Colorado, Arizona and Texas. Mr. Harvey has led socioeconomic, recreation and 

land use impact analyses for EAs and EISs led by the US Army Corps of Engineers, Bureau of Land 

Management, Bureau of Reclamation and National Park Service. That work evaluates changes in economic, 

demographic, social, recreational and land use resources resulting from an applicant’s proposed actions and 

other alternatives. Coordination with federal agencies, other resource consultants and other stakeholder groups 

is an important part of this work. Analyses address many topics, including construction benefits, tourism impacts, 

public facility and social service impacts, fiscal impacts, agriculture, energy resources and land use changes. 

 



 

 
YEARS EXPERIENCE 

Total 16 

At Harvey  

Economics  14 

 

EDUCATION 

MS, Forest Economics, 

Colorado State 

University 

BS, Forest 

Management, 

University of Vermont 

 

PROFESSIONAL 

AFFILIATIONS 

AWRA 
 
Colorado Water 
Congress 
   

LOCATION 

Denver, CO 
  
 

Susan H. Walker, Harvey Economics 

Ms. Walker’s work focuses on planning endeavors related to water, energy, 
agriculture and other natural resource sectors. Her project experience 
includes socioeconomic impact analysis, demand projections, cost – benefit 
analysis, project financing and resource valuation. She is an expert at 
economic and demographic research and analysis. Ms. Walker has completed 
work for municipalities, utilities, special districts and private industry, as well 
as county, state and federal agencies across the West.  

Relevant Project Experience 

Campbell County Land Use Plan, Wyoming. Ms. Walker developed the 

economic and recreational components of the County’s existing land use plan. That work 

addressed County goals, policies and objectives in regard to economic activity, private 

property rights, recreational land uses and interactions between the county and state or 

federal agencies. The updated land use plan provides support for each of the county’s 

policies and includes data about current economic conditions and recreational activities.      

Converse County Oil and Gas EIS, Wyoming. The Converse County Board of 

Commissioners engaged Harvey Economics to support them on this EIS, focused on the 

impacts of large-scale regional oil and gas development. Ms. Walker identified a wide 

range of socioeconomic characteristics likely to be affected by development activities, 

from housing availability and price to the demand and cost for public services; she also 

identified potential changes to regional land use patterns and recreational activity.  

Glendo Reservoir Cost - Benefit Study, Wyoming. Working for the Wyoming 

Water Development Commission, Ms. Walker quantified the economic costs and benefits 

associated with re-operation of Glendo Reservoir. She evaluated costs and benefits to 

recreational amenities and State Park visitation; hydropower generation; agricultural 

productivity and access to irrigation water supplies; and environmental amenities.  

 

Platte River Basin Water Plan Update, Wyoming. Harvey Economics updated portions of the original 

Platte River Basin Plan for the Wyoming Water Development Commission. Ms. Walker developed water demand 

projections under three alternative future scenarios, including high, low and medium population growth and water 

use scenarios. She created a profile of current economic and demographic conditions, researched future outlook 

scenarios for each of the Basin’s important economic sectors and projected water demands for each scenario.   

Solar Energy Facility Benefits Study, Wyoming. Ms. Walker completed an evaluation of the 

socioeconomic effects of a commercial solar power generation facility to be developed in Sweetwater County. 

She prepared a baseline socioeconomic conditions report and quantified a wide variety of project outcomes, 

including new employment, generation of state and local tax revenues, impacts to existing industry activity and 

potential changes in local land uses and recreational activity. Her work was incorporated into an Environmental 

Assessment for the BLM and a Conditional Use Permit for review by the Sweetwater County Commissioners.      

Greybull River Watershed Study, Wyoming. Ms. Walker completed economic and financial 

components of this watershed study for the Wyoming Water Development Commission and two local 

Conservation Districts. Ms. Walker worked to identify potential sources of funding for specific watershed 

improvements, including information on eligibility requirements for each source. 



RESUME 

1 

KENDALL C. NECKER, CCM 
Senior Project Manager 
 

Ms. Necker is an air quality meteorologist with over 30 years of experience. 

Ms. Necker’s expertise includes dispersion modeling, permitting, emissions 

inventory development, and data management. She has worked with the 

air dispersion models AERMOD and CALPUFF, as well as a variety of other 

specialty models. She has performed both Class I and Class II analyses, as 

well as hazardous air pollutant analyses. Her air permitting experience 

involves minor sources, major sources, synthetic minors and Title V. Ms. 

Necker has developed emission inventories for various industries including 

coal and hard rock mining, manufacturing, grain ethanol, and gas 

compressor stations. Ms. Necker has managed data for both 

meteorological and air quality parameters, and has developed databases 

and spreadsheet systems for various applications. 

 

 

EDUCATION 

Metropolitan State College, Denver, CO 

BS, Meteorology 

 

 

SELECTED EXPERIENCE 

 

Senior Air Quality Meteorologist – Trona Mines – Confidential Client, 

Wyoming 

The project involved an AERMOD modeling analysis to identify potential 

locations for sulfur dioxide (SO2) monitors that would be used assess 

regional ambient air quality compliance. The model involved multiple 

Trona plants and emissions. Developed a FORTRAN program to process 

output results to determine locations that had both the highest frequency 

and highest impacts to isolate potential monitoring locations. A report was generated describing the process and 

results for submittal to the state agency. 

 

Senior Air Quality Meteorologist – Coal Mine – Confidential Client, Wyoming 

Performed wind analysis of on-site meteorological data to determine placement of particulate samplers to capture 

impacts from mine activities for a Wyoming coal mine. The analysis was based on high wind events, wind flow regime 

and placement feasibility. 

 

Senior Air Quality Meteorologist – Coal Mine – Confidential Client, Wyoming 

The project involved a culpability evaluation for a measured exceedance of particulate matter at a monitor located at 

a coal mine in relation to a regional wildfire. The project involved running the meteorological model Weather 

Research and Forecasting (WRF) and employing that data to run CALPUFF in the near field. The output from CALPUFF 

tracked the plumes generated by the fire to show impacts on the monitor. A presentation was generated for the 

client to present to the agency.  

 

Air Quality Meteorologist – Steel Mill - Confidential Client, Colorado 

The project involved Title V permits for three separately-managed portions of a steel mill. For each portion, an 

emissions inventory was generated based on sources and production levels to compare against Title V permitting 

thresholds. Report summaries and permit applications were generated and submitted. 

 

 
 

AREAS OF EXPERTISE 

Dispersion modeling 

(AERMOD and CALPUFF) 

Emissions inventory 

development 

Data management 

Excel 

 

CERTIFICATIONS 

Certified Consulting 

Meteorologist (CCM) #633 

 

PROFESSIONAL 

MEMBERSHIPS 

Air & Waste Management 

Association 

American Meteorological 

Society 



RESUME 

1 

GARY GARMAN 
Senior Environmental Project Manager 
 

Mr. Garman joined Wenck Associates in July 2019. He specializes in air 

permitting, air quality dispersion modeling, emission inventories, and the 

development of fugitive dust emission factors. He is a degreed scientist with 

over 30 years of professional experience in the environmental sciences. He is 

responsible for modeling and permitting of stationary sources, particularly 

those in the mining industry. Other duties include data analysis and quality 

assurance. He has also been responsible for installing, calibrating, and 

auditing air quality and meteorological monitoring systems.  

 

 

EDUCATION 

Kansas State University 

BS, Biology 

 

 

SELECTED EXPERIENCE 

 

McVehil-Monnett Associates, Greenwood Village, CO – Vice President, 

Senior Environmental Scientist 

 Completed dozens of air permit applications for surface mining 

operations in Wyoming, Colorado, Montana, Alaska and Arizona 

 Prepared Title V applications and renewals for mining and mineral processing facilities 

 Provided air quality technical support for Environmental Assessments and Environmental Impact Statements 

 Performed ISC and AERMOD modeling in support of numerous state permitting and NEPA actions 

 Provided third-party review of modeling efforts and for an Australian surface mining emission factor study 

 Developed Title V and minor source emission inventories for various industrial clients 

 Assisted with toxic tort litigation cases that assessed impacts to nearby residents 

 Crew chief on a multi-year study to develop site-specific particulate emission factors at a surface coal mine 

 Installed, calibrated, and/or audited air quality and meteorological monitoring equipment at many locations 

throughout the USA and at numerous sites in Mexico and Peru 

 Conducted testing programs at several industrial agriculture facilities to develop site-specific particulate 

emission factors from paved road traffic 

 Participated in a field program to characterize dust emissions from ship and barge grain handling operations 

 Assisted on a study to determine the efficiencies of various road dust suppressants 

 Participated in a study to characterize dust emissions and particle size distributions from dust brownout 

clouds created by helicopters in support of a program to develop “see-through” technology 

 

Midwest Research Institute, Kansas City, MO – Environmental Scientist 

 Crew chief on numerous field studies to develop particulate emission factors and evaluate particulate control 

technologies at steel plants, agricultural operations, construction sites, and from paved and unpaved roads 

 Crew chief on a multi-year field evaluation of surface coal mine emission factors and dispersion modeling as 

required by Section 234 of the 1990 CAAA 

 Crew chief on a multi-facility test program to develop emission factors and study the control efficiency of oil 

suppression at grain elevators  

 Led field testing on a study in Colorado to characterize particulate emissions generated from winter road 

sanding 

 

 

 
 

AREAS OF EXPERTISE 

Air Permitting 

Air Quality Dispersion 

Modeling 

Emission Inventories 

Development of Fugitive 

Dust Emission Factors 

 

CERTIFICATIONS 

MSHA Surface Miner 

EPA Method 9 



M. GREGORY WEISZ (GREG) 
Pence and MacMillan LLC 

1720 Carey Avenue, Suite 600 
Cheyenne, WY 82001 

(307) 638-0386 
 

Professional & Employment 
 
Attorney at Law 
 Pence and MacMillan LLC 
 Laramie, Wyoming 
 March 1997 to present 
 Member/Partner since 2000 
 Managing Member 
 

• General civil practice.  Practice emphasis in the following areas: 
o Easement and right-of-way acquisition, real estate litigation, real estate transactions, 

zoning and land use, construction law, business entities, natural resources,  
o Representation of governmental and institutional clients 
o General civil litigation 

 Practice before federal, state and local administrative agencies 
 Administrative appeals of agency decisions 

 
Attorney at Law 
 Budd-Falen Law Offices 
 Cheyenne, Wyoming 
 September 1995 to February 1997 
 

• Associate with law firm emphasizing natural resources law, public lands litigation, 
  environmental law, and administrative law 
• Practice in front of federal administrative agencies, including administrative appeals,

 administrative adjudication, and federal rulemaking commentary 
 
Attorney Licensure: Wyoming; Colorado; United States District Court Wyoming; United States District 
Court Colorado; United States Court of Appeals for the Tenth Circuit; Court of Federal Claims  
 
Non-Legal Employment 
 

• Crew Supervisor, Louisiana-Pacific Corporation 
o Shift foreman at waferboard plant in Kremmling, Colorado 

• Consulting Forester 
o Self-employed consulting forester in Dillon, Colorado 

• Contract Forester 
o Timber inventory and insect/disease control inventory on contract basis for U.S. Forest 

Service 
• Other 

o Resort condominium property manager 
o Ranch laborer 
o Water treatment plant worker 

 



Professional Services Contract   6 | P a g e  
 

Attachment “B” 



 

 1 April 27, 2020 

 

Campbell County 

Natural Resource 

Land Use Plan 

Update – Budget 

Estimate 
 

 

  



 

 1 April 27, 2020 

 

Task Hours Personnel Direct Expenses Total 

Task 1. Document Review and Scope Confirmation 48 $8,800 $0 $8,800 

Task 2. Public Workshop 0 $0 $0 $0 

Task 3. Document Revisions 217 $32,760 $0 $32,760 

Task 4. Second Public Meeting  $0 $0 $0 

Task 5. Final Document Production 68 $7,880 $0 $7,880 

Total 333 $49,440 $0 $49,440 

 

Budget details are provided on the following page. 

 

Assumptions used to develop this proposal and budget are as follows: 

 

We anticipate that each review will generate comments that are considered to be minor to moderate. 

Minor to moderate comments include technical edits, rewording of sentences and possible 

reorganization of the content presentation. Major comments include additional analysis or inclusion of 

data provided during the reviews. Major comments would be considered out of scope with this proposal 

as well as preparing additional versions of the document. 

 

We limited the involvement of our team members on conference calls with the Board of 

Commissioners to reduce costs. The request for other team members beyond those identified in the 

proposal to participate in any conference call would be considered out of scope with this proposal.  

 

We assumed only two new topics would need to be included in the resource analyses section of the 

existing document. A request for more than two topics to be included in the plan, as a result of the 

review with the Board of Commissioners in Task 1 or the public workshop, would be considered out 

of scope with this proposal.  

 

We assumed only the air quality Appendix B data would require update and not the information 

presented in Chapter 3. Updating Chapter 3 data would be considered out of scope with this proposal.  

 

We assume our team will not be required to participate in Tasks 2 and 4. The Board of Commissioners 

will conduct the public workshops and provide the feedback to the team.    

 

 The cost estimate does not include any in person meetings. 



 

 

 

  

Task 1. Document 
Review and Scope 

Confirmation 
Task 2. Public 

Workshop 
Task 3. Document 

Revisions 
Task 4. Second 
Public Meeting 

Task 5. Final 
Document 
Production 

LABOR EXPENSE  

  

        

WEST            

Personnel Rate Hours Cost Hours Cost Hours Cost Hours Cost Hours Cost 

Gretchen Norman $130 32 $4,160 0 $0 8 $1,040 0 $0 24 $3,120 

Casi Lathan $85 0 $0 0 $0 40 $3,400 0 $0 0 $0 

Elizabeth Lack $110 0 $0 0 $0 20 $2,200 0 $0 0 $0 

Andrea Palochak $90 0 $0 0 $0 20 $1,800 0 $0 40 $3,600 

WEST Total Labor  32 $4,160 0 $0 88 $8,440 0 $0 64 $6,720 

            

Harvey Economics            

Personnel Rate Hours Cost Hours Cost Hours Cost Hours Cost Hours Cost 

Ed Harvey $235 0 $0 0 $0 5 $1,175 $0 $0 $0 $0 

Susan Walker $200 0 $0 0 $0 40 $8,000 $0 $0 $0 $0 

Kegan Reiswig $165 0 $0 0 $0 15 $2,475 $0 $0 $0 $0 

Cae Dornfeld  $70 0 $0 0 $0 5 $350 $0 $0 $0 $0 

HE Total Labor      65 $12,000     

            

Wenck            

Personnel Rate Hours Cost Hours Cost Hours Cost Hours Cost Hours Cost 

Greg Garman $170 0 $0 0 $0 22 $3,740 0 $0 0 $0 

Kendal Necker $170 0 $0 0 $0 30 $5,100 0 $0 0 $0 

Skylor Wade $180 0 $0 0 $0 6.4 $1,152 0 $0 0 $0 

Wenck Total Labor      56 $9,992     

            

Pence & MacMillan            

Greg Weisnz $290 16 $4,640 0 $0 8 $2,320 0 $0 4 $1,160 
Pence & MacMillan Total 

Labor 16 $4,640 0 $0 8 $2,320 0 0 4 1,160 

            



 

 

DIRECT EXPENSES Rate 
No. 

Units Cost 
No. 

Units Cost 
No. 

Units Cost 
No. 

Units Cost 
No. 

Units Cost 

Lodging $150  $0  $0  $0  $0  $0 
Per Diem (check 
current/location 
rates for accuracy) $51  $0  $0  $0  $0  $0 
Rental Car (1/2 ton 
pick-up truck) - Daily $83  $0  $0  $0  $0  $0 

Mileage  $1  $0  $0  $0  $0  $0 

5% Tech   $0  $0  $0  $0  $0 

Total Expenses   $0  $0  $0  $0  $0 

5%            
Total Cost - Labor and Expense 48 $8,800 0 $0 217 $32,760 0 $0 68 $7,880 

  



 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 



 

*Individuals wishing to provide public comment are asked to sign in prior to the start of the meeting, provide 
contact information and the topic(s) to be discussed. 

 
 
The following page(s) contain the backup material for Agenda Item: 10:40 Improvement Agreement & Letter of 
Credit, Ft. Union Industrial Park 



 

Engineering   Building    Planning    Surveying  Solid Waste  Facilities  

 
 

 

 

    

    

TO:    Campbell County Board of Commissioners 

 

FROM:   Megan Nelms, AICP, Planner and Zoning Administrator 

 

DATE:   June 8, 2020 

 

SUBJECT:  Ft. Union Industrial Park – Improvements Agreement & Letter of 

Credit  

     

Case Number:  17.01 COSP 

         

Summary: On October 15, 2019 the County approved an extension and allowed the 

applicant, Green Bridge Holdings, LLC, to enter into a new Subdivision Improvements 

Agreement. Green Bridge Holdings, LLC provided an associated Irrevocable Letter of 

Credit (#555) to guarantee the installation of certain public improvements within the Ft. 

Union Industrial Park, as outlined in ‘Exhibit A’. The new Improvements Agreement 

specified that all improvements shall be installed, constructed and completed by June 15, 

2020.  

 

The Public Works Department has not received notice of completion of said 

improvements by the applicant. Inspection made by Public Works Engineering on June 

8, 2020 found the work incomplete.   

 

Staff Recommendation: Staff recommends the Board take action to obtain funds from 

the Irrevocable Letter of Credit to complete the required improvements and to recover 

the cost thereof.  



























 

*Individuals wishing to provide public comment are asked to sign in prior to the start of the meeting, provide 
contact information and the topic(s) to be discussed. 

 
 
The following page(s) contain the backup material for Agenda Item: 10:45 District Support Grant, Little Thunder 
I&S  



ZV----Y—N 
Campbell County 

w y 0 rn I n g 

Department of Public Works - Engineering Division Kevin C. King, RE., Director 
500 S. Gillette Avenue, Suite 1400 Gillette, WY 82716 I 307-685-8061 Office I 307-687-6468 Fax 

DISTRICT SUPPORT GRANT MEMORANDUM 
SECTION 1 - General 

FROM: Kevin C. King, P.E., Public Works Executive Director  

TO: Board of County Commissioners 

SUBJECT: District Support Grant Application From: 

DATE: 6/10/2020 

Little Thunder l&S has submitted a District Support Grant application 
for costs associated with the formation of their 

$5,979 

Little Thunder l&S 

in the amount of 
District 

SECTION 2 - Grant Type and Priority District Formation/Enlargement, Priority 1 

SECTION 3 - Costs and Eligibility Enlargement Eligible? No 

Total Formation Cost: $5,979 

Total Number of District Lots: 193 

Total allowable grant over a 5-yr period: 193 lots @ 

Total amount of Grants approved over current 5-yr period: 

Total amount not subject to $1500/lot limitation 

Remaining Grant eligibility this current 5-yr period: 

Current Fiscal Year Awards $ - 

Remaining Eligibility this Fiscal Year $ 50,000 O.K. 

$1,500 $ 250,000  

$ -  

$ -  

$ 250,000 

O.K. 

SECTION 4 - Compliance 

Little Thunder l&S is a newly formed District 

SECTION 5 - Analysis District Formation/Enlargement, Priority 1 

(PR-1) 100%, up to $4500 max 

% Total Grant Item 

100 $ 5,979.00 $ 4,500.00 $4500 maximum grant 

50 $ - $ - 

33 $ - $ - 

25 $ 

Totals $ 5,979 $ 4,500 1 

SECTION 6 -Bills Received 

Company Total Notes: 

1 PCA Engineering $ 3,500 

2 
Stevens, Edwards, Hallock & 
Caprpenter $ 2,479 

Total Formation Cost $ 5,979 

SECTION 7 - Recommendation 

I recommend the Board approve the District Support Grant request from Little Thunder l&S 

Improvement and Service District in an amount not to exceed $ 4,500 

for costs associated with the formation of their District 

Funding History 

5 year $0 

10 year $0 

Since 2011 $0 

Board Approval? $ Date Approved 



Stevens, Edwards, Hallock & Carpenter, P.C. 
Attorneys at Law 

511 S. Kendrick Ave. - PO Box 1148 
Gillette, WY 82717-1148 

(307) 682-1444 

Little Thunder Improvement and Service District 
c/o Justin Dooley, Arrow Langston, Keith Serkinen 
PO Box 1212 
Wright, WY 82732-1212 

August 27, 2019 

Acct# 11661 

Professional Services: 

Amount 

1/4/2019 PEC 

1 /1 1/2019 PEC 

1/15/2019 PEC 

1/18/2019 PEC 

2/1 1/2019 PEC 

5/21/2019 PEC 

6/1 2/2019 PEC 

PEC 

7/22/2019 PEC 

Telephone conference with client / Telephone conference with Megan 

Telephone conference with client and Megan 

Landowner' Consents 1/15/19-1/22/19 

Prepare Petition to form ISD 

Telephone conference with proposed ISD board 

Telephone conference with Adam Shishe with Tall Grass 

Conference with Kendra 

Prepare Letter to Assessor! Dept. of Revenue 

E-mail exchange with CC Clerk 

110.00 

82.50 

1,000.00 

550.00 

137.50 

55.00 

68.75 

206.25 

68.75 

FEES: $2,278.75 



Little Thunder Improvement and Service District Page 2 

Acct# 11661 

Expenses: 

Amount 

6/12/2019 Filing fees ck# 15743 200.00 
COSTS: $200.00 

Current charges: $2,478.75 

Balance due: $2,478.75 



Invoice PCA Engineering, Inc. 
P.O. Box 2185 

4506 Wigwam Blvd. 
Gillette, WY 82717-2185 

 

Project Manager Sheila Slocum 

Arrow Langston 
Little Thunder District 
Gillette, WY 82716 

April 7, 2020 
Invoice No: 21924 

Project 203872.002 Little Thunder District Map 
Professional Services from March 1, 2020 to April 4, 2020  

Phase 100 Map & Legals 

Total Fee 3,500.00 

Percent Complete 100.00 Total Earned 
Previous Fee Billing 
Current Fee Billing 
Total Fee 

3,500.00 
0.00 

3,500.00 

Total this Phase 

Total this Invoice 

3,500.00 

$3,500.00 

$3,500.00 

PAYMENT DUE UPON RECEIPT OF INVOICE 



ZN-Z  
Campbell County 

DISTRICT SUPPORT GRANT APPLICATION 

District Nameda,(Aileil c:50/M2g #66euested Amount:  't.5979  

Mailing Address:  Po &-/K 81 3 6,10,,, /Aix 8 Z7 /7  

kid to Lerii,543)/)  

Day Time Phone: 36 '219-  g3  
Application is requesting financial assistance Yes X No  
to form a District? 

Applicant is requesting financial assistance for Yes No  
connection to regional water? 

Is the project anticipated to be complete in the next 18 months? Yes  X No  

Description of proposed project: (Include engineering reports, portion to be funded by grant, etc.) 
takUCr 3(AVVe3  

Total project cost (estimated) (itemize on separate sheet):  459-79  
Projected start date: Projected completion date:  

Briefly describe why the project is needed: 

Governing Board members: to (A_..\ LeLA (WO ill XI/LC (: /1 ( 0-(66Y1  066(aje 
Acreage (approximate) of district or proposed district:  10,S mcia5 CYF iro  

Date of district formation (if applicable)  

Number of lots: 15  

Population of District:  

Ratio of Developed and undeveloped land:  

Is area legally platted? 

District boundary map included?  

Is District Zoned? If so, what is it zoned? t6(2-InAlk4 NritYl/larid  aft alS°̀  

Is District in compliance with the Elections Office? (Submit letter of compliance).  440  

Revised November201 3 

Contact Person: 



FINANCIAL INFO ATION  
Current Mill Levy for the Subdivision 

Current Assessed Valuation (County Assessor's Office) $  

Current Indebtedness 

Current Income statement and balance sheet 

Water and sewer rates, tap fees, plant investment fees, association or district dues (Describe) 

Will project generate user fees, charges, other revenues or income revenue? 

Yes  No  

List and describe other potential funding sources: 

Other pending applications for funding: 

Land developers or others whose business ventures will directly benefit from project and funding 
or other assistance requested, received, or pledged from these sources: 

(SEAL) 

Attest: 

Secretary 

Revised November 2013 



Charity D. Stewart 

From: 
Sent: 
To: 
Cc: 
Subject: 

hIcathey@collinscom.net  
Thursday, June 4, 2020 4:53 PM 
Charity D. Stewart 
Arrow Langston 
FW: Little Thunder Road Service District 

Charity, 

Here is the list of directors and officers for Little Thunder Improvement & Service District. 

Helenanne Cathey 
Cathey Consulting, LLC 
PO Box 471 
400 South Gillette Avenue, Suite 106 
(1<2 Technologies Building - office entrance is on 4th Street across from Arrow Printing) 
Gillette, WY 82717 
307-685-8235 (phone) 
307-682-1187 (fax) 
hicathey@collinscom.net  
www.catheyconsulting.net  

From: arrow langston <langston82732@yahoo.com> 
Sent: Thursday, June 4, 2020 4:35 PM 
To: hIcathey@collinscom.net  
Subject: Little Thunder Road Service District 

Hello, 
How do I turn this in to Charity at the elections office? Can I just email it to her? 

Little Thunder Road Service District 
Wright WY 

President 
Levi Strohschein 
PO Box 764 
Wright WY 82732 
307-660-6004 

Vice President 
Justin Dooley 



PO Box 1212 
Wright WY 82732 
307-290-0472 

Secretary 
Arrow Langston 
PO Box 724 
Wright WY 82732 
307-299-8324 

2 



lEgERO t I DM 0.11.1. Ottan.D. 

iika...72225/32E1311131 
INC MIL 11423/0211 017210711,13751 NCI URN. Mina IS LOGO. 3 3011110.5 Cf 
mortalts at um 33.114431. 07704 POA113145 or 0001000 2. 4. a MO 11. 4140. WWI or IVIL 6111 00200033 003111, 113133333244. STIlE 122132 04R1011,14.1 .  
MOWED 345 MUM: 
20.5.17 44 710(4134 RN. 72 937131 
- 5C1314 OF $2C11031 34 
- PODIUM OF 5171/4 OF SECTION 35. 3000 0001(1(0 OF 117.6 MP OXON 10 

1194-13 336-350) 

107015110 tc3 DOD, 304110 72 Wei,  
- PCfM531 OF W1/2 OP 5207344 Z001000.6003703 4140 10 400(10430 10 MATS. 

21.3.2 336-330) 
- tV2 Or SECT. 3 
- r1f25131/4 OF 57 ,C11034 3 
- 51/2 Or 3PC11011 10 
- otjavota or ammo to 
- roman or Din or soonottII. ototo nom, Or MO 39 41034 (00341 II PIA% MED 339-353) 

• 13410..35,1 ten 
UTTLE MURDER DIPROVILIEHT 

AND SERVICE DISTRICT DO. DC. CU DWI. DT 01122 CD7-900-6004 
• p A  17351=12113510137 

.211344.112FIAL 111.31P 
547435..3323 .11.  

5.544 533 35 5* 55 33 1543....333 33  
3344,34.3434 5.1231+  

la cr.. ...artaz  
tt arr. 

LITTLE THUNDER 
IMPROVEMENT AND 
SERVICE DISTRICT 

VICINITY MAP 

LITTLE THUNDER IMPROVEMENT AND SERVICE DISTRICT 
BOUNDARY MAP — MARCH, 2020 

— --r - 

a DUIUND • I 

I 

t  -IBSTBR  
FLITS I —411,7,t4 • SUM,

j.   
. 44 art Amps  

- 

_. .1 
t. 

I  

- "I 
_ ' 

, . , NOONAN - - 11 7'7-  '1 1  ,1 SUBDIVISION r • ' • 

sqoxVISION larf,,EL _i 
I 11. 

a 
E 

, 

.r. 

i I 
: IRONBROSS - II - ' i ' : : 

a 1 - i SUBDTSION 1 I , E 
— I 7. 

-- 1 I - --' -- 1.1. : 
I 

, - 3 ......7 
111 i 

▪ -3:.-----3--  ., 
I 3. I 

. 
I 

.! 
I inei`cnoss r.(:',' 

: I - siyiarvisri,7-. z 

liz  ' — ' — ii-''''-1 ,-7J.I'' I — I' _.. . ,.• , , , , 

-1. ' ' . I — ,1",._____• __I :1  

.1. 
- . , 

: 

, . • . ,-''' I I 
iI 

: 

•
1: III 

_ 
i I 

. 
• \ 

. .. ---- - --- - - -----40044  
— — 43- — — — --4.11•0-1, 4.. 1--1-041.'.1 Orti-DI  Hr.. p-tas,1 am ',,,i-Friiira-1-1-ens-t-p.,••=7;a13-V4 1.11... , . 

I 
I . 

i 
I • 

\\. SHEET 1 OF 1 

DISTRICT MAP 

IL 



 

*Individuals wishing to provide public comment are asked to sign in prior to the start of the meeting, provide 
contact information and the topic(s) to be discussed. 

 
 
The following page(s) contain the backup material for Agenda Item: 10:50 Balboa Peaks Software Agreements 































 

*Individuals wishing to provide public comment are asked to sign in prior to the start of the meeting, provide 
contact information and the topic(s) to be discussed. 

 
 
The following page(s) contain the backup material for Agenda Item: 10:55 Consulting Services Agreement, 
Waypoints Wyoming LLC 















 

*Individuals wishing to provide public comment are asked to sign in prior to the start of the meeting, provide 
contact information and the topic(s) to be discussed. 

 
 
The following page(s) contain the backup material for Agenda Item: 11:00 Resolution for Special Prosecution 







 

*Individuals wishing to provide public comment are asked to sign in prior to the start of the meeting, provide 
contact information and the topic(s) to be discussed. 

 
 
The following page(s) contain the backup material for Agenda Item: 11:05 Urban Farming Lease Agreement, 
Westwood Property 











 

*Individuals wishing to provide public comment are asked to sign in prior to the start of the meeting, provide 
contact information and the topic(s) to be discussed. 

 
 
The following page(s) contain the backup material for Agenda Item: 11:30 CARES Act Funding, CSBG 









































































 

*Individuals wishing to provide public comment are asked to sign in prior to the start of the meeting, provide 
contact information and the topic(s) to be discussed. 

 
 
The following page(s) contain the backup material for Agenda Item: 12:00 Order Dismissal Appeals 






































	Home
	Due to the COVID-19 Pandemic crisis, there will be limited seating available in the Commissioners Chambers to allow for proper social distancing. Citizens are encouraged to submit public comment via email to boc@ccgov.net by Noon on June 15th and view the meeting on GPA Channel 192 or through the County website at www.ccgov.net.  

09:00 MEETING CALLED TO ORDER
	PLEDGE OF ALLEGIANCE

	CONSENT AGENDA 
	Consent Agenda
	Min Directors Wkshp 060120.pdf (2 pages)
	Min Regular Mtg 060220.pdf (14 pages)
	Monthly Reports 061620.pdf (9 pages)
	Payroll Payments 061620.pdf (1 page)
	CancellationRebateTaxes 061620.pdf (6 pages)
	ESLB Requests 061620.pdf (3 pages)
	Line Item Transfers 061620.pdf (9 pages)
	Oath of Office 061620.pdf (2 pages)
	Official Bond&Oath 061620.pdf (3 pages)


	PUBLIC COMMENT
	9:05 For the Good of the County*

	OPEN GOVERNMENT
	9:15 County Information 

	REGULAR BUSINESS
	9:20 Funding Request, Save the 4th of July Gillette
	Funding Request-July4th 061620.pdf (1 page)

	9:25 Second Amendment Sanctuary County Resolution
	RES 2nd Amendment Sanctuary County 061620.pdf (2 pages)

	9:30 Certificate of State Aid, 2020 Aviation Encouragement
	2020 Aviation Encouragement 061620.pdf (3 pages)

	9:33 Certificate of State Aid, 2020 Marketing
	2020 Airport Marketing 061620.pdf (3 pages)

	9:35 JAG Supplemental Funding 2018
	JAG Fuding 2018 061620.pdf (4 pages)

	9:40 Position Vacancy Justification, Detention Officer
	PVJ-Detention Officer 061620.pdf (1 page)

	9:45 Position Vacancy Justification, Deputy County Attorney
	PVJ-Deputy Attorney 061620.pdf (1 page)

	9:50 Position Vacancy Justification, Custodian I
	PVJ-Custodian 061620.pdf (2 pages)

	9:55 Position Vacancy Justification, Maintenance Tech
	PVJ-Maintenance Tech 061620.pdf (1 page)

	10:00 Coronavirus Emergency Supplemental Funding Program FY2020
	Coronavirus Emergency Funding 061620.pdf (32 pages)

	10:05 FamCare Contract, Global Vision Technologies
	Global Vision Contract 061620.pdf (30 pages)

	10:10 Contract to Provide Juvenile & Family Drug Court Services
	JFDC State Contract 061620.pdf (37 pages)

	10:15 Contract to Provide Adult Treatment Court Services
	ATC State Contract 061620.pdf (39 pages)


	BREAK
	REGULAR BUSINESS II
	10:25 Chapter 4 Rules Proposed Amendments
	Chpt 4 Proposed Rules 061620.pdf (32 pages)

	10:35  Professional Services Contract, West EcoSystems Technology
	WEST Contract 061620.pdf (32 pages)

	10:40 Improvement Agreement & Letter of Credit, Ft. Union Industrial Park
	Ft. Union LOC 061620.pdf (13 pages)

	10:45 District Support Grant, Little Thunder I&S 
	DSG-Little Thunder 061620.pdf (9 pages)

	10:50 Balboa Peaks Software Agreements
	Balboa Peaks Agmt 061620.pdf (14 pages)

	10:55 Consulting Services Agreement, Waypoints Wyoming LLC
	Waypoints Consulting Agmt 061620.pdf (6 pages)

	11:00 Resolution for Special Prosecution
	Resolution for Special Prosecution 061620.pdf (2 pages)

	11:05 Urban Farming Lease Agreement, Westwood Property
	Urban Farming Lease Agmt 061620.pdf (4 pages)

	11:10 Board Appointments, Childrens Developmental Services Board 
	11:12 Board Appointments, Corrections Board 
	11:14 Board Appointment, Fire Board
	11:16 Board Appointments, Parks & Recreation Board
	11:18 Board Appointments, Planning Commission
	11:20 Board Appointments, Public Health Board
	11:22 Board Appointments, Public Land Board
	11:24 Board Appointment, Public Library Board
	11:26 Board Appointments, Rockpile Museum Board
	11:28 Board Appointment, Senior Center Board
	11:30 CARES Act Funding, CSBG
	CARES Act-CSBG 061620.pdf (35 pages)

	11:40 Budget Amendments FY2020-21
	11:35 Adoption of Budget FY2020-21
	11:45 Budget Message FY2020-21

	BOARD OF EQUALIZATION
	12:00 Order Dismissal Appeals
	BOE Memo 061620.pdf (1 page)
	BOE 2020-04 Enerflex061620.pdf (4 pages)
	BOE 2020-05 K2 Technologies 061620.pdf (13 pages)


	ADJOURN 
	Consent Agenda
	MINUTES
	MONTHLY REPORTS
	PAYROLL PAYMENTS
	CANCELLATION/REBATE OF TAXES
	EMERGENCY SICK LEAVE BANK REQUESTS
	CATERING PERMITS
	LINE ITEM TRANSFERS
	OATH OF OFFICE 
	OFFICIAL BOND AND OATH
	HAND WARRANTS


