
 

*Individuals wishing to provide public comment are asked to sign in prior to the start of the meeting, provide 
contact information and the topic(s) to be discussed. 

AGENDA 
 

CAMPBELL COUNTY BOARD OF COMMISSIONERS 
 

DG REARDON, Chairman 
RUSTY BELL 
BOB MAUL 

DEL SHELSTAD 

COLLEEN FABER 

AUGUST 4, 2020 
 

09:00 MEETING CALLED TO ORDER 
 PLEDGE OF ALLEGIANCE 

CONSENT AGENDA  

A. Consent Agenda   

VOUCHERS 

B. Vouchers  

PUBLIC COMMENT 

C. 9:05 For the Good of the County*  

OPEN GOVERNMENT 

D. 9:15 County Information   

REGULAR BUSINESS 

E. 9:20 Board Appointment, Employee Recognition Committee  Allie Buechler 

F. 9:25 Stuart Ranch Tower & Building Space Agreement Sheriff Matheny 

G. 9:30 Service Provider Agreement, Adolescent Substance Abuse Treatment  Jim Lyon 

H. 9:35 Service Provider Agreement, Adult Substance Abuse Treatment Jim Lyon 

I. 9:40 Service Provider Agreement, Individual & Family Treatment Jim Lyon 

J. 9:45 District Support Grant Annual Report FY 2019-20 Kevin King 

K. 9:50 District Support Grant, Rocky Point I&S Kevin King 

L. 9:55 Johnson Simple Subdivision Megan Nelms 

M. 10:00 Congestion Mitigation and Air Quality (CMAQ) Resolution Kevin Geis 

N. 10:05 Tyler Technologies, Historical Index Module  Susan Saunders 

O. 10:10 Mill Levy Report Troy Clements 

PUBLIC HEARING 

P. 10:30 Chapter 4 Proposed Amendments Jed Holder 

REGULAR BUSINESS II 



 

*Individuals wishing to provide public comment are asked to sign in prior to the start of the meeting, provide 
contact information and the topic(s) to be discussed. 

Q. 10:35 Chapter 4 Proposed Amendments Jed Holder 

R. 10:40 Easement Agreement, Donkey Creek Pathway Carol Seeger 

ADJOURN  



 

*Individuals wishing to provide public comment are asked to sign in prior to the start of the meeting, provide 
contact information and the topic(s) to be discussed. 

Consent Agenda 

MINUTES 
Board of Commissioners Regular Meeting, July 21, 2020  
Board of Commissioners Managers Meeting, July 21, 2020  
Board of Commissioners Fire Board Meeting, July 22, 2020  
 

MONTHLY REPORTS 
County Clerk – June 2020  
Treasurer’s Office – June 2020  
 

PAYROLL PAYMENTS 
July 11, 2020 

AGREEMENTS - OPTIONAL ONE PERCENT FY2020-21 
Contract for Services between the Board of Campbell County Commissioners and AVA 
Community Art Center in the amount of $3,600.  
  
Contract for Services between the Board of Campbell County Commissioners and Campbell 
County Conservation District in the amount of $270,000.  
  
Contract for Services between the Board of Campbell County Commissioners and Campbell 
County Healthcare Foundation in the amount of $4,500.  
  
Contract for Services between the Board of Campbell County Commissioners and CLIMB 
Wyoming in the amount of $22,500.  
  
Contract for Services between the Board of Campbell County Commissioners and Boys and 
Girls Club of Campbell County in the amount of $117,000.  
  
Contract for Services between the Board of Campbell County Commissioners and Edible 
Prairie Project in the amount of $6,300.  
  
Contract for Services between the Board of Campbell County Commissioners and Energy 
Capital Economic Development in the amount of $117,000.  
  
Contract for Services between the Board of Campbell County Commissioners and Gillette 
Abuse Refuge Foundation, Inc. (GARF) in the amount of $83,160.  
  
Contract for Services between the Board of Campbell County Commissioners and Gillette 
Main Street in the amount of $4,500.  
  
Contract for Services between the Board of Campbell County Commissioners and Northern 
Community College District on behalf of   
Gillette College in the amount of $795,000 and an additional $5,000 for Area 59 
Memberships for Veterans.  



 

*Individuals wishing to provide public comment are asked to sign in prior to the start of the meeting, provide 
contact information and the topic(s) to be discussed. 

  
Contract for Services between the Board of Campbell County Commissioners and Personal 
Frontiers, Inc in the amount of $27,000.  
  
Contract for Services between the Board of Campbell County Commissioners and Second 
Chance Ministries in the amount of $18,000.  
  
Contract for Services between the Board of Campbell County Commissioners and Visitation 
and Advocacy Center in the amount of $58,500.  
  
Contract for Services between the Board of Campbell County Commissioners and Wright 
Community Assistance in the amount of $7,200.  
  
Contract for Services between the Board of Campbell County Commissioners and Youth 
Emergency Services, Inc. in the amount of $283,500. 

POSITION VACANCY JUSTIFICATIONS 
Children’s Developmental Services – Early Head Start Home Visitor  
Public Works/Facilities Maintenance – Custodian I  
Sheriff’s Office – Detention Officer  
 

HAND WARRANTS 
Campbell County Clerk Tax Account $315,658.40 
 AMOUNT 
Campco Federal Credit Union  276.01  
Campbell County Parks & Recreation Activity Fund 31.00  
Campbell County Treasurer – HSA/FLX 44,052.65  
Great West Trust Company 35,741.66  
Wyoming Child Support 1,688.38  
CCCBT 32,161.13  
CCEHBTA – Health 974,483.58  
CCEHBTA – Dental 42,968.60  
Delta Dental Plan of Wyoming 2,116.40  
Internal Revenue Service 2,998.20  
Wyoming Department of Revenue & Taxation 857.85  
Circuit Court of Campbell County 30.00  
Wyoming Department of Workforce Services – WC 89,516.09  
 
 



 

*Individuals wishing to provide public comment are asked to sign in prior to the start of the meeting, provide 
contact information and the topic(s) to be discussed. 

 
 
The following page(s) contain the backup material for Agenda Item: Consent Agenda 





































































































 

*Individuals wishing to provide public comment are asked to sign in prior to the start of the meeting, provide 
contact information and the topic(s) to be discussed. 

 
 
The following page(s) contain the backup material for Agenda Item: 9:20 Board Appointment, Employee 
Recognition Committee  



 

 

 

 

 

MEMORANDUM 
. . . from H.R./Risk Management  

 

TO: Campbell County Board of Commissioners 

   Daniel Reardon, Chair 

Rusty Bell 

Del Shelstad 

   Robert Maul 

   Colleen Faber 

   

 

FROM: Melissia Kershner 

HR/Risk Management Generalist 

 

DATE: August 18, 2020 

 

SUBJECT: Employee Recognition Committee Appointment 

 

The Campbell County Employee Recognition Committee is comprised of eight members from 

different departments within the County.  The eight members currently serve staggered three-

year terms.  One term was recently vacated by Natalie Linneman on June 30, 2020.  The 

committee has a new nomination from CAM-PLEX to fill the vacancy. 

 

A nomination has been submitted for: 

 

   Tamala Schmidt by ReNae Keuck, CAM-PLEX 

 

I would like to thank all the employees who have served on this very important committee as 

well as the department heads willing to support this committee. 

 

 

 





 

*Individuals wishing to provide public comment are asked to sign in prior to the start of the meeting, provide 
contact information and the topic(s) to be discussed. 

 
 
The following page(s) contain the backup material for Agenda Item: 9:25 Stuart Ranch Tower & Building Space 
Agreement 



 

 

Stuart Ranch Tower and Building Space Agreement 

Campbell County Sheriff 

KCWC-TV/Wyoming Public Broadcasting System 

 

 

THIS AGREEMENT is made and entered into this 1st day of July, 2020, between the 

Campbell County, by and through the Campbell County Sheriff (Sheriff), 600 West Boxelder 

Road, Gillette, Wyoming 82718 and KCWC-TV/Wyoming (PBS), a public television station 

licensed to Central Wyoming College, 2660 Peck Avenue, Riverton, Wyoming 82501.  

 

WHEREAS, Campbell County constructed, operates and maintains a communications 

tower and equipment building situated in Campbell County, Wyoming on property currently leased 

from Ark Land Company pursuant to: Communications Tower Lease Agreement dated May 24, 

2014, as amended between Jacobs Ranch Coal LLC, as successor in interest to Paul R. Stuart as 

Trustee of the Paul R. Stuart Revocable Trust, dated September 18, 1996 and Campbell County 

(Stuart Ranch Tower); 

  

 WHEREAS, PBS retained Tower Engineering Company, 21907 64th Avenue West, Suite  

140, Mountlake Terrace, WA  98043-1198 to perform a structural analysis of the Stuart Ranch  

Tower and feasibility study to determine current and future loading conditions;  

 

WHEREAS, the study is beneficial to the Sheriff’s present and future communications  

operations and PBS’s use of the tower is beneficial to the citizens of Campbell County;   

 

 WHEREAS, PBS wants to utilize available space on the Stuart Ranch Tower and  

equipment building. 

 

 THEREFORE, Sheriff and PBS agree as follows: 

 

1. Property and Use: Sheriff grants PBS space on its tower and in its equipment building to 

install the following equipment belonging to PBS: 

a. Kathrein SL8 – 60’ North Leg 

b. Kathrein RR Series Parafletcher – 10’ Southwest Leg 

c. Space in Equipment Building for equipment rack.  

 

2. Regulatory Compliance: PBS shall comply with all laws, ordinances, rules or regulations 

of all appropriate governmental authorities affecting the use of the Stuart Ranch Tower and 

equipment building.  PBS shall obtain and maintain in good standing all necessary licenses 

and permits to allow and authorize the use of the Stuart Ranch Tower and equipment 

building. 

 

3. Equipment/Operations: PBS equipment must be installed, maintained, and operated in a 

manner which does not interfere with the operations of the Sheriff’s communications 

capabilities or tower use including that of other tower and building space users.  In the 

event PBS’s equipment causes any interference to existing communications operations, 

PBS shall immediately take all necessary steps the correct or eliminate the interference.  



 

 

Campbell County Sheriff 

Wyoming PBS 

Stuart Ranch Tower and Building Space Agreement 

Page 2 of 3 

 

Sheriff shall not be liable for loss of damage to PBS equipment caused by Sheriff or third 

parties. 

 

4. Modification: Once installed, PBS shall not make changes to the location of the 

equipment added to the communications tower or building pursuant to this and in 

accordance with this Agreement without written prior approval of Sheriff.  

 

5. Access:  PBS agrees that its use of the tower is contingent upon the grant of ingress and 

egress by the landowner, ARK Land Company.  It shall be PBS’s responsibility to obtain 

said grant.   

 

6. Rental Amount:  In exchange for granting PBS tower and equipment building space, PBS 

agrees to pay the Sheriff One Hundred and Fifty dollars ($150.00) per month payable on 

or before the fifth day of each month. 

 

7. Utilities:  Sheriff agrees to pay the reasonable, customary and normal utilities of PBS at 

the site, but in no event, will Sheriff be required to pay more than seventy ($70.00) per 

month attributable to PBS.  In the event, the utilities appear to be more than seventy 

($70.00) per month, the parties agree to renegotiate the rental amount.  

 

8. Maintenance: All costs and expenses incurred in connection with the installation, 

maintenance, and repair of PBS equipment shall be borne by PBS.  PBS agrees to hold 

Sheriff, Campbell County, its agents and employees harmless from any and all claims 

arising from the installation, use, maintenance, repair or removal of PBS’s equipment on 

the communications tower and equipment building.   

 

9. Term and Termination:  The term of this Agreement shall be two (2) years beginning July 

1, 2020 and terminating June 31, 2022.  The Agreement will automatically renew for four 

(4) year terms unless earlier terminated by Sheriff upon 60 days written notice.  The 

Sheriff may terminate this Agreement at any time upon 60 days written notice.  

 

10. Notices:  

 

Campbell County Sheriff’s Office 

600 West Boxelder 

Gillette, WY  82718 

Email: JLW05@ccgov.net 

 

Wyoming PBS 

2660 Peck Avenue 

Riverton, WY  82501 

Email: jwilliam@cwc.edu 

 

 



 

 

Campbell County Sheriff 

Wyoming PBS 

Stuart Ranch Tower and Building Space Agreement 

Page 3 of 3 

 

 

11.  Applicable Law:  This Agreement is governed by the laws of the State of Wyoming and 

exclusive jurisdiction and venue shall be in the appropriate court in Campbell County, 

Wyoming. 

 

12.  Sovereign Immunity:  Sheriff or Campbell County does not waive its sovereign 

immunity and or its governmental immunity by entering into this Agreement and fully 

retains all immunities and defenses by law regarding any action based upon this 

agreement.  

 

13.  Governmental Claims: Any actions or claims against Sheriff or Campbell County under 

this Agreement must be in accordance with and are controlled by the Wyoming 

Governmental Claims Act. W.S.§1-39-101 et seq.    

 

 

CAMPBELL COUNTY BOARD OF COMMISSIONERS 

 

 

____________________________________ Date:_________________ 

DG Reardon, Chairman 

 

 

CAMPBELL COUNTY SHERIFF 

 

 

___________________________________  Date:_________________ 

Scott Matheny 

 

 

WYOMING  PBS   

 

 

__________________________________  Date:_________________ 

Terry Dugas, General Manager 

 



 

*Individuals wishing to provide public comment are asked to sign in prior to the start of the meeting, provide 
contact information and the topic(s) to be discussed. 

 
 
The following page(s) contain the backup material for Agenda Item: 9:30 Service Provider Agreement, 
Adolescent Substance Abuse Treatment  

















 

*Individuals wishing to provide public comment are asked to sign in prior to the start of the meeting, provide 
contact information and the topic(s) to be discussed. 

 
 
The following page(s) contain the backup material for Agenda Item: 9:35 Service Provider Agreement, Adult 
Substance Abuse Treatment 

















 

*Individuals wishing to provide public comment are asked to sign in prior to the start of the meeting, provide 
contact information and the topic(s) to be discussed. 

 
 
The following page(s) contain the backup material for Agenda Item: 9:40 Service Provider Agreement, Individual 
& Family Treatment 

















 

*Individuals wishing to provide public comment are asked to sign in prior to the start of the meeting, provide 
contact information and the topic(s) to be discussed. 

 
 
The following page(s) contain the backup material for Agenda Item: 9:45 District Support Grant Annual Report 
FY 2019-20 



	
Department	of	Public	Works     Kevin	C.	King,	P.E.,	Director	

500 S. Gillette Avenue, Suite 1400, Gillette, WY 82716   ●   307-685-8061   ●   Building 307-682-1970   ●   Solid Waste/Recycle 307-682-9499 

 

https://campbellcountywy‐my.sharepoint.com/personal/kck08_ccgov_net/Documents/Annual Documents/DSG Annual Report/FY19‐20 DSG 
Report/FY19‐20 DSG Report Memo.docx 

M	E	M	O	R	A	N	D	U	M		

   
TO:  Board of Commissioners 
FROM:  Kevin King, Director 
DATE:  August 4, 2020 
SUBJECT: FY19-20 District Support Grant wrap-up report 
 
FY19-20 was a light year for our District Support Grant program, mirroring the local economic 
conditions in the County. 16 grants were awarded to 14 Districts, compared to 19 grants awarded to 14 
Districts the previous year. The total dollar amount awarded was down over 23.5% from the previous 
year. We were below both the 10-year and 5-year average totals. As you know, this program is funded by 
Optional 1% tax dollars and is the only program like it in the State of Wyoming.  
 
FY19-20 highlights include: 

 16 grants awarded (27% less than 5-year average) 
 14 separate Districts received grants 
 $138,251 in grants awarded (20% less than 5-year average) 
 $78,699 awarded for water projects 
 $46,302 awarded for road projects 
 $1,026,570 in total project value (18% less than 5-year average) 

 
A graphical representation of FY19-20 grant awards and details has been attached to this memo. 
 
Also, we have compiled District Support Grant stats for the last five and ten fiscal years.   
 
5-Year highlights of the period 7/1/2015 to 6/30/2020 (FY15-16 through FY19-20) include: 

 109 grants were awarded (22 average annual) 
 $868,793 in grants awarded ($173,759 average annual) (14% of total project funding) 
 $6,222,134 in total project value ($1,244,427 average annual) 

10-Year highlights of the period 7/1/2010 to 6/30/2020 (FY10-11 through FY19-20) include: 
 229 grants were awarded (23 average annual) 

 $2,197,252 in grants awarded ($219,725 average annual) (19% of total project funding) 

 $11,510,537 in total project value ($1,151,054 average annual) 

A graphical representation of these 5-year and 10-year highlights are attached to this memo. 

 

 



FY 19-20 District Support Grant Master List
Meeting District Project Grant Budget Project

Date Name Cost Award Remaining Description

Beginning Approved Budget 275,000.00$           

08/06/19 Pineview 680,000.00$        44,601.00$      230,399.00$           Design/Construction of Water Project
12/17/19 Central Campbell County 136,393.00$        34,098.00$      196,301.00$           Emergency repair to pump #6
12/17/19 Brunsen Road 12,395.00$          3,099.00$        193,202.00$           Road Maintenance
04/07/20 Fox Ridge 14,502.00$          3,626.00$        189,576.00$           Road Maintenance
04/07/20 Central Campbell  5,750.00$            2,875.00$        186,701.00$           Street Sweeping
04/07/20 Means, Carter, N. Hannum 11,900.00$          2,975.00$        183,726.00$           Mag Chloride Application
04/07/20 Prairieview Champion Ventures 3,600.00$            1,800.00$        181,926.00$           Street Sweeping
04/07/20 Central Campbell 16,301.00$          4,075.00$        177,851.00$           Sewer Line Jetting
04/07/20 Eight Mile 8,500.00$            2,683.00$        175,168.00$           Mag Chloride Application
04/07/20 Bennor Estates 6,800.00$            1,700.00$        173,468.00$           Mag Chloride Application
04/07/20 Box n Ranch 9,643.00$            2,411.00$        171,057.00$           Roadway Surfacing
04/21/20 Rozet Ranchettes 39,482.00$          9,871.00$        161,186.00$           Roadway Surfacing
04/21/20 Graceland 36,906.00$          9,227.00$        151,959.00$           Roadway Surfacing
04/21/20 Stonegate 21,790.00$          5,448.00$        146,511.00$           Road Maint/Dust Control
05/05/20 Rustic Hills 16,629.00$          5,262.00$        141,249.00$           Road Maintenance
06/15/20 Little Thunder 5,979.00$            4,500.00$        136,749.00$           District Formation

1,026,570.00$     138,251.00$    13.47%

136,749.00$    50% Budget Remaining

Grant Type Total Percentage
Meters/water 78,699.00$          56.9%

Road Maintenance 46,302.00$          33.5%

Street Sweeping 4,675.00$            3.4%

Sewer Jetting 4,075.00$            2.9%

Engineering/grant requests -$                      0.0%

District Formation 4,500.00$            3.3%

Total 138,251.00$        100.0%

Breakdown of FY19-20 District Support Grant Awards

Total FY19-20 Awards
Budget Remaining



Compiled stats for FY15-16 through FY19-20

 $‐

 $50,000.00

 $100,000.00

 $150,000.00

 $200,000.00

 $250,000.00

FY15‐16 FY16‐17 FY17‐18 FY18‐19 FY19‐20

Awards

 $‐

 $500,000.00

 $1,000,000.00

 $1,500,000.00

 $2,000,000.00

 $2,500,000.00

 $3,000,000.00

 $3,500,000.00

 $4,000,000.00

FY15‐16 FY16‐17 FY17‐18 FY18‐19 FY19‐20

Project Costs

 $‐

 $20,000.00

 $40,000.00

 $60,000.00

 $80,000.00

 $100,000.00

 $120,000.00

 $140,000.00

 $160,000.00

FY15‐16 FY16‐17 FY17‐18 FY18‐19 FY19‐20

Roads

 $‐

 $20,000.00

 $40,000.00

 $60,000.00

 $80,000.00

 $100,000.00

 $120,000.00

 $140,000.00

 $160,000.00

FY15‐16 FY16‐17 FY17‐18 FY18‐19 FY19‐20

Water



Compiled stats for FY10-11 through FY19-20

 $‐

 $50,000.00

 $100,000.00

 $150,000.00

 $200,000.00

 $250,000.00

 $300,000.00

 $350,000.00

 $400,000.00

 $450,000.00

Awards

 $‐

 $500,000.00

 $1,000,000.00

 $1,500,000.00

 $2,000,000.00

 $2,500,000.00

 $3,000,000.00

 $3,500,000.00

 $4,000,000.00

Project Costs

 $‐

 $50,000.00

 $100,000.00

 $150,000.00

 $200,000.00

 $250,000.00

 $300,000.00

Roads

 $‐

 $20,000.00

 $40,000.00

 $60,000.00

 $80,000.00

 $100,000.00

 $120,000.00

 $140,000.00

 $160,000.00

 $180,000.00

 $200,000.00

Water



 

*Individuals wishing to provide public comment are asked to sign in prior to the start of the meeting, provide 
contact information and the topic(s) to be discussed. 

 
 
The following page(s) contain the backup material for Agenda Item: 9:50 District Support Grant, Rocky Point I&S 



Z\/---Thr---\ 
Campbell County 

w yorning 

Department of Public Works - Engineering Division Kevin C. King, P.E., Director 

500 S. Gillette Avenue, Suite 1400 Gillette, WY 82716 l 307-685-8061 Office I 307-687-6468 Fax 

DISTRICT SUPPORT GRANT MEMORANDUM 

SECTION General 

FROM: Kevin C. King, P.E., Public Works Executive Director 

TO: Board of County Commissioners 

SUBJECT: District Support Grant Application From: Rocky Point 186 

DATE: 7/28/2020 

Rocky Point l&S has submitted a District Support Grant application in the amount of $594 
for application of 2000 gallons of mag chloride dust control on Rocky Point Drive 

SECTION 2 - Grant Type and Priority Gravel Road, Priority 6 

SECTION 3 - Costs and Eligibility Enlargement Eligible? Yes 

Total Estimated Project Cost: $1,800 

Total Number of District Lots: 29 

Total allowable grant over a 5-yr period: 29 lots @ $1,500 

Total amount of Grants approved over current 5-yr period: 

Total amount not subject to $1500/lot limitation 

Remaining Grant eligibility this current 5-yr period: 

Current Fiscal Year Awards $ 594 

Remaining Eligibility this Fiscal Year $ 38,957 O.K. 

 $ 38,957 

$ 43,500 

$ 11,274 

$ 6,731 

O.K. 

SECTION 4- Compliance 

Rocky Point l&S District is in compliance with the elections office per a 6/12/2020 memo 

SECTION 5 - Analysis Gravel Road, Priority 6 

Gravel Road, Priority 6 (PR-6) 50% up to $50,000 drainage, 33% up to $50,000 connecting roads, 25% up to $50,000 gravel 
% Total Grant Item 

100 $ $ 

50 $ - $ 

33 $1,800 $ 594.00 Approved at 33% due to connective subdivisions 

25 $ - $ - 

Totals $ 1,800 $ 594 

SECTION 6 Quotes Received 

Company Total Notes: $0.90 per gallon 

1 Dustbusters, Inc. 1,800 

2 

3 

4 

SECTION 7- Recomm endation 

I recommend the Board approve the District Support Grant request from Rocky Point l&S 

Improvement and Service District in an amount not to exceed $ 594 

for application of 2000 gallons of mag chloride dust control on Rocky Point Drive 

Funding History 

5 year $11,274 

10 year $31,432 

Since 2011 $36,774 
Approved? Y or N $ Date Approved 



Campbell County 

DISTRICT SUPPORT GRANT APPLICATION 

:District Name: S Requested Amount: 

Mailing Address-  _Pc) 

 

'tt-  a -4 Tri, 

Contact Person:  

      

Day Time Phone: to:cst_Ls  t'-51  

    

        

Is applicant requesting financial assistance Yes 
to Conn a District? 

Is Applicant requesti ng financial assistance for Yes No  
connection to regional water? 

Is the project anticipated to be complete in the next I 8 months? Yes X No 

Description of proposed project: (Include engineering reports, portion lobe funded by grant, etc. 
Elio --', i  - ,--,,-) .2 - ,:k.  - '  V -,. ,....., ° L°:`,Z, L_., ,-”, ..-", r  

,J 

Total project cost (estimated) (itemize on separate sheet): 't  

Projected start date: 'Projected completion date: _ 

Briefly describe why the project is needed: 
Is) As6_0-- 

  

l'g)t-t_, s.,;_k_ 

Governing Board members:  LL_:_sin._   
cr tAtit.c1v3. 

      

Acreage (approximate) of district or proposed district; (7.-)̀ k f--)c."2,4 C.S 

Date of district forn n (if applicable) 

Number of lots: 

Population of District: 

  

Ratio of developed and undeveloped land:  

Is area legally platted?  

District boundary map included? 

Is District zoned? A If so, what is it zoned? 

Is District in compliance with the Elections Office? (Submit letter of compliance): 

     

\I  

    

    

Id Nowtriber2013 



Respectfully submitted, 

, 

FINANCIAL INFORMATION 
Current Mill Levy for the Subdivision 

Current Assessed Valuation (County Assessor's Office) 

Current indebtedness 

Current Income Statement and Balance Sheet 

Water and sewer rates, tap fees, plant investment fees, association or district dues (Describe) 

   

$ 

  

 

C 

, • ;no *-= 
•±, , • 

,f."N•k•-v ,„  

Will project generate user fees, charges, other revenues or income revenue? 

Yes 

List and describe other potential funding sources: 

Other pending applications for funding: 
_  

Land developers or others whose business ventures will directly benefit from project and funding 
or other assistance requested, received, or pledged from these sources: 

Title: vç  

scti November 21) t 3 



„ 
GILLET 82717 relnecca .00.171 

TEL tiZb • 1 FAX P.:•6•-- 1 

July 24, 2020 

To whom it may concern. 

The Rocky Point Water and Sewer District is requesting a District Support Grant 
in the amount of $594.00. This is 33% of our bided project amount, which is $1.800 for 
2,000 gallons of Mag. Chloride to be applied to the road by the end of August to help 
with dust control on Rocky Point Drive. The board is asking for 33% again this year due 
to usage on the road from other subdivisions in the area. During the recent construction 
on Highway 50 the homowners also saw an increase of usage on their roadway as 
well. I have attached a map to show how the road is used by those other than Rocky 
Point Homeowners, 

If any other information is required or needed to further assist in the progress of this 
grant please contact me at the office - 686-1511, and III be happy to help 

Sincerely, 

Rebecca Vandrak 
Administrative Manager 



Other (Specify) 
2000 0,9 

ntrol Du 

g Chloride 

Du ol Sub to Dist G s pp Ccu Elisle T j1 )1 

District Support Grant Roadway Cost Estimate Template  

acto Dustbus Con 

Submit one form for each road 

Draina c/Ditch 

Ftl Deep F Culve 
Dust Control  

en F id 

ROADWAY PROJECT INFORMATION 

Crushed Asphalt this i the case,mark out tons and put la CY 
pecify 

ding Hrs Total 

CONTRACTOR PRICING 

placementry and If mixing v 
fill out both rows. licost does not include placement of aggregate, pie, 

od then include It under blading below. Scoria is often in cubic yards instead of tons.1 Crushed Concrete 

ncludes ag 
„r 

cin§ Subtotal  

qr2.1.016.48.21.0.4.4.1r• 

leg /Surfacing 
Truck 

Includes cost of water and appli 
Guiders for drainage to ditches  

oad surface, May also include Hading 

Scoria (2" max) 

Drainage  
Install 12" culvert includes mate I no culverts,F d le includes uttin 
Install 18" culvert 
Install 24" culvert 
Cut Ditches 

disposing of excess material if applicable, and any erosion pro ection measures necessary 

Check if A 

btot 

Gallons/Gallon Check If Appl 

'otal Cost Estimate 

To a 

00 .cludes product and applicatIon of product to ro 

00 



1 

(ampbell COWity 

  

Qffice of 

UNrr .2. 

 

   

5005. Gillette Azialue, ,5uite.i 1600 0  P.O. Likx3010 0  giffette., Wyaxing 82717-3010 
Phone: 307.582.7255 0 j . 5Q757 45[  

June 12, 2020 

To: Rebecca Vondrok 
RE: Rocky Point Water and Sewer District 

The compliance requirements below have been met by the Rocky Point Water and Sewer District 
Having met the requirements, Rocky Point Water and Sewer District is currently in compliance with the 
Campbell County Elections Office. 

Notice of Board — 05/07/2020 

Final Budget — 07/29/2019 

Public Records — 05/07/2020 

Map-YES 

Department of Audit - YES 

Department of Revenue - YES 

Sincerely, 

Charity D. Stewart 
Elections Coordinator 



4 1- 



594.00 594.00 

0.00 0.00 0.00 6,731.00 0.00 5yr total 11,274.00 
10yr 31,432.01 

Since inception 36,774.01 

0.00 0.00 10,035.60 0.00 0.00 4,633.00 

Rocky Point W & S District #29 
020.7085.21 
29 Lots 

Date Description Award 
Priority 6 Priority 6 Priority 6 

Disbursed Remaining Priority 1 Priority 2 Priority 3 Priority 4 Priority 5 25% 33% 50% Priority 7 Priority 8 
4/15/2008 Road Maintenance & Repair 5,342.00 
5/28/2008 Pay req 1-Final 5,342.00 

263.06 5,078.94 
6/8/2012 DSG 2012.04 Road Improvement 6,879.01 

12/19/2013 Pay req 1 
6/25/2014 Pay req 2-Final 

6,879.01 6,879.01 
6,597.84 
6,279.09 

281.17 
318.75 

7/21/2015 DSG 2015.03 Meter pits/readers 13,279.00 
8/26/2015 Pay Req 1 
3/15/2016 Pay req 2-Final 

13,279.00 13,279.00 
6,631.15 

0.00 
6,647.85 
6,631.15 

4/17/2018 DSG 2017.17 Road Maintenance 1,485.00 
10/16/2018 Pay req 1-Final 

1,485.00 1,485.00 
22.10 1,462.90 

11/6/2018 DSG 2018.09 Well Pump 4,633.00 
12/3/2018 Pay req 1-Final 

4,633.00 4,633.00 
0.00 4,633.00 

4/16/2019 DSG 2018.19 Road Maintenance 4,562.00 
11/12/2019 Pay Req 1 - Final 

7ninnnn rtcr. nn AA 1-...-• r.-...a...-I •-e, . •••-• 

4,652.00 4,562.00 
622.30 3,939.70 

Project Cost 

29 Eligible 43,500.00 
Awards 11,274.00 
Disbursments 10,035.60 
Subject to 1500. 4,633.00 
Not subject to 1500. 6,731.00 
Remaining current 5-yr period 38,957.00 

not subject to $1500/lot limitation 

picked up 1% sign 10.10.18 



Meeting 
Date 

District 
Name 

Project 
Cost 

Grant 
Award 

Budget 
Remaining 

Project 
Description 

Beginning Approved Budget $ 225,000.00 
07/07/20 Rocky Point $ 1,800.00 S 594-.00 $ 224,406.00 Road Maintenance 
07/07/20 Overbrook $ 8,075.00 S 2,019.00 $ 222,387.00 Road Maintenance 
07/07/20 Oriva Hills $ 24,123.00 S 6,031.00 $ 216,356.00 Road Maintenance 

Total FY20-21 Awards $ 33,998.00 $ 8,644.00 25.4-3% 
Budget Remaining $ 216,356.00 96% Budget Remaining 

FY 20-21 District Support Grant Master List 

Breakdown of FY19-20 District Support Grant Awards 
Grant Type Total Percentage , 

Meters/water S - 0.0°A) 
Road Maintenance S 8,64-4.00 100.0% 
Street Sweeping $- 0.0% . 

$- 0.0% Sewer Jetting 

Engineering/grant requests S - 0.0% 
District Formation S - , 0.0% 
Total I S 8,644.00 100.0% 



 

*Individuals wishing to provide public comment are asked to sign in prior to the start of the meeting, provide 
contact information and the topic(s) to be discussed. 

 
 
The following page(s) contain the backup material for Agenda Item: 9:55 Johnson Simple Subdivision 



























 

 
Engineering    Building     Planning     Surveying   Solid Waste   Facilities  

 
500 South Gillette Avenue 

Suite 1400 

Gillette, Wyoming 82716 

(307) 685-8061 

(307) 687-6349   

 

DEPARTMENT OF PUBLIC WORKS 
JUNE 18, 2020 

PRE-MEETING WORKSHOP 

CAMPBELL COUNTY PLANNING COMMISSION 

 

 

The June 18, 2020 pre-meeting workshop of the Campbell County Planning Commission began at 6:00 

P.M. in the Commissioner’s Chambers. Members present were: Bob Jordan, Marc Matlick, Todd 

Hildebrand and Kurt Siebenaler. Staff present were Megan Nelms, Planner and Zoning Administrator 

and Clark Melinkovich, Senior Engineer & County Recorder.  

 

No official action was taken. 

 

The workshop adjourned at 7:00 P.M. 

 

 

 

 

Megan Nelms, AICP 

Planner and Zoning Administrator

 

 



CAMPBELL COUNTY PLANNING COMMISSION  

REGULAR MEETING  

June 18, 2020 

Page 1 

  

  

MEMBERS PRESENT    MEMBERS ABSENT 

Todd Hildebrand, Chairman    Miles Williams, Member 

Bob Jordan, Vice Chair                               

Marc Matlick, Member     

Kurt Siebenaler, Member 

    

       

STAFF MEMBERS PRESENT 

Megan Nelms, Planner and Zoning Administrator 

Clark Melinkovich, Senior Engineer & County Recorder 

 

The meeting was brought to order by Chairman Hildebrand at 7:00 p.m.  

 

Approval of Minutes 

 

Chairman Hildebrand called for a motion for the approval of the minutes from the April 

16, 2020 County Planning Commission meeting. Marc Matlick motioned; Bob Jordan 

seconded. All voted aye. Motion carried.  

 

Case No. 20.03 CRSD – Johnson Simple Subdivision  

Nick Johnson/Cevin Imus, LSI Inc. 

 

Chairman Hildebrand introduced the case and asked staff to present. Megan Nelms 

presented the case, and recommended approval of the simple subdivision request, 

pending completion of all planning considerations.  

 

Chairman Hildebrand asked if there were any public comments received for the case? 

Megan stated she had not received any comments. She also stated that the applicant has 

informed staff that the purpose of the subdivision is for refinancing purposes only, he has 

no intentions of subdividing. The bank is just requiring a smaller separate, deeded parcel 

for his home as the collateral.  

 

Commissioner Siebenaler inquired if Mr. Johnson had any plans for future subdividing or 

selling the larger acreage or if he had made any contact with WYDOT about future 

access for proposed Parcel 2. Mr. Johnson said he has not, and he has no intentions of 

building on the 91-acre parcel, so it had not crossed his mind to investigate another 

access/approach from Highway 50. Mr. Siebenaler then asked if the proposed parcel 

layout fit with the existing topography if Mr. Johnson or anyone in the future wanted to 

fence the 10-acres? Mr. Johnson stated that it does.  

 

The chairman asked if any of the Commissioners had any additional questions or 

comments on the case? There were none. With that, Chairman Hildebrand asked for a 

motion. Commissioner Jordan moved to approve case number 20.03 CRSD, Johnson  

 



CAMPBELL COUNTY PLANNING COMMISSION  

REGULAR MEETING  

June 18, 2020 

Page 2 

 

Simple subdivision request, pending completion of all planning considerations. 

Commissioner Matlick seconded. 

 

 Voting was as follows: 

 

 Bob Jordan  Yes 

 Todd Hildebrand Yes 

 Kurt Siebenaler Yes 

 Marc Matlick  Yes 

    

 Motion Carried 4/0. 

 

Case No. 20.02 COSP – Piper Acres, Phase I - Final Plat  

TLC Developments, LLC/Tony MacDonald, KLJ Engineering 

 

Chairman Hildebrand introduced the next case and asked staff to present. Megan Nelms 

presented the case, and recommended approval of the final plat, pending completion of 

all planning considerations.  

 

Chairman Hildebrand asked if there were any public comments received for the case? 

Megan stated she had received one phone call but had not received any comments. 

Chairman Hildebrand asked if the board had any questions or comments.  

 

Tom Civin, representative of TLC Developments, LLC approached the Board. 

Commissioner Jordan inquired as to the progress of the formation of the improvement & 

service district for the subdivision. Mr. Civin stated that his attorney, Patrick Carpenter, 

had filed the petition and they are in the waiting period and waiting for it to run its 

course. Commissioner Siebenaler inquired about the approach permit with WYDOT and 

how that was coming along. Mr. Civin stated they had some cosmetic changes and 

technical details that were needed to the plans.  

 

Chairman Hildebrand asked about Mr. Civin’s plan for road maintenance within the 

subdivision. Mr. Civin stated that it would be part of the improvement & service district, 

that it would be their responsibility. The chairman clarified his question, stating he was 

asking about the plan. Mr. Civin is putting gravel roads, and Mr. Hildebrand would like 

to know what the plan for maintenance and collection of maintenance fees is. Mr. 

Hildebrand stated he lives in a subdivision with gravel roads, and he has experience in 

dealing with maintenance. He stated that the plan can’t be, “we’ll see what happens and 

deal with it as it comes.” There must an operational plan and money in place. Mr. Civin 

stated that he was sure they would have some time after the roads were initially installed 

to get a plan together and the improvement & service district will have something in 

place regarding when maintenance will happen, as well as funds for unforeseen events or 

issues. Mr. Hildebrand then inquired about what that plan will be, since Mr. Civin is the 

one forming the new district? 

 



CAMPBELL COUNTY PLANNING COMMISSION  

REGULAR MEETING  

June 18, 2020 

Page 3 

 

Mr. Civin responded that he hasn’t gotten that far yet. Mr. Hildebrand asked how he 

could file to form a new district if he didn’t have that information in place yet. Megan 

stated that usually, a maintenance plan for infrastructure or other subdivision issues is 

something that would be addressed in the improvement & service district by-laws or a 

new subdivision’s HOA documents, depending on which type of entity a developer was 

planning to utilize. Megan stated that as far as she is aware, a new district does not have 

to complete their bylaws until the district is formed. She stated that is the reasoning 

behind the planning consideration, that Mr. Civin provide a copy of any proposed 

covenants, as many new subdivisions include their covenants and HOA bylaws/operating 

procedures all as one document. Staff would like to see those preliminary documents 

from Mr. Civin prior to recording of the final plat for Phase I.  

 

Mr. Hildebrand then asked what the total length of roadway was between Highway 50 

and the Red Hills Subdivision? Megan stated that the entire subdivision contains about 

three miles  of roadway. Senior Engineer Melinkovich stated that the length of Piper 

Blvd, the road from Highway 50 to Red Hills, including the side streets and cul-de-sacs is 

approximately 6,000 feet, so just over a mile of road. Mr. Hildebrand said he was 

addressing this topic because his subdivision spends approximately $35,000 to maintain 

1-mile of gravel roadway with 3” of crushed limestone. He understands they won’t be re-

doing the road every year, but he is looking at over 1-mile of roadway within the first 

phase and only 27 lots. Mr. Hildebrand asked if Mr. Civin had yet considered what the 

assessment/fees would be per lot to ensure that maintenance could be covered? 

 

Mr. Civin stated that his plan is to build the infrastructure and sell the 27 lots and move 

forward with additional lots. There was additional discussion regarding what assessments 

might be, and Mr. Hildebrand said he wants Mr. Civin to start thinking about costs 

because he does not want people to move out there and then be shocked by the cost of 

I&S assessments or dues, or have the subdivision lack the funds to maintain the roads. 

Commissioner Jordan stated that they want to see it all done right up front. Mr. Civin 

agreed, stating he does as well.  

 

Commissioner Jordan then inquired about the County Commissioners seeing the district 

bylaws. Megan re-iterated that the planning consideration requires Mr. Civin to submit at 

least a preliminary set of bylaws and/or covenants, which would be included in the 

Commissioner’s packet and semi-finalized at approval by the Board of Commissioners.  

 

Mr. Jordan then asked about Mr. Civin’s phasing plan for building the roads. Mr. Civin 

stated that he would build the roads as the phases require and to subdivision standard. 

Engineer Melinkovich stated that the submitted road plans show 4” inches of a scoria and 

2” inches of limestone on top for a 6” road base. This is in line with what is required for 

road infrastructure in the subdivision regulations. Mr. Jordan stated that he wanted to 

ensure the roads were installed prior to lots being sold. Megan clarified that yes, the 

regulations required all infrastructure to be installed and completed prior to recording of 

the plat, or the developer may enter into an Improvements Agreement with the County 

and provide a letter of credit for 125% of the costs of the outstanding infrastructure if he  



CAMPBELL COUNTY PLANNING COMMISSION  

REGULAR MEETING  

June 18, 2020 

Page 4 

 

desires to sell lots prior to completion. He then would have up to 24 months to complete 

all items within the Improvements Agreement.  

 

There was discussion about the process of forming a district and any issues. Megan stated 

the biggest issue will probably finding new owners who move to the subdivision who 

want to serve on the I&S Board. Mr. Hildebrand inquired about when Mr. Civin would 

turn over responsibility of the district to the homeowners. Mr. Civin responded that he 

would stay active with the District for quite some time. He said that leaving too early can 

complicate things, so he plans to be around for a while.  

 

Mr. Jordan then asked about the distance from Running Hills Road as it exits Red Hills 

into Piper Acres to the front door of the house at 7500 Running Hills Rd. Megan stated 

that Running Hills will be constructed within the Red Hills Subdivision for access to 

Piper Acres. However, the right-of-way was platted when Red Hills was first recorded, 

and the owners of that home knew it was right-of-way and an access point for potential 

development to the south when they placed their home on the property.  

 

Mr. Siebenaler asked Megan about the timeline and when the plat moves to the County 

Commission for approval. Megan stated that every planning consideration must be 

completed prior to the Board of Commissioners reviewing and approving the final plat 

for recording. Megan said that staff works to get as much information as possible to bring 

before the Planning Commission, as they will not see a plat again before it is approved by 

the Board of Commissioners, however, staff’s role is to ensure that all considerations are 

met, or an Improvements Agreement and associated letter of credit is provided, prior to 

final approval of the plat.   

 

Mr. Jordan said he thought the roads got a little bigger. Mr. Civin stated he didn’t think 

they made many changes; however, they did straighten out Piper Blvd. It is his opinion, 

and he said the traffic engineers with WYDOT feel that most people will utilize the 

entrance and exit to the subdivision at the Highway 50 access point. Chairman 

Hildebrand said that he is going to respectfully disagree with WYDOT and that he thinks 

this direct connection between Highway 50 and Force Road will lead to more traffic 

cutting through the Red Hills and Stonegate Subdivisions. This is another reason why he 

is so concerned about the road maintenance plan. He sees significant traffic that is non-

native to Stonegate go through his subdivision.  

 

Chairman Hildebrand then asked if there were any further questions or comments. There 

were none. With that, Chairman Hildebrand asked for a motion. Commissioner 

Siebenaler moved to approve case number 20.02 COSP, the Piper Acres, Phase I final 

plat, pending completion of all planning considerations. Commissioner Matlick seconded. 

 

Voting was as follows: 

 

 Bob Jordan  Yes 

 Todd Hildebrand Yes 



CAMPBELL COUNTY PLANNING COMMISSION  

REGULAR MEETING  

June 18, 2020 

Page 5 

 Kurt Siebenaler Yes 

 Marc Matlick  Yes 

    

 Motion Carried 4/0. 

 

 

Adjournment  

 

There being no further business to come before the Board, Chairman Hildebrand 

adjourned the meeting at 7:44 p.m.  

 

    __________________________________________ 

    Todd Hildebrand, Planning Commission Chairman 

    mn 

 

 

NOTE:  Campbell County Planning Commission meeting minutes contain a summary of 

discussions and are not intended to be verbatim.   



























 

*Individuals wishing to provide public comment are asked to sign in prior to the start of the meeting, provide 
contact information and the topic(s) to be discussed. 

 
 
The following page(s) contain the backup material for Agenda Item: 10:00 Congestion Mitigation and Air Quality 
(CMAQ) Resolution 



































 

*Individuals wishing to provide public comment are asked to sign in prior to the start of the meeting, provide 
contact information and the topic(s) to be discussed. 

 
 
The following page(s) contain the backup material for Agenda Item: 10:05 Tyler Technologies, Historical Index 
Module  



Proposal
Local Government Division

Historical Index Module
Document Pro

Presented to: Cindy Longwell

Campbell County 
500 S Gillette Ave Suite 1600
Gillette, WY 82716
307-682-7285

Proposal date: June 10, 2020

  

Submitted by: Erin Walker

800-554-4434

Erin.Walker@tylertech.com

Tyler Technologies

Local Government Division

5519 53rd Street
Lubbock, Texas 79414



Investment Summary
Cindy Longwell
Campbell County 

Cost Breakdown Proposal Valid for 120 days

Software Cost Annual Fees

Historical Index License Fees 1,600             384

1,600             

Professional Services Cost

Implementation Services 2,900             

2,900             

Project Total 4,500             384                     

Remote Services Only

Please see page 5 for payment terms  

Unless otherwise indicated in the contract or amendment thereto, pricing for optional items will be

held for six (6) months from the Quote date or the Effective Date of the contract, whichever is later.

Client Approval:___________________________________

Date:____________________________________________

Print Name:_______________________________________

PO#:_____________________________________________

June 10, 2020



Software Licenses
Cindy Longwell
Campbell County 

Application Software QTY License Fee Annual Fees

Document Pro Suite    

Historical Index Module 1 1,600 384
 

Historical Index  

 

Document Pro Suite 1,600 384

Application and System Software Total 1,600 384

Allows for viewing digitized index books online.

June 10, 2020



Professional Services
Cindy Longwell
Campbell County 

Application Professional Services Summary

Services

Document Pro Suite 10 2,900

Professional Services Total 10 2,900

Services Breakdown Hours Services

Document Pro Suite

Historical Index (Alpha Index)   

Project Management 2 300
Services for software implementation and training. 8 1,200

Conversion Services  1,400

Import of images and configuration of path/search terms

(Conversion fee assumes data/images are delivered to Tyler Technologies in 
the correct format, as outlined in attached Historical Index Conversion 
Specifications.  If they are not delivered in the correct format, additional 
charges will apply).

Document Pro Suite Total 10 2,900

June 10, 2020

Estimated Hours Estimated Services



Existing Client Terms
Cindy Longwell
Campbell County 

Existing Client Terms  

Client agrees that items in this sales quotation are, upon Client’s signature or approval of same, hereby added to the existing 
agreement (“Agreement”) between the parties and subject to its terms. Additionally, payment for said items, as applicable but 
subject to any listed assumptions herein, shall conform to the following terms: 

License fees for Tyler and third party software are invoiced upon the earlier of (i) delivery of the license key or (ii) when 
Tyler makes such software available for download by the Client;

Fees for hardware are invoiced upon delivery;
Fees for year one of hardware maintenance are invoiced upon delivery of the hardware;  

 

Annual Maintenance and Support fees, SaaS fees, Hosting fees, and Subscription fees are first payable when Tyler makes 
the software available for download by the Client (for Maintenance) or on the first day of the month following the date 
this quotation was signed (for SaaS, Hosting, and Subscription), and any such fees are prorated to align with the applicable 
term under the Agreement, with renewals invoiced annually thereafter in accord with the Agreement.

Fees for services included in this sales quotation shall be invoiced as indicated below.

Implementation and other professional services fees shall be invoiced as delivered. 
 

Fixed-fee Business Process Consulting services shall be invoiced 50% upon delivery of the Best Practice Recommendations, 
by module, and 50% upon delivery of custom desktop procedures, by module.

 

Fixed-fee conversions are invoiced 50% upon initial delivery of the converted data, by conversion option, and 50% upon 
Client acceptance to load the converted data into Live/Production environment, by conversion option.  Where conversions 
are quoted as estimated, Tyler will invoice Client the actual services delivered on a time and materials basis.

Except as otherwise provided, other fixed price services are invoiced upon complete delivery of the service. For the 
avoidance of doubt, where “Project Planning Services” are provided, payment shall be invoiced upon delivery of the 
Implementation Planning document. Dedicated Project Management services, if any, will be invoiced monthly in arrears, 
beginning on the first day of the month immediately following initiation of project planning.

If Client has purchased any change management services, those services will be invoiced in accordance with the Agreement.
 

 

Expenses associated with onsite services are invoiced as incurred.  

June 10, 2020



 

*Individuals wishing to provide public comment are asked to sign in prior to the start of the meeting, provide 
contact information and the topic(s) to be discussed. 

 
 
The following page(s) contain the backup material for Agenda Item: 10:10 Mill Levy Report 



Campbell County 
REPORT OF VALUATIONS, LEVIES AND TAXES 

2020 

COUNTY VALUATION (as fixed by State Board): 4,242,015,313 

 

---...._ 
LINE 

... 
PURPOSE OF LEVY LEVY  TAXES LEVIED  

101 
STATE GENERAL FUND (4 MILLS MAXIMUM) 
Art. 15, 4; Wyo. Stat. 39-13-104(a)(i) 

102 STATE CHARITABLE INSTITUTIONS (1 MILL MAXIMUM) - 

103 

STATE DEBT AND INTEREST 
Art. 16, 1 & 2;Wyo. Stat. 39-11-102, 1 (e), Wyo. Stat. 39-13-104(a)(iii) 
Wyo. Stat. 9-4-904. Wyo. Stat. 24-8-104. - 

104 
SCHOOL FOUNDATION PROGRAM (12 MILLS MAXIMUM) 
Art. 15, 15 Wyo. Stat. 21-13-303(a) and (c) 12.000 50,904,184 

110 TOTAL STATE LEVY & TAXES 12.000  50,904,184  

- 
201 COUNTY HOSPITAL OPERATION 

202 COUNTY LIBRARY OPERATION 

203 COUNTY FAIR OPERATION 

204 COUNTY MUSEUM OPERATION 

205 PUBLIC ASSISTANCE AND SOCIAL SERVICES - 

206 AIRPORT OPERATION 

207 CIVIL DEFENSE - 

208 COUNTY BUILDING FUND - 

209 ROAD AND BRIDGE PURPOSES 

210 RECREATION PURPOSES 

211 PUBLIC HEALTH PURPOSES - 

212 AGRICULTURE & HOME ECONOMICS - 

213 OTHER COUNTY GENERAL FUND 11.276 47,832,965 

214 FIRE PROTECTION (1 MILL MAXIMUM) (enter valuation in row below) - 

220 TOTAL OPERATING LEVY & TAXES (12 MILLS MAXIMUM) 11.276 47,832,965  

COUNTY LEVIES- Bonds & Interests 

 

TOTAL COUNTY BONDS & INTEREST LEVY & TAXES 

 

225 

  

0 NTY LEVIES- GRAND TOTALS 
250 TOTAL COUNTY LEVY & TAXES (Lines 220 & 225) 11.276  47,832,965 

Page 1 of 8 



  LEVY TAXES LEVIED LINE PURPOSE OF LEVY 

  

SCHOOL DISTRICT LEVIES 
mber VALUATION 4,242,015,313 

301 

, 

OPERATING LEVY (25 MILLS MANDATORY) 25.000 106,050,383 

302  BOARD OF COOPERATIVE EDUCATIONAL SERVICES (2.5 MILLS MAXIMUM) 0.500 2,121,008 

302a BOARD OF COOPERATIVE EDUCATIONAL SERVICES (2.5 MILLS MAXIMUM) - 

302b BOARD OF COOPERATIVE EDUCATIONAL SERVICES (2.5 MILLS MAXIMUM) - 

303 VOCATIONAL, TERM. CONTINUATION & ADULT ED. (2.5 MILLS MAXIMUM) - 

304 BUILDING FUND - 

305 RECREATION (1 MILL MAXIMUM) 1.000 4,242,015 

306 BONDS & INTEREST (TOTAL) - 

310 TOTALS 26.500  112,413,406   

 

VALUATION Tax District Number 
311 OPERATING LEVY (25 MILLS MANDATORY) - 

312 BOARD OF COOPERATIVE EDUCATIONAL SERVICES (2.5 MILLS MAXIMUM) - 

312a BOARD OF COOPERATIVE EDUCATIONAL SERVICES (2.5 MILLS MAXIMUM) - 

312b BOARD OF COOPERATIVE EDUCATIONAL SERVICES (2.5 MILLS MAXIMUM) - 

313 VOCATIONAL, TERM. CONTINUATION & ADULT ED. (2.5 MILLS MAXIMUM) - 

314 BUILDING FUND - 

315 RECREATION (1 MILL MAXIMUM) - 

1316  BONDS & INTEREST (TOTAL) - 

320 TOTALS - - 

 

VALUATION Tax District Number 

321 OPERATING LEVY (25 MILLS MANDATORY) - 

322 BOARD OF COOPERATIVE EDUCATIONAL SERVICES (2.5 MILLS MAXIMUM) - 

322a BOARD OF COOPERATIVE EDUCATIONAL SERVICES (2.5 MILLS MAXIMUM) - 

322b BOARD OF COOPERATIVE EDUCATIONAL SERVICES (2.5 MILLS MAXIMUM) - 

323 VOCATIONAL, TERM. CONTINUATION & ADULT ED. (2.5 MILLS MAXIMUM) - 

324 BUILDING FUND - 

325 RECREATION (1 MILL MAXIMUM) - 

326 BONDS & INTEREST (TOTAL) - 

330 TOTALS - - 

Tax District Number VALUATION 

331 OPERATING LEVY (25 MILLS MANDATORY) - 

332 BOARD OF COOPERATIVE EDUCATIONAL SERVICES (2.5 MILLS MAXIMUM) - 

332a BOARD OF COOPERATIVE EDUCATIONAL SERVICES (2.5 MILLS MAXIMUM) - 

332b BOARD OF COOPERATIVE EDUCATIONAL SERVICES (2.5 MILLS MAXIMUM) - 

333 VOCATIONAL, TERM. CONTINUATION & ADULT ED. (2.5 MILLS MAXIMUM) - 

334 BUILDING FUND - 

335 RECREATION (1 MILL MAXIMUM) - 

336 BONDS & INTEREST (TOTAL) - 

340 TOTALS - - 

Tax District Number VALUATION 

341 OPERATING LEVY (25 MILLS MANDATORY) - 

342 BOARD OF COOPERATIVE EDUCATIONAL SERVICES (2.5 MILLS MAXIMUM) - 

342a BOARD OF COOPERATIVE EDUCATIONAL SERVICES (2.5 MILLS MAXIMUM) - 

342b BOARD OF COOPERATIVE EDUCATIONAL SERVICES (2.5 MILLS MAXIMUM) 

343 VOCATIONAL, TERM. CONTINUATION & ADULT ED. (2.5 MILLS MAXIMUM) - 

344 BUILDING FUND - 

345 RECREATION (1 MILL MAXIMUM) - 

346 BONDS & INTEREST (TOTAL) - 

350 TOTALS - - 

Page 2 of 8 



VALUATION 

351 

. ---. - 
OPERATING LEVY (25 MILLS MANDATORY) - 

352  BOARD OF COOPERATIVE EDUCATIONAL SERVICES (2.5 MILLS MAXIMUM) - 

352a  BOARD OF COOPERATIVE EDUCATIONAL SERVICES (2.5 MILLS MAXIMUM) - 

352b  BOARD OF COOPERATIVE EDUCATIONAL SERVICES (2.5 MILLS MAXIMUM) - 

353 VOCATIONAL, TERM. CONTINUATION & ADULT ED. (2.5 MILLS MAXIMUM) - 

354 BUILDING FUND - 

355 RECREATION (1 MILL MAXIMUM) - 

356 BONDS & INTEREST (TOTAL) - 

360 TOTALS - -  

VALUATION 

361 OPERATING LEVY (25 MILLS MANDATORY) - 

362 BOARD OF COOPERATIVE EDUCATIONAL SERVICES (2.5 MILLS MAXIMUM) - 

362a BOARD OF COOPERATIVE EDUCATIONAL SERVICES (2.5 MILLS MAXIMUM) - 

362b BOARD OF COOPERATIVE EDUCATIONAL SERVICES (2.5 MILLS MAXIMUM) - 

363 VOCATIONAL, TERM. CONTINUATION & ADULT ED. (2.5 MILLS MAXIMUM) - 

364 BUILDING FUND - 

365 RECREATION (1 MILL MAXIMUM) - 

366 BONDS & INTEREST (TOTAL) - 

370 TOTALS - - 

x District Number VALUATION 

371 OPERATING LEVY (25 MILLS MANDATORY) - 

372 BOARD OF COOPERATIVE EDUCATIONAL SERVICES (2.5 MILLS MAXIMUM) - 

372a BOARD OF COOPERATIVE EDUCATIONAL SERVICES (2.5 MILLS MAXIMUM) - 

372b BOARD OF COOPERATIVE EDUCATIONAL SERVICES (2.5 MILLS MAXIMUM) _ 

373 VOCATIONAL, TERM. CONTINUATION & ADULT ED. (2.5 MILLS MAXIMUM) - 

374 BUILDING FUND 

375 RECREATION (1 MILL MAXIMUM) - 

376 BONDS & INTEREST (TOTAL) - 

380 TOTALS -  - 

Tax District Number VALUATION 

381 OPERATING LEVY (25 MILLS MANDATORY) - 

382 BOARD OF COOPERATIVE EDUCATIONAL SERVICES (2.5 MILLS MAXIMUM) - 

382a BOARD OF COOPERATIVE EDUCATIONAL SERVICES (2.5 MILLS MAXIMUM) - 

382b BOARD OF COOPERATIVE EDUCATIONAL SERVICES (2.5 MILLS MAXIMUM) - 

383 VOCATIONAL, TERM. CONTINUATION & ADULT ED. (2.5 MILLS MAXIMUM) - 

384 BUILDING FUND - 

385 RECREATION (1 MILL MAXIMUM) - 

386 BONDS & INTEREST (TOTAL) - 

390 TOTALS - - 

SIX MILL COUNTY SCHOOL LEVY VALUATION 4,242,015,313 

MANDATORY 6 MILL COUNTY SCHOOL LEVY AND TAXES 

TOTAL SCHOOL DISTRICT LEVIES 

392 TOTAL SCHOOL TAXES (Lines 310,320,330,340,350,360,370,380,390,& 391) 137,865,498 

MMUNITY COLLEGE DISTRICT VALUATION 

394 COMMUNITY COLLEGE OPERATIONS (4 MILLS) - 

395 ADDITIONAL COMMUNITY COLLEGE OPERATIONS (1 MILL) 

396 ADDITIONAL COMMUNITY COLLEGE OPERATIONS (1- 5 MILLS, VOTER APPROVED) - 

397 BOARD OF COOPERATIVE EDUCATIONAL SERVICES (0.5 MILL) - 

397a BOARD OF COOPERATIVE EDUCATIONAL SERVICES (0.5 MILL) - 

397b BOARD OF COOPERATIVE EDUCATIONAL SERVICES (0.5 MILL) - 

398 BONDS & INTEREST (TOTAL) - 

399 TOTALS - - 

Page 3 of 8 



VALUATION 

1 TOTALS 

[Name] 
[Tax District Number] 

OPERATING (8 MILL MAXIMUM) 
BONDS & INTEREST (TOTAL) 

410 
411 

412 - 

415 

OPERATING (8 MILL MAXIMUM) 
BONDS & INTEREST (TOTAL) 

413 
414 

TOTALS 

      

425 OPERATING (8 MILL MAXIMUM) 

   

426 BONDS & INTEREST (TOTAL) 

    

      

427 TOTALS 

MUNICIPAL LEVIES 

City of Gillette 

  

 

VALUATION 290,281,695 

401 OPERATING (8 MILL MAXIMUM) 8.000 2,322,254 

402 BONDS & INTEREST (TOTAL) - 

403 TOTALS 8.000 2,322,254   

Town of Wright 
VALUATION 10,408,297 

404 OPERATING (8 MILL MAXIMUM) 8.000 83,266 

405 BONDS & INTEREST (TOTAL) 

406 TOTALS 8.000 83,266   

[Name] 
VALUATION 

407 OPERATING (8 MILL MAXIMUM) 
408 BONDS & INTEREST (TOTAL) - 

409 TOTALS - - 

[Name] 
[Tax District Number] VALUATION 

[Name] 
VALUATION 

416 OPERATING (8 MILL MAXIMUM) 
417 BONDS & INTEREST (TOTAL) - 

418 IITOTALS I - I _ 

[Name] 

  

VALUATION r 

 

  

419 OPERATING (8 MILL MAXIMUM) 
420 BONDS & INTEREST (TOTAL) 
421 IITOTALS II - _ 

[Name] 
rict Number VALUATION 

422 OPERATING (8 MILL MAXIMUM) - 

423 BONDS & INTEREST (TOTAL) 
424 IITOTALS - II 

[Name] 
[Tax District Number] VALUATION 

[Name] 

 

VALUATION District Number 

428 OPERATING (8 MILL MAXIMUM) _ 

429 BONDS & INTEREST (TOTAL) - 

430 TOTALS - - 

[Name] 
rict Number 

 

VALUATION 

  

431 OPERATING (8 MILL MAXIMUM) . 

432 BONDS & INTEREST (TOTAL) - 

433 TOTALS - - 

TOTAL MUNICIPAL LEVIES 

450 TOTAL MUNICIPAL TAXES (Lines 403,406,409,412,415,418,421,424,427,430, & 433) 2,405,520 

Page 4 of 8 



LINE 
- - - -- 
NAME OF SPECIAL DISTRICT AND TAX DISTRICT # VALUATION LEVY  TAXES LEVIED 

501   HOSPTIAL DISTRICT - 100 4,242,015,313 3.000 12,726,046 

502 CEMETERY DISTRICT - 100 4,242,015,313 0.826 3,503,905 

503   WEED & PEST 4,242,015,313 0.454 1,925,875 

504   HERITAGE VILLAGE W & S DISTRICT - 103 4,105,191 8.000 32,842 

505   ROCKY POINT W & S DISTRICT - 129 715,937 8.000 5,727 

506 ROCKY POINT W & S DISTRICT - 129 (Maintenance) 715,937 8.900 6,372 

507 WRIGHT W & S DISTRICT - 146 13,731,176 8.000 109,849 

508 - 

509 - 

510 - 

511 - 

512 - 

513 - 

514 - 

515 - 

516 - 

517 - 

518 - 

519 - 

520 - 

521 - 

522 _ 

523 _ 

524 _ 

525 _ 

526 _ 

527 _ 

528 - 

529 _ 

530 _ 

531 _ 

532 _ 

550 TOTAL SPECIAL DISTRICT TAXES (Lines 501 thru 532) 18,310,616  

Page 5 of 8 



GRAND TOTALS 

601  LINE 110, TOTAL STATE TAXES LEVIED 50,904,184 

602  LINE 250, TOTAL COUNTY TAXES LEVIED 47,832,965 

603  LINE 392, TOTAL SCHOOL DISTRICT TAXES LEVIED 137,865,498 

604  LINE 399, TOTAL COMMUNITY COLLEGE TAXES LEVIED - 

605 LINE 450, TOTAL MUNICIPAL TAXES LEVIED 2,405,520 

606 LINE 550, TOTAL SPECIAL DISTRICT TAXES LEVIED 18,310,616 

610 GRAND TOTAL, ALL TAXES LEVIED 257,318,783   

STATE OF WYOMING 

 

Campbell County 

I, Troy D. Clements, County Assessor for the County of Campbell, do hereby certify that 
the within and foregoing report of valuations, levies and taxes for the year 2020 is true 
and correct. In Testimony Whereof, I have hereunto set my hand this 5th day of 

August A.D., 2020. 

County Assessor 



I & S $14,600.00 COUNTRYSIDE WELL- 144 

I & S $2,095.00 CRESTVIEW - 162 
I & S $30,292.26 OVERBROOK - 163 
I & S $72,594.21 BEN NOR ESTATES - 164 
I & S $4,200.00 RAFTER D - 166 
I & S $28,200.00 WILD HORSE CREEK - 167 
I & S $4,200.00 PINNACLE HEIGHTS - 169 
I & S $11,220.00 NORTH RANGELAND - 170 
I & S $27,375.00 MOON RIDGE - 171 
I & S $20,300.00 FOX RIDGE - 173 
I & S $10,200.00 SMALL BUTTES - 176 

I & S $6,450.00 ROCK ROAD - 182 
I & S $25,102.00 PINEVIEW - 183 
I & S $12,600.00 BRUNSEN - 184 

ORIVIA HILLS - 109 
CENTERAL CAMPBELL COUNTY - 111 
SOUTHFORK - 113 
SUNDOG - 114 
MEANS FIRST EXTENSION - 115 
PEOPLES DISTRICT - 117 
WESSEX - 120 
PRAIRIEVIEW/CHAMPION VENTURES - 122 
RUSTIC HILLS - 124 
STONE GATE ESTATES - 125 
MCKENNEY - 126 
GREEN VALLEY - 127 
EIGHT MILE - 130 
DONKEY CREEK - 131 
FOX PARK - 133 
LOS CABALLOS - 135 
MEADOW SPRINGS - 136 
HIGH COUNTRY - 137 
BUCKSKIN - 138 
COUNTRY LIVING ACRES - 139 
SOUTH DOUGLAS HWY - 141 
COTTONWOOD - 142 
GRACE LAND - 143 

I & S $81,200.00 

I & S $135,000.00 

I & S $28,200.00 

I & S $13,020.72 

W & S $0.00 

I & S $40,927.00 

I & S $5,250.00 

I & S $96,073.34 
I & S $28,700.00 

I & S $84,734.00 
I & S $6,635.88 
I & S $180.00 
I  & S $58,237.00 
I  & S $9,000.00 
I & S $4,250.00 

I & S $10,800.00 
I & S $14,950.00 
I & S $6,723.84 

I & S $7,680.00 
I & S $3,400.00 
W & S $5,639.70 
I & S $6,900.00 
I & S $27,900.00 

WRIGHT - 146 
ANTELOPE VALLEY - 148 
SOUTHSIDE WELL- 149 
SOUTH DOUGLAS HWY (CITY) - 154 
FREEDOM HILLS - 161 

W & S $1,010.12 
I & S $305,040.00 
I & S $0.00 
W & S $77,737.74 
I & S $152,512.80 

MEANS, CARTER, NORTH HANNUM - 177 
BOX N RANCH ROAD - 180 

I & S $32,400.00 
I & S $9,360.00 

Campbell County 
Report of Special Assessments 

    

1 

 

1 
Type of Special Assessment 

 

Name of Special District and Tax District # 
Amount of 
Assessment 

   

ITotal Special Assessments 1,522,891 I 

Page 7 of 8 



Campbell County 
Report of Appeals 

Instructions: This information is necessary to determine the appropriate mill levy. To complete the information use the row to identify 
the following to the best of your ability (attach additional sheets if necessary): 

1. Taxpayer: Please identify the name of the entity responsible for payment of the taxes. 

2. Tax District: Enter the number of the appropriate tax district or tax districts affected. 

3. Taxable Value Amount Contested: Enter the amount of appraised (taxable) value contested; this may be on file with 

the County Treasurer. 
4. Type of Appeal: Please indicate if the property is residential, agricultural, commercial, industrial, or minerals. Also, 
indicate if the taxpayer is requesting an exemption from taxation. 
5. Stage of Appeal: Please indicate if the case is pending before the County Board of Equalization, State Board of 

Court.  

TAXPAYER TAX DISTRICT 
TAXABLE VALUE 

AMOUNT CONTESTED 
TYPE OF APPEAL STAGE OF APPEAL 

Powder River Coal - Rawhide Mine  00100 $23,487,280.00 Industrial  Settled  

Powder River Coal - North Antelope Mine  00100 $283,226,750.00 Industrial  Settled  

Powder River Coal - Caballo Mine  00100 $31,735,860.00 Industrial  Settled  

LOF Gillette - Ramada Inn  00150 $2,691,120.00 Commercial  Settled  

Jamie Pedersen  00150 $512,985.00 Residential  Settled  

_  

_ 
_  

_  
_  

_  
_  

_  

TOTAL TAXABLE VALUE 341,653,995 

Page 8 of 8 



 

*Individuals wishing to provide public comment are asked to sign in prior to the start of the meeting, provide 
contact information and the topic(s) to be discussed. 

 
 
The following page(s) contain the backup material for Agenda Item: 10:30 Chapter 4 Proposed Amendments 



 

Department of Public Works     Kevin C. King, P.E., Director 

500 S. Gillette Avenue, Suite 1400, Gillette, WY 82716   ●   307-685-8061   ●   Building 307-682-1970   ●   Solid Waste/Recycle 307-682-9499 

 

 

 

 

Memo 

To:  Campbell County Commissioners 

From:  Jed Holder, Building Code Official 

CC:  Kevin King, Carol Seeger, Megan Nelms 

RE:  Chapter 4 Revision--Public Comment 

During the public comment segment of 2020 Chapter 4 Rules changes/updates, 

we received no public comments. We did receive two comments from 

Commissioner Faber outlined below. 

Section 12, A.11.a) p.4-23 Language used for un-zoned septic systems.  

Section 12, A ,5a) (12) p.4-21 Suggested to eliminate the drinking fountain 

requirements. 

 



 

4-1 

 

CHAPTER 4 

RULES REGULATING CONSTRUCTION 

Amended December, 2018 

 

 

Section 1. Authority. 

 

This Chapter is adopted pursuant to the authority granted by W.S. 18-5-105, W.S. 35-9-121 and 

W.S. 35-11-304 and supersedes all previous Rules Regulating Construction. 

 

Section 2. Definitions. 

 

As used in this Chapter, the following definitions apply: 

 

A. “Applicant” means the owner or authorized agent making application for a permit. 

 

B. “Automatic Sprinkler System” is an integrated system of a water source, piping, and heat 

activated fire suppression devices designed in accordance with fire protection engineering 

standards as fully defined in 2015 IFC Chapter 2. 

 

C. “Average Daily Demand” means the total annual water use divided by the number of days 

the system was in operation.  A minimum average daily demand of four hundred (400) 

gallons per day per Water Service Connection shall be used, unless the annual water use is 

available.  Comparable records may be used if approved by the Building Code Official.  

 

D. “Building Division” means the division of the Campbell County Department of Public Works 

responsible for issuing Building, Electrical, Mechanical and Plumbing Permits and 

performing inspections on that work.  

 

E. “Building Code Appeals Board” means a Board created by the Campbell County 

Commissioners (Resolution 1449) to hear and decide appeals of orders, decisions or 

determinations made by the Building Code Official or Fire Code Official relative to the 

application and interpretation of this code.  

 

F. “Building Code Official” means the officer or other designated authority or a duly authorized 

representative charged with the administration and enforcement of this code.  The position of 

Building Code Official is also referred to as the “Administrative Authority”, “Authority 

Having Jurisdiction”, “Code Official”, and “Fire Code Official” as those titles are used to 

refer to the individual responsible for administration and enforcement of the codes adopted in 

this Chapter. 

 

G. “Building Permit” means an official certificate of authorization by the Building Division for 

construction, enlargement or alteration of a building in accordance with Section 6. 

 



 

4-2 

 

H. “Central Stations” means a system or a group of systems in which the operations of circuits 

and devices are transmitted automatically to, recorded in, maintained by, and supervised 

from a listed central station that has competent and experienced servers and operators who, 

upon receipt of a signal, take such action as calling the local dispatch (fire or law 

enforcement).   

 

I. “Commercial Building” means all buildings not included in the definition of Residential 

buildings.  

 

J. “Community Water System” means a water supply system that has no more than nine (9) 

Water Service Connections and serves fewer than twenty-five (25) individuals with water for 

human consumption, which is permitted through the Campbell County Public Works 

Department and Chapter 4, Rules Regulation Construction.  

 

K. “Cross Connection” means any actual or potential connection between a potable water supply 

and any other source or system through which it is possible to introduce contamination into 

the system.  

 

L. “Delegation Agreement” means the current agreement between the Wyoming Department of 

Environmental Quality and Campbell County in accordance with W.S. 35-11-304 by which 

Campbell County has assumed authority for the enforcement and administration of the 

permitting of Residential Small Wastewater Systems, publicly owned and controlled sewage 

collection facilities, and publicly owned and controlled water distribution facilities. 

 

M. “Electrical Wiring Permit” means an official certificate of authorization issued by the 

Building Division in accordance with W.S. 35-9-120(e) and 35-9-121 and Section 7.  

 

N. “Engineer” means a professional engineer licensed with the State of Wyoming Board of 

Professional Engineers and Professional Land Surveyors.  In Section 13, any item required to 

be completed by an Engineer may also be completed by a professional geologist licensed 

with the Wyoming State Board of Professional Geologists.  

 

O. “Farm or Ranch Operation” means that the primary use of the property where the structures 

are located, along with any leased or owned property adjacent to or in close proximity to the 

subject parcel, is to produce agricultural products or to graze livestock for monetary profit as 

a primary source of income.  

 

P. “Flood Damage Prevention Resolution” is a resolution adopted by the Campbell County 

Commissioners on January 2, 2008 for the purpose of minimizing losses due to flooding in 

specific areas of the county.  

 

Q. “Looped Water System” means a water distribution system whereby any Water Service 

Connection can receive water from two (2) directions.  

Commented [SGP1]: We are proposing to strike the word 

‘residential’, just leaving the term ‘small wastewater 

systems’. Small Wastewater Systems as defined by DEQ 

already encompasses residential. By striking the word 

‘residential’ here, it removes that limitation and leaves the 

scoping authority to the delegation agreement that is in effect 

at the time.   



 

4-3 

 

 

R. “Mechanical Permit” means an official certificate of authorization by the Building Division 

for heating, ventilation, air conditioning and gas line work in accordance with Section 8.  

 

S. “Meter Pits” must be Mueller single or double meter pits or an approved equal and shall 

contain backflow prevention and shut-off valves.  Approval shall be made by the Building 

Code Official.  

 

T. “Owner” means the person holding title to real property.  

 

U. “Platted Subdivision” means any parcel or lot created through the subdivision plat process 

and where a map, drawn to scale by a licensed surveyor, showing how a portion of land is 

divided into blocks and lots, and showing streets, alleys and easements, common areas, 

dedications and other attributes, pursuant to the requirements of Campbell County Chapter 6, 

Subdivision Regulations and W.S. 18-5-306, is recorded in the land vault of the County 

Clerk’s Office.  Parcels created through a Record of Survey or subdivision exemption 

process shall not be considered part of a platted subdivision.  

 

V. “Plumbing Permit” means an official certificate of authorization issued by the Building 

Division in accordance with Sections 9 and 10 for domestic or commercial water supplies, 

sewage disposal, and all piping and materials necessary to complete these activities.  

 

W. “Potable Water” means water meeting EPA Primary Drinking Water Standards.  

 

X. “Remodeling” includes repairing, altering, or expanding a building or its plumbing, 

mechanical or electrical systems.  

 

Y. “Residential” means a building where more than half of the floor area is used for dwelling 

purposes.  

 

Z. “Rules Regulating Construction” means this document as adopted by the Board of 

Commissioners.  

 

AA. “Small Wastewater System” means any sewage system, disposal system, or treatment       

works having simple hydrologic and engineering needs which is intended for wastes 

originating from a single Residential unit serving no more than four (4) families or which 

distributes two thousand (2,000) gallons or less of domestic sewage per day.  

 

BB. “Water Service Connection” means any water line or pipe connected to a distribution 

supply main or pipe for the purpose of conveying water to a water user’s system.  

 

 



 

4-4 

 

Section 3. Applicability of Rules Regulating Construction.  

 

A. The provisions of this Chapter shall apply to any construction or installation for which an 

application for a Building Permit, Electrical Wiring Permit, Mechanical Permit or Plumbing 

Permit is required by the Building Division.  

 

B. The provisions of this Chapter shall not apply to any construction or installation that 

Campbell County is preempted by state or federal law from regulating or permitting. 

 

C. This Chapter shall supersede all previous rules and regulations, resolution, or building codes 

adopted by Campbell County.   

 

Section 4. Enforcement of Rules Regulating Construction.  

 

A. The Building Division shall enforce the Rules Regulating Construction prescribed in Chapter 

4 for that portion of Campbell County lying outside of the corporate limits of the City of 

Gillette and the Town of Wright.  

 

B. The Building Code Official shall have the authority to render interpretations and enforce the 

Rules Regulating Construction.  

 

C. Violation penalties, re-inspection fees, and appeals.  

 

1. Persons who violate a provision of any of the Rules Regulating Construction or fail to 

comply with any of the requirements thereof or who shall erect, install, alter, repair or do 

work in violation of the approved construction documents or directive of the Building 

Code Official, or of a permit or certificate issued under provisions of any of the Rules 

Regulating Construction, shall be subject to a fine of $250 per day.  Each day that a 

violation continues after due notice has been served shall be deemed a separate offense.   

 

2. Upon issuance of a stop work notice from the Building Code Official, work that is being 

done contrary to the provisions of any of the Rules Regulating Construction or in a 

dangerous or unsafe manner shall immediately cease.  Such notice shall be in writing and 

shall be given to the owner of the property, or to the owner’s agent, or to the person 

performing the work.  The notice shall state the condition under which work is authorized 

to resume.  Where an emergency exists, the Building Code Official shall not be required 

to give a written notice prior to stopping the work.  Any person who shall continue any 

work in or about the structure after having been served with a stop work order, except 

such work as the person is directed to perform to remove a violation or unsafe condition, 

shall be subject to the penalties set forth in Section 4.C.1. 

 

3. The first two (2) inspections for each portion of construction or type of work are 

performed free of charge.  Each additional re-inspection that is needed due to incorrect 

work will be assessed a fee of $60.  The fee must be paid in person at the Building 

Division office prior to scheduling the reinspection.   

 



 

4-5 

 

4. The first two (2) commercial plan reviews will be completed free of charge.  A $250 fee 

will be assessed and added to the cost of the Building Permit for each subsequent review 

which is needed due to incorrect material.   

 

5. A $60 fee will be assessed when any work commences prior to obtaining a required 

permit. 

 

6. Appeals from the decision or actions of the Building Code Official shall be to the 

Building Code Appeals Board in accordance with its established rules and procedures. 

 

7. The Building Code Official reserves all other rights and remedies available under the law 

to enforce the Rules Regulating Construction.  

 

Section 5. General Permit Requirements. 

 

A. All applications for permits under this Chapter require the following:  

 

1. Zoning Certificate.  For zoned parcels, an approved Zoning Certificate from the Planning 

and Zoning Division shall be required prior to issuance of any permit.  Refer to Chapter 

7, Zoning Regulations for requirements. 

 

2. An approved site plan.  The site plan shall be a drawing, to scale or clearly dimensioned, 

showing the uses and structures (existing or proposed) for a parcel of land.  The plan 

shall include a north arrow, property lines, streets, location of all buildings, wells (water 

and methane), septic tank and leach field, as well as the location for a future replacement 

leach field, easements/rights-of-way, and the location of utilities including electrical 

service lines, water lines, sewer/septic lines, natural gas and propane & LPG lines, etc. 

(existing and proposed).  The Building Code Official, per IBC 107.2.5, may also require 

a grading plan and/or spot elevation to address topographical and drainage issues on a site 

by site basis.  

 

a) Culverts are required for new driveway approaches that cross drainage ditches.  

Culvert installation shall be as specified in the subdivision disclosure statement, or as 

approved by the Building Code Official.  Minimum size is twelve (12) inches in 

diameter.  Driveway and culvert installation may be subject to approval by the 

subdivision Improvement and Service District or Homeowners Association. 

 

3. Plans to verify compliance with the Rules Regulating Construction.  Plans shall be 

drawings that show the shape, size, and location of important details relating to the 

construction of all buildings.  The plans shall clearly indicate the nature and extent of the 

work proposed and show, by details or other means, that the work will conform to the 

Rules Regulating Construction.   

 

B. The Building Code Official shall issue permits under this Chapter after determining that the 

proposed project will comply with the Rules Regulating Construction.  

 



 

4-6 

 

C. The applicant shall maintain a copy of all permits, approved plans, job sign off sheet, and 

plan review documents available on the job site.  

 

D. Per the current Campbell County Chapter 8, Addressing Standards, all properties must 

display the assigned address with address numbers which are clearly visible from the 

roadway.  Inspection by the Building Division will not be performed upon the property until 

those assigned address numbers are posted.  

 

1. Campbell County Public Works shall issue a new address for all properties not currently 

assigned a valid address, and shall re-assign property addresses as applicable, upon 

review.  No properties shall obtain a building permit without a valid County issued 

address. 

 

Section 6. Building Permits.  

 

A. Except as provided in subsection C of this section, before performing any work, any person 

constructing or remodeling a residential dwelling, public, commercial, or industrial building 

shall apply to the Building Division to obtain a Building Permit.  

 

B. For all public, commercial or industrial buildings, a Commercial Site Plan Review 

application and meeting shall be required prior to applying for a Building Permit.  The 

application and submittal schedule for Commercial Site Plan Review meetings can be found 

in the Public Works Office or on the county website.  

 

C. A Building Permit shall not be required for:  

 

1. A public, commercial, or industrial building associated with the extraction of oil, gas, 

coal or other minerals. 

 

2. Structures located o parcels used exclusively for Farm and Ranch Operations as defined 

within Section 2. Definitions of this document.   

 

3. One- and two-family residential dwelling located outside a Platted Subdivision. 

 

4. Any Manufactured home designed and constructed per HUD Standards. 

 

D. A $250 fee will be charged for all new Commercial Building Permits.  Reinspection fees may 

apply per Section 4(C)(3).   

 

E. For homes built off site to IRC standards, onsite inspections are required per Section 11.  In 

addition, a third-party inspection report is required from the manufacturer.  

 

 

 



 

4-7 

 

Section 7. Electrical Wiring Permits.  

 

A. Except as provided in subsection B. of this section, before performing any work, any person 

installing electrical equipment in new construction or remodeling of a building, mobile home, 

or premises shall apply to the Building Division to obtain an Electrical Wiring Permit.  

 

B. An Electrical Wiring Permit shall not be required for:  

 

1. Structures located on parcels used exclusively for Farm and Ranch Operations as defined 

within Section 2, Definitions of this document.  Electrical contractors performing work 

on parcels of deeded land forty (40) acres or greater shall comply with W.S. 35-9-123(b). 

 

2. Any installation associated with the extraction of oil, gas, coal or other minerals.   

 

Section 8. Mechanical Permits. 

 

A. Except as provided in subsection B. of this section, before performing any work, any person 

installing a heating or air conditioning system or gas lines in a building or structure shall 

apply to the Building Division to obtain a Mechanical Permit.  

 

B. A Mechanical Permit shall not be required for:  

 

1. Structures located on parcels used exclusively for Farm and Ranch Operations as defined 

within Section 2. Definitions of this document.  

 

2. Buildings and structures associated with the extraction of oil, gas, coal, or other minerals. 

 

Section 9. Plumbing Permits. 

 

A. Except as provided in subsection B. of this section, before performing any work, any person 

installing plumbing in a building or structure, or modifying or installing a Community Water 

System, or Small Wastewater System, shall apply to the Building Division to obtain a 

Plumbing Permit.  

 

B. A Plumbing Permit shall not be required for: 

 

1. Structures located on parcels used exclusively for Farm and Ranch Operations as defined 

within Section 2, Definitions of this document. 

 

2. Buildings or structures associated with the extraction of oil, gas, coal, or other minerals. 

 

C. No Plumbing Permits for new Residential or any Commercial construction will be issued 

until the applicant provides proper verification that a potable water source will be provided to 

the project.   

 



 

4-8 

 

1. For on-lot wells a copy of the valid State Engineer’s Office well permit for the proposed 

use shall be required.  

 

2. For shared wells, a valid Shared Well Agreement shall be submitted along with a copy of 

the State Engineer’s Office well permit for the proposed use.  

 

3. For connections to Community or Public Water Systems, written verification shall be 

submitted from the owner of the system indicating the system has adequate capacity and 

that permission is granted to make the connection.  

 

Section 10. Plumbing Permit for Residential Small Wastewater Systems.  

 

A. Before permitting any work, aAny person installing a Residential Small Wastewater System 

shall apply to the Building Division to obtain a Plumbing Permit prior to starting work.  All 

wastewater systems shall comply with Appendix 2 to Chapter 4 Regulations. the Delegation 

Agreement.  

 

1. All Small Wastewater Systems for residential dwellings shall be permitted, inspected, 

and approved through the Building Division.  If the percolation rate is less than one 

minute per inch, or more than 60 minutes per inch, the Small Wastewater System must be 

designed and sealed by an Engineer. 

 

2. A complete application is required prior to inspection in the field.  The application shall 

clearly identify the location and results of the percolation tests, the location and materials 

for the proposed leach field, the length of the individual legs, depth to the base of the 

infiltrator or the leach field and the location of a replacement field.  

 

 

1. Any system that is not a Small Wastewater System for a Residential dwelling shall be 

permitted through the Wyoming Department of Environmental Quality Any system 

for which Campbell County does not have current delegated authority from DEQ to 

permit shall be permitted through DEQ. 

 

2.  Prior to re-energizing any home or business on a parcel where no information on the 

Small Wastewater System is on file, the septic tank shall be pumped to verify a 1000 

gallon minimum capacity as required by Appendix 2 to Chapter 4 Regulations. Wyoming 

DEQ for single family dwellings with 4 bedrooms or less. 

 

Section 11. Inspections. 

 

A. The Building Division shall perform required inspections during the normal course of 

construction and notify the Owner and builder of any violations found during any inspection. 

 

B. If an inspection reveals that a life-threatening code violation exists, or that a project has 

commenced before the required permits have been obtained, the Building Division or 

Building Code Official shall issue a violation notice and a stop work order to the Owner.  

 

Commented [SGP2]: The wording in this section is 

modified to include any Small Wastewater System for 

domestic sewage, whether from a home or a business as 

found in the definition for Small Wastewater Systems on 

page 4-3. The word ‘residential’ is struck throughout here in 

Section 10 where it might conflict with our delegated 

authority agreement with DEQ. 

 

 

Commented [SGP3]: Appendix 2 is a new document 

created for the purposes of permitting and design of Small 

Wastewater Systems. The intent is to provide all information 

in one easy to understand document. 

Commented [SGP4]: Items 1 and 2 here are struck 

because they are addressed in Appendix 2 to Chapter 4, 

thereby reducing redundancy and confusion. 

Commented [SGP5]: This section is struck in its’ entirety 

and reworded. 

 

Our delegated authority as agreed upon between Campbell 

County and the DEQ defines what we can and cannot permit. 

The proposed change here is intended to simplify the text 

and point the user to our delegated authority agreement for 

guidance on scope of authority.  

Commented [SGP6]: We have added the word ‘business’ 

to reflect that small wastewater systems are not limited to 

only residential homes. We propose to strike certain words 

here that are already addressed in Appendix 2 to Chapter 4 to 

eliminate redundancy and avoid confusion. 



 

4-9 

 

C. Upon completion of a project requiring a permit under this Chapter, and prior to occupancy, 

the Building Division shall perform a final inspection to determine conformance with the 

approved plans and codes.  When there are no violations, a certificate of occupancy shall be 

issued.   

 

Section 12. Adoption of Rules Regulating Construction. 

 

A. The following documents are adopted by reference into Chapter 4, Rules Regulating 

Construction for Campbell County, Wyoming: 

 

1. International Fire Code, 2018 Edition, including Appendices A, D, E, F, G and B (B only 

applies in certain circumstances as outlined below). 

 

Appendix B only applies in areas with access to a water supply capable of supplying the 

required fire flows. 

 

a) The following amendments to the International Fire Code, as adopted by Section 

12(A)(1) above, are hereby made a part of this rule. 

 

(1) Section 101.1 of the International Fire Code is amended to read as follows: 

 

101.1 Title.  These regulations shall be known as the Fire Code of Campbell 

County hereinafter referred to as “this code”.   

 

(2) Section 108, Board of Appeals, is repealed in its entirety. 

 

(3) Section 401.3.2 Alarm Activations, the following is added: 

 

401.3.2.1 Central Stations.  Central stations shall immediately notify the 

Campbell County Sheriff’s Office Dispatch for dispatch of the fire department of 

alarm signals initiated by any fire alarm, fire extinguishing system or equipment.  

Supervisory signals shall be relayed to the Campbell County Sheriff’s Office 

Dispatch for dispatch of the fire department.  The fire department must be notified 

by faxed or electronic report of all trouble signals which exist for greater than a 

single 6-hour time period.  Campbell County Sheriff’s Office Dispatch, for the 

fire department, shall be contacted prior to notification of the subscriber.  

 

(4) Section 505.1, Address Numbers, amended to read as follows: 

 

505.1 New and existing building shall have approved address numbers, building 

numbers or approved building identification placed in a position that is plainly 

legible and visible from the street or road fronting the property.  If the structure is 

not visible from the roadway because of terrain, trees or other obstruction, the 

address numbers shall be posted on both sides of a post which shall be a minimum 

of four (4’) feet and maximum of seven (7’) feet in height above the ground in a 

visible location within twenty (20’) feet of a public road at the Access Drive to 

the structure.  These numbers shall contrast with their background.  Address 



 

4-10 

 

numbers shall be Arabic numerals or alphabet letters.  Numbers shall be a 

minimum of 4 inches high with a minimum stroke width of 0.5 inch. 

 

Exceptions:  Structures within twenty-five (25’) feet of a public road may place 

the addresses on the structure.   

 

(5) Section 506.1, Where Required.  Delete the first sentence and amend the section 

as follows: 

 

Key boxes (Knox Box) shall be provided for Fire Department entry for all 

Commercial occupancies.  The key boxes shall be installed on all new businesses 

before occupancy is granted.  Any existing business that obtains a permit to do 

any work or change of use or occupancy shall be required to install a key box 

before the work can be completed and approved and occupancy resumed.  The 

key box shall be located within 10 feet of the front doors, a minimum of 6 feet 

above the ground level and not to exceed 7 feet in height unless approved in 

writing by the Building Code Official.  The Building Division has the ordering 

forms for key boxes.  The key box shall be of an approved type and shall contain 

items necessary to gain access as required by the Fire Department.   

 

(6) Section 507.1, Required water supply.  Amended to read as follows: 

 

For areas with access to a water supply capable of supplying the required fire 

flows, fire protection shall be provided.  For areas that do not have a water supply 

capable of providing fire flows, the Campbell County Fire Department tanker-

shuttle system will be utilized as the fire protection method.   

 

(7) Section 507.1.1, Building, or portions of buildings which are hereafter constructed 

or moved into the jurisdiction which are required to be equipped with an 

Automatic Sprinkler System shall have access to an approved water system 

capable of providing the required Automatic Sprinkler System fire flows or shall 

provide an approved on-site water storage and delivery system capable of 

providing such flows. 

 

(8) Section 507.5.1, Where Required.  Amended to read as follows: 

 

For areas with access to a water supply system capable of supplying required fire 

flows, fire hydrants providing the required fire flows shall be located within 500 

feet of the building as measured by an approved route around the exterior of the 

facility or building.  

 

(9) Section 901.4.6.1, Clearances of the International Fire Code, a new section is 

added to read as follows: 

 

901.4.6.1  Clearances.  Fire Protection Equipment shall not be obstructed or 

concealed.  Fire Protection Equipment includes, but is not limited to, the 

following:  fire sprinkler control valves, risers, hose stations, standpipes, and fire 

alarm panels.  A minimum of eight (8”) inches on each side and a clear access 



 

4-11 

 

width of three (3’) feet shall be maintained in front of the fire protection 

equipment. 

 

(10) Section 903.2.8 is amended to include an exception to read as follows:  Group 

R-3 (one- and two-family dwellings) shall not be required to install an automatic 

sprinkler system.   

 

2. International Building Code; 2018 Edition, including Appendixes C and J; 

 

a) The following amendments to the International Building Code, as adopted by Section 

12(A)(2) above, are hereby made a part of this rule:  

 

(1) Section 101.4.1 Gas.  The provisions of the International Fuel Gas Code shall 

apply to gas piping systems extending from the point of delivery to the inlet 

connections of appliance and installation and operation of residential and 

commercial gas appliances and related accessories.  

 

(2) Section 101.42 Mechanical.  The provisions of the International Mechanical Code 

shall apply to the installation, alterations, repair and replacement of mechanical 

systems including equipment, appliances, fixtures, fittings and/or appurtenances, 

ventilation, heating, cooling, air-conditioning and refrigeration systems, 

incinerators and other energy-related systems.   

 

(3) Section 101.4.3 Plumbing.  Amended to read as follows:   

 

The provisions of the International Plumbing Code shall apply to the installation, 

alteration, repair and replacement of plumbing systems including equipment, 

appliances, fixtures, fittings and appurtenances where connected to a water or 

sewage system, and all aspects of a medical gas system.  The provisions of the 

Delegation Agreement shall apply to private sewage disposal systems.   

 

(4) Section 101.4.4 Property Maintenance.  Amended to read as follows:  

 

The provisions of the International Property Code are adopted; only to the extent 

as it applies to fire and life-safety issues for Commercial and Residential 

Structures. 

 

(5) Section 101.4.5 Fire Protection.  The provisions of the International Fire Code 

shall apply to matters affecting or relating to structures, processes and premises 

from the hazard of fire and explosions arising from storage, handling or use of 

structures, materials or devices; from conditions hazardous to life, property or 

public welfare in the occupancy of structures or premises; and from the 

construction, extension, repair, alteration or removal of fire suppression, 

automatic sprinkler systems and alarm systems or fire hazards in the structure or 

on the premises from occupancy or operation. 

 

(6) Section 101.4.6 of the International Building Code is repealed.   



 

4-12 

 

 

(7) Section 102.6 Existing Structures.  Amended to read as follows:   

 

The legal occupancy of any structure existing on the date of adoption of this code 

shall be permitted to continue without change, except as is specifically covered in 

this code, the International Fire Code, or as is deemed necessary by the Building 

Code Official for the general safety and welfare of the occupants and the public. 

 

(8) Section 103.3 Deputies.  Amended to read as follows:   

 

In accordance with the prescribed procedures of this jurisdiction and with the 

concurrence of the appointing authority, the Building Code Official shall have the 

authority to appoint a deputy-building official, related technical officers, 

inspectors, plan examiners, and other employees.  Such employees shall have 

powers as delegated by the Building Code Official.   

 

(9) Section 109 Fees is repealed. 

 

(10) Section 113 Board of Appeals is repealed in its entirety.   

 

(11) Section 114.3 Prosecution of Violation is repealed in its entirety. 

 

(12) Chapter 13 Energy Efficiency is repealed in its entirety. 

 

(13) Section 1608.2 Ground Snow Load.  Repeal in its 

entirety and replace with: 

 

Minimum roof snow loads:  1:12 pitch 

and flatter roofs (4.76 degrees) shall be designed for a minimum balanced roof 

snow load of 35 pounds per square foot with no reductions.  

The effects of unbalanced snow, drifting, sliding snow, and ponding shall be 

The effects of unbalanced snow, drifting, sliding snow, and ponding shall be 

The effects of unbalanced snow, drifting, sliding snow, and ponding 

shall be considered in addition to the balanced snow load 

where applicable.   

 

Greater than 1:12 pitch roofs (4.76 degrees) shall be designed for a minimum 

balanced roof snow load of 30 pounds per square foot with no reductions.  

The effects of unbalanced snow, drifting, sliding snow, and ponding shall be 

The 

effects of unbalanced snow, drifting, sliding snow, and ponding shall be 

considered in addition to the balanced snow load where applicable.   

 

(14) Section 1609.3 Basic Design Wind Speed.  Amended to read as follows: 

 

Basic Design Wind Speed 115, Nominal Wind Speed 90 Exposure C 

Commented [SGP7]: The changes to this section do not 

change the requirements or intent of the previous version. 

The previous language was confusing. The new language 

was developed with the aid of  both private local and county 

staff structural engineers who helped make the language 

more precise and clear utilizing terminology common to 

design professionals.  



 

4-13 

 

 

 

               Climatic and Geographical Design Criteria 
Minimum 

Roof Live 

Snow 

Load (psf) 

Basic 

Design 

Wind 

Speed 

Per IBC 

1609.3 

Wind 

Speed 

115 

Nom. 

90 mph 

Seismic 

Design 

Category 

Subject to Damage From Winter 

Design 

Temp 

(°f) 

Ice Barrier 

Underlayment 

Requirements 

Flood 

Hazards 

Air 

Freezing 

Index 

Mean 

Annual 

Temp 

(°f) 

Weathering Frost 

Line 

Depth 

(in.) 

Termite 

30-35* Exp.C B Severe 42 Slight / 

moderate 
-5 Yes Jan. 02 

2008 

2000 45 

*See Section 12.A.2.a.(12)1:12 pitch and flatter, 35 psf. 1:12 pitch and greater, 30 

psf.  

 

 

(15) Section 1612 Flood Loads is repealed in its entirety and replaced with the 

 following: 

 

The Flood Damage Prevention Resolution.  All new construction of buildings, 

structures, and portions of buildings and structures, including substantial 

improvements and restoration of substantial damage to buildings and 

structures shall comply with the above document.   

 

(16) 1803.5.3 Expansive Soils. 

 

The Building Code Official shall require soil tests to be performed for all 

commercial and industrial buildings.   

 

(17) Section 1809.4 Depth of Footings.  Amended to read as follows:  

 

The minimum depth of footings below the undisturbed ground surface shall be 

42” inches; or protected from frost with an approved method.   

 

(18) 1904.3 Sulfate exposures is added and reads as follows: 

 

Concrete that will be exposed to sulfate-containing solutions or soils shall 

comply with the maximum water-cementitious materials ratios, minimum 

specified compressive strength and be made with the appropriate type of 

cement in accordance with the provisions of ACI 318, Section 4.3. 

 

Exception:  Unless the owner or applicant supplies results from a soils 

investigation containing data on sulfates, the owner or applicant must use a 

concrete mix design meeting the following specifications:  

 

Use Type V cement or increase the amount of Type II Modified cement in 

concrete to obtain a maximum water-to-cement ratio of 0.45 (by weight, 



 

4-14 

 

normal weight concrete) and a minimum compressive strength fc of 4000 

pounds per square inch (psi). 

 

 

 

(19) Section 2901.1 Scope.  Amended to read as follows:   

 

The provisions of this Chapter and the International Plumbing Code shall 

govern the erection, installation, alteration, repairs, relocation, replacement, 

addition to, use or maintenance of plumbing equipment and systems.  Toilet 

and bathing rooms shall be constructed in accordance with Section 1209 of the 

IBC 2018.  Plumbing systems and equipment shall be constructed, installed, 

and maintained in accordance with the International Plumbing Code.  

Residential Small Wastewater Systems shall conform to the Delegation 

Agreement. 

 

3. International Residential Code, 2018 Edition, including Appendixes A, B, C and E. 

 

The International Residential Code (IRC) is adopted for the purpose of providing 

standards for residential construction, including plumbing and mechanical codes on 

Platted Subdivision Lots.  Electrical provisions are obtained from the currently adopted 

NEC.  To obtain a Certificate of Occupancy all applicable portions of the IRC shall 

apply.  

 

(a) The following amendments to the International Residential Code, as adopted by 

Section 12(A)(3) above, are hereby made a part of this rule:   

 

(1) Section R104.10.1 Areas Prone to Flooding is repealed and replaced with the 

following: 

 

All residential construction in areas prone to flooding shall comply with Flood 

Damage Prevention Resolution.  
 

(2) Section R105.2 Work Exempt from Permit is amended to read as follows:  

 

Work Exempt from Permit. 

 

Exemption from permit requirements of this code shall not be deemed to grant 

authorization for any work to be done in any manner in violation of the provisions 

of this code or any other laws or ordinances of this jurisdiction.  

 

Permits shall not be required for the following:  

 

Building:  Numbers 1 through 10 remain unchanged, add number 11 as follows:  

 

(11) Non-habitable accessory structures including, but not limited to, pole 

barns and similar structures that meet the following requirements: 

 

Commented [SGP8]: We are proposing to strike the word 

‘residential’, just leaving the term ‘small wastewater 

systems’.  

 

Again, this is meant to remove limitations on our authority 

and rely on our current delegation agreement as stated here.   



 

4-15 

 

1. There shall be clear separation distance of seven (7’) feet between the 

structure and any dwelling;  

 

2. The structure shall not be attached to a dwelling with a breezeway or other 

form of connecting structure; and 

 

   3. The clear roof span is less than 61 feet.   

 

(3) Section R108 Fees is repealed. 

 

(4) Section R109.1.3 Flood Plain Inspections.  Amended to read as follows:  

 

For construction in areas prone to flooding, as established in Flood Damage 

Prevention Resolution.   

 

(5) Section R112 Board of Appeals is repealed. 

 

(6) Section 112.2 is added to read as follows:   

 

Criteria for issuance of a variance for areas prone to flooding shall be in 

accordance with Article IV, Section C of the Flood Damage Prevention 

Resolution.   

 

(7) Section R114.2 Unlawful Continuance is repealed. 

 

(8) Table R301.2(1) replaced with the following:   
 

  

               Climatic and Geographical Design Criteria 
Minimum 

Roof Live 

Snow 

Load (psf) 

Basic 

Design 

Wind 

Speed 

Per IBC 

1609.3 

Wind 

Speed 

115 

Nom. 

90 mph 

Seismic 

Design 

Category 

Subject to Damage From Winter 

Design 

Temp 

(°f) 

Ice Barrier 

Underlayment 

Requirements 

Flood 

Hazards 

Air 

Freezing 

Index 

Mean 

Annual 

Temp 

(°f) 

Weathering Frost 

Line 

Depth 

(in.) 

Termite 

30-35* Exp.C B Severe 42 Slight / 

moderate 
-5 Yes Jan. 02 

2008 

2000 45 

*1:12 pitch and flatter, 35 psf. 1:12 pitch and greater, 30 psf.See Section 

12.A.2.a.(12) 

 

 

(9) Table R302.1(2) of the International Residential Code is repealed.  

 

(10) Section R302.13 of the International Code is repealed. 

 

Commented [SGP9]: Language in this table was amended 

to reflect the changes to Ground Snow Load found in Section 

12.A.2.a.(13), page 4-12. 



 

4-16 

 

(11) Section R309.5 of the International Residential Code is repealed. 

 

(12) Sections R310.2.3.2 & R310.3.2.1 Drainage of the International Residential 

Code is amended to read as follows: 

 

R310.2.3.2 & R310.3.2.1 Drainage.  Window wells and Bulkhead enclosures 

shall be designed for proper drainage by connecting to the building’s 

foundation drainage system required by Section 405.1 or by an approved 

alternative method.   

 

(13) Section R313.1 & R313.2 of the International Residential Code is repealed.  

 

(14) Sections R313.1.1 & R313.2.1 of the International Residential Code is 

amended to read as follows:   

 

Sections R313.1.1 & R313.2.1  When provided, automatic residential fire 

sprinkler systems for buildings covered under the International Residential 

Code shall be designed and installed in accordance with IRC Section P2904 or 

NFPA 13D. 

 

 

(15) R401.4 Soil tests. 

 

In areas likely to have expansive, compressible, shifting or other unknown soil 

characteristics, the Building Code Official shall require a soil investigation to 

determine the soil’s characteristics at a particular location. 
 

Exception:  In lieu of a soil investigation, the owner shall submit to the 

Building Code Official a signed and sealed letter from an Engineer stating that 

the soils are adequate for the proposed application.  The letter shall reference 

Table R401.4.1 from the International Residential Code and specify the 

appropriate Class of Material to be used for the foundation design. 

 

(16) Chapter 11 Energy Efficiency is repealed in its entirety.   

 

(17) M1411.8 Locking access port caps is repealed in its entirety.   

 

(18) M1502.4.2 Duct Installation repealed in its entirety and replaced with: 

 

Duct Installation.  Dryer exhaust ducts shall be supported at intervals not to 

exceed 4 feet and shall be secured in place.  The insert end of the duct shall 

extend into the adjoining duct or fitting in the direction of airflow.  Exhaust 

duct joints shall be sealed in accordance with Section M1601.4.1.  Ducts shall 

not be joined with screws or similar fasteners. 

 



 

4-17 

 

(19) M1701.2.1 Exhaust and ventilation system, add a new section to the IRC.  All 

dwellings shall have make-up air for the exhaust systems provided in the 

following manner: 

 

Piping for the make-up air shall come from the exterior of the dwelling to the 

return-air duct of the HVAC system, or to an opening in a laundry room or 

other acceptable location.  A four (4”) inch minimum diameter pipe shall be 

used.   

 

(20) Section G2406.2 Prohibited Locations.  Exceptions 3 & 4 are repealed and 

replaced with the following:   

 

Unvented fuel burning equipment shall not be installed, used, or maintained 

within a dwelling unit. 

 

(21) Section G2444.1 Unit Heaters.  This section is repealed.   

 

(22) Section G2445.2 Prohibited Use.  Amended to read as follows:   

 

Unvented room heaters shall not be used in attached or detached garages 

unless protected by a carbon monoxide detection system and equipped with an 

oxygen-depletion safety system.   

 

(23) Section G2445.4 Unvented Room Heaters, Prohibited Locations.  Amended to 

read as follows:   
 

The location of unvented room heaters shall comply with Section G2406.2 as 

amended in this document.   

 

(24) Section P2503.5.1 Rough Plumbing.  Drain, waste and venting systems shall 

be tested on completion of the rough piping installation by water or by air with 

no evidence of leakage.  Either test shall be applied to the drainage system in 

its entirety or in sections after rough piping has been installed, as follows: 

 

1. Water test.  Each section shall be filled with water to a point not less than 

10 feet above the highest fitting connection in that section, or to the highest 

point in the complete system.  Water shall be held in the section under test 

for a period of 15 minutes.  The system shall prove leak free by visual 

inspection.   

 

2. Air Test.  The portion under test shall be maintained at a gauge of 5 pounds 

per square inch (psi).  This pressure shall be held without introduction of 

additional air for a period of 15 minutes.   
 

(25) Section P2601.3 Flood Hazard Area.  Amended to read as follows:   

 



 

4-18 

 

In areas prone to flooding as established by Flood Damage Prevention 

Resolution, plumbing fixtures, drains, and appliances shall be located or 

installed in accordance with Article V Section A of the above document.   

 

(26) Section P2602.2 Flood Resistant Installation.  Amended to read as follows:  

  

In areas prone to flooding as established by the Flood Damage Prevention 

Resolution:  Remainder of the section unchanged.   

 

(27) Section P2603.5.1 Sewer Depth.  Amended to read as follows:   

 

Building sewers that connect to private sewage disposal systems shall be a 

minimum of thirty-six (36”) inches below finished grade at the point of septic 

tank connection.  All building sewer piping shall be a minimum of thirty-six 

(36”) inches below grade. 

 

(28) Section P2603.5 Freezing.  Amend the last sentence to read:   

 

All water service lines and exterior water pipes shall be installed not less than 

five-foot six (5’6”) inches below grade.   

 

Exception:  Lawn watering systems need not be installed at the above depth.   

 

Add the following language to the end of this section:   

 

Water services for mobile/manufactured homes shall use a Woodford 

Thermaline, or equivalent water connector, or shall be placed in a 12” diameter 

by 5 ft. deep pipe located up under the home.  

 

(29) Section P2705.1 Installation, item #3 is repealed.   

 

(30) Section P3001.3 Flood-resistant Installation.  Amended to read as follows:   

 

In areas prone to flooding as established by the Flood Damage Prevention 

Resolution, drainage, waste, and vent systems shall be located and installed to 

prevent infiltration of floodwaters into the systems and discharges from the 

systems into floodwaters. 

 

(31) Delete Chapters 34 through 42 (Electrical Provisions) of the International 

Residential Code and replace with the 2020 NEC. 

 

(32) Add Appendix E, Section AE101 General.  Amended to read as follows:   

 

Section AE101.1 General.  These provisions shall be applicable to all 

manufactured homes used as a single dwelling unit and shall apply to the 

following:  Remainder of this section unchanged.   

 

Commented [SGP10]: Amending to the 2020 NEC as 

required by Wyoming State Statute. See page 4-21 for full 

explanation. 



 

4-19 

 

(33) Section AE304 Fees is repealed.  There are no fees for plan review or 

inspections.  Re-inspection fees may apply per Section 4. C. 3. 
 

4. International Mechanical Code, 2018 Edition, including Appendix A. 

 

a) The following amendments to the International Mechanical Code, as adopted by 

Section 12(A)(4) above are hereby made a part of this rule.   

 

(1) Section 106.5 Fees is repealed.  There are no fees for plan review or inspections.  

Re-inspection fees may apply per Section 4. C. 3. 

 

(2) Section 108.4 Violation Penalties is repealed. 

 

(3) Section 108.5 Stop Work Order is repealed.   

 

(4) Section 109 Means of Appeal is repealed in its entirety.   

 

(5) Section 301.2 Energy Utilization is repealed.  

 

(6) Section 303.3 Prohibited Locations.  Amended to read as follows:   

 

Except in attached or detached garages protected with a carbon monoxide 

detection system and equipped with an oxygen-depletion safety system, unvented 

fuel burning equipment shall not be installed, used, maintained, or permitted to 

exist in any building. 

 

(7) Table 403.3.1.1 shall be amended to include footnote i.  Footnote i shall read as 

follows:  For repair garages, the required 0.75 cfm per square ft. of exhaust 

airflow may be achieved by providing 0.25 cfm of continuous airflow per sq. ft. 

with an additional 0.50 cfm of intermittent airflow per sq. ft. when installed in 

accordance with Section 404.   

 

(8) Section 501.3 Outdoor Discharge.  The air removed by every mechanical exhaust 

system shall be discharged at a point where it will not cause a nuisance and from 

which it cannot again be readily drawn in by a ventilating system.  An attic not 

used for make-up air may have exhaust ducts terminate in the attic.  The exhaust 

duct shall extend to a minimum of six (6”) inches above the insulation.   

 

(9) Section 604.1 General.  Delete the reference to the International Energy 

Conservation Code.  The rest of the section to remain as is.   

 

5. The International Plumbing Code, 2018 Edition, including Appendix A and B: 

 

a) The following amendments to the International Plumbing Code, as adopted by 

Section 12.A.5 above, are hereby made a part of this rule.  



 

4-20 

 

 

(1) Section 106.6 Fees is repealed.  There are no fees for plan review or inspections.  

Re-inspection fees may apply per Section 4.C.3.   

 

(2) Section 108.4 Violation Penalties is repealed. 

 

(3) Section 108.5 Stop Work Orders is repealed. 

 

(4) Section 109 Means of Appeal is repealed in its entirety. 

 

(5) Section 305.4 Freezing.  The last sentence is amended to read as follows: 

 

Exterior water supply system piping shall be installed below the frost line and not 

less than five-foot six (5’6”) inches below grade. 

 

Exception:  Lawn watering systems need not be installed at the above depth. 

 

Add the following language to the end of this section:   

 

Water services for mobile/manufactured homes shall use a Woodford Thermaline, 

or equivalent water connector, or shall be placed in a 12” diameter by 5 ft. deep 

pipe located up under the home.   

 

(6) Section 305.4.1 Sewer Depth is amended to read as follows:  

 

Building sewers that connect to private sewage disposal systems shall be a 

minimum of 36” inches below finished grade at the point of septic tank 

connection.  Building sewers shall be a minimum of 36” inches below grade.  All 

sewer lines will be required to have a full-size end of line cleanout.   

 

(7) Section 312.3 Drainage and Vent air test.  Drain, waste, venting systems shall be 

tested on completion of the rough piping installation by water or by air with no 

evidence of leakage.  Either test shall be applied to the drainage system in its 

entirety, or in sections after the rough piping has been installed, as follows:   

 

Water test.  Each section of piping shall be filled with water to a point not less 

than 10 feet above the highest fitting connection in that section, or to the highest 

point in the completed system.  Water shall be held in the test section (under test) 

for a period of 15 minutes.  The system shall prove leak free by visual inspection.  

 

Air Test.  The portion under test shall be maintained at a gauge of 5 pounds per 

square inch (psi).  This pressure shall be held without introduction of additional 

air for a period of 15 minutes.  A contractor using air to test plastic pipe shall be 

aware of the risk.   

 

(8) 602.1 General.  WATER REQUIRED is amended to read as follows:   



 

4-21 

 

 

602.1 General. 
 

Every structure equipped with plumbing fixtures and utilized for human 

occupancy or habitation shall be provided with a potable supply of water in the 

amounts and at the pressures specified in this Chapter.  All shared wells shall be 

required to install a dual check valve on each water service line.  If all 

Community Water System regulations are met, the system requirements in 

Section 13 of this document may be used in place of those prescribed in the 2018 

International Plumbing Code.  

 

(9) Section 701.2 Sewer Required is amended to read as follows:  

 

Every building having plumbing fixtures installed and all premises having 

drainage piping shall be connected to a public sewer, where available, or an 

approved private sewage disposal system in accordance with the Delegation 

Agreement.  

 

(10) Section 708.1.1.2 Base of stack is added to read as follows:   

 

A full-size cleanout shall be provided at each end of the line base waste or soil 

stack. 

 

(11) Section 903.2 Frost Closure shall be amended to the following:   

 

Vent extensions through a roof or wall shall not be less than 3 inches in 

diameter.  Any increase in size of the vent shall be made not less than 1 foot 

below the roof line.  

 

(12) Section 410.2 Small Occupancies shall be amended as follows: 

 

Drinking fountains shall not be required for an occupant load of 30 or fewer. 

 

6. The National Electrical Code, 2020 Edition; as copyrighted by the National Fire 

Protection Association, including Article 80, also known as Annex H.  

 

a) The following amendments to the National Electrical Code, as adopted by Section 

12(A)(6) above, are hereby made a part of this rule.  

 

(1) Section 80.1(2) of the National Electric Code is repealed.  

 

(2) Section 80.15 Electric Board of the National Electric Code is renamed Building 

Code Appeals Board. 

 

(3) Section 80.15(A) of the National Electric Code is repealed. 

 

Commented [SGP11]: This is a proposed new amendment 

to Chapter 4.  

 

The original text exempts drinking fountains for buildings 

with design occupant loads of 15 or fewer. This amendment 

expands that exemption to a more lenient requirement.   

 

This proposed change is intended to address a code 

requirement that may not necessarily apply to structures 

located in a rural setting. 

 

 

Commented [SGP12]: The State of Wyoming adopted the 

2020 edition of the NEC effective January 1, 2020. By state 

statute, Campbell County must update our ordinance to 

match the States’ adoption of the 2020 NEC no later than 

July 1, 2020. 



 

4-22 

 

(4) Sections (B) through (H) of Section 80.15 of the National Electric Code are 

repealed. 

 

(5) Sections 80.23(B)(3) of the National Electric Code is repealed.  

 

(6) Section 80.27 Inspectors Qualifications: 

 

(a) Inspectors qualifications as required by Statue Statute 35-9-121(a)(iv) for 

Home Rule requirements only.  For Local enforcement, all Inspectors 

employed by Campbell County can/will do Electrical Inspections.   

 

(b) Sections 80.27(B), (C) and (D) are repealed. 

 

(7) Sections 80.33 and 80.35 are repealed.  

 

(8) Section 230.70(A)(1) Readily Accessible Location is amended to read as follows: 

 

The service disconnecting means shall be installed at a readily accessible location 

outside of a building or structure.  (Note:  Mobile Homes and Manufactured 

Homes shall comply with Article 550 of the National Electrical Code.) 

 

(9) Section 230.79(C) of the National Electrical Code is amended to read as follows: 

 

(a) One- and Two-Family Dwellings and Townhouses.  For a one-family, two-

family or townhouse dwelling, the service disconnecting means shall have a 

rating of not less than 200 amperes, 3-wire.   

 

(10) Section 250.53(A)(2) Exception shall be repealed in its entirety.   
 

7. The International Existing Building Code 2018; 

 

a) The following amendments to the International Existing Building Code, as adopted 

by Section 12.A.7 above, are hereby made a part of this rule.   

 

(1) Section 101.4.2 Building previously occupied, reference to the International 

Property Maintenance Code is removed.  

 

(2) Section 1401.2 Conformance, reference to the International Property Maintenance 

Code is removed.  

 

8. The International Fuel Gas Code 2018 Edition, including all Appendices;  

 

a) The following amendments to the International Fuel Gas Code, as adopted by Section 

12(A)(8) above, are hereby made a part of this rule. 

 



 

4-23 

 

(1) Section 106.6, Fee Schedule, is repealed.  There are no fees for plan review or 

inspections.  Re-inspection fees may apply per Section 4.C.3. 

 

(2) Section 108.4, Violation Penalties is repealed. 

 

(3) Section 108.5, Stop Work Orders is repealed. 

 

(4) Section 109, Means of Appeal is repealed in its entirety.   

 

(5) Section 303.3, Exceptions #3 and #4 are deleted.   

 

(6) Section 621.4 Prohibited Locations is amended to read as follows:  

 

Except in attached or detached garages protected with a carbon monoxide 

detection system and equipped with an oxygen-depletion safety system, unvented 

room heaters shall not be installed with occupancies in Groups A, B, E, F, H, I, M 

or R. 

 

 

9. The Liquefied Petroleum Gas Code (NFPA 58), 2014 Edition, including all Appendices. 

 

10. The Flood Damage Prevention Resolution. 

 

11. Wyoming DEQ, Water Quality Rules and Regulations, Chapter 25 as amended in 

Appendix 1 to Chapter 4, and supplemented as follows: 

 

a) There shall be a maximum of one (1) septic system per any un-zoned parcel 10 acres 

or less in size and no more than one (1) septic system per each un-zoned ten (10) 

acres area on larger parcels.  Multiple septic systems shall be spaced a minimum of 

600 feet apart. 

 

b) The current Campbell County Public Works Building Division Small Wastewater 

System Record shall be used for percolation test procedures, leach field sizing, 

system design, installation parameters and documentation.  

 

c) Remove Sections 5 and 8 – use Small Wastewater System Record.   

 

d) Remove Sections 10c, 10d, 14, 15 16, 17, 19 and Appendix B.  DEQ to regulate these 

items. 

 

 

 

 

Commented [SGP13]: DEQ Chapter 25 as amended is 

now being added to Chapter 4 as an appendix, rather than a 

separate document apart from Chapter 4, ‘Rules for 

Construction’. This is more appropriate and reduces 

confusion for administration. 

Commented [SGP14]: The addition of the term ‘un-

zoned’ is intended to eliminate confusion over the 

administration of this section.  

 

Chapter 7 ‘Zoning Regulations’ already addresses minimum 

requirements for land development within any zoning 

district.  

 

This section was always intended to apply to un-zoned 

parcels and has been administrated as such. The added 

language simply removes any ambiguity and gives greater 

clarity to the original intent.  



 

4-24 

 

Section 13. Community Water Systems. 
 

A. Scope.  The provisions of this section shall apply to the minimum design and installation 

requirements for a Community Water System. 

 

B. Purpose.  The purpose of these standards is to:   

 

1. Protect the health, safety, and welfare of the users of the water system. 

 

2. Provide an alternative method for providing water in lieu of using Chapter 6 of the 

2018 International Plumbing Code.  

 

C. Applicability. 

 

1. The system must have no more than nine (9) Water Service Connections and must 

serve fewer than twenty-five (25) individuals with water for human consumption.   

 

2. A Community Water System shall not be used when serving an average of at least 25 

people with water for human consumption for at least 60 days a year.  These systems 

qualify as Public Water Systems per EPA (Environmental Protection Agency) and 

requirements related to them are found in Wyoming DEQ Water Quality Rules and 

Regulations Chapter 12.   

 

3. For all new systems with four (4) or more Water Service Connections, a Community 

Water System is required.   

 

4. For multi-unit apartment complexes on single parcels, the requirements in Section 13 

based on numbers of Water Service Connections regarding flow, pressure, pipe 

sizing, etc. do not apply as written and must be modified accordingly.   

 

D. Design Parameters and System Requirements.   

 

1. Community Water Systems shall comply with Wyoming DEQ Water Quality Rules 

and Regulations, Chapter 12, except as amended below:   

 

(a) Level of Treatment.  Treatment shall be provided to produce a potable water 

supply that is bacteriological, chemically, radiologically, and physically safe as 

determined by an Engineer.   

 

(b) Surface Water Supplies.  Surface water shall not be used for potable water 

sources. 

 

(c) Ground Water Supplies.  Disinfection equipment shall not be required unless the 

above level of treatment cannot be obtained.  When disinfection equipment is 

necessary it shall be designed by an Engineer. 



 

4-25 

 

 

(d) Treatment.  When treatment is required, one treatment unit capable of the 

maximum demand shall be required and shall be designed by an Engineer. 

 

(e) Equipment Providing Required Flows.  Multiple pumping and/or treatment 

equipment shall not be required.  However, equipment needs shall be determined 

by an Engineer.  

 

(f) Alternative Power.  Alternative power shall not be required unless fire protection 

is provided.   

 

(g) Flow and Pressure Requirements.   

 

(1) Pressure shall be reviewed by an Engineer and included in the design report.   

 

(2) The design flow for the system shall be 7 gallons per minute (gpm) for each 

Water Service Connection plus an additional 10 gpm. 

 

(3) When the design flow from (2) is proportioned to the 1/3 of the locations with 

the highest head loss, a minimum of forty (40) psi shall be met at those 

locations.  

 

(4) When the design flow rate from (2) is proportioned to the ½ of the locations 

with the highest head loss, a minimum of twenty-five (25) psi shall be met at 

those locations. 

 

(h) Finished Water Storage.  

 

(1) Storage shall not be required if a twenty-four (24) hour pump test of the yield 

and drawdown of the well taken as described in DEQ Chapter 12 

demonstrates the well can produce a minimum of ten (10) gpm per Water 

Service Connection and that a submersible pump has been installed which can 

provide pressures as called for in g(3) and g(4). 

 

(2) When the above criteria cannot be met, finished water storage shall be 

provided in the amount of two (2) times the average daily demand for the 

system. 

 

(i) Pumping Units.  Single pumping units as necessary shall be provided.  Alarms are 

not required at attended pump stations.   

 

2. A design report, plans, and hydraulic analysis shall be provided by an Engineer.   

 



 

4-26 

 

3. The Community Water System shall be subject to all applicable codes, permits, and 

inspections required by the Building Division.  

 

4. Backflow prevention in accordance with the 2018 International Plumbing Code shall 

be installed. 

 

5. Piping material shall be any material allowed for potable water piping in Table 605.4 

of the 2018 International Plumbing Code.   

 

6. When providing potable water to four (4) to six (6) Water Service Connections, a 

looped supply line of no smaller than two (2) inches in diameter shall be provided.  A 

water service line shall be extended to the property line for each parcel.  

 

7. When providing potable water to seven (7) to nine (9) connections a looped supply 

line no smaller than three (3”) inches in diameter shall be provided.  A water service 

line shall be extended to the property line for each parcel.  

 

8. Pressure tanks shall be provided in accordance with pump manufacturers 

recommendations.  Minimum volumes shall be three (3) gallons per Water Service 

Connection for variable speed drive pumps and fifteen (15) gallons per Water Service 

Connection for conventional pumps. 

 

9. In addition to the above requirements, forty (40’) feet of surface casing shall be 

installed and the annual space between the borehole and the surface casing shall be 

filled with cement, grout, or bentonite slurried material.  The well bore shall not 

continue until the surface casing is installed.   

 

10. Flushing hydrants shall be provided as determined by an Engineer.  

 

11. Water wells shall be placed at a maximum density of two (2) per forty (40) acres and 

shall provide a minimum of two (2) gpm per Water Service Connection.  

 

E. Construction Requirements. 

 

1. Permitting is required.  Contract Public Works Engineering Division for permit forms 

and general requirements prior to construction.   

 

2. During construction, inspections are required by an Engineer to verify that the project 

is being built according to the approved and permitted design, and that all 

requirements are being met.   

 



 

4-27 

 

3. During construction, inspection is required by Campbell County Public Works 

Engineering Division.  Forty-eight (48) hour notice must be given prior to any work 

being done.   

 

4. The entire Community Water System shall be disinfected and flushed in accordance 

with the Wyoming Public Works Standard Specifications prior to water samples 

being taken.   

 

5. Water samples shall be taken at the curb stop for each Water Service Connection and 

shall be tested.   

 

F. Closeout and Documentation Requirements. 

 

1. The Engineer shall provide ‘as constructed plans’ for the Community Water System 

within thirty (30) days of completion.  

 

2. Maintenance of a Community Water System shall be provided for by a water well 

agreement or home/landowner association documents filed at the Campbell County 

Clerk’s Office.   

 

3. Access and utility easements shall be provided for the water well and storage tanks.  

Easements shall be filed at the Campbell County Clerk’s Office.  

 

4. A copy of the U.W.5 Water Well Permit from the State Engineer’s Office shall be 

provided. 

 

5. Water well ‘as-constructed’ data shall be provided by an Engineer demonstrating the 

water well was constructed in accordance with the current Wyoming State Engineer’s 

Office Water Well Minimum Construction Standards.  

 

6. At a minimum, water quality testing shall be conducted and reviewed by an Engineer 

for the following:  Total Dissolved Solids (TDS), Nitrate & Nitrite as N, Total 

Coliform, Sulfates, Calcium, Magnesium, Sodium, Chloride, Iron, Zinc, Lead, 

Fluoride, Manganese, Copper, Arsenic, pH, and E-Coli.  SAR (Sodium Absorption 

Rate) and/or other constituents to be reviewed as considered as necessary.  

 

7. The test results from the water samples taken at each Water Service Connection shall 

be submitted with the record documents.  

 

8. A written report from an Engineer analyzing EPA Primary Drinking Water Standards 

is required.  

 



 

4-28 

 

9. A map from an Engineer or professional land surveyor shall be provided for all 

Community Water Systems that identifies bearings & distances from property corners 

to the distribution lines. 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

List of Appendices 

 

Appendix 1: DEQ Chapter 25 Amended 

 

Appendix 2: Campbell County Small Wastewater System Permit Workbook and Application 

Commented [SGP15]: The List of Appendices is an 

addition to Chapter 4 for the purposes of codifying all 

technical and permitting requirements for Small Wastewater 

Systems into one location. 



CERTIFICATE OF ADOPTION OF RULES 
 

 
 
Adopting Entity:  Campbell County Board of County Commissioners 
     
Rules Adopted:  Chapter 4, Rules Regulating Construction (These are amended 

rules) 
 
Summary of Amendments: Clarification of current language for Roof Snow Load design 

standards and small wastewater systems (no change to current 
requirements), update the National Electric Code to the 2020 
edition as required by state statute, and amend the International 
Plumbing Code to ease requirements of when drinking fountains 
are deemed necessary. 

 
Statutory Authority:  W.S. 18-5-201 
    W.S. 35-9-121 
 
Date Rules Proposed & 
Available for Inspection: June 16, 2020 
 
Copies mailed to all on 
the mailing list:  Yes 
 
Date of Public Hearing: August 4, 2020 
     
 
Date of Final Adoption: August 4, 2020 
 
Effective Date:  Immediately upon filing with the County Clerk 
 
 
 I hereby certify the attached rules are a true and correct copy of rules adopted by the 
Campbell County Board of County Commissioners in accordance with the Wyoming 
Administrative Procedure Act. 
 
 
 
     __________________________ 
     D.G. Reardon, Chairman      
     Board of Commissioners      
 
 
ATTESTED:        
________________________________    
Susan Saunders, County Clerk     



 

*Individuals wishing to provide public comment are asked to sign in prior to the start of the meeting, provide 
contact information and the topic(s) to be discussed. 

 
 
The following page(s) contain the backup material for Agenda Item: 10:40 Easement Agreement, Donkey Creek 
Pathway 








	Home
	09:00 MEETING CALLED TO ORDER
	PLEDGE OF ALLEGIANCE

	CONSENT AGENDA 
	Consent Agenda
	Min Fire Brd Mtg 072220.pdf (1 page)
	Min Managers Mtg 072120.pdf (1 page)
	Min Regular Mtg 072120.pdf (4 pages)
	Monthly Reports 080420.pdf (8 pages)
	Payroll Report 080420.pdf (1 page)
	AVA 1% Agmt 080420.pdf (2 pages)
	Boys&Girls Club 1% Agmt 080420.pdf (2 pages)
	Conservation District 1% Agmt 080420.pdf (2 pages)
	Healthcare Foundation 1% 080420.pdf (3 pages)
	CLIMB WY 1% Agmt 080420.pdf (2 pages)
	Edible Prairie Project 1% Agmt 080420.pdf (2 pages)
	ECED 1% Agmt 080420.pdf (2 pages)
	GARF 1% Agmt 080420.pdf (2 pages)
	Gillette Main Street 1% Agmt 080420.pdf (2 pages)
	NWCCD Gillette College 1% Agmt 080420.pdf (2 pages)
	PFI 1% Agmt 080420.pdf (2 pages)
	Second Chance Ministries 1% Agmt 080420.pdf (2 pages)
	VAC 1% Agmt 080420.pdf (2 pages)
	Wright Comm Assistance 1% Agmt 080420.pdf (2 pages)
	YES House 1% Agmt 080420.pdf (2 pages)
	Position Vacancy Justifications 080420.pdf (3 pages)


	VOUCHERS
	Vouchers

	PUBLIC COMMENT
	9:05 For the Good of the County*

	OPEN GOVERNMENT
	9:15 County Information 

	REGULAR BUSINESS
	9:20 Board Appointment, Employee Recognition Committee 
	ERC Appointment 080420.pdf (2 pages)

	9:25 Stuart Ranch Tower & Building Space Agreement
	Stuart Ranch Tower & Building Space Agmt 080420.pdf (3 pages)

	9:30 Service Provider Agreement, Adolescent Substance Abuse Treatment 
	Svc Provider Agmt-YES House 080420.pdf (7 pages)

	9:35 Service Provider Agreement, Adult Substance Abuse Treatment
	Svc Provider Agmt-PFI 080420.pdf (7 pages)

	9:40 Service Provider Agreement, Individual & Family Treatment
	Svc Provider Agmt-Counseling Connections 080420.pdf (7 pages)

	9:45 District Support Grant Annual Report FY 2019-20
	FY19-20 DSG Annual Report 080420.pdf (4 pages)

	9:50 District Support Grant, Rocky Point I&S
	Rocky Point DSG 080420.pdf (9 pages)

	9:55 Johnson Simple Subdivision
	Johnson Simple Subdivision 080420.pdf (30 pages)

	10:00 Congestion Mitigation and Air Quality (CMAQ) Resolution
	RES 2050 CMAQ App 080420.pdf (16 pages)

	10:05 Tyler Technologies, Historical Index Module 
	Historical Index Module 080420.pdf (5 pages)

	10:10 Mill Levy Report
	Report of ValuationsLeviesTaxes 080420.pdf (8 pages)


	PUBLIC HEARING
	10:30 Chapter 4 Proposed Amendments
	CHAPTER 4 Rules-Amend 080420.pdf (30 pages)


	REGULAR BUSINESS II
	10:35 Chapter 4 Proposed Amendments
	10:40 Easement Agreement, Donkey Creek Pathway
	Easement-Donkey Creek Pathway 080420.pdf (3 pages)


	ADJOURN 
	Consent Agenda
	MINUTES
	MONTHLY REPORTS
	PAYROLL PAYMENTS
	AGREEMENTS - OPTIONAL ONE PERCENT FY2020-21
	POSITION VACANCY JUSTIFICATIONS
	HAND WARRANTS


