
 

*Individuals wishing to provide public comment are asked to sign in prior to the start of the meeting, provide 
contact information and the topic(s) to be discussed. 

AGENDA 
 

CAMPBELL COUNTY BOARD OF COMMISSIONERS 
 

DG REARDON, Chairman 
RUSTY BELL 
BOB MAUL 

DEL SHELSTAD 

COLLEEN FABER 

AUGUST 18, 2020 
 

09:00 MEETING CALLED TO ORDER 
 PLEDGE OF ALLEGIANCE 

CONSENT AGENDA  

A. Consent Agenda   

PUBLIC COMMENT 

B. 9:05 For the Good of the County*  

REGULAR BUSINESS 

C. 9:15 Request for State Airport Aid, NAVAIDS 2020 Shelly Besel 

D. 9:20 Memorandum of Understanding, Maternal & Child Health Services  Jane Glaser 

E. 9:25 Ary Simple Subdivision  Megan Nelms 

F. 9:30 Collins Simple Subdivision  Megan Nelms 

G. 9:35 Chapter 4 Rules Proposed Amendments Jed Holder 

H. 9:40 Southern Campbell County Arterial Road Reconstruction AML Project Clark 
Melinkovich 

I. 9:45 Memorandum of Understanding, Guardian Ad Litem  Carol Seeger 

J. 9:50 GIS Summer Intern Presentation  Miles Geis/Tony Knievel 

EXECUTIVE SESSION 

K. 10:15 Personnel  

ADJOURN  



 

*Individuals wishing to provide public comment are asked to sign in prior to the start of the meeting, provide 
contact information and the topic(s) to be discussed. 

Consent Agenda 

MINUTES 
Board of Commissioners Library Board Meeting, July 27, 2020  
Board of Commissioners Directors Workshop, August 3, 2020  
Board of Commissioners Regular Meeting, August 4, 2020  
 

MONTHLY REPORTS 
Clerk of District Court - July 2020  
County Clerk - July 2020  
Sheriff's Office - July 2020  
Sheriff's Office, Detention - July 2020  
County Salaries  
941 Tax Report - 2nd Qtr 2020  
Workers Comp Report - 2nd Qtr 2020 

AGREEMENTS - OPTIONAL ONE PERCENT FY 2020-21 
Contract for Services between the Board of Campbell County Commissioners and Council of 
Community Services in the amount of $31,500.  
  
Contract for Services between the Board of Campbell County Commissioners and Cowboy 
State Games in the amount of $11,250.  
  
Contract for Services between the Board of Campbell County Commissioners and Predator 
Management District of Campbell County in the amount of $45,000.  
  
Contract for Services between the Board of Campbell County Commissioners and The 
Salvation Army in the amount of $12,000.  
  
Contract for Services between the Board of Campbell County Commissioners and Senior 
Center Association, Inc. in the amount of $391,500. 

CONTRACTS 
Contract for Purchase between Campbell County and IT Outlet to purchase the Annual 2020 
Computer and Peripheral Equipment. 

CATERING PERMITS 
Spotted Horse Bar for James Heald Ranch Rodeo at the Recluse Community Arena on 
August 29, 2020.  

LINE ITEM TRANSFERS 
Transfer $693 from 020.7085 District Support Grants to 020.7085.21 Rocky Point I&S 

POSITION VACANCY JUSTIFICATIONS 
Fire Department – Firefighter (2 Positions) 

HAND WARRANTS 
Campbell County Clerk Tax Account 331,478.94 



 

*Individuals wishing to provide public comment are asked to sign in prior to the start of the meeting, provide 
contact information and the topic(s) to be discussed. 

 AMOUNT 
Campbell County Treasurer – HAS/FLX 1,533.64  
Campco Federal Credit Union  276.01  
Great West Trust Company 35,641.66  
Wyoming Child Support 1,359.62  
Campbell County Parks & Recreation Activity Fund 31.00  
HM Life Insurance 201,312.20  
Campbell County Clerk Tax Account 20,797.74  
Campbell County Treasurer – HSA/FLX 2,437.49  
Campco Federal Credit Union  950.00  
Great West Trust Company 4,525.00  
Wyoming Department of Revenue & Taxation  47.86  
CCCBT 30,764.65  
CCEHBTA – Health 749,554.74  
CCEHBTA – Dental  42,874.50  
Delta Dental Plan of Wyoming 2,090.50  
Tyler Technologies Inc.  23,535.53  
Tyler Technologies Inc.  31,772.00  
Youth Emergency Services  17,679.70 
 



 

*Individuals wishing to provide public comment are asked to sign in prior to the start of the meeting, provide 
contact information and the topic(s) to be discussed. 

 
 
The following page(s) contain the backup material for Agenda Item: Consent Agenda 



































































































CONTRACT FOR SERVICES AGREEMENT 
COUNCIL OF COMMUNITY SERVICES 

Fiscal Year 2020-2021 

Parties: This agreement is made between the Board of County 
Commissioners, Campbell County, Wyoming, 500 South Gillette Avenue, Suite 1100, 
Gillette, Wyoming, (hereafter "COUNTY") and Council of Community Services, 114 4J 
Road, Gillette, Wyoming, (hereafter, "CONTRACTOR"). 

Purpose: This agreement is for the purpose of establishing the terms and 
conditions of the contract for services between COUNTY and CONTRACTOR, as 
authorized by W.S. 35-1-614 (a). 

Term: This agreement shall be in effect for a one-year term beginning July 
1,2020 and ending on June 30, 2021. 

Payment,:  The COUNTY shall reimburse the CONTRACTOR up to a total of 
$31,500 during the term of this agreement for the services outlined below. 

Termination: CONTRACTOR may terminate this agreement thirty (30) days 
after giving notice in writing to COUNTY of intent to terminate. COUNTY may terminate 
this agreement at any time for any breach thereof by CONTRACTOR or due to lack of 
sufficient funds in the county treasury. Termination by either party ceases further 
obligation on the part of COUNTY to make further payments under this agreement and 
CONTRACTOR shall be required to reimburse COUNTY for monies paid to 
CONTRACTOR under the terms of this agreement which have been paid in advance for 
services not yet rendered. 

Responsibilities of Contractor:  CONTRACTOR shall: 

1. Provide assistance and resources to low-income citizens of Campbell 
County. 

2. Submit to the Campbell County CARE Board a monthly financial statement 
and program statistics, with specific detail on how County funds are being expended for 
County residents. All reports and supporting documentation are due to the CARE Board 
by the 5th of each month in care of: Campbell County Office of the Commissioners, 500 
S. Gillette Avenue, Suite 1100, Gillette, WY 82716. All submitted documentation must be 
approved by your Board and signed by the Board Chairman. 

3. Submit to the COUNTY a copy of your previous year's annual financial 
compilation, review, or audit when completed. 

4. Participate in an annual compliance monitoring visit with the CARE Board. 

FY 2020-21 Contract for Services Agreement - Page 1 



5. Ensure all Board Members attend a Board Training Workshop annually to 
maintain eligibility for CSBG funding. 

Miscellaneous Provisions:  

1. By entering into this agreement, COUNTY does not waive its sovereign 
immunity, or any other defense provided by law. 

2. It is understood by both parties the funding provided to the CONTRACTOR 
is budgeted through the Optional One Percent Sales Tax account, most recently 
approved by the voters of Campbell County in November 2018. 

Signatures: 

CAMPBELL COUNTY 

  

   

D.G. Reardon, Chairman Date 
Board of Commissioners 

ATTEST: 

Susan F. Saunders, County Clerk 

COUNCIL OF COMMUNITY SERVICES 

,  
Chilstina Perry, Board Cr 

ATTEST: 

  

'3 117_/ 2.0 

  

Date 

Scott Wiley, Treasurer 

   

FY 2020-21 Contract for Services Agreement - Page 2 











 

 FY 2020-21 Contract for Services Agreement - Page 1 

  
 CONTRACT FOR SERVICES AGREEMENT 
 THE SALVATION ARMY, A CALIFORNIA CORPORATION 
 Fiscal Year 2020-2021 
  
 
 Parties: This agreement is made between the Board of County 
Commissioners, Campbell County, Wyoming, 500 South Gillette Avenue, Suite 1100, 
Gillette, Wyoming, (hereafter “COUNTY”) and The Salvation Army, a California 
Corporation, P.O. Box 161, Gillette, Wyoming, (hereafter, “CONTRACTOR”). 
 
 Purpose: This agreement is for the purpose of establishing the terms and 
conditions of the contract for services between COUNTY and CONTRACTOR, as 
authorized by W.S. 35-1-614 (a). 
 
 Term:  This agreement shall be in effect for a one-year term beginning July 
1, 2020 and ending on June 30, 2021. 
 
 Payment: The COUNTY shall reimburse the CONTRACTOR, upon receipt of a 
detailed invoice and accurate supporting documentation, up to a total of $12,000 for the 
services set out below.  
 
 Termination:   CONTRACTOR may terminate this agreement thirty (30) days 
after giving notice in writing to COUNTY of intent to terminate.  COUNTY may terminate 
this agreement at any time for any breach thereof by CONTRACTOR or due to lack of 
sufficient funds in the county treasury.  Termination by either party ceases further 
obligation on the part of COUNTY to make further payments under this agreement and 
CONTRACTOR shall be required to reimburse COUNTY for monies paid to 
CONTRACTOR under the terms of this agreement which have been paid in advance for 
services not yet rendered.   
   
 Responsibilities of Contractor:  CONTRACTOR shall: 
 

1. Provide assistance to Campbell County families with healthcare, housing, 
social services and employment.   
 2. Submit to the Campbell County CARE Board a monthly financial statement 
and program statistics, with specific detail on how County funds are being expended for 
County residents.  All reports and supporting documentation are due to the CARE Board 
by the 5th of each month in care of:  Campbell County Office of the Commissioners, 500 
S. Gillette Avenue, Suite 1100, Gillette, WY 82716. All submitted documentation must be 
approved by your Board and signed by the Board Chairman. 
 
 3. Submit to the COUNTY a copy of your previous year’s annual financial 
compilation, review, or audit when completed. 



 

 FY 2020-21 Contract for Services Agreement - Page 2 

 
4. Participate in an annual compliance monitoring visit with the CARE Board. 
 
5. Ensure all board members attend a board training workshop during their 
term of service. 
   

 Miscellaneous Provisions: 
 
 1. By entering into this agreement, COUNTY does not waive its sovereign 
immunity, or any other defense provided by law. 
 
 2. It is understood by both parties the funding provided to the CONTRACTOR 
is budgeted through the Optional One Percent Sales Tax account, most recently 
approved by the voters of Campbell County in November 2018.   
 
 Signatures: 
 
CAMPBELL COUNTY 
 
 
__________________________________ ________________ 
D.G. Reardon, Chairman        Date 
Board of Commissioners 
 
ATTEST: 
 
____________________________ 
Susan F. Saunders, County Clerk 
  
THE SALVATION ARMY, A CALIFORNIA CORPORATION 
 
BY:__________________________________ ________________       
      Date 
 
TITLE:________________________________  
 

Major Richard Pease, Divisional Secretary for Business

July 9, 2020





















 

*Individuals wishing to provide public comment are asked to sign in prior to the start of the meeting, provide 
contact information and the topic(s) to be discussed. 

 
 
The following page(s) contain the backup material for Agenda Item: 9:15 Request for State Airport Aid, 
NAVAIDS 2020 







 

*Individuals wishing to provide public comment are asked to sign in prior to the start of the meeting, provide 
contact information and the topic(s) to be discussed. 

 
 
The following page(s) contain the backup material for Agenda Item: 9:20 Memorandum of Understanding, 
Maternal & Child Health Services  





























































 

*Individuals wishing to provide public comment are asked to sign in prior to the start of the meeting, provide 
contact information and the topic(s) to be discussed. 

 
 
The following page(s) contain the backup material for Agenda Item: 9:25 Ary Simple Subdivision  



Campbell County 
w yoming 

Memorandum Department of Public Works 

TO: Campbell County Board of Commissioners 

FROM: Megan Nelms, AICP, Planner and Zoning Administrator 

DATE: August 11, 2020 

SUBJECT: Ary Simple Subdivision 
A portion of the SW1/4, Section 6, T5ON, R7OW 

Case Number: 19.05 CRSD 

Summary: The applicant is proposing to subdivide 51.16 acres into two parcels, a 
16.07-acre tract and a 35.09-acre tract. It should be noted that the proposed 35.09-acre 
tract cannot be further subdivided through the Simple Subdivision process. 

Current Zoning: Unzoned 

Proposed Zoning: Unzoned — No zoning required outside the Joint Plan Boundary 

Planning Commission Recommendation: At their October 17, 2020 meeting the 
Planning Commission recommended APPROVAL of the proposed simple subdivision, 
pending completion of all planning considerations. 

Staff Recommendation: Staff recommends APPROVAL of the proposed simple 
subdivision. 

Engineering • Building ' Planning • Surveying • Solid Waste • Facilities 



 

z\z 

     

500 South Gillette Avenue 
Suite 1400 
Gillette, Wyoming 82716 

    

Public Works Department 
(307) 685-8061 
(307) 687-6349 Fax Campbell County 

Wyoming 

Ary 
Simple Subdivision 

August 7, 2020 

Planning Commissioners Meeting Board of Commissioners Meeting 
October 17, 2019 

Applicant: Stacy L. Ary Trust Case Number: 19.05 CRSD 

Agent: Doyle Surveying 

Summary: The applicant is proposing to subdivide 51.16 acres into two parcels, a 16.07-acre 
tract and a 35.09-acre tract. It should be noted that the proposed 35.09-acre tract cannot be 
further subdivided through the Simple Subdivision process. 

Legal Description: A portion of the SW1/4, Section 6, T5ON, R7OW 

Location: The property is located on the west side of American Road, approximately 5 miles 
north of the American Road 1-90 exit. 

Current Zoning: Unzoned 

Proposed Zoning: Unzoned — No zoning required outside the Joint Plan Boundary 

Existing Land Use: Vacant grasslands. There is an existing home on the proposed 16.07 acre 
tract 

Adjacent Land Use: North: Scattered residences on larger tracts, UZ 
South: Scattered residences on larger tracts, UZ 
East: Scattered residences on larger tracts, UZ 

West: Scattered residences on larger tracts, UZ 



Water Source: Individual Wells 

Wastewater: Individual Septic Systems 

Planning Considerations: 

1. Sealed, original Record of Survey 

2. Original, signed Simple Subdivision Application 

3. Proposed Tract 1 is in a flag lot configuration. Per Section 7.4(1) flag lots are 
generally prohibited because they have often been used to avoid building a street to 
serve a subdivision, and their use increases the number of approaches onto roads 

The configuration of Tract 1 should be revised to remove the flag lot. Planning 
Commission recommends allowing the flag lot configuration and adding a 
statement on the Record of Survey stating "no access to Tract 1 is allowed via 
Hope Dr." 

4. Survey Revisions: 
a. On the Patriot Lane easement, the ROS shows the record bearing as 64°59'53" 

but the Survey Plat show 65°08'43". The rest of the record bearings and 
distances on the ROS match the Survey 

b. Why is "formerly described as" being added to the legal descriptions? 

5. Cosmetic Revisions: 
a. Label the easement as AMERICAN ROAD not American Ranch Road. 
b. Label each parcel legal description as Tract 1 & Tract 2 

6. Standard Planning Considerations: 
a. Owners & Encumbrance Report (not less than three months old) 
b. Consent to Subdivide 
c. Publisher's Affidavit 

Staff Recommendation: Staff recommends APPROVAL of the proposed simple subdivision, 
pending completion of all planning considerations. 

Planning Commission Recommendation: On October 17, 2019 the County Planning 
Commission recommended APPROVAL of the simple subdivision upon completion of all 
planning considerations. 



SIMPLE SUBDIVISION APPLICATION 
ISOLATED PARCEL (35+ ACRES) RECORD OF SURVEY DIVISION 

SUBDIVISION PERMIT 
Applicant Information 

Name of Applicant: .\--e„. v.. vk , A r i - C ki 6  , ) v -*- ,  
Applicant Phone Number:  1NCEyrz3tot —Applisantlax  Nfirnher,--2  tp g ci - 9( 
Applicant Mailing Address: 'TO. .e:Doy k D 1 to _--t : I tzt-t-.e__ \ \kb< 52.7  ( 7 
Applicant Email Address: 3 1  01 /4  V\  0 Vo  s (a-) b ff  _s yvail  .  
Relationship of of Applicant to 
Property: 

Other 0\Owner • Tenant • Lessee • 

Agent Information 

Name of Authorized Agent (if applicable): —Dg  lia— (.) r v-t-v\I ,,,,,s, \ 
Agent Phone Number: -3 ci . (0,c. lo  . Agent Fax Number:  
Agent Mailing Address: 0. Dl a 14,-PA ..,.-v-, , s--te.., Ls —, Gsat.e.,-1+-(.... \A-1\e 4s2...--/ k k., 
Agent Email: ci, t s C2, V &K. LA) (‘A. - 

he applicant requests to receive correspondence from the Planning Department regarding any submittals received or 
changes made regarding this application. 

plicant Date 

INFORMATION REQUIRED FOR REVIEW: 

1. Legal Description of Area: 14 c 6 , T T.---DGAt •12 7o\ '  
2. Parcel to be divided is a quarter of a quarter section, or, if larger than a quarter of a quarter section, is less 

than seventy acres. 

Total Proposed Area for this Subdivision:,5  ( . t TS-Acres  

3. Parcel is surrounded by land owned by others than the applicant. 

4. Parcel is being divided into two (2)  tracts ECEDVIE 

Parcel 1:  ('p.b7,6 Acres Parcel 2: .35 - tires II SE P 1 2 2019 

5. Parcel sizes both exceed ten (10) acres in size: 

A-31 

143 



A-32 

Landowner's Certification: 

The above or foregoing subdivision SV1 /41 '44 pi, 67501.4. tAhts appears on the attached 
Record of Survey, is made with the free consent, and in accordance with the desires of the undersigned owners and 
proprietors, and that this is a correct survey of the area as it is divided into two parcels; 

That ingress and egress and utility easements have been provided to each parcel by binding and recordable 
easements of not less than forty (40). 

There will be no proposed domestic water source, public sewage disposal system or public maintenance of streets 
or roads. Maintenance of streets or roads will be the responsibility of the lot owners. 

Landowner acknowledges that parcels created under this section shall not be eligible for further subdivision under 
the reduced minimum requirements provided by this section. 

Executed this day of  Se 'e-Ve Kin ker-  A.D., C 1 by 

(It orfi0  ek7,  is\A, 

  

Owner Owner 

STATE OF WYOMING 
) ss. 

,OUNTY OF CAMPBELL ) 

The foregoing Subdivision Application was acknowledged before me by 
this  / 2 day ofSP. 4- , efri,Jer- ,20  VI  . 

Notary Public 

My Commission Expires: 01- 04-  2023 
JONATHAN J. SHANNON - NOTARY PUBLIC 

SEAL County of 
Campbell 

State of 
Wyoming 

MY pommissION EXPIRES JANUARY 4, 2023 

CERTIFICATE OF APPROVAL — CAMPBELL COUNTY PLANNING COMMISSION: 

The foregoing Subdivision Application dated , 20 ,by  
and the attached Record of Survey dated ,20 , is approved by the Campbell County 
Planning Commission this day of , 20 A.D. 

Chairman of the Planning Commission 

Attest: 

Clerk of the Planning Commission 



A-33 

,UBDIVISION PERMIT APPROVAL — CAMPBELL COUNTY BOARD OF COMMISSIONERS 
The foregoing Subdivision Application dated , 20 by and 
the attached Record of Survey dated , 20 is approved by the Board of 
Commissioners in and for the County of Campbell, State of Wyoming, this day of , 20 
A.D. 

Chairman of the Board 

Attest: 

Clerk of the Board 



SECTION r BAS IS BAS OF BEARING. 
N0:1'59'56'W 

Record of Survey 
PART OF 

SW1/4 SECTION 6 
T5ON, R7OW OF THE SIXTH P. N. 
Caryobe 11 County, Wyoni ng 

33' R.M. 

N881.1'42'E, 2048.34 (M) 

L 61
71

6
 f m

,s
t,

s
o.

T O 
N89•28'14E, 904.94 OD 

TRACT 2 
16.078 AC 

cn 

L30' R.N. 

S8853'32' \./, 436.25 (R) 
S89•07'03'W, 435.10(M) 

----. --... 

-, 
."-- -..... 

-......'''''— HOPE DRIVE 0,9, Iv  ....., • - • . . 

60' ACCESS 1..3.-, .." 67-- I. 
UTILITY 

.1"..  G.  
EASEMENT ''.96 s'ii  '-• rfil, 

LEGEND  

o FOUND CORNER MONUMENT 
• SET STEEL REBAR W/ 

ALCAP MARKED "RLS 2333" 

RM (DIST) ON REFERENCE MARKERS 
BASIS OF BEARING  
WEST UNE SECTION 6 

N0O°59'56"W 

BLM BRASS CAP 
1/4 CORNER 

S14/S23 

o o 00 
AMERICAN 1   

I N 7.: ROAD CI ,:.- 
66' PUBLIC I 0 0-.. 

ROAD I '1'1  A DEDICATION —.....„....._ i .17-1  ,a,  

BK 8 PLATS/PG  

I 
I ci, 

3..  
TRACT 1 I 
35.097 AC I 

33' R.M. 
0 0 
00 

I 
Cil CO. 
N , 

I
CD v--Z 

I 

 
0% 1.16Z 

3 a' 
R,m. 

33'/30' R.m. 
.  I PI CI 

S-75'20.25' \..I, 1161.09 

 

Zo Vi as 

1161.12 a 

F3 't 

-- ) 

SCALE 
0 150 300 
I= Mal 

MIN I= 
1' = 300' 

81
73
,I
6
 '/.

1.
9

S,
6
.U

UN
  

O
D

 CO
'01

7 6
 '3

, L
0,

0T
.T

OS
 

BK 8 PLATS/PG 116 

N8802'42'E, 2048.63 (R) 

s/61.1°3  

\• -_PATRIOT LANE 
60' ACCESS & 

UTILITY 
EASEMENT 

BK 8 PLATS/PG 116 

NOTE: 
NO ACCESS TO TRACT 1 
FROM HOPE DRIVE 

SURVEYOR'S CERTIFICATE 

I, Richard T. Doyle, of Gillette, Wyoming, hereby certify that this plat was made from notes 
taken during and actual survey performed under my direct supervision during the months of 
February and March, 2019, and that said survey is accurately represented on this plat and 
is set out on the ground as shown hereon. 

PREPARED BY: 
DOYLE SURVEYING, INC. 
801 E. Fourth St. ,Ste 15 
Gillette, WY 82716 
PH: (307) 686-2410 

DATE OF PREPARATION: 
9-12-2019 

PREPARED FOR: 
Stacy L. Ary Trust 
P.O. Box 1016 
Gillette, WY 82717 



LAND DESCRIPTION 
TRACT 2 

A tract of land situated in the SW1/4 of Section 6, Township 50 North, Range 70 West of the Sixth Principal 
Meridian, Campbell County, Wyoming. Said tract of land being described more particularly as follows: 

Beginning at a point of the West section line of said Section 6 from which the Southwest section corner of 
Section 6 lies S00 59'56"E a distance of 1066.19 feet, formerly described at S01°05'18"E a distance of 1067.40 feet; 

Thence NO0°59'56"W along the said West section line of Section 6, formerly described as N01 °05'18"W, a 
distance of 716.05 feet; 

Thence N89°28'14"E a distance of 904.94 feet; 
Thence S01°10107"E a distance of 940.03 feet; 
Thence N64°59153"W, formerly described as N65°08'43"W, a distance of 525.81 feet; 
Thence S89°07'03"W a distance of 435.10 feet, formerly described as S88°53'32"W a distance of 436.25 feet to 

the point of beginning. 

Said tract of land contains 16.078 Acres more or less, subject to all right, restrictions, reservations and/or 
easements of sight and record. 



LAND DESCRIPTION 
TRACT 1 

A tract of land situated in the SW1/4 of Section 6, Township 50 North, Range 70 West of the Sixth Principal 
Meridian, Campbell County, Wyoming. Said tract of land being described more particularly as follows: 

Commencing at a point of the West section line of said Section 6 from which the Southwest section corner of 
Section 6 lies S00 59'56"E a distance of 1066.19 feet, formerly described at S01°05118"E a distance of 1067.40 feet; 

Thence N00 59'56"W along the said West section line of Section 6, formerly described as NO1 05'18"W, a 
distance of 716.05 feet to the TRUE POINT OF BEGINNING; 

Thence N00°59'56"W along the said West section line of Section 6, formerly described as N01°05'18"W, a 
distance of 198.43 feet; 

Thence N88°1 1'42"E a distance of 2048.34 feet, formerly described as N88°02'42"E a distance of 2048.63feet, to 
the centerline of American Road; 

Thence S08
0 
 11116"E a distance of 644.54 feet, formerly described as S08°20'06"E a distance of 644.56 feet, 

along the said centerline of American Road; 
Thence S08°1 1'16"E a distance of 328.95 feet, formerly described as S08°20'06"E a distance of 328.96 feet, 

along the said centerline of American Road; 
Thence S75 20'25"W a distance of 1161.09 feet, formerly described as 575°11'35"E a distance of 1161.12 feet; 
Thence N64°59'53"W, formerly described as N65°08'43"W, a distance of 149.13 feet; 
Thence N01°10107"W a distance of 940.03 feet; 
Thence S89 28'14"W a distance of 904.94 feet to the point of beginning. 

Said tract of land contains 35.097 Acres more or less, subject to all right, restrictions, reservations and/or 
easements of sight and record. 



880 

Feet 

0 440 

CAMPBELL COUNTY 
DEPARTMENT OF PUBLIC WORKS 

500 S. Gillette Ave.Gillette, Wyoming 82716 
Phone # 307 685-8061 

Fax # 307 687-6349 

N 

Ary Simple Subdivision 

DATE: 9/12/2019 DRAWN BY: mak08 

Campbell County 
wyoming 



4600 _ 

TRACT 2 
ak 16.078 

. -. WELL  

I \ 
IS RESIDENCE 

4620 
SEPTIC 
SYSTEM 

illECE WED 
SEP 1 2 2019 

SW CUR 
SEC 6 

SITE PLAN 
PART OF 

SW1/4 SECTION 6 
T5ON, R7OW OF THE SIXTH P. M. 

Caripbe 1 County, Wyori i ng 

SECTION 
/— LINE 

LITTLE 
POWDER 
RIVER 

• 

S88•53'32'W, 43625 02,- 
,*89•07'03'W, 435.10 (M) 

HOPE DRIVE 464.3.9,o,?.4/  09,, 
60' ACCESS & 

UTILITY 
EASEMENT 

BK 8 PLATS/PG 116 

N89•28 114'E, 904.94 (M) 

!DRIVE POWER 

N8802'42'E, 2048.63 (R) 
N88•11142'E, 2048.34 OD 

AMERICAN RANCH 
ROAD 

\ 66' PUBLIC 
- ROAD 
\ DEDICATION 

FENCE BK EATS/PG 

o•-• 

I 
I 

TRACT
\ 

 1 \. II 
\ 

350 \ AC \* 
\ \ • 

I 
1 
I 

\ 
. I 

.1_ 
'---, I .,_1  

'1 

.2.012,5  5 
'1,419t8).._ 

S15.1:1  
rAf ---_PATRIOT LANE •-yis 

0?) 60' ACCESS & 
UTILITY 

EASEMENT 
BK 8 PLATS/PG 116 

I ...we. 
,,161.1e 

2 

SCALE 
= 300' 

Prepared Port 
Stacy L Ary Trust 
P. a BOX 1016 
Gillette, WY 82717 

BATE OF PREPARATION, 
9/2019 

Prepared by' 
BOYLE SURVEYING, INC. 
801 East Fourth Street 
Suite. 15 
Gillette, WY 82716 
PH: ( qn7) ARA-P4 1 n 



CAMPBELL COUNTY PLANNING COMMISSION 
REGULAR MEETING 
October 17, 2019 
Page 1 

MEMBERS PRESENT 
Todd Hildebrand, Chairman 
Bob Jordan, Vice Chair 
Marc Matlick, Member 
Kurt Siebenaler, Member 
Miles Williams, Member 

STAFF MEMBERS PRESENT 
Megan Nelms, Planner and Zoning Administrator 
Kevin King, Public Works Director 
Clark Melinkovich, Staff Engineer 
Melissia Kershner, County Recorder 

MEMBERS ABSENT 

 

The meeting was brought to order by Chairman Hildebrand at 7:00 p.m. 

Approval of Minutes 

Chairman Hildebrand called for a motion for the approval of the minutes from the 
September 19, 2019 County Planning Commission meeting. Bob Jordan motioned; Marc 
Matlick seconded. All voted Aye. Motion carried. 

Case No. 19.05 CRSD — Ary Simple Subdivision 
Stacy L. Ary Trust/Doyle Land Surveying 

Chairman Hildebrand introduced the case and asked staff to present. Megan Nelms 
presented the case, and recommended approval of the simple subdivision, pending 
completion of all planning considerations. 

Chairman Hildebrand asked if there were any questions. Dick Doyle, agent for Stacy Ary, 
approached the Board. Dick said he disagrees with planning consideration #3 which 
states, "Proposed Tract 1 is in a flag lot configuration. Per Section 7.4(1) flag lots are 
generally prohibited because they have often been used to avoid building a street to serve 
a subdivision, and their use increases the number of approaches onto roads." He reports 
the piece that looks like the "pole" of the flag lot is 200' wide and used to produce hay, 
not as an access. 

Miles Williams asked why they don't use that portion of the lot to increase the acreage of 
the other proposed parcel. Stacy Ary responded she uses the area for income as a hay 
meadow. 

Kurt Siebenaler asked Stacy why she is splitting the property. She responded that she 
would like to sell the house and 16 acres while keeping the remaining 35 acres for 
herself. Bob Jordan asked if she intends to develop the 35 acres to which she said she 
does not; unless she put another home of her own there in the future. Miles Williams 



CAMPBELL COUNTY PLANNING COMMISSION 
REGULAR MEETING 
October 17, 2019 
Page 2 
asked who lives in the house on the proposed 16 acres. Stacy replied the house is hers 
right now. She wants to sell the land with the house and keep the other 35 acres as 
agricultural and have it for income. 

Megan re-iterated Staff's concern regarding the flag shaped lot, noting that any future 
subdividing could use the configuration for access to more developed parcels. Dick 
asked if there could be anything added to the Record of Survey that could prohibit future 
development on that parcel? Stacy reported that when she purchased the property, it was 
with the stipulation in the Covenants that it could only be divided once. Bob Jordan asked 
if that was on record at the court house. Stacy said she thought they were at the 
courthouse or she received it from the title company. Either way, it is stipulated in the 
property covenants. It was noted that neither the title report nor covenants have been 
given to Staff for review. 

There was discussion among the planning commission on the flag lot and if they could 
leave the configuration as is, with stipulations. Megan advised that was correct. They 
could recommend approval with the planning considerations presented by staff, or the 
planning commission can modify the considerations with their recommendation. 

Chairman Hildebrand asked if there were any other comments or discussion. There were 
none. With that, he asked for a motion. Commissioner Williams moved to approve case 
number 19.05 CRSD, Ary Simple Subdivision, pending completion of all planning 
considerations. Commissioner Williams added to the motion the following 
considerations: removing planning consideration #3, thus allowing the flag shaped parcel. 
He added a planning consideration, to require a statement on the Record of Survey that 
no access for Tract 1 is allowed from Hope Drive. He also added that if review of the 
Covenants found that parcels are not limited to just a one-time split, that the case will be 
brought back before the Planning Commission. Commissioner Matlick seconded. Voting 
was as follows: 

Bob Jordan Yes 
Todd Hildebrand Yes 
Kurt Siebenaler No 
Marc Matlick Yes 
Miles Williams Yes 

Motion Carried 4/1. 

Other Business 
The Wyoming Planning Association held their annual conference in Gillette last week 
with a good turnout. One of the items to celebrate is Commissioners Todd Hildebrand 
and Bob Jordan were nominated and then awarded the 2019 Planning Commissioners of 
the Year. Congratulations gentlemen! 



CAMPBELL COUNTY PLANNING COMMISSION 
REGULAR MEETING 
October 17, 2019 
Page 3 

Adjournment 

There being no further business to come before the Board, Chairman Hildebrand 
adjourned the meeting at 7:32 p.m. 

Chairman Hildebrand, Planning Commission Chairman 
mk 

NOTE: Campbell County Planning Commission meeting minutes contain a summary of 
discussions and are not intended to be verbatim. 



Book 2137 of Photos, Page 49 

63670.37 

AGREEMENT CREATING RESTRICTIVE COVENANTS 

We, the undersigned owners of real property in Campbell County, Wyoming, described as 
follows to wit: 

Parcel 1 as described in Exhibit I attached hereto 
Parcel 2 as described in Exhibit 2 attached hereto 
Parcel 3 as described in Exhibit 3 attached hereto 
Parcel 4 as described in Exhibit 4 attached hereto 
Parcel 5 as described in Exhibit 5 attached hereto 
Parcel 6 as described in Exhibit 6 attached hereto 
Parcel 7 as described in Exhibit 7 attached hereto 
Parcel 8 as described in Exhibit 8 attached hereto 
Parcel 9 as described in Exhibit 9 attached hereto 
Tract lA as described in Exhibit 11 attached hereto 
Tract 2A as described in Exhibit II attached hereto 
Tract 3A as described in Exhibit 11 attached hereto 
Tract 4A as described in Exhibit 12 attached hereto 
Tract 5A as described in Exhibit 12 attached hereto 
Tract 6A as described in Exhibit 12 attached hereto 

and as illustrated on the Plat attached hereto as Exhibit "A" ("Subject Properties"), for the purpose 
of mai ntaining fair and adequate property values in the Subject Properties and continuing the Subject 
Properties as desirable residential properties in Campbell County, Wyoming, in consideration of our 
mutual interest as owners of the Subject Properties, we hereby covenant and agree with one another 
as follows: 

1. No trailer house or mobile home shall be placed on any of the above-described 
properties for any reason, unless, any such trailer house or mobile home has 
dimensions of, or exceeding, 25 x 50 feet, and is constructed with a pitched roof, and 
is placed on a concrete foundation; 

2. No more than two (2) residences shall be constructed on, or any way placed on any 
of the above-described properties. 

3. None of the above-described properties shall be divided into more than two (2) 
properties. If any property is divided into two (2) parcels, no more than one (1) 
residence shall ever be placed on each such property; 

4. Garbage disposal shall be the sole responsibility of the property owner. Each 
property owner shall make arrangements to obtain garbage disposal, or otherwise 
ensure that garbage is removed from the property at least one (1) time per week; 

5. No vehicles, machinery, equipment or materials shall be stored on any of the above-
described nronertv. unless any such vehicles. machinery. eauinment or materials are 



Book 2137 of Photos, Page 50 

put to some practical use on the property on which it is being kept at least one (1) 
time per year, or any such vehicles, machinery or equipment are kept in a garage or 
an area enclosed by a privacy fence; 

6. Any construction, maintenance or remodeling of any kind, whether it be plumbing, 
electrical, sewer, or any other construction, maintenance, or remodeling on any of the 
above-described property must fully comply with the UPC and NEC, and must be 
permitted and inspected by the County Engineer, and pass all inspections. 

7. The Subject Properties are to be kept as peaceful and enjoyable residential properties 
free from excessive noise. No property owner shall produce, or in any way cause, or 
foster, unreasonable levels of noise within the Subject Properties. 

8. The road running along the 60 foot access and utility easements traveling through 
Parcels 4, 5, 9, 3A, 4A, 5A as illustrated in Exhibit A attached hereto shall be 
maintained so that it remains in good condition and it shall not deviate from its 
current route. The property owners making substantial else of that access and utility 
easement for purposes of accessing their properties shall be responsible for 
maintaining that road and insuring the road does not deviate from its current route. 
All of the land owners making substantial use of the easement for access to their 
properties shall he responsible for the maintenance of the road and shall equally share 
the costs and expenses of maintaining the road traveling along the easements and 
insuring that the road does not deviate from its current route. 

Any deed, lease, conveyance, or contract made in violation of this Agreement shall be void 
and may be set aside on petition of one or more of the parties to this Agreement, and all successors 
in interest, heirs, executors, administrators, or assigns, shall be deemed parties to this Agreement to 
the same effect as the original signers; and when any such conveyance or other instrument is set 
aside by decree of a court of competent jurisdiction. 

This Agreement Creating Restrictive Covenants may also be enforced by specific 
performance, injunctive relief, or other equitable relief as may be fashioned by the Court. 

All costs and all expenses of any proceedings to enforce the terms of this Agreement creating 
restrictive covenants shall be taxed against the offending party or parties, and shall be declared by 
the Court to constitute a lien against the real estate so wrongfully deeded, sold, leased, or conveyed, 
until paid, and such lien may be enforce in such manner as the court may order. 

This Agreement constitutes a mutual covenant running with the land, and all successive 
future owners shall have the same right to invoke and enforce its provisions as the original signers 
of this Agreement this Agreement shall be deemed effective. 

This Agreement shall become effective upon its execution by all of the parties owning an 

Agreement Creating Restrictive Covenants 
Page 2 of 8 



Donna B. Tanner, this day of March, 2006. 

G LEM 61E3°  rititirlPatia o Octal seal. 
CONY OF STATE OF 
CAN11111. VIY01.111G 

My Ca rraissim &pies sEkt. 11,2006 
M tirsiblrEflitrts".' 

STATE OF WYOMING 
) § 

COUNTY OF CAMPBELL 

Shei Koe Attorney-m- ct for 
Don a B. Tanner 

Book 2137 of Photos, Page 51 

interest in the Subject Properties. 

In witness, each party to this Agreement has caused it to be executed at office of Lubnau, 
& Dumbrill, PC Attorney's at Law on the dates indicated below. 

STATE OF WYOMING ) 
) § 

COUNTY OF CAMPBELL ) 

CZ-2-72,9-ut,  
Donna B. Tanner 

The foregoing Agrgonent Creating Restrictive Covenants was acknowledged before me 

The foregoing Agreement Creating Restrictive Covm-iA was acknowledged before me 
Sheri Koenig, Attorney in Fact for Donna B. Tanner, this  f/--'- day  of March, 2006. 

My 

ial seal. 

STATE OF WYOMING ) 
) § 

COUNTY OF CAMPBELL ) 

Robert Jo on, Attorney-in-Fact for 
Donna B. Tanner 

Agreement Creation Restrictive Covenants 



Witness my hand and official seal. 

GLENDA J. BROWN - 

My Commission Expire 

Book 2137 of Photos, Page 52 

The foregoing Agreement Creating Restrictive C • ,enants was acknowledged before me 
Robert Johnson, Attorney in Fact, this day of , 2005. 

Witness my hand and official seal. 
AVA GLENDA J. BROYM 'AWItiktital‘ 

. • wilitiNINN.' My Commission Expire COMM 
MEM 

STATE°, 
MOM° bile or 

Mr Cowin's(' 14. 20:15 _ 

STATE OF WYOMING ) 
§ 

COUNTY OF CAMPBELL ) 

Chad L. Hooker, Private Client Officer for 
First Interstate Bank as Trustee of Howard A. 
Tanner Testamentary Trust dated February 5, 
1987. 

The foregoing Agreement Creating Restrictive Covenants was acknowledged before me 
Chad L. Hooker, Private Client Officer for First Inter§tate Bank a Trustee of Howard A. Tanner 
Testamentary Trust dated February 5, 1987, this  SW.'  day of — u , 2006. 

STATE OF WYOMING ) 
§ 

COUNTY OF CAMPBELL ) 

Larryliobbs 

The foregoing Agreement Creating Restrictive Covenants was acknowledged before me 
Larry Hobbs, this  /  day of04.0,   2091/0 

Witness my hand and official seal. 

for Donna B. Tann 

    

(Th v.1 

 

nnJs 

MIT M. &GEE. NOTARY PURIC 
fitted E 1.111,1' s: irmapi  

litiOntmEtilortEspireilem 24.200r  

  

My Cs 

 

N ary Pu lie 

 

    

Agreement Creating Restrictive Covenants 
Page 4 of 8 



Book 2137 of Photos, Page 53 

STATE OF WYOMING ) 
) § 

COUNTY OF CAMPBELL ) 

 

Stacy Hobbs 

The foregoing Agreement Creating Restrictive Covenants was acknowledged before me 
Stacy Hobbs, this / day of P..a01.14--- , 2005. 

)̀/trivoatiAkcitittAtiffaint seal. 
2 Cuty 4. CIA el ,1 Campbell .4`N kreflming 

. Comm•Woa Ex re: Jeme 24, 200 My Col 

STATE OF WYOMING ) 
) § 

COUNTY OF CAMPBELL ) 

c-rh  
No r Ptillic 

The foregoing Agjeement reating Restrictive Covenants was cknowledged before me 
Ryan Walker, this t•_.  day of ,2005. 

Witness my hand and official seal. 
GLENDA J. BROWN - NOTARY PUBLIC 

My Commission E pkarrra,  STALE OF COWELL 
WYOUMG 

{if  Camizin Emies DMA 2006 

STATE OF WYOMING ) 
) § 

COUNTY OF CAMPBELL ) 

 

wow_ 
otary --- 

 

  

 

Tawnya Walker, thi 4 day of 
The foregoing Agyement Crg Restrictive Covenants was acknowledged before me 

,2005. 

Witness my hand and official seal. 

My Commission Expires: 

GLENDA J. BROWN - NOTARY PUBLIC 

CCM"' at% spa Of A irronniani rronlinn Pactrirgiva rnvonnttrc 



The foregoing Agrpement C ting Restrictive Covenants was acknowledged before me 
Aric Peterson, this day of e , 2005. 

. V4KOATEPPOATAFOchll seaL  

1 

------------- 

M IltNil Alr„. : WYOWIG Y Cr aon E 
couroy of t .,,?,. STATE OF 

(.1 

0,4 Corrnis! ,:n Dr.:-,s Sni. H. 2006 

STATE OF WYOMING ) 
) § 

COUNTY OF CAMPBELL ) 
nrioffilyNyL nyt- 

 

  

otary Pub ic 

The foregoing Agreeinent Creating Restrictive Covenants was acknowledged before me 
Marissa Peterson, this,-. 12.b-r   day o ,2005. 

Witnessmv.hand.und.official seal. L.1,, uiVid riOTPIFY PUBUC " C  
COWITY CF STATE OF My C ingumion Expty $: 

MOW* 
•••-: I 4. 20Ori 

STATE OF WYOMING ) 
) § 

COUNTY OF CAMPBELL ) 

Notarylr-c 

Book 2137 of Photos, Page 54 

STATE OF WYOMING ) 
) § 

COUNTY OF CAMPBELL ) 

 

Aric Peterson 

Matissa Peterson 

The foregoing Agreement C2nr ting Restrictive Covenants was acknowledged before me 
Ty Anderson, this  -<.,ALL  day , 2005. 

Witness my hand and official seal. 
7- • 

My Commission Expires: °tarp ublic  

s CLEROW.1.  !.:,)*FiliY 

COUNTY OF ;' STATE OF 
CRZELL Via= 

Agr..ement Creating Restrictive Covenants 
Page 6 of 8 



GLf NDA J. BROWN- NOTARY PUBLIC 

CAMEL! WYOMING 
STATE OF COLPOY OF 

1;ly Conrissim &N.H. 2006 

Barbara Hardy 

Book 2137 of Photos, Page 55 

STATE OF WYOMING ) 
) § 

COUNTY OF CAMPBELL ) 

 

Sarah Anderson 

The foregoing Agrrent c,r,a ng Restrictive Covenants was acknowledged before me 
Sarah Anderson, this   day or  tiy„,.4,,,  2005. 

• 
Witness my hand and official seal. 

o STATE OF 
My Commission EXPO : WT°M24G 

STATE OF WYOMING ) 
) § 

COUNTY OF CAMPBELL ) 

The foregoing Agreement Creating Restrictive Covenants was acknowledged before me 
Barbara Hardy, this aa  day of  *4 , 200$ 1 

Witness my hand and official seal. 

My Comn NOtary Pilic isErifxpi 

Zirt SI :17,6 c C17-7-7 .1: 1: .7• • .  

14/ 044wissim ('pen 20114,2006 
WTOMNG 
STATE Of  

STATE OF WYOMING ) 
) § 

COUNTY OF CAMPBELL ) 

J rry \Vat 

The foregoing Agreement Creating Restrictive Covenants was acknowledged before me 
Jeriy Waugh, this  3 day of  4atzed1e.../—e4 , 2005. 

Witness my hand and official seal. 

My Commission Expires: voz.A.W0,31/ otary Publi 

ovvsemalit 



Sheila Waugh 

The foregoing Agreement Creating Restrictive Covenants was acknowled ed before me 
Robert Johnson, this  ;-.2/44(day  , 20155. 

Witness my hand and official sea 

COUNTY OF CAMPBELL ) 
) § c-) 

Witness my hand and official seal. 

My Commission Expires: 

Book 2137 of Photos, Page 56 

STATE OF WYOMING ) 
) § 

COUNTY OF CAMPBELL ) 

The foregoing Agreement Creating Restrictive Covenants was acicnowledged before me 
Sheila Waugh, this  3-4°   day of Agzot 4.t4 .2005. 

Witness my hand and official 

My Commission Expires: 44,04 

STATE OF WYOMING ) 
) § 

COUNTY OF CAMPBELL ) 

seal. 

0V7,706,r Notary Public LOOM 1 STEELE - NOM( NIEUC 

COUP Of o fp) STATE Of 
CM.1FULL OtgA %IMMO 

Lly Ccininion 27, ma 

Robert Johnsc 

eane Jolm 

The foregoing.Agreemen (11) ting R9strictive Covenants was acknowledged before me 
Jane Johnson, this 61 day of ,2005. 

GLENDA J. BITOWN — NOTARY PUBLIC 

COVEY Of STATE Of 
CAMPBELL WYOMING 

Carrrizion EANres Sept 14.2606 

greement Creating Restrictive Covenants 
Page 8 of 8 



Book 2137 of Photos, Page 57 

LEGAL DESCRIPTION 

PARCEL I 

A tract of land located in a portion of the SW 'A of the NW 'A and a portion of the NW 'A of the SW 
'A of Section 7, T 50 N, R 70W of the 6th P.M., Campbell County, Wyoming, being more 
particularly described as follows: 

Beginning at the west 'A corner of said Section 7; thence N 00° 4920° W, 897.00 feet; thence 
S 55° 16 33" E, 1,527.27 feet the centerline of American County Road; thence S 31° 38' 42" W 
along the said centerline of American County Road, 99.57 feet; thence along the said centerline of 
American County Road and a curve to the left, said curve has a central angle of 13° 14' 47", a 
radius of 2,635.00 feet and an arc length of 609.19 feet; thence S 18° 23' 55" W along the said 
centerline of American County Road, 728.81 feet; thence S 87° 09' 35W, 684.26 feet; thence 
N 00° 50' 34" W, 1,334.22 feet to the point of beginning and containing 41.00 acres more or less. 

CERTIFICATE OF SURVEYOR 

I, Robert L. St. Claire, a Professional Land Surveyor duly registered in the State of Wyoming do 
hereby certi that the above legal description is a true and accurate description of the property to 
the best of my knowledge and belief. 

ccG 



Book 2137 of Photos, Page 58 

LEGAL DESCRIPTION 

PARCEL 2 

A tract of land located in a portion of the NW 1/4  and a portion of the North 1/2  of the SW 1/4  of 
Section?, T SON, R 70W of the 6th P.M., Campbell County, Wyoming, being more particularly 
described as follows: 

Commencing at the west V4 corner of said Section?; thence N 440  17' 21" E, 740.13 feet to the 
point of beginning; thence N 30° 36' 03" E, 1,409.74 feet; thence N 08° 20 55" W, 357.21 feet; 
thence S 79° 59' 57" E, 1,003.70 feet to the centerline of American County Road; thence along the 
said centerline of American County Road and along a curve to the right, said curve has a central 
angle of 02° 39' 06", a radius of 4,100.00 feet and an arc length of 189.75 feet to a point of 
compound curve; thence along the said centerline of American County Road and along a curve to 
the right, said curve has a central angle of 19° 13' 24", a radius of 2,462.00 feet and an arc length 
of 826.03 feet thence S31° 38' 42" W along the said centerline of American County Road, 1,112.53 
feet; thence N 55° 16' 33" W, 882.81 feet to the point of beginning and containing 40.00 acres more 
or less. 

CERTIFICATE OF SURVEYOR 

I, Robert L. St. Claire, a Professional Land Surveyor duly registered in the State of Wyoming do 
hereby certify that the above legal description is a true and accurate description of the property to 
the best of my knowledge and belief. 

1z

ioo k Lau(' 

At-St• 



Book 2137 of Photos, Page 59 

LEGAL DESCRIPTION 

PARCEL 3 

A tract of land located in a portion of the South 'A of the NW 'A and a portion of the North '/2 of the 
SW 'A of Section?, T 50 N, R 70W of the 6th P.M., Campbell County, Wyoming, being more 
particularly described as follows: 

Beginning at the center 'A corner of said Section 7; thence N 010  05' 08W, 1,198.19 feet; thence 
N 89° 00 26" W, 616.15 feet to the centerline of American County Road; thence along the said 
centerline of American County Road and a curve to the right, said curve has a central angle of 
09° 25' 52", a radius of 2,462.00 feet and an arc length of 405.26 feet; thence 5310  38 42" W 
along the said centerline of American County Road, 1,212.10 feet; thence along the said centerline 
of American County Road and a curve to the left, said curve has a central angle of 13° 14' 47", a 
radius of 2,635.00 feet and an arc length of 609.19 feet; thence S 18° 23' 55" W along the said 
centerline of American County Road, 728.81 feet; thence N 87° 09' 35" E, 1,972.74 feet; thence 
N 010  0508" W, 1,328.95 feet to the point of beginning and containing 80.12 acres more or less. 

CERTIFICATE OF SURVEYOR 

I, Robert L. St. Claire, a Professional Land Surveyor duly registered in the State of Wyoming do 
hereby certify that the above legal description is a true and accurate description of the property to 
the best of my knowledge and belief. 



Book 2137 of Photos, Page 60 

LEGAL DESCRIPTION 

PARCEL 4 

A tract of land located in a portion of the South 'A of the SW % of Section 6 and in a portion of the 
North Y2 of the NW% of Section 7, T SON, R 70 W of the 6th P.M., Campbell County, Wyoming, 
being more particularly described as follows: 

Commencing at the west % corner of said Section 7; thence N 29° 25' 28" E, 2,407.16 feet to the 
point of beginning; thence S 790  59 57" E, 1,003.70 feet to the centerline of American County 
Road; thence along the said centerline of American County Road and along a curve to the left; said 
curve has a central angle of 18° 18' 56", a radius of 4,100.00 feet and an arc length of 1,310.63 
feet; thence N 080  32' 44" W along the said centerline of American County Road, 487.45 feet; 
thence S 750  1437° W, 1,161.52 feet; thence S 08° 20' 55" E, 1,330.98 feet to the point of 
beginning and containing 40.00 acres more or less. 

CERTIFICATE OF SURVEYOR 

I, Robert L. St. Claire, a Professional Land Surveyor duly registered in the State of Wyoming do 
hereby certify that the above legal description is a true and accurate description of the property to 
the best of my knowledge and belief. 



Book 2137 of Photos, Page 61 

LEGAL DESCRIPTION 

PARCELS 

A tract of land located in a portion of the South 'A of the SW % of Section 6 and in a portion of the 
NW % of Section 7, T SON, R 70W of the 6th P.M., Campbell County, Wyoming, being more 
particularly described as follows: 

Commencing at the west % Corner of said Section 7; thence N 000  4920 W, 897.00 feet to the 
point of beginning; thence N 00° 49' 20" W, 1,726.66 feet to the Northwest corner of Said Section 
7; thence N 01° 06' 29" W, 1,065.62 feet; thence N 88° 53 32 E, 435.23 feet; thence 
S 650  0843" E, 674.96 feet; thence S 08° 2055' E, 1,688.19 feet; thence S 30° 36' 03" W, 
1,409.74 feet; thence N 55° 16 33W, 644.47 feet to the point of beginning and containing 71.50 
acres more or less. 

CERTIFICATE OF SURVEYOR 

1, Robert L. St. Claire, a Professional Land Surveyor duly registered in the State of Wyoming do 
hereby certify that the above legal description is a true and accurate description of the property to 
the best of my knowledge and belief. 

ce

\oa t Land so> 

e 584 04.; e• 
4.5  ,0...st o, =i;N \  

0°, 

ell

5.4 , 
wromi0 



Book 2137 of Photos, Page 62 

PARCEL 6 

A tract of land located in a portion of the South 'A of the SW Vs of Section 7, T SON, R 70W of the 
6th P.M., Campbell County, Wyoming, being more particularly described as follows: 

Beginning at the Southwest 'A corner of said Section 7; thence N 87° 04 36" E, 2,662.94 feet to the 
South Vs corner of said Section 7; thence N 01° 05' 08" W, 1,328.95 feet; thence 
S 87° 09' 35" W, 2,657.00 feet; thence S 00° 5007° E, 1,330.00 feet to the point of beginning and 
containing 81.23 acres more or less. 



Book 2137 of Photos, Page 63 

LEGAL DESCRIPTION 

PARCEL 7 

A tract of land located in a portion of the NW /4 ofof Section 6, T SON, R 70 Wand a 
portion of the SW 'A of Section 31, T 51 N, R 70 W of the 6th P.M., Campbell County, 
Wyoming, being more particularly described as follows: 

Beginning at the Northwest comer of said Section 6; thence N 88° 02' 42" E, 2,788.27 
feet; thence S 29° 05' 06" W, 589.95 feet; thence S 27° 27' 43" W, 139.35 feet; thence 
along a curve to the left, said curve has a radius of 1,088.07 feet, a central angle of 
26° 57' 34" and an arc length of 511.97 feet; thence S00° 30' 10" W, 326.58 feet; thence 
along a curve to the right, said curve has a radius of 1,891.88 feet, a central angle of 
14° 50' 19" and an arc length of 489.96 feet; thence S 15° 20' 29" W, 28.47 feet; thence 
S 88° 02' 42" W, 2,198.98 feet; thence N 01° 06' 19" W, 1,949.65 feet to the point of 
beginning, said tract contains 107.11 acres more or less. 

CERTIFICATE OF SURVEYOR 

I, Robert L. St. Claire, a Professional Land Surveyor duly registered in the State of 
Wyoming do hereby certify that the above legal description is a true and accurate 
description of the property to the best of my knowledge and belief. 



Book 2137 of Photos, Page 64 

LEGAL DESCRIPTION 

PARCELS 

A tract of land located in a portion of the West 'A of Section 6, T 50 N, R 70W of the 6th 
P.M., Campbell County, Wyoming, being more particularly described as follows: 

Commencing at the South 'A comer of said Section 6; thence N 18° 01' 37" W, 2,026.88 
feet to the point of beginning; thence N 05° 01' 09" W, 597.77 feet; thence along a curve 
to the right, said curve has a radius of 500.00 feet, a central angle of 20° 21' 38", an arc 
length of 177.68 feet, a chord bearing of N 05° 09'40" E and a chord length of 176.75 
feet; thence N 15° 20' 29" E, 607.63 feet; thence S 88° 02' 42" W, 2,198.98 feet; thence 
S 01° 06' 19" E, 691.81 feet; thence S 01° 05' 19" E, 660.79 feet; thence 
N 88° 02' 42" E, 2,048.63 feet to the point of beginning, said tract contains 64.03 acres 
more or less. 

CERTIFICATE OF SURVEYOR 

I, Robert L. St. Claire, a Professional Land Surveyor duly registered in the State of 
Wyoming do hereby certify that the above legal description is a true and accurate 
description of the property to the best of my knowledge and belief. 



Book 2137 of Photos, Page 65 

LEGAL DESCRIPTION 

PARCEL 9 

A tract of land located in a portion of the SW V. of Section 6, T SON, R 70W of the 6th 
P.M., Campbell County, Wyoming, being more particularly described as follows: 

Commencing at the Southwest corner of said Section 6; thence N 01* 05' 18" W, 
1,067.40 feet to the point of beginning; thence N 01° 05' 18" W, 914.97 feet; thence 
N 88° 02'42" E, 2,048.63 feet; thence S 08° 20' 06" E, 973.52 feet; thence 
S 75° 12' 01" W, 1,161.62 feet; thence N 65° 08' 43" W, 674.96 feet; thence 
S 88° 53' 32" W, 435.74 feet to the point of beginning, said tract contains 51.19 acres 
more or less. 

CERTIFICATE OF SURVEYOR 

1, Robert L. St. Claire, a Professional Land Surveyor duly registered in the State of 
Wyoming do hereby certify that the above legal description is a true and accurate 
description of the property to the best of my knowledge and belief. 



Book 2137 of Photos, Page 66 

LEGAL DESCRIPTIONS 

TRACT lA 

A tract of land that is in the East 1/4  of the NE V4 of Section 12, T SON, R 71 W of the 6th 
P.M., Campbell County, Wyoming, being more particularly described as follows: 

Beginning at the East 1/4  corner of said Section 12; thence S 89° 16' 35" W, 1,328.40 feet; 
thence N 000  36' 25" W, 1,316.21 feet; thence N 87° 54' 35"E, 1,324.63 feet; thence 
S 000  47' 09" E, 1,347.81 feet to the point of beginning, said tract contains 40.56 acres 
more or less. 

TRACT 2A 

A tract of land that is in the NE 'A of the NE 1/4  of Section 12, T 50 N, R 71 W of the 6th 
P.M., Campbell County, Wyoming, being more particularly described as follows: 

Beginning at the Northeast corner of said Section 12; thence S 000  50' 41" E, 1,275.90 
feet; thence S 87° 54' 35" W, 1,324.63 feet; thence N 00° 36' 25" W, 1,316.21 feet; 
thence N 89° 39' 18" E, 1,318.91 feet to the point of beginning, said tract contains 39.32 
acres more or less. 

TRACT 3A 

A tract of land that is in the SE 1/4  of the SE 1/4  of Section 1, T 50 N, R 71 W of the 6th 
P.M., Campbell County, Wyoming, being more particularly described as follows: 

Beginning at the Southeast corner of said Section 1; thence S 89° 39' 18" W, 1,318.91 
feet; thence N 010  10' 53" W, 1,323.57 feet; thence N 89° 44' 24" E, 1,321.08 feet; 
thence S 01° 05' 18" E, 1,321.58 feet to the point of beginning, said tract contains 40.07 
acres more or less. 



Book 2137 of Photos, Page 67 

PAGE 2 

TRACT 4A 

A tract of land that is in the NE 1/4  of the SE V. of Section 1, T 50 N, R 71 W of the 6th 
P.M., Campbell County, Wyoming, being more particularly described as follows: 

Beginning at the East corner of said Section 1; thence 5010 05 18" E, 1,321.58 feet; 
thence S 89° 44' 24" W, 1,321.08 feet; thence Not' 10' 05" W, 1,324.44 feet; thence 
N 89° 51' 45" E, 1,322.96 feet to the point of beginning, said tract contains 40.15 acres 
more or less. 

TRACT 5A 

A tract of land that is in the SE 'A of the NE of Section 1, T SON, R 71 W of the 6th 
P.M., Campbell County, Wyoming, being more particularly described as follows: 

Beginning at the East y  corner of said Section 1; thence S 89° 51' 45" E, 1,322.96 feet; 
thence N 010  10' 01" W, 1,317.73 feet; thence N 89° 43' 54" E, 1,324.33 feet; thence 
S 01° 06' 19" E, 1,320.73 feet to the point of beginning, said tract contains 40.08 acres 
more or less. 

TRACT 6A 

A tract of land that is in the NE 1/4  of the NE V, of Section 1, T 50 N, R 71 W of the 6th 
P.M., Campbell County, Wyoming, being more particularly described as follows: 

Beginning at the Northeast corner of said Section 1; thence S 01° 06' 19" E, 1,320.73 
feet; thence S 89° 43' 54" W, 1,324.33 feet; thence N 01° 10' 01" W, 1,317.73 feet; 
thence N 89° 36' 03" E, 1,325.70 feet to the point of beginning, said tract contains 40.12 
acres more or less. 

CERTIFICATE OF SURVEYOR 

I, Robert L. St. Claire, a Professional Land Surveyor duly registered in the State of 
Wyoming do hereby certify that the above legal descriptions are a true and accurate 
description of the easements to the best of my knowledge and belief. 



T1111 
T50,1 

3.t 11 

ok 2137 of Photos, Page 68 

WM m 

Bi 

••••••••••0 

Injects.* 7'1 

.1t 
k' 

—rrf<MIEN.3 101111. 
•1  

9,12 

1 

r 
41.2w.  I tint 

TI 

§. 
Mater. 

LIRE TABLE 

I 
19 
11 
11 

tritGpi  
(11.4 

.C.5111.0 
1111-VGIM1 

41.• 

21111  

11770 irst,ca 1.1 illif  
Lis  1.11 UUB  
CURVE TABLE 

WIVE 

111  311.11 

RADIUS ti.10-L 
tells 

11 
.5 

tifittWastivit 
"EgV  

1 • MIX itr,111.  411011%17•• 
2. b. I.  Wel 

21.11,IY 

10.1, awed, 

it 

it 

•12•11 'eatit 

LLCM 

• MOM DRABS CAP 

• TWO ALUNIHUI CAP 

• BET AMR I 0LVIIIIAA1 CAP 

OCTo RC1AR C ittlimint11 CAP AT 73 orrsEr 

II- 
// st z 

11Iti. 
O 300 000 

EXHIBIT A 

1 Inch = 800 IL 

int..12,PC 
art•Siatt -L 

195.21.21.( 
.111.217,-( 
nie-Avrit 

ittlsriala 

"14 
50tim 

411.1.10 
.11•261 
5.4,4 

1111111. 



First American 

  

Schedule A 

EC 1VE 

AUG - 7 2020 

Public Works 
Building Division 

Condition of Title Guarantee 
ISSUED BY 

First American Title Insurance Company 
GUARANTEE NUMBER 

3538013 

File No.: 4539-3538013 

Guarantee No. 3538013 Amount of Liability: $300.00 

Date of Guarantee: July 15, 2020 at 7:30 A.M. Fee: $250.00 

1. Name of Assured: 

Stacy L Ary Trust 

2. The estate or interest in the Land which is covered by this Guarantee is: 

Fee Simple 

3. The Land referred to in this Guarantee is described as follows: 

Real property in the County of Campbell, State of Wyoming, described as follows: 

A tract of land located in a portion of the SW1/4  of Section 6, T5ON, R7OW of the 6th P.M., Campbell County, 
Wyoming, being more particularly described as follows: 

Commencing at the Southwest corner of said Section 6; thence N01°05'18"W, 1,067.40 feet to the point of 
beginning; thence N01°05'18"W, 914.97 feet; thence N88°02'42"E, 2,048.63 feet; thence S08°20'06"E, 973.52 feet; 
thence S75°12'01"W, 1,161.62 feet; thence N65°08'43"W, 674.96 feet; thence S88°53'32"W, 435.74 feet to the point 
of beginning. 

4. ASSURANCES: 

According to the Public Records as of the Date of Guarantee, 

a. Title to the estate or interest in the Land is vested in: 

Stacy L. Ary, Trustee of the Stacy L. Ary Trust dated September 1, 2016 

b. Except for the matters shown in Schedule B, there are no defects, liens, encumbrances or other matters affecting 
title to the estate or interest in the land shown in Schedule A, which matters are not necessarily shown in the 
order of their priority 

Form 50036956 (10-17-19) Page 5 of 7 Condition of Title Guarantee (7-17-19) 
Wyoming 

  



First American 

Schedule B 

Condition of Title Guarantee 
ISSUED BY 

First American Title Insurance Company 
GUARANTEE NUMBER 

3538013 

File No.: 4539-3538013 

1. Documents, liens or other matters that are indexed by name only but which, if any exist, may affect title or 
impose liens or encumbrances on the Land. 

2. Surface and Damage Agreement and the terms and conditions thereof: 
Owner: 
Operator: 
As disclosed by: 
Recorded: 
Recording No.: 

Donna B. Tanner 
Pacific Enterprises Oil Company (USA) 
Oil and Gas Lease 
March 25, 1991 
Book 1139 of Photos, page 271 

3. Right of way, including terms and conditions contained therein: 
Granted to: Tri-County Electric Association, Inc. 
For: Electric lines 
Recorded: December 29, 1993 
Recording Information: Book 1274 of Photos, page 419 

4. Easement(s), including the terms and conditions thereof, as shown on the American Ranch 
Properties Access Road Easements plat: 
Recorded: March 15, 2006 
Recording Information: Book 8 of Plats, page 116 

5. Covenants, conditions, restrictions and/or easements; but deleting any covenant, condition or 
restriction indicating a preference, limitation or discrimination based on race, color, religion, sex, 
handicap, family status, or national origin to the extent such covenants, conditions or restrictions 
violate Title 42, Section 3604(c), of the United States Codes: 
Recording Information: March 15, 2006 in Book 2137 of Photos, page 49 

6. American Road and Patriot Lane as it may cross the Land. 

7. Mortgage and the terms and conditions thereof. 
Mortgagor: Stacy Lynn Hobbs, a single person 
Mortgagee: First National Bank of Gillette 
Amount: $236,800.00 
Recorded: July 25, 2012 
Recording Information: Book 2725 of Photos, Page 179 

Form 50036956 (10-17-19) Page 6 of 7 Condition of Title Guarantee (7-17-19) 
Wyoming 



Assignment of Mortgagee's interest: 
Assignee: Wyoming Community Development Authority 
Recorded: July 27, 2012 
Recording Information: Book 2725 of Photos, Page 494 

Partial Release of Real Estate Mortgage recorded May 26, 2020 in Book 3274 of Photos, Page 109. 

Form 50036956 (10-17-19) Page 7 of 7 Condition of Title Guarantee (7-17-19) 
Wyoming 

   



CONSENT TO SUBDIVIDE 

COMES NOW, Wyoming Community Development Authority, who is the holder and real party of 

interest in the documents entitled Mortgage, recorded 27 July 2012 in Book 2725, Page 494 between 

Stacy L. Hobbs, a/k/a Stacy L. Ary and Wyoming Community Development Authority 

For the following described property; 

Part of the SW1/4 of Section 6, T50N,R7OW of the 6 th  P.M., Campbell County, Wyoming 

hereby consent to the subdivision by Stacy L. Hobbs, a/k/a Stacy L. Ary for the following described 

property, to-wit: 

Part of the SW1/4 of Section 6, T5ON,R7OW of the 6 1h P.M., Campbell County, Wyoming 

I hereby agree that to the best of my knowledge binding arrangements have been made to 

assure purchasers of any part of the subdivision that upon full payment of the purchase price a deed can 

and will be delivered conveying merchantable title subject only to noted reservations or restrictions of 

record and free of encumbrances not specifically assumed by the purchasers, subject only to a 

proportionate share of such taxes and assessments thereon 

DATED this  k "  day of  ,20 
- - !.(27s -. c:2 Tsl 

as -(Title) for Wyoming`Community Devel pment Authority 

STATE OF WYOMING 

) ss 

COUNTY OF 

The foregoing instrurwnt was acknowledged before me this II'  day of 
Ce.3k 

20V2 by  Grvi  I LAVIciress  
(Title)1)1(645 SaliiGiV ilfor  Wyoming Community Development Authority 

My commission expires: 16/( 6 /24 

CAILIN E OUINLAN - NOTARY PUBLIC 
COON! Y OF  4,  STATE or NATTIONA 

WYOM:NG 
MY COMMISSION EXPIRES klAY 16, 2(121 



Name Mailing Address Mailing City Mailing St Mailing Zip 
Robert L & Jane E Johnson Po Box 2373 Gillette WY 82717 

Aric N & Marissa L Peterson Po Box 1966 Gillette WY 82717 

Andrew W & Marcia L Jordan Po Box 2695 Gillette WY 82717 

Ary Stacy L Trust Po Box 1016 Gillette WY 82717 

Tyrel G & Sarah L Anderson 500 Hope Dr Gillette WY 82716 

Roger & Lavon Anton 550 American Rd Gillette WY 82716 

Lowell T Schweitzer 559 American Rd Gillette WY 82716 

Melgaard Family Limited Partnership Po Box 2408 Gillette WY 82717 



Affidavit of Publication  

;TATE OF VVYOMING SS 
COUNTY OF CAMPBELL } 

Ann Kennedy Turner, being duly sworn, says: 

That she is Publisher of the The Gillette News Record, a 
daily newspaper of general circulation, printed and 
published in Gillette, Campbell County, Wyoming; that the 
publication, a copy of which is attached hereto, was 
published in the said newspaper on the following dates: 

September 27, 2019, October 04, 2019 

NOTICE OF APPLICATION FOR SUBDIVISION PERMIT 
NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN THAT STACY L. ARY TRUST, GILLETTE, 

WYOMING, APPLIED FOR A PERMIT TO SUBDIVIDE PART OF THE SW1/4 OF 
SECTION 6, T5ON, R7OW, CAMPBELL COUNTY, WYOMING. A FINAL PLAT WILL 
BE REVIEWED AT THE CAMPBELL COUNTY PLANNING COMMISSION 
MEETING ON OCTOBER 17, 2019.41 7:00 P.M. IN THE CAMPBELL COUNTY 
COMMISSION CHAMBERS AT 500 SOUTH GILLETTE AVENUE. THE PLAT CAN 
BE REVIEWED AT THE CAMPBELL COUNTY PUBLIC WORKS DEPARTMENT, 
500 SOUTH GILLETTE AVENUE, GILLETTE, WYOMING. 
September 27, October 4, 2019 

That said newspaper was regularly issued and circulated 
on those dates. 
SIGNED: 

Publisher 

Jbscribed to and sworn to me this 4th day of October 
2019. 

VALERIE A. Kt i 14.'a - 

COUNTY OF STATE OF 
WYOMING CAMPBELL 

My CommIssion 77. .'S$ \  

Valerie A. Kettrey, Notary Public, Cam ell County, 
Wyoming 

My commission expires: August 03, 2021 

Publication Fees: $ 85.44 

00032572 00355914 

Stacy Ary 
Stacy L. Ary Trust 
PO Box 1016 
Gillette, WY 82717 



 

*Individuals wishing to provide public comment are asked to sign in prior to the start of the meeting, provide 
contact information and the topic(s) to be discussed. 

 
 
The following page(s) contain the backup material for Agenda Item: 9:30 Collins Simple Subdivision  



 

Engineering   Building    Planning    Surveying  Solid Waste  Facilities  

 
 

 

 

    

    

 

TO:    Campbell County Board of Commissioners 

 

FROM:   Megan Nelms, AICP, Planner and Zoning Administrator 

 

DATE:   August 18, 2020 

 

SUBJECT:  Collins Simple Subdivision  

 A portion of Sections 10 & 11, T43N, R72W 

 

     

Case Number:  19.01 CRSD 

         

Summary: The applicant is proposing to subdivide 39.99 acres into two parcels, a 

20.01-acre tract and a 19.98-acre tract. 

 

Current Zoning:  Unzoned  

 

Proposed Zoning: Unzoned – No zoning required outside the Joint Plan Boundary 

 

Planning Commission Recommendation: At their March 21, 2019 meeting the Planning 

Commission recommended APPROVAL of the proposed simple subdivision, pending 

completion of all planning considerations. 

 

Staff Recommendation: This case was previously presented to the Board of 

Commissioners at their April 16, 2019 meeting. At that time, the subdivision request  

was DENIED by the Commission with a 2-2 vote.  

 

The denial was primarily caused by the applicant’s unwillingness to zone the two  

proposed parcels. The Simple Subdivision rules require zoning of a new split if the  

property lies within the 1-mile joint planning boundary with either the City of Gillette or  

the Town of Wright. This property lies approximately 550 feet beyond that boundary.  

 

The zoning in the area of the proposed subdivision, which is now part of the Little  

Thunder Acres Improvement & Service District is not comprehensive and there are  



 

Engineering   Building    Planning    Surveying  Solid Waste  Facilities  

many incompatible zones adjacent to one another (i.e. Rural Residential adjacent to a  

Light Industrial District) as well as many parcels that remain unzoned. This lack of  

comprehensive zoning has resulted in incompatible land uses. 

 

The applicant now wishes to have the Commission reconsider the subdivision permit  

request. The application and proposed subdivision layout remain the same.  

 











































 

*Individuals wishing to provide public comment are asked to sign in prior to the start of the meeting, provide 
contact information and the topic(s) to be discussed. 

 
 
The following page(s) contain the backup material for Agenda Item: 9:35 Chapter 4 Rules Proposed 
Amendments 



 

Department of Public Works     Kevin C. King, P.E., Director 

500 S. Gillette Avenue, Suite 1400, Gillette, WY 82716   ●   307-685-8061   ●   Building 307-682-1970   ●   Solid Waste/Recycle 307-682-9499 

 

 

 

 

Memo 

To:  Campbell County Commissioners 

From:  Jed Holder, Building Code Official 

CC:  Kevin King, Carol Seeger, Megan Nelms 

RE:  Chapter 4 Revision--Public Comment 

During the public comment segment of 2020 Chapter 4 Rules changes/updates, 

we received no public comments. We did receive two comments from 

Commissioner Faber outlined below. 

Section 12, A.11.a) p.4-23 Language used for un-zoned septic systems.  

Section 12, A ,5a) (12) p.4-21 Suggested to eliminate the drinking fountain 

requirements. 

 



 

4-1 

 

CHAPTER 4 

RULES REGULATING CONSTRUCTION 

Amended December, 2018 

 

 

Section 1. Authority. 

 

This Chapter is adopted pursuant to the authority granted by W.S. 18-5-105, W.S. 35-9-121 and 

W.S. 35-11-304 and supersedes all previous Rules Regulating Construction. 

 

Section 2. Definitions. 

 

As used in this Chapter, the following definitions apply: 

 

A. “Applicant” means the owner or authorized agent making application for a permit. 

 

B. “Automatic Sprinkler System” is an integrated system of a water source, piping, and heat 

activated fire suppression devices designed in accordance with fire protection engineering 

standards as fully defined in 2015 IFC Chapter 2. 

 

C. “Average Daily Demand” means the total annual water use divided by the number of days 

the system was in operation.  A minimum average daily demand of four hundred (400) 

gallons per day per Water Service Connection shall be used, unless the annual water use is 

available.  Comparable records may be used if approved by the Building Code Official.  

 

D. “Building Division” means the division of the Campbell County Department of Public Works 

responsible for issuing Building, Electrical, Mechanical and Plumbing Permits and 

performing inspections on that work.  

 

E. “Building Code Appeals Board” means a Board created by the Campbell County 

Commissioners (Resolution 1449) to hear and decide appeals of orders, decisions or 

determinations made by the Building Code Official or Fire Code Official relative to the 

application and interpretation of this code.  

 

F. “Building Code Official” means the officer or other designated authority or a duly authorized 

representative charged with the administration and enforcement of this code.  The position of 

Building Code Official is also referred to as the “Administrative Authority”, “Authority 

Having Jurisdiction”, “Code Official”, and “Fire Code Official” as those titles are used to 

refer to the individual responsible for administration and enforcement of the codes adopted in 

this Chapter. 

 

G. “Building Permit” means an official certificate of authorization by the Building Division for 

construction, enlargement or alteration of a building in accordance with Section 6. 

 



 

4-2 

 

H. “Central Stations” means a system or a group of systems in which the operations of circuits 

and devices are transmitted automatically to, recorded in, maintained by, and supervised 

from a listed central station that has competent and experienced servers and operators who, 

upon receipt of a signal, take such action as calling the local dispatch (fire or law 

enforcement).   

 

I. “Commercial Building” means all buildings not included in the definition of Residential 

buildings.  

 

J. “Community Water System” means a water supply system that has no more than nine (9) 

Water Service Connections and serves fewer than twenty-five (25) individuals with water for 

human consumption, which is permitted through the Campbell County Public Works 

Department and Chapter 4, Rules Regulation Construction.  

 

K. “Cross Connection” means any actual or potential connection between a potable water supply 

and any other source or system through which it is possible to introduce contamination into 

the system.  

 

L. “Delegation Agreement” means the current agreement between the Wyoming Department of 

Environmental Quality and Campbell County in accordance with W.S. 35-11-304 by which 

Campbell County has assumed authority for the enforcement and administration of the 

permitting of Residential Small Wastewater Systems, publicly owned and controlled sewage 

collection facilities, and publicly owned and controlled water distribution facilities. 

 

M. “Electrical Wiring Permit” means an official certificate of authorization issued by the 

Building Division in accordance with W.S. 35-9-120(e) and 35-9-121 and Section 7.  

 

N. “Engineer” means a professional engineer licensed with the State of Wyoming Board of 

Professional Engineers and Professional Land Surveyors.  In Section 13, any item required to 

be completed by an Engineer may also be completed by a professional geologist licensed 

with the Wyoming State Board of Professional Geologists.  

 

O. “Farm or Ranch Operation” means that the primary use of the property where the structures 

are located, along with any leased or owned property adjacent to or in close proximity to the 

subject parcel, is to produce agricultural products or to graze livestock for monetary profit as 

a primary source of income.  

 

P. “Flood Damage Prevention Resolution” is a resolution adopted by the Campbell County 

Commissioners on January 2, 2008 for the purpose of minimizing losses due to flooding in 

specific areas of the county.  

 

Q. “Looped Water System” means a water distribution system whereby any Water Service 

Connection can receive water from two (2) directions.  

Commented [SGP1]: We are proposing to strike the word 

‘residential’, just leaving the term ‘small wastewater 

systems’. Small Wastewater Systems as defined by DEQ 

already encompasses residential. By striking the word 

‘residential’ here, it removes that limitation and leaves the 

scoping authority to the delegation agreement that is in effect 

at the time.   



 

4-3 

 

 

R. “Mechanical Permit” means an official certificate of authorization by the Building Division 

for heating, ventilation, air conditioning and gas line work in accordance with Section 8.  

 

S. “Meter Pits” must be Mueller single or double meter pits or an approved equal and shall 

contain backflow prevention and shut-off valves.  Approval shall be made by the Building 

Code Official.  

 

T. “Owner” means the person holding title to real property.  

 

U. “Platted Subdivision” means any parcel or lot created through the subdivision plat process 

and where a map, drawn to scale by a licensed surveyor, showing how a portion of land is 

divided into blocks and lots, and showing streets, alleys and easements, common areas, 

dedications and other attributes, pursuant to the requirements of Campbell County Chapter 6, 

Subdivision Regulations and W.S. 18-5-306, is recorded in the land vault of the County 

Clerk’s Office.  Parcels created through a Record of Survey or subdivision exemption 

process shall not be considered part of a platted subdivision.  

 

V. “Plumbing Permit” means an official certificate of authorization issued by the Building 

Division in accordance with Sections 9 and 10 for domestic or commercial water supplies, 

sewage disposal, and all piping and materials necessary to complete these activities.  

 

W. “Potable Water” means water meeting EPA Primary Drinking Water Standards.  

 

X. “Remodeling” includes repairing, altering, or expanding a building or its plumbing, 

mechanical or electrical systems.  

 

Y. “Residential” means a building where more than half of the floor area is used for dwelling 

purposes.  

 

Z. “Rules Regulating Construction” means this document as adopted by the Board of 

Commissioners.  

 

AA. “Small Wastewater System” means any sewage system, disposal system, or treatment       

works having simple hydrologic and engineering needs which is intended for wastes 

originating from a single Residential unit serving no more than four (4) families or which 

distributes two thousand (2,000) gallons or less of domestic sewage per day.  

 

BB. “Water Service Connection” means any water line or pipe connected to a distribution 

supply main or pipe for the purpose of conveying water to a water user’s system.  

 

 



 

4-4 

 

Section 3. Applicability of Rules Regulating Construction.  

 

A. The provisions of this Chapter shall apply to any construction or installation for which an 

application for a Building Permit, Electrical Wiring Permit, Mechanical Permit or Plumbing 

Permit is required by the Building Division.  

 

B. The provisions of this Chapter shall not apply to any construction or installation that 

Campbell County is preempted by state or federal law from regulating or permitting. 

 

C. This Chapter shall supersede all previous rules and regulations, resolution, or building codes 

adopted by Campbell County.   

 

Section 4. Enforcement of Rules Regulating Construction.  

 

A. The Building Division shall enforce the Rules Regulating Construction prescribed in Chapter 

4 for that portion of Campbell County lying outside of the corporate limits of the City of 

Gillette and the Town of Wright.  

 

B. The Building Code Official shall have the authority to render interpretations and enforce the 

Rules Regulating Construction.  

 

C. Violation penalties, re-inspection fees, and appeals.  

 

1. Persons who violate a provision of any of the Rules Regulating Construction or fail to 

comply with any of the requirements thereof or who shall erect, install, alter, repair or do 

work in violation of the approved construction documents or directive of the Building 

Code Official, or of a permit or certificate issued under provisions of any of the Rules 

Regulating Construction, shall be subject to a fine of $250 per day.  Each day that a 

violation continues after due notice has been served shall be deemed a separate offense.   

 

2. Upon issuance of a stop work notice from the Building Code Official, work that is being 

done contrary to the provisions of any of the Rules Regulating Construction or in a 

dangerous or unsafe manner shall immediately cease.  Such notice shall be in writing and 

shall be given to the owner of the property, or to the owner’s agent, or to the person 

performing the work.  The notice shall state the condition under which work is authorized 

to resume.  Where an emergency exists, the Building Code Official shall not be required 

to give a written notice prior to stopping the work.  Any person who shall continue any 

work in or about the structure after having been served with a stop work order, except 

such work as the person is directed to perform to remove a violation or unsafe condition, 

shall be subject to the penalties set forth in Section 4.C.1. 

 

3. The first two (2) inspections for each portion of construction or type of work are 

performed free of charge.  Each additional re-inspection that is needed due to incorrect 

work will be assessed a fee of $60.  The fee must be paid in person at the Building 

Division office prior to scheduling the reinspection.   

 



 

4-5 

 

4. The first two (2) commercial plan reviews will be completed free of charge.  A $250 fee 

will be assessed and added to the cost of the Building Permit for each subsequent review 

which is needed due to incorrect material.   

 

5. A $60 fee will be assessed when any work commences prior to obtaining a required 

permit. 

 

6. Appeals from the decision or actions of the Building Code Official shall be to the 

Building Code Appeals Board in accordance with its established rules and procedures. 

 

7. The Building Code Official reserves all other rights and remedies available under the law 

to enforce the Rules Regulating Construction.  

 

Section 5. General Permit Requirements. 

 

A. All applications for permits under this Chapter require the following:  

 

1. Zoning Certificate.  For zoned parcels, an approved Zoning Certificate from the Planning 

and Zoning Division shall be required prior to issuance of any permit.  Refer to Chapter 

7, Zoning Regulations for requirements. 

 

2. An approved site plan.  The site plan shall be a drawing, to scale or clearly dimensioned, 

showing the uses and structures (existing or proposed) for a parcel of land.  The plan 

shall include a north arrow, property lines, streets, location of all buildings, wells (water 

and methane), septic tank and leach field, as well as the location for a future replacement 

leach field, easements/rights-of-way, and the location of utilities including electrical 

service lines, water lines, sewer/septic lines, natural gas and propane & LPG lines, etc. 

(existing and proposed).  The Building Code Official, per IBC 107.2.5, may also require 

a grading plan and/or spot elevation to address topographical and drainage issues on a site 

by site basis.  

 

a) Culverts are required for new driveway approaches that cross drainage ditches.  

Culvert installation shall be as specified in the subdivision disclosure statement, or as 

approved by the Building Code Official.  Minimum size is twelve (12) inches in 

diameter.  Driveway and culvert installation may be subject to approval by the 

subdivision Improvement and Service District or Homeowners Association. 

 

3. Plans to verify compliance with the Rules Regulating Construction.  Plans shall be 

drawings that show the shape, size, and location of important details relating to the 

construction of all buildings.  The plans shall clearly indicate the nature and extent of the 

work proposed and show, by details or other means, that the work will conform to the 

Rules Regulating Construction.   

 

B. The Building Code Official shall issue permits under this Chapter after determining that the 

proposed project will comply with the Rules Regulating Construction.  

 



 

4-6 

 

C. The applicant shall maintain a copy of all permits, approved plans, job sign off sheet, and 

plan review documents available on the job site.  

 

D. Per the current Campbell County Chapter 8, Addressing Standards, all properties must 

display the assigned address with address numbers which are clearly visible from the 

roadway.  Inspection by the Building Division will not be performed upon the property until 

those assigned address numbers are posted.  

 

1. Campbell County Public Works shall issue a new address for all properties not currently 

assigned a valid address, and shall re-assign property addresses as applicable, upon 

review.  No properties shall obtain a building permit without a valid County issued 

address. 

 

Section 6. Building Permits.  

 

A. Except as provided in subsection C of this section, before performing any work, any person 

constructing or remodeling a residential dwelling, public, commercial, or industrial building 

shall apply to the Building Division to obtain a Building Permit.  

 

B. For all public, commercial or industrial buildings, a Commercial Site Plan Review 

application and meeting shall be required prior to applying for a Building Permit.  The 

application and submittal schedule for Commercial Site Plan Review meetings can be found 

in the Public Works Office or on the county website.  

 

C. A Building Permit shall not be required for:  

 

1. A public, commercial, or industrial building associated with the extraction of oil, gas, 

coal or other minerals. 

 

2. Structures located o parcels used exclusively for Farm and Ranch Operations as defined 

within Section 2. Definitions of this document.   

 

3. One- and two-family residential dwelling located outside a Platted Subdivision. 

 

4. Any Manufactured home designed and constructed per HUD Standards. 

 

D. A $250 fee will be charged for all new Commercial Building Permits.  Reinspection fees may 

apply per Section 4(C)(3).   

 

E. For homes built off site to IRC standards, onsite inspections are required per Section 11.  In 

addition, a third-party inspection report is required from the manufacturer.  

 

 

 



 

4-7 

 

Section 7. Electrical Wiring Permits.  

 

A. Except as provided in subsection B. of this section, before performing any work, any person 

installing electrical equipment in new construction or remodeling of a building, mobile home, 

or premises shall apply to the Building Division to obtain an Electrical Wiring Permit.  

 

B. An Electrical Wiring Permit shall not be required for:  

 

1. Structures located on parcels used exclusively for Farm and Ranch Operations as defined 

within Section 2, Definitions of this document.  Electrical contractors performing work 

on parcels of deeded land forty (40) acres or greater shall comply with W.S. 35-9-123(b). 

 

2. Any installation associated with the extraction of oil, gas, coal or other minerals.   

 

Section 8. Mechanical Permits. 

 

A. Except as provided in subsection B. of this section, before performing any work, any person 

installing a heating or air conditioning system or gas lines in a building or structure shall 

apply to the Building Division to obtain a Mechanical Permit.  

 

B. A Mechanical Permit shall not be required for:  

 

1. Structures located on parcels used exclusively for Farm and Ranch Operations as defined 

within Section 2. Definitions of this document.  

 

2. Buildings and structures associated with the extraction of oil, gas, coal, or other minerals. 

 

Section 9. Plumbing Permits. 

 

A. Except as provided in subsection B. of this section, before performing any work, any person 

installing plumbing in a building or structure, or modifying or installing a Community Water 

System, or Small Wastewater System, shall apply to the Building Division to obtain a 

Plumbing Permit.  

 

B. A Plumbing Permit shall not be required for: 

 

1. Structures located on parcels used exclusively for Farm and Ranch Operations as defined 

within Section 2, Definitions of this document. 

 

2. Buildings or structures associated with the extraction of oil, gas, coal, or other minerals. 

 

C. No Plumbing Permits for new Residential or any Commercial construction will be issued 

until the applicant provides proper verification that a potable water source will be provided to 

the project.   

 



 

4-8 

 

1. For on-lot wells a copy of the valid State Engineer’s Office well permit for the proposed 

use shall be required.  

 

2. For shared wells, a valid Shared Well Agreement shall be submitted along with a copy of 

the State Engineer’s Office well permit for the proposed use.  

 

3. For connections to Community or Public Water Systems, written verification shall be 

submitted from the owner of the system indicating the system has adequate capacity and 

that permission is granted to make the connection.  

 

Section 10. Plumbing Permit for Residential Small Wastewater Systems.  

 

A. Before permitting any work, aAny person installing a Residential Small Wastewater System 

shall apply to the Building Division to obtain a Plumbing Permit prior to starting work.  All 

wastewater systems shall comply with Appendix 2 to Chapter 4 Regulations. the Delegation 

Agreement.  

 

1. All Small Wastewater Systems for residential dwellings shall be permitted, inspected, 

and approved through the Building Division.  If the percolation rate is less than one 

minute per inch, or more than 60 minutes per inch, the Small Wastewater System must be 

designed and sealed by an Engineer. 

 

2. A complete application is required prior to inspection in the field.  The application shall 

clearly identify the location and results of the percolation tests, the location and materials 

for the proposed leach field, the length of the individual legs, depth to the base of the 

infiltrator or the leach field and the location of a replacement field.  

 

 

1. Any system that is not a Small Wastewater System for a Residential dwelling shall be 

permitted through the Wyoming Department of Environmental Quality Any system 

for which Campbell County does not have current delegated authority from DEQ to 

permit shall be permitted through DEQ. 

 

2.  Prior to re-energizing any home or business on a parcel where no information on the 

Small Wastewater System is on file, the septic tank shall be pumped to verify a 1000 

gallon minimum capacity as required by Appendix 2 to Chapter 4 Regulations. Wyoming 

DEQ for single family dwellings with 4 bedrooms or less. 

 

Section 11. Inspections. 

 

A. The Building Division shall perform required inspections during the normal course of 

construction and notify the Owner and builder of any violations found during any inspection. 

 

B. If an inspection reveals that a life-threatening code violation exists, or that a project has 

commenced before the required permits have been obtained, the Building Division or 

Building Code Official shall issue a violation notice and a stop work order to the Owner.  

 

Commented [SGP2]: The wording in this section is 

modified to include any Small Wastewater System for 

domestic sewage, whether from a home or a business as 

found in the definition for Small Wastewater Systems on 

page 4-3. The word ‘residential’ is struck throughout here in 

Section 10 where it might conflict with our delegated 

authority agreement with DEQ. 

 

 

Commented [SGP3]: Appendix 2 is a new document 

created for the purposes of permitting and design of Small 

Wastewater Systems. The intent is to provide all information 

in one easy to understand document. 

Commented [SGP4]: Items 1 and 2 here are struck 

because they are addressed in Appendix 2 to Chapter 4, 

thereby reducing redundancy and confusion. 

Commented [SGP5]: This section is struck in its’ entirety 

and reworded. 

 

Our delegated authority as agreed upon between Campbell 

County and the DEQ defines what we can and cannot permit. 

The proposed change here is intended to simplify the text 

and point the user to our delegated authority agreement for 

guidance on scope of authority.  

Commented [SGP6]: We have added the word ‘business’ 

to reflect that small wastewater systems are not limited to 

only residential homes. We propose to strike certain words 

here that are already addressed in Appendix 2 to Chapter 4 to 

eliminate redundancy and avoid confusion. 



 

4-9 

 

C. Upon completion of a project requiring a permit under this Chapter, and prior to occupancy, 

the Building Division shall perform a final inspection to determine conformance with the 

approved plans and codes.  When there are no violations, a certificate of occupancy shall be 

issued.   

 

Section 12. Adoption of Rules Regulating Construction. 

 

A. The following documents are adopted by reference into Chapter 4, Rules Regulating 

Construction for Campbell County, Wyoming: 

 

1. International Fire Code, 2018 Edition, including Appendices A, D, E, F, G and B (B only 

applies in certain circumstances as outlined below). 

 

Appendix B only applies in areas with access to a water supply capable of supplying the 

required fire flows. 

 

a) The following amendments to the International Fire Code, as adopted by Section 

12(A)(1) above, are hereby made a part of this rule. 

 

(1) Section 101.1 of the International Fire Code is amended to read as follows: 

 

101.1 Title.  These regulations shall be known as the Fire Code of Campbell 

County hereinafter referred to as “this code”.   

 

(2) Section 108, Board of Appeals, is repealed in its entirety. 

 

(3) Section 401.3.2 Alarm Activations, the following is added: 

 

401.3.2.1 Central Stations.  Central stations shall immediately notify the 

Campbell County Sheriff’s Office Dispatch for dispatch of the fire department of 

alarm signals initiated by any fire alarm, fire extinguishing system or equipment.  

Supervisory signals shall be relayed to the Campbell County Sheriff’s Office 

Dispatch for dispatch of the fire department.  The fire department must be notified 

by faxed or electronic report of all trouble signals which exist for greater than a 

single 6-hour time period.  Campbell County Sheriff’s Office Dispatch, for the 

fire department, shall be contacted prior to notification of the subscriber.  

 

(4) Section 505.1, Address Numbers, amended to read as follows: 

 

505.1 New and existing building shall have approved address numbers, building 

numbers or approved building identification placed in a position that is plainly 

legible and visible from the street or road fronting the property.  If the structure is 

not visible from the roadway because of terrain, trees or other obstruction, the 

address numbers shall be posted on both sides of a post which shall be a minimum 

of four (4’) feet and maximum of seven (7’) feet in height above the ground in a 

visible location within twenty (20’) feet of a public road at the Access Drive to 

the structure.  These numbers shall contrast with their background.  Address 



 

4-10 

 

numbers shall be Arabic numerals or alphabet letters.  Numbers shall be a 

minimum of 4 inches high with a minimum stroke width of 0.5 inch. 

 

Exceptions:  Structures within twenty-five (25’) feet of a public road may place 

the addresses on the structure.   

 

(5) Section 506.1, Where Required.  Delete the first sentence and amend the section 

as follows: 

 

Key boxes (Knox Box) shall be provided for Fire Department entry for all 

Commercial occupancies.  The key boxes shall be installed on all new businesses 

before occupancy is granted.  Any existing business that obtains a permit to do 

any work or change of use or occupancy shall be required to install a key box 

before the work can be completed and approved and occupancy resumed.  The 

key box shall be located within 10 feet of the front doors, a minimum of 6 feet 

above the ground level and not to exceed 7 feet in height unless approved in 

writing by the Building Code Official.  The Building Division has the ordering 

forms for key boxes.  The key box shall be of an approved type and shall contain 

items necessary to gain access as required by the Fire Department.   

 

(6) Section 507.1, Required water supply.  Amended to read as follows: 

 

For areas with access to a water supply capable of supplying the required fire 

flows, fire protection shall be provided.  For areas that do not have a water supply 

capable of providing fire flows, the Campbell County Fire Department tanker-

shuttle system will be utilized as the fire protection method.   

 

(7) Section 507.1.1, Building, or portions of buildings which are hereafter constructed 

or moved into the jurisdiction which are required to be equipped with an 

Automatic Sprinkler System shall have access to an approved water system 

capable of providing the required Automatic Sprinkler System fire flows or shall 

provide an approved on-site water storage and delivery system capable of 

providing such flows. 

 

(8) Section 507.5.1, Where Required.  Amended to read as follows: 

 

For areas with access to a water supply system capable of supplying required fire 

flows, fire hydrants providing the required fire flows shall be located within 500 

feet of the building as measured by an approved route around the exterior of the 

facility or building.  

 

(9) Section 901.4.6.1, Clearances of the International Fire Code, a new section is 

added to read as follows: 

 

901.4.6.1  Clearances.  Fire Protection Equipment shall not be obstructed or 

concealed.  Fire Protection Equipment includes, but is not limited to, the 

following:  fire sprinkler control valves, risers, hose stations, standpipes, and fire 

alarm panels.  A minimum of eight (8”) inches on each side and a clear access 



 

4-11 

 

width of three (3’) feet shall be maintained in front of the fire protection 

equipment. 

 

(10) Section 903.2.8 is amended to include an exception to read as follows:  Group 

R-3 (one- and two-family dwellings) shall not be required to install an automatic 

sprinkler system.   

 

2. International Building Code; 2018 Edition, including Appendixes C and J; 

 

a) The following amendments to the International Building Code, as adopted by Section 

12(A)(2) above, are hereby made a part of this rule:  

 

(1) Section 101.4.1 Gas.  The provisions of the International Fuel Gas Code shall 

apply to gas piping systems extending from the point of delivery to the inlet 

connections of appliance and installation and operation of residential and 

commercial gas appliances and related accessories.  

 

(2) Section 101.42 Mechanical.  The provisions of the International Mechanical Code 

shall apply to the installation, alterations, repair and replacement of mechanical 

systems including equipment, appliances, fixtures, fittings and/or appurtenances, 

ventilation, heating, cooling, air-conditioning and refrigeration systems, 

incinerators and other energy-related systems.   

 

(3) Section 101.4.3 Plumbing.  Amended to read as follows:   

 

The provisions of the International Plumbing Code shall apply to the installation, 

alteration, repair and replacement of plumbing systems including equipment, 

appliances, fixtures, fittings and appurtenances where connected to a water or 

sewage system, and all aspects of a medical gas system.  The provisions of the 

Delegation Agreement shall apply to private sewage disposal systems.   

 

(4) Section 101.4.4 Property Maintenance.  Amended to read as follows:  

 

The provisions of the International Property Code are adopted; only to the extent 

as it applies to fire and life-safety issues for Commercial and Residential 

Structures. 

 

(5) Section 101.4.5 Fire Protection.  The provisions of the International Fire Code 

shall apply to matters affecting or relating to structures, processes and premises 

from the hazard of fire and explosions arising from storage, handling or use of 

structures, materials or devices; from conditions hazardous to life, property or 

public welfare in the occupancy of structures or premises; and from the 

construction, extension, repair, alteration or removal of fire suppression, 

automatic sprinkler systems and alarm systems or fire hazards in the structure or 

on the premises from occupancy or operation. 

 

(6) Section 101.4.6 of the International Building Code is repealed.   



 

4-12 

 

 

(7) Section 102.6 Existing Structures.  Amended to read as follows:   

 

The legal occupancy of any structure existing on the date of adoption of this code 

shall be permitted to continue without change, except as is specifically covered in 

this code, the International Fire Code, or as is deemed necessary by the Building 

Code Official for the general safety and welfare of the occupants and the public. 

 

(8) Section 103.3 Deputies.  Amended to read as follows:   

 

In accordance with the prescribed procedures of this jurisdiction and with the 

concurrence of the appointing authority, the Building Code Official shall have the 

authority to appoint a deputy-building official, related technical officers, 

inspectors, plan examiners, and other employees.  Such employees shall have 

powers as delegated by the Building Code Official.   

 

(9) Section 109 Fees is repealed. 

 

(10) Section 113 Board of Appeals is repealed in its entirety.   

 

(11) Section 114.3 Prosecution of Violation is repealed in its entirety. 

 

(12) Chapter 13 Energy Efficiency is repealed in its entirety. 

 

(13) Section 1608.2 Ground Snow Load.  Repeal in its 

entirety and replace with: 

 

Minimum roof snow loads:  1:12 pitch 

and flatter roofs (4.76 degrees) shall be designed for a minimum balanced roof 

snow load of 35 pounds per square foot with no reductions.  

The effects of unbalanced snow, drifting, sliding snow, and ponding shall be 

The effects of unbalanced snow, drifting, sliding snow, and ponding shall be 

The effects of unbalanced snow, drifting, sliding snow, and ponding 

shall be considered in addition to the balanced snow load 

where applicable.   

 

Greater than 1:12 pitch roofs (4.76 degrees) shall be designed for a minimum 

balanced roof snow load of 30 pounds per square foot with no reductions.  

The effects of unbalanced snow, drifting, sliding snow, and ponding shall be 

The 

effects of unbalanced snow, drifting, sliding snow, and ponding shall be 

considered in addition to the balanced snow load where applicable.   

 

(14) Section 1609.3 Basic Design Wind Speed.  Amended to read as follows: 

 

Basic Design Wind Speed 115, Nominal Wind Speed 90 Exposure C 

Commented [SGP7]: The changes to this section do not 

change the requirements or intent of the previous version. 

The previous language was confusing. The new language 

was developed with the aid of  both private local and county 

staff structural engineers who helped make the language 

more precise and clear utilizing terminology common to 

design professionals.  



 

4-13 

 

 

 

               Climatic and Geographical Design Criteria 
Minimum 

Roof Live 

Snow 

Load (psf) 

Basic 

Design 

Wind 

Speed 

Per IBC 

1609.3 

Wind 

Speed 

115 

Nom. 

90 mph 

Seismic 

Design 

Category 

Subject to Damage From Winter 

Design 

Temp 

(°f) 

Ice Barrier 

Underlayment 

Requirements 

Flood 

Hazards 

Air 

Freezing 

Index 

Mean 

Annual 

Temp 

(°f) 

Weathering Frost 

Line 

Depth 

(in.) 

Termite 

30-35* Exp.C B Severe 42 Slight / 

moderate 
-5 Yes Jan. 02 

2008 

2000 45 

*See Section 12.A.2.a.(12)1:12 pitch and flatter, 35 psf. 1:12 pitch and greater, 30 

psf.  

 

 

(15) Section 1612 Flood Loads is repealed in its entirety and replaced with the 

 following: 

 

The Flood Damage Prevention Resolution.  All new construction of buildings, 

structures, and portions of buildings and structures, including substantial 

improvements and restoration of substantial damage to buildings and 

structures shall comply with the above document.   

 

(16) 1803.5.3 Expansive Soils. 

 

The Building Code Official shall require soil tests to be performed for all 

commercial and industrial buildings.   

 

(17) Section 1809.4 Depth of Footings.  Amended to read as follows:  

 

The minimum depth of footings below the undisturbed ground surface shall be 

42” inches; or protected from frost with an approved method.   

 

(18) 1904.3 Sulfate exposures is added and reads as follows: 

 

Concrete that will be exposed to sulfate-containing solutions or soils shall 

comply with the maximum water-cementitious materials ratios, minimum 

specified compressive strength and be made with the appropriate type of 

cement in accordance with the provisions of ACI 318, Section 4.3. 

 

Exception:  Unless the owner or applicant supplies results from a soils 

investigation containing data on sulfates, the owner or applicant must use a 

concrete mix design meeting the following specifications:  

 

Use Type V cement or increase the amount of Type II Modified cement in 

concrete to obtain a maximum water-to-cement ratio of 0.45 (by weight, 



 

4-14 

 

normal weight concrete) and a minimum compressive strength fc of 4000 

pounds per square inch (psi). 

 

 

 

(19) Section 2901.1 Scope.  Amended to read as follows:   

 

The provisions of this Chapter and the International Plumbing Code shall 

govern the erection, installation, alteration, repairs, relocation, replacement, 

addition to, use or maintenance of plumbing equipment and systems.  Toilet 

and bathing rooms shall be constructed in accordance with Section 1209 of the 

IBC 2018.  Plumbing systems and equipment shall be constructed, installed, 

and maintained in accordance with the International Plumbing Code.  

Residential Small Wastewater Systems shall conform to the Delegation 

Agreement. 

 

3. International Residential Code, 2018 Edition, including Appendixes A, B, C and E. 

 

The International Residential Code (IRC) is adopted for the purpose of providing 

standards for residential construction, including plumbing and mechanical codes on 

Platted Subdivision Lots.  Electrical provisions are obtained from the currently adopted 

NEC.  To obtain a Certificate of Occupancy all applicable portions of the IRC shall 

apply.  

 

(a) The following amendments to the International Residential Code, as adopted by 

Section 12(A)(3) above, are hereby made a part of this rule:   

 

(1) Section R104.10.1 Areas Prone to Flooding is repealed and replaced with the 

following: 

 

All residential construction in areas prone to flooding shall comply with Flood 

Damage Prevention Resolution.  
 

(2) Section R105.2 Work Exempt from Permit is amended to read as follows:  

 

Work Exempt from Permit. 

 

Exemption from permit requirements of this code shall not be deemed to grant 

authorization for any work to be done in any manner in violation of the provisions 

of this code or any other laws or ordinances of this jurisdiction.  

 

Permits shall not be required for the following:  

 

Building:  Numbers 1 through 10 remain unchanged, add number 11 as follows:  

 

(11) Non-habitable accessory structures including, but not limited to, pole 

barns and similar structures that meet the following requirements: 

 

Commented [SGP8]: We are proposing to strike the word 

‘residential’, just leaving the term ‘small wastewater 

systems’.  

 

Again, this is meant to remove limitations on our authority 

and rely on our current delegation agreement as stated here.   



 

4-15 

 

1. There shall be clear separation distance of seven (7’) feet between the 

structure and any dwelling;  

 

2. The structure shall not be attached to a dwelling with a breezeway or other 

form of connecting structure; and 

 

   3. The clear roof span is less than 61 feet.   

 

(3) Section R108 Fees is repealed. 

 

(4) Section R109.1.3 Flood Plain Inspections.  Amended to read as follows:  

 

For construction in areas prone to flooding, as established in Flood Damage 

Prevention Resolution.   

 

(5) Section R112 Board of Appeals is repealed. 

 

(6) Section 112.2 is added to read as follows:   

 

Criteria for issuance of a variance for areas prone to flooding shall be in 

accordance with Article IV, Section C of the Flood Damage Prevention 

Resolution.   

 

(7) Section R114.2 Unlawful Continuance is repealed. 

 

(8) Table R301.2(1) replaced with the following:   
 

  

               Climatic and Geographical Design Criteria 
Minimum 

Roof Live 

Snow 

Load (psf) 

Basic 

Design 

Wind 

Speed 

Per IBC 

1609.3 

Wind 

Speed 

115 

Nom. 

90 mph 

Seismic 

Design 

Category 

Subject to Damage From Winter 

Design 

Temp 

(°f) 

Ice Barrier 

Underlayment 

Requirements 

Flood 

Hazards 

Air 

Freezing 

Index 

Mean 

Annual 

Temp 

(°f) 

Weathering Frost 

Line 

Depth 

(in.) 

Termite 

30-35* Exp.C B Severe 42 Slight / 

moderate 
-5 Yes Jan. 02 

2008 

2000 45 

*1:12 pitch and flatter, 35 psf. 1:12 pitch and greater, 30 psf.See Section 

12.A.2.a.(12) 

 

 

(9) Table R302.1(2) of the International Residential Code is repealed.  

 

(10) Section R302.13 of the International Code is repealed. 

 

Commented [SGP9]: Language in this table was amended 

to reflect the changes to Ground Snow Load found in Section 

12.A.2.a.(13), page 4-12. 



 

4-16 

 

(11) Section R309.5 of the International Residential Code is repealed. 

 

(12) Sections R310.2.3.2 & R310.3.2.1 Drainage of the International Residential 

Code is amended to read as follows: 

 

R310.2.3.2 & R310.3.2.1 Drainage.  Window wells and Bulkhead enclosures 

shall be designed for proper drainage by connecting to the building’s 

foundation drainage system required by Section 405.1 or by an approved 

alternative method.   

 

(13) Section R313.1 & R313.2 of the International Residential Code is repealed.  

 

(14) Sections R313.1.1 & R313.2.1 of the International Residential Code is 

amended to read as follows:   

 

Sections R313.1.1 & R313.2.1  When provided, automatic residential fire 

sprinkler systems for buildings covered under the International Residential 

Code shall be designed and installed in accordance with IRC Section P2904 or 

NFPA 13D. 

 

 

(15) R401.4 Soil tests. 

 

In areas likely to have expansive, compressible, shifting or other unknown soil 

characteristics, the Building Code Official shall require a soil investigation to 

determine the soil’s characteristics at a particular location. 
 

Exception:  In lieu of a soil investigation, the owner shall submit to the 

Building Code Official a signed and sealed letter from an Engineer stating that 

the soils are adequate for the proposed application.  The letter shall reference 

Table R401.4.1 from the International Residential Code and specify the 

appropriate Class of Material to be used for the foundation design. 

 

(16) Chapter 11 Energy Efficiency is repealed in its entirety.   

 

(17) M1411.8 Locking access port caps is repealed in its entirety.   

 

(18) M1502.4.2 Duct Installation repealed in its entirety and replaced with: 

 

Duct Installation.  Dryer exhaust ducts shall be supported at intervals not to 

exceed 4 feet and shall be secured in place.  The insert end of the duct shall 

extend into the adjoining duct or fitting in the direction of airflow.  Exhaust 

duct joints shall be sealed in accordance with Section M1601.4.1.  Ducts shall 

not be joined with screws or similar fasteners. 

 



 

4-17 

 

(19) M1701.2.1 Exhaust and ventilation system, add a new section to the IRC.  All 

dwellings shall have make-up air for the exhaust systems provided in the 

following manner: 

 

Piping for the make-up air shall come from the exterior of the dwelling to the 

return-air duct of the HVAC system, or to an opening in a laundry room or 

other acceptable location.  A four (4”) inch minimum diameter pipe shall be 

used.   

 

(20) Section G2406.2 Prohibited Locations.  Exceptions 3 & 4 are repealed and 

replaced with the following:   

 

Unvented fuel burning equipment shall not be installed, used, or maintained 

within a dwelling unit. 

 

(21) Section G2444.1 Unit Heaters.  This section is repealed.   

 

(22) Section G2445.2 Prohibited Use.  Amended to read as follows:   

 

Unvented room heaters shall not be used in attached or detached garages 

unless protected by a carbon monoxide detection system and equipped with an 

oxygen-depletion safety system.   

 

(23) Section G2445.4 Unvented Room Heaters, Prohibited Locations.  Amended to 

read as follows:   
 

The location of unvented room heaters shall comply with Section G2406.2 as 

amended in this document.   

 

(24) Section P2503.5.1 Rough Plumbing.  Drain, waste and venting systems shall 

be tested on completion of the rough piping installation by water or by air with 

no evidence of leakage.  Either test shall be applied to the drainage system in 

its entirety or in sections after rough piping has been installed, as follows: 

 

1. Water test.  Each section shall be filled with water to a point not less than 

10 feet above the highest fitting connection in that section, or to the highest 

point in the complete system.  Water shall be held in the section under test 

for a period of 15 minutes.  The system shall prove leak free by visual 

inspection.   

 

2. Air Test.  The portion under test shall be maintained at a gauge of 5 pounds 

per square inch (psi).  This pressure shall be held without introduction of 

additional air for a period of 15 minutes.   
 

(25) Section P2601.3 Flood Hazard Area.  Amended to read as follows:   

 



 

4-18 

 

In areas prone to flooding as established by Flood Damage Prevention 

Resolution, plumbing fixtures, drains, and appliances shall be located or 

installed in accordance with Article V Section A of the above document.   

 

(26) Section P2602.2 Flood Resistant Installation.  Amended to read as follows:  

  

In areas prone to flooding as established by the Flood Damage Prevention 

Resolution:  Remainder of the section unchanged.   

 

(27) Section P2603.5.1 Sewer Depth.  Amended to read as follows:   

 

Building sewers that connect to private sewage disposal systems shall be a 

minimum of thirty-six (36”) inches below finished grade at the point of septic 

tank connection.  All building sewer piping shall be a minimum of thirty-six 

(36”) inches below grade. 

 

(28) Section P2603.5 Freezing.  Amend the last sentence to read:   

 

All water service lines and exterior water pipes shall be installed not less than 

five-foot six (5’6”) inches below grade.   

 

Exception:  Lawn watering systems need not be installed at the above depth.   

 

Add the following language to the end of this section:   

 

Water services for mobile/manufactured homes shall use a Woodford 

Thermaline, or equivalent water connector, or shall be placed in a 12” diameter 

by 5 ft. deep pipe located up under the home.  

 

(29) Section P2705.1 Installation, item #3 is repealed.   

 

(30) Section P3001.3 Flood-resistant Installation.  Amended to read as follows:   

 

In areas prone to flooding as established by the Flood Damage Prevention 

Resolution, drainage, waste, and vent systems shall be located and installed to 

prevent infiltration of floodwaters into the systems and discharges from the 

systems into floodwaters. 

 

(31) Delete Chapters 34 through 42 (Electrical Provisions) of the International 

Residential Code and replace with the 2020 NEC. 

 

(32) Add Appendix E, Section AE101 General.  Amended to read as follows:   

 

Section AE101.1 General.  These provisions shall be applicable to all 

manufactured homes used as a single dwelling unit and shall apply to the 

following:  Remainder of this section unchanged.   

 

Commented [SGP10]: Amending to the 2020 NEC as 

required by Wyoming State Statute. See page 4-21 for full 

explanation. 



 

4-19 

 

(33) Section AE304 Fees is repealed.  There are no fees for plan review or 

inspections.  Re-inspection fees may apply per Section 4. C. 3. 
 

4. International Mechanical Code, 2018 Edition, including Appendix A. 

 

a) The following amendments to the International Mechanical Code, as adopted by 

Section 12(A)(4) above are hereby made a part of this rule.   

 

(1) Section 106.5 Fees is repealed.  There are no fees for plan review or inspections.  

Re-inspection fees may apply per Section 4. C. 3. 

 

(2) Section 108.4 Violation Penalties is repealed. 

 

(3) Section 108.5 Stop Work Order is repealed.   

 

(4) Section 109 Means of Appeal is repealed in its entirety.   

 

(5) Section 301.2 Energy Utilization is repealed.  

 

(6) Section 303.3 Prohibited Locations.  Amended to read as follows:   

 

Except in attached or detached garages protected with a carbon monoxide 

detection system and equipped with an oxygen-depletion safety system, unvented 

fuel burning equipment shall not be installed, used, maintained, or permitted to 

exist in any building. 

 

(7) Table 403.3.1.1 shall be amended to include footnote i.  Footnote i shall read as 

follows:  For repair garages, the required 0.75 cfm per square ft. of exhaust 

airflow may be achieved by providing 0.25 cfm of continuous airflow per sq. ft. 

with an additional 0.50 cfm of intermittent airflow per sq. ft. when installed in 

accordance with Section 404.   

 

(8) Section 501.3 Outdoor Discharge.  The air removed by every mechanical exhaust 

system shall be discharged at a point where it will not cause a nuisance and from 

which it cannot again be readily drawn in by a ventilating system.  An attic not 

used for make-up air may have exhaust ducts terminate in the attic.  The exhaust 

duct shall extend to a minimum of six (6”) inches above the insulation.   

 

(9) Section 604.1 General.  Delete the reference to the International Energy 

Conservation Code.  The rest of the section to remain as is.   

 

5. The International Plumbing Code, 2018 Edition, including Appendix A and B: 

 

a) The following amendments to the International Plumbing Code, as adopted by 

Section 12.A.5 above, are hereby made a part of this rule.  



 

4-20 

 

 

(1) Section 106.6 Fees is repealed.  There are no fees for plan review or inspections.  

Re-inspection fees may apply per Section 4.C.3.   

 

(2) Section 108.4 Violation Penalties is repealed. 

 

(3) Section 108.5 Stop Work Orders is repealed. 

 

(4) Section 109 Means of Appeal is repealed in its entirety. 

 

(5) Section 305.4 Freezing.  The last sentence is amended to read as follows: 

 

Exterior water supply system piping shall be installed below the frost line and not 

less than five-foot six (5’6”) inches below grade. 

 

Exception:  Lawn watering systems need not be installed at the above depth. 

 

Add the following language to the end of this section:   

 

Water services for mobile/manufactured homes shall use a Woodford Thermaline, 

or equivalent water connector, or shall be placed in a 12” diameter by 5 ft. deep 

pipe located up under the home.   

 

(6) Section 305.4.1 Sewer Depth is amended to read as follows:  

 

Building sewers that connect to private sewage disposal systems shall be a 

minimum of 36” inches below finished grade at the point of septic tank 

connection.  Building sewers shall be a minimum of 36” inches below grade.  All 

sewer lines will be required to have a full-size end of line cleanout.   

 

(7) Section 312.3 Drainage and Vent air test.  Drain, waste, venting systems shall be 

tested on completion of the rough piping installation by water or by air with no 

evidence of leakage.  Either test shall be applied to the drainage system in its 

entirety, or in sections after the rough piping has been installed, as follows:   

 

Water test.  Each section of piping shall be filled with water to a point not less 

than 10 feet above the highest fitting connection in that section, or to the highest 

point in the completed system.  Water shall be held in the test section (under test) 

for a period of 15 minutes.  The system shall prove leak free by visual inspection.  

 

Air Test.  The portion under test shall be maintained at a gauge of 5 pounds per 

square inch (psi).  This pressure shall be held without introduction of additional 

air for a period of 15 minutes.  A contractor using air to test plastic pipe shall be 

aware of the risk.   

 

(8) 602.1 General.  WATER REQUIRED is amended to read as follows:   



 

4-21 

 

 

602.1 General. 
 

Every structure equipped with plumbing fixtures and utilized for human 

occupancy or habitation shall be provided with a potable supply of water in the 

amounts and at the pressures specified in this Chapter.  All shared wells shall be 

required to install a dual check valve on each water service line.  If all 

Community Water System regulations are met, the system requirements in 

Section 13 of this document may be used in place of those prescribed in the 2018 

International Plumbing Code.  

 

(9) Section 701.2 Sewer Required is amended to read as follows:  

 

Every building having plumbing fixtures installed and all premises having 

drainage piping shall be connected to a public sewer, where available, or an 

approved private sewage disposal system in accordance with the Delegation 

Agreement.  

 

(10) Section 708.1.1.2 Base of stack is added to read as follows:   

 

A full-size cleanout shall be provided at each end of the line base waste or soil 

stack. 

 

(11) Section 903.2 Frost Closure shall be amended to the following:   

 

Vent extensions through a roof or wall shall not be less than 3 inches in 

diameter.  Any increase in size of the vent shall be made not less than 1 foot 

below the roof line.  

 

(12) Section 410.2 Small Occupancies shall be amended as follows: 

 

Drinking fountains shall not be required for an occupant load of 30 or fewer. 

 

6. The National Electrical Code, 2020 Edition; as copyrighted by the National Fire 

Protection Association, including Article 80, also known as Annex H.  

 

a) The following amendments to the National Electrical Code, as adopted by Section 

12(A)(6) above, are hereby made a part of this rule.  

 

(1) Section 80.1(2) of the National Electric Code is repealed.  

 

(2) Section 80.15 Electric Board of the National Electric Code is renamed Building 

Code Appeals Board. 

 

(3) Section 80.15(A) of the National Electric Code is repealed. 

 

Commented [SGP11]: This is a proposed new amendment 

to Chapter 4.  

 

The original text exempts drinking fountains for buildings 

with design occupant loads of 15 or fewer. This amendment 

expands that exemption to a more lenient requirement.   

 

This proposed change is intended to address a code 

requirement that may not necessarily apply to structures 

located in a rural setting. 

 

 

Commented [SGP12]: The State of Wyoming adopted the 

2020 edition of the NEC effective January 1, 2020. By state 

statute, Campbell County must update our ordinance to 

match the States’ adoption of the 2020 NEC no later than 

July 1, 2020. 



 

4-22 

 

(4) Sections (B) through (H) of Section 80.15 of the National Electric Code are 

repealed. 

 

(5) Sections 80.23(B)(3) of the National Electric Code is repealed.  

 

(6) Section 80.27 Inspectors Qualifications: 

 

(a) Inspectors qualifications as required by Statue Statute 35-9-121(a)(iv) for 

Home Rule requirements only.  For Local enforcement, all Inspectors 

employed by Campbell County can/will do Electrical Inspections.   

 

(b) Sections 80.27(B), (C) and (D) are repealed. 

 

(7) Sections 80.33 and 80.35 are repealed.  

 

(8) Section 230.70(A)(1) Readily Accessible Location is amended to read as follows: 

 

The service disconnecting means shall be installed at a readily accessible location 

outside of a building or structure.  (Note:  Mobile Homes and Manufactured 

Homes shall comply with Article 550 of the National Electrical Code.) 

 

(9) Section 230.79(C) of the National Electrical Code is amended to read as follows: 

 

(a) One- and Two-Family Dwellings and Townhouses.  For a one-family, two-

family or townhouse dwelling, the service disconnecting means shall have a 

rating of not less than 200 amperes, 3-wire.   

 

(10) Section 250.53(A)(2) Exception shall be repealed in its entirety.   
 

7. The International Existing Building Code 2018; 

 

a) The following amendments to the International Existing Building Code, as adopted 

by Section 12.A.7 above, are hereby made a part of this rule.   

 

(1) Section 101.4.2 Building previously occupied, reference to the International 

Property Maintenance Code is removed.  

 

(2) Section 1401.2 Conformance, reference to the International Property Maintenance 

Code is removed.  

 

8. The International Fuel Gas Code 2018 Edition, including all Appendices;  

 

a) The following amendments to the International Fuel Gas Code, as adopted by Section 

12(A)(8) above, are hereby made a part of this rule. 

 



 

4-23 

 

(1) Section 106.6, Fee Schedule, is repealed.  There are no fees for plan review or 

inspections.  Re-inspection fees may apply per Section 4.C.3. 

 

(2) Section 108.4, Violation Penalties is repealed. 

 

(3) Section 108.5, Stop Work Orders is repealed. 

 

(4) Section 109, Means of Appeal is repealed in its entirety.   

 

(5) Section 303.3, Exceptions #3 and #4 are deleted.   

 

(6) Section 621.4 Prohibited Locations is amended to read as follows:  

 

Except in attached or detached garages protected with a carbon monoxide 

detection system and equipped with an oxygen-depletion safety system, unvented 

room heaters shall not be installed with occupancies in Groups A, B, E, F, H, I, M 

or R. 

 

 

9. The Liquefied Petroleum Gas Code (NFPA 58), 2014 Edition, including all Appendices. 

 

10. The Flood Damage Prevention Resolution. 

 

11. Wyoming DEQ, Water Quality Rules and Regulations, Chapter 25 as amended in 

Appendix 1 to Chapter 4, and supplemented as follows: 

 

a) There shall be a maximum of one (1) septic system per any un-zoned parcel 10 acres 

or less in size and no more than one (1) septic system per each un-zoned ten (10) 

acres area on larger parcels.  Multiple septic systems shall be spaced a minimum of 

600 feet apart. 

 

b) The current Campbell County Public Works Building Division Small Wastewater 

System Record shall be used for percolation test procedures, leach field sizing, 

system design, installation parameters and documentation.  

 

c) Remove Sections 5 and 8 – use Small Wastewater System Record.   

 

d) Remove Sections 10c, 10d, 14, 15 16, 17, 19 and Appendix B.  DEQ to regulate these 

items. 

 

 

 

 

Commented [SGP13]: DEQ Chapter 25 as amended is 

now being added to Chapter 4 as an appendix, rather than a 

separate document apart from Chapter 4, ‘Rules for 

Construction’. This is more appropriate and reduces 

confusion for administration. 

Commented [SGP14]: The addition of the term ‘un-

zoned’ is intended to eliminate confusion over the 

administration of this section.  

 

Chapter 7 ‘Zoning Regulations’ already addresses minimum 

requirements for land development within any zoning 

district.  

 

This section was always intended to apply to un-zoned 

parcels and has been administrated as such. The added 

language simply removes any ambiguity and gives greater 

clarity to the original intent.  



 

4-24 

 

Section 13. Community Water Systems. 
 

A. Scope.  The provisions of this section shall apply to the minimum design and installation 

requirements for a Community Water System. 

 

B. Purpose.  The purpose of these standards is to:   

 

1. Protect the health, safety, and welfare of the users of the water system. 

 

2. Provide an alternative method for providing water in lieu of using Chapter 6 of the 

2018 International Plumbing Code.  

 

C. Applicability. 

 

1. The system must have no more than nine (9) Water Service Connections and must 

serve fewer than twenty-five (25) individuals with water for human consumption.   

 

2. A Community Water System shall not be used when serving an average of at least 25 

people with water for human consumption for at least 60 days a year.  These systems 

qualify as Public Water Systems per EPA (Environmental Protection Agency) and 

requirements related to them are found in Wyoming DEQ Water Quality Rules and 

Regulations Chapter 12.   

 

3. For all new systems with four (4) or more Water Service Connections, a Community 

Water System is required.   

 

4. For multi-unit apartment complexes on single parcels, the requirements in Section 13 

based on numbers of Water Service Connections regarding flow, pressure, pipe 

sizing, etc. do not apply as written and must be modified accordingly.   

 

D. Design Parameters and System Requirements.   

 

1. Community Water Systems shall comply with Wyoming DEQ Water Quality Rules 

and Regulations, Chapter 12, except as amended below:   

 

(a) Level of Treatment.  Treatment shall be provided to produce a potable water 

supply that is bacteriological, chemically, radiologically, and physically safe as 

determined by an Engineer.   

 

(b) Surface Water Supplies.  Surface water shall not be used for potable water 

sources. 

 

(c) Ground Water Supplies.  Disinfection equipment shall not be required unless the 

above level of treatment cannot be obtained.  When disinfection equipment is 

necessary it shall be designed by an Engineer. 



 

4-25 

 

 

(d) Treatment.  When treatment is required, one treatment unit capable of the 

maximum demand shall be required and shall be designed by an Engineer. 

 

(e) Equipment Providing Required Flows.  Multiple pumping and/or treatment 

equipment shall not be required.  However, equipment needs shall be determined 

by an Engineer.  

 

(f) Alternative Power.  Alternative power shall not be required unless fire protection 

is provided.   

 

(g) Flow and Pressure Requirements.   

 

(1) Pressure shall be reviewed by an Engineer and included in the design report.   

 

(2) The design flow for the system shall be 7 gallons per minute (gpm) for each 

Water Service Connection plus an additional 10 gpm. 

 

(3) When the design flow from (2) is proportioned to the 1/3 of the locations with 

the highest head loss, a minimum of forty (40) psi shall be met at those 

locations.  

 

(4) When the design flow rate from (2) is proportioned to the ½ of the locations 

with the highest head loss, a minimum of twenty-five (25) psi shall be met at 

those locations. 

 

(h) Finished Water Storage.  

 

(1) Storage shall not be required if a twenty-four (24) hour pump test of the yield 

and drawdown of the well taken as described in DEQ Chapter 12 

demonstrates the well can produce a minimum of ten (10) gpm per Water 

Service Connection and that a submersible pump has been installed which can 

provide pressures as called for in g(3) and g(4). 

 

(2) When the above criteria cannot be met, finished water storage shall be 

provided in the amount of two (2) times the average daily demand for the 

system. 

 

(i) Pumping Units.  Single pumping units as necessary shall be provided.  Alarms are 

not required at attended pump stations.   

 

2. A design report, plans, and hydraulic analysis shall be provided by an Engineer.   

 



 

4-26 

 

3. The Community Water System shall be subject to all applicable codes, permits, and 

inspections required by the Building Division.  

 

4. Backflow prevention in accordance with the 2018 International Plumbing Code shall 

be installed. 

 

5. Piping material shall be any material allowed for potable water piping in Table 605.4 

of the 2018 International Plumbing Code.   

 

6. When providing potable water to four (4) to six (6) Water Service Connections, a 

looped supply line of no smaller than two (2) inches in diameter shall be provided.  A 

water service line shall be extended to the property line for each parcel.  

 

7. When providing potable water to seven (7) to nine (9) connections a looped supply 

line no smaller than three (3”) inches in diameter shall be provided.  A water service 

line shall be extended to the property line for each parcel.  

 

8. Pressure tanks shall be provided in accordance with pump manufacturers 

recommendations.  Minimum volumes shall be three (3) gallons per Water Service 

Connection for variable speed drive pumps and fifteen (15) gallons per Water Service 

Connection for conventional pumps. 

 

9. In addition to the above requirements, forty (40’) feet of surface casing shall be 

installed and the annual space between the borehole and the surface casing shall be 

filled with cement, grout, or bentonite slurried material.  The well bore shall not 

continue until the surface casing is installed.   

 

10. Flushing hydrants shall be provided as determined by an Engineer.  

 

11. Water wells shall be placed at a maximum density of two (2) per forty (40) acres and 

shall provide a minimum of two (2) gpm per Water Service Connection.  

 

E. Construction Requirements. 

 

1. Permitting is required.  Contract Public Works Engineering Division for permit forms 

and general requirements prior to construction.   

 

2. During construction, inspections are required by an Engineer to verify that the project 

is being built according to the approved and permitted design, and that all 

requirements are being met.   

 



 

4-27 

 

3. During construction, inspection is required by Campbell County Public Works 

Engineering Division.  Forty-eight (48) hour notice must be given prior to any work 

being done.   

 

4. The entire Community Water System shall be disinfected and flushed in accordance 

with the Wyoming Public Works Standard Specifications prior to water samples 

being taken.   

 

5. Water samples shall be taken at the curb stop for each Water Service Connection and 

shall be tested.   

 

F. Closeout and Documentation Requirements. 

 

1. The Engineer shall provide ‘as constructed plans’ for the Community Water System 

within thirty (30) days of completion.  

 

2. Maintenance of a Community Water System shall be provided for by a water well 

agreement or home/landowner association documents filed at the Campbell County 

Clerk’s Office.   

 

3. Access and utility easements shall be provided for the water well and storage tanks.  

Easements shall be filed at the Campbell County Clerk’s Office.  

 

4. A copy of the U.W.5 Water Well Permit from the State Engineer’s Office shall be 

provided. 

 

5. Water well ‘as-constructed’ data shall be provided by an Engineer demonstrating the 

water well was constructed in accordance with the current Wyoming State Engineer’s 

Office Water Well Minimum Construction Standards.  

 

6. At a minimum, water quality testing shall be conducted and reviewed by an Engineer 

for the following:  Total Dissolved Solids (TDS), Nitrate & Nitrite as N, Total 

Coliform, Sulfates, Calcium, Magnesium, Sodium, Chloride, Iron, Zinc, Lead, 

Fluoride, Manganese, Copper, Arsenic, pH, and E-Coli.  SAR (Sodium Absorption 

Rate) and/or other constituents to be reviewed as considered as necessary.  

 

7. The test results from the water samples taken at each Water Service Connection shall 

be submitted with the record documents.  

 

8. A written report from an Engineer analyzing EPA Primary Drinking Water Standards 

is required.  

 



 

4-28 

 

9. A map from an Engineer or professional land surveyor shall be provided for all 

Community Water Systems that identifies bearings & distances from property corners 

to the distribution lines. 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

List of Appendices 

 

Appendix 1: DEQ Chapter 25 Amended 

 

Appendix 2: Campbell County Small Wastewater System Permit Workbook and Application 

Commented [SGP15]: The List of Appendices is an 

addition to Chapter 4 for the purposes of codifying all 

technical and permitting requirements for Small Wastewater 

Systems into one location. 



CERTIFICATE OF ADOPTION OF RULES 
 

 
 
Adopting Entity:  Campbell County Board of County Commissioners 
     
Rules Adopted:  Chapter 4, Rules Regulating Construction (These are amended 

rules) 
 
Summary of Amendments: Clarification of current language for Roof Snow Load design 

standards and small wastewater systems (no change to current 
requirements), update the National Electric Code to the 2020 
edition as required by state statute, and amend the International 
Plumbing Code to ease requirements of when drinking fountains 
are deemed necessary. 

 
Statutory Authority:  W.S. 18-5-201 
    W.S. 35-9-121 
 
Date Rules Proposed & 
Available for Inspection: June 16, 2020 
 
Copies mailed to all on 
the mailing list:  Yes 
 
Date of Public Hearing: August 4, 2020 
     
 
Date of Final Adoption: August 4, 2020 
 
Effective Date:  Immediately upon filing with the County Clerk 
 
 
 I hereby certify the attached rules are a true and correct copy of rules adopted by the 
Campbell County Board of County Commissioners in accordance with the Wyoming 
Administrative Procedure Act. 
 
 
 
     __________________________ 
     D.G. Reardon, Chairman      
     Board of Commissioners      
 
 
ATTESTED:        
________________________________    
Susan Saunders, County Clerk     



 

*Individuals wishing to provide public comment are asked to sign in prior to the start of the meeting, provide 
contact information and the topic(s) to be discussed. 

 
 
The following page(s) contain the backup material for Agenda Item: 9:40 Southern Campbell County Arterial 
Road Reconstruction AML Project 



 

Department of Public Works     Kevin C. King, P.E., Director 

500 S. Gillette Avenue, Suite 1400, Gillette, WY 82716   ●   307-685-8061   ●   Building 307-682-1970   ●   Solid Waste/Recycle 307-682-9499 

 

 

M E M O R A N D U M  

  
TO:   Board of Commissioners 

FROM:  Clark Melinkovich, Public Works 

DATE:  August 18, 2020 

SUBJECT:  Southern Campbell County Arterial Road Reconstruction AML project 

 

 

Campbell County has secured a state of Wyoming DEQ Abandoned Mine Land Public Facilities grant to 

upgrade subdivision roads in the area just south of the Town of Wright   The Project involves upgrading 

approximately 1500 feet of Chad Road, 4100 feet of Duffy Road, 3900 feet of Noonan Road and 2300 

feet of Hicks Road, providing an upgraded roadway from town limits through the subdivision to the 

intersection of Highway 59 and 450.  Campbell County will act as Owner during this project and will 

administer the project through the Public Works department. 

 

Public Works solicited qualifications statements from engineering firms to serve as a consultant for the 

County during the project.  Ten submittals were received from local and regional engineering firms. Each 

company was evaluated and scored by staff based on experience and qualifications of the team, AML and 

other grant experience, local experience, in house vs contracted services, and quality and content of the 

qualifications statement. 

 

The recommendation is to select HDR Engineering of Gillette to serve as the consultant for the project. 

The cost proposal will be payment on a time and materials basis with an total not-to-exceed cost of  

$323,878.  This amount fits within the budget and the approved cost of professional services for the grant. 

Timeline on this project will be design through the end of the year, bidding in January, and construction 

May through July 2021.  

 

 

 

 



Page 1 of 8 
 

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES AGREEMENT  

BETWEEN CAMPBELL COUNTY AND HDR Engineering, Inc._ 

 

Parties  

 

Campbell County Board of Commissioners 

500 South Gillette Ave, Gillette, WY 82716 

Telephone (307) 685-8061 

hereinafter referenced as “Owner” 

 

Consultant     HDR Engineering, Inc. 

Address     601 Metz Drive, Gillette, WY 82718 

Telephone (307) 228-6000 

hereinafter referenced as “Consultant” 

 

Project Name Southern Campbell County Arterial Roads Reconstruction AML Project  

Location Wright, WY 

Brief description: Improved drainage infrastructure and new gravel section on 12,000 feet of road within 

an existing rural neighborhood immediately south of the Town of Wright. 

 

 

This document is an Agreement entered into by and between Campbell County, “Owner” and 

_HDR Engineering, Inc., “Consultant” for the Southern Campbell County Arterial Roads 

Reconstruction AML Project. 

 

Scope of Services.  

 

The Scope of Services shall be as described in Exhibit A and is incorporated into this agreement by 

reference herein.  

 

Term.  

 

This Agreement is effective when all parties have executed it and all required approvals have been 

granted. The term of this Agreement is determined by the Project Timeline provided in Exhibit B. 

 

Project Timeline.   

 

The timeline for services to be provided shall be as described in Exhibit B and is incorporated into this 

agreement by reference herein.  

 

Definitions.  

 

a. Agreement - This written contract for professional services between Owner and Consultant, 

including all Exhibits and any duly executed amendments. 

b. Consultant - The professional firm hired by the Owner to perform services on the project.  

Includes Consultant's officers, directors, members, partners, agents, employees, and any 

subconsultants providing services on the Project. 

c. Contractor - The entity or individual hired by the Owner to complete the work on the Project. 

This includes subcontractors and sub-subcontractors. 



Page 2 of 8 
 

d. Owner - Campbell County, whose authorized representatives may be identified in the Authorized 

Representatives section of this Agreement.   

e. Project - The total undertaking to be accomplished for Owner by consultants, contractors, and 

others, including, but not limited to, planning, study, design, construction, testing, 

commissioning, and start-up, and of which the services to be performed or furnished by 

Consultant under this Agreement are a part of. 

f. Project Documents - Project documents include all reports, drawings, specifications, electronic 

media, computer models, or other items prepared or furnished by Consultant and provided to 

Owner pursuant to this Agreement. 

 

Compensation.   

 

Owner shall compensate the Consultant for the services described in Exhibit C.  Compensation will be 

on a time and materials basis with a total not-to-exceed value of $323,878. 

 

Payment.  

 

Payment shall be made according the current Campbell County Accounts payable schedule provided in 

Exhibit D.  

 

Availability of Funds 

 

Each payment obligation of Owner is conditioned upon the availability of government funds which are 

appropriated or allocated for the payment of this obligation.  If funds are not allocated and available for 

the continuance of the services performed by Consultant, the Agreement may be terminated by Owner at 

the end of the period for which the funds are available.  Owner shall notify Consultant in a timely 

manner of the services which will or may be affected by a shortage of funds.  No penalty shall accrue to 

Owner in the event this provision is exercised, and Campbell County shall not be obligated or liable for 

any future payments due or for any damages as a result of termination under this section.  This provision 

shall not be construed to permit Owner to terminate this Agreement to acquire similar services from 

another party.  

 

Authorized Representatives.   

 

The following are authorized representatives, who may act on behalf of their respective entities. 

 

CAMPBELL COUNTY  

 

Owner Authorized Representative:     Kevin King, Public Works Director 

Telephone  (307) 685-8061 

Email        kck08@ccgov.net 

 

Owner Authorized Representative:     Clark Melinkovich, Senior Engineer 

Telephone (307) 685-8061 

Email       cmm08@ccgov.net  

 

 

HDR Engineering 

 

Consultant Authorized Representative:     Mike Oakley 



Page 3 of 8 
 

Address     601 Metz Drive, Gillette, WY 

Telephone (307) 228-6000 

Email        mike.oakley@hdrinc.com 

 

Consultant Authorized Representative:     _____________________________ 

Address     _____________________________ 

Telephone _____________________________ 

Email        _____________________________ 

 

Owner’s Responsibilities. 

 

a. Owner shall inform Consultant of the policies, procedures, design objectives, and requirements 

for the Project including, but not limited to, schedule, constraints, and criteria.   

b. Owner shall establish a budget for the project that includes, but is not limited to, funds for the 

cost of the work, Consultants fees, Owner’s other costs, and a reasonable contingency related to 

the costs. Owner shall notify Consultant of any significant changes to the budget. 

c. Owner shall assign a representative to the Project and authorize this person to act on the Owner’s 

behalf with respect to the Project. Such person(s) may be identified in the Authorized 

Representatives section of this Agreement. 

d. Owner may furnish any necessary services that are not identified as the Consultant’s 

responsibility, per the scope of services detailed in Exhibit A, through their own forces or by 

hiring others to assist.  When hiring others, Owner shall advise Consultant of the identity and 

scope of services of any independent consultants employed by Owner to perform or furnish 

services concerning the Project and Owner shall assist in the coordination of these services with 

those of the Consultant.  

e. Owner shall make provisions for the Consultant to safely and properly access the Project site as 

required to perform services under this Agreement. 

f. Owner shall answer questions and provide information in a reasonably timely manner when 

requested by the Consultant. 

g. Owner shall give feedback and approve or disapprove of Consultant’s services or work products 

in a reasonably timely manner.   

h. Owner shall provide, at its discretion, data and information in its possession for Consultant to 

provide its services.  Consultant may rely on such information as fully accurate unless otherwise 

disclosed.   

  

Compliance with Laws, Regulations, Policies, Procedures. 

 

a. Consultant shall comply with all applicable laws and regulations. 

b. All design work shall be overseen by professional engineers licensed with the Wyoming State 

Board of Engineers and Surveyors and by architects licensed with the Wyoming State Board of 

Architects and Landscape Architects. All survey work shall be overseen by surveyors licensed 

with the Wyoming State Board of Engineers and Surveyors. 

c. Consultant shall comply with the policies, procedures, and instructions of Owner that are 

applicable to Consultants performance of services under this Agreement and that Owner provides 

to Consultant in writing.  

 

Insurance. 

 

Consultant shall procure and maintain at its expense insurance policies that meet the following: 

i. Commercial General Liability: 1,000,000 per occurrence, 2,000,000 aggregate 



Page 4 of 8 
 

ii. Commercial Auto Liability: 1,000,000 per accident 

iii. Workers Compensation: per Wyoming state statutes 

iv. Professional Liability Insurance: 1,000,000 per claim, 2,000,000 aggregate 

 

a. Consultant shall name Owner as additional insured on the Commercial General Liability and 

Commercial Auto Liability policies and shall provide waiver of subrogation. 

 

b. Owner shall require Contractor doing construction work to purchase and maintain policies of 

insurance covering workers' compensation, general liability, motor vehicle damage and injuries, 

and other insurance necessary to protect Owner's and Consultant's interests in the Project. 

Consultant shall be listed as additional insured with respect to such liability insurance purchased 

and maintained by Contractor for the Project. Owner shall give Consultant access to any 

certificates of insurance and copies of endorsements and policies obtained by Owner from 

Contractor. The burden of request and verification of this insurance shall be on the Consultant.  

                  

Standard of Performance. 

 

The standard of care for all professional engineering, architecture, consulting and related services 

performed or furnished by Consultant and its employees under this Agreement will be the care and skill 

ordinarily used by members of Consultant’s profession practicing under the same or similar 

circumstances at the same time and in the same locality. 

 

Consultant’s cost estimates are to be made on the basis of their experience, qualifications, and general 

familiarity with the construction industry.  However, because Consultant has no control over the cost of 

labor and materials, the Contractors’ methods of determining prices, or over competitive bidding or 

market conditions, Consultant cannot and does not guarantee that actual construction costs will not 

significantly differ from Consultant’s cost estimates. 

 

Hazardous Materials.  

 

Owner represents that to the best of its knowledge it has disclosed to Consultant the existence of any 

known hazardous materials located at or near the project site.  It is acknowledged by both parties that 

Consultant’s scope of services does not include services related in any way to hazardous materials.  In 

the event Consultant or any other party encounters undisclosed hazardous materials, Consultant shall 

notify Owner and Consultant may, at its option and without liability for delay, consequential or any 

other damages to Owner, suspend performance of services on that portion of the project affected by 

hazardous materials until Owner: (i) retains appropriate specialist consultant(s) or contractor(s) to 

identify and, as appropriate, abate, remediate, or remove the hazardous materials; and (ii) warrants that 

the project site is in full compliance with all applicable laws and regulations.  

 

Consultant Liability.  

 

Notwithstanding any other provision of this Agreement, and to the fullest extent permitted by law, the 

total liability of Consultant to Owner and anyone claiming by, through, or under Owner for any and all 

claims, losses, costs, or damages arising out of, resulting from, or otherwise related to the Project or this 

Agreement from any cause, including but not limited to negligence, professional errors/omissions, strict 

liability, breach of contract, indemnity obligations, or warranty express or implied, shall be limited to 

the greatest of the following three (3) values: 

 



Page 5 of 8 
 

1. The total insurance proceeds paid on behalf of or to Consultant by the Consultant’s insurers in 

settlement or satisfaction of Owner's claims, under the terms and conditions of Consultant's 

applicable insurance policies, as required under the Insurance section of this Agreement. The 

total insurance proceeds paid are calculated after the Consultant has made payment for all or the 

applicable portion of any deductibles.  The value of insurance proceeds shall not be reduced, 

increased, or adjusted on account of legal fees paid, or costs and expenses of investigation, 

claims adjustment, defense, or appeal, or; 

 

2. The amount of the Consultant’s fee for the Project, or;  

 

3. $50,000. 

 

Contractor Liability.  

 

Consultant 's observation or monitoring of portions of the work shall not relieve the Contractor from its 

responsibility to inspect and otherwise perform the work in accordance with applicable contract 

documents.  Consultant does not guarantee the performance of any contractor, does not assume any 

responsibility for a failure of contractor performance, and is not responsible for the acts or omissions of 

the Contractor or other parties on the Project.  Consultant shall not supervise, control, or have charge of 

construction means, methods, sequences, or for safety or security programs or precautions connected 

with the Project that are outside of the terms of this Agreement.   

 

Independent Contractor. 

 

Consultant and Consultant's officers, directors, members, partners, agents, employees, and any 

subconsultants providing services on the Project shall function as independent contractors for the 

purposes of this Agreement and shall not be considered employees of Campbell County for any purpose. 

Consultant shall assume sole responsibility for any debts or liabilities that may be incurred by 

Consultant and/or Consultant's officers, directors, members, partners, agents, employees, and any 

subconsultants in fulfilling the terms of this Agreement and shall be solely responsible for the payment 

of all federal, state, and local taxes which may accrue because of this Agreement.  Nothing in this 

Agreement shall be interpreted as authorizing Consultant or its Consultant's officers, directors, members, 

partners, agents, employees, and any subconsultants to act as an agent or representative for or on behalf 

of Campbell County or to incur any obligation of any kind on the behalf of Campbell County. 

Consultant agrees that no health/hospitalization benefits, workers' compensation, and/or similar benefits 

available to Campbell County employees will inure to the benefit of Consultant or its Consultant's 

officers, directors, members, partners, agents, employees, and any subconsultants agents as a result of 

this Agreement. 

 

Governmental Immunity.   

 

Campbell County does not waive governmental immunity by entering into this Agreement and 

specifically retains all immunities and defenses available pursuant to Wyoming Statutes §§ 1-39-101 

through 1-39-121 and all other applicable law.  Designations of venue, choice of law, enforcement 

actions, and similar provisions should not be construed as a waiver of governmental immunity.  The 

parties agree that any ambiguity in this Agreement shall not be strictly construed, either against or for 

either party, except that any ambiguity as to governmental immunity shall be construed in favor of 

governmental immunity. 

 



Page 6 of 8 
 

Third Party Beneficiary. 

 

The parties do not intend to create in any other individual or entity the status of third-party beneficiary, 

and this Agreement shall not be construed so as to create such status.  The rights, duties, and obligations 

contained in this Agreement shall operate only between the parties to this Agreement and shall inure 

solely to the benefit of the parties to this Agreement.  The provisions of this Agreement are intended 

only to assist the parties in determining and performing their obligations under this Agreement. 

 

Indemnity. 

 

Consultant agrees to indemnify, defend, and hold harmless Owner and their officers, agents, employees, 

successors, assignees, or third-parties from any and all claims, lawsuits, losses, personal injury or 

property damage, and liability arising out of Consultant’s failure to perform any of its duties and 

obligations hereunder or in connection with the negligent performance of its duties or obligations, 

including, but not limited to, any claims, lawsuits, losses, or liability arising out of Consultant’s actions. 

 

Assignment of Agreement. 

 

Owner and Consultant, bind themselves, their partners, successors, assigns, and legal representatives to 

the covenants of this Agreement. Neither Owner nor Consultant will assign, sublet, or transfer any 

interest in this Agreement or claims arising therefrom without the written consent of the other.  

 

Ownership and Use of Project Documents. 

 

Consultant warrants and represents to be the author and creator of all Project Documents prepared or 

furnished by Consultant to Owner pursuant to and in fulfillment of this Agreement.  

 

Consultant grants to Owner a nonexclusive license to use Project Documents for the purposes of 

constructing, using, maintaining, altering, and/or adding to the intended original Project. Said license 

grants to Owner the right to use and reproduce Project documents for the purpose of Project completion, 

alteration, maintenance, or other similar acts. Said license also permits the Owner to authorize 

contractors, subcontractors, suppliers, Owner’s consultants, separate contractors, and other similar 

individuals, to use and reproduce the Project Documents for performing services or construction on the 

Project. Consultant agrees to continue or make any necessary arrangements to continue the nonexclusive 

license for Owner to use Project Documents, as described in this Agreement, if a patent or copyright of 

the Project Documents is obtained.  

 

Consultant shall provide Owner electronic copies of all Project documents in Microsoft Word and 

AutoCAD format at each stage of progress of design, contingent only upon payment for the design up to 

that stage. If either party terminates this Agreement, Owner may expand upon or complete the 

Consultant’s current design with Owner’s own forces or with that of another consultant.  Owner 

understands that there are risks associated with using or expanding upon the Consultant’s partially 

complete designs, including risks related to structural or geotechnical engineering. 

 

Any reuse of Project documents without written verification or adaptation by Consultant for the specific 

purpose intended will be at Owner 's sole risk and without liability or legal exposure to Consultant, and 

Owner shall indemnify and hold harmless Consultant from all claims and damages arising or resulting 

therefrom. 

 



Page 7 of 8 
 

 

Changes to Agreement.   

 

In any event, as the Project progresses, the facts developed may dictate a change in the services to be 

performed, which may alter the Scope of Services as defined in Exhibit A and/or the Project Timeline in 

Exhibit B.  Consultant shall promptly inform Owner if such situations arise and whether changes, by 

way of example and not limited to, in the Scope of Services, including the addition or suspension of 

services, adjustments to the time of performance, and/or compensation are required.  If such change 

results in an increase or decrease in the cost or time, as described in Exhibit B,  required for performance 

of the services, an equitable adjustment may be made, and this Agreement shall be modified in writing; 

requiring approval and signature of  the authorized representatives of both parties.  

 

Suspension by Owner.  

 

Owner may suspend Consultant’s services for up to ninety (90) days upon seven (7) days written notice 

to Consultant.  

 

Termination of Agreement.   

 

Owner may terminate the Agreement, in whole or in part, by giving seven (7) days written notice to the 

Consultant.  In the event of premature termination of the Project by the Owner and through no fault of 

the Consultant, the Consultant shall be entitled to receive full payment for all services performed or 

furnished in accordance with this Agreement through the effective date of termination. Upon making 

such payment, Owner shall have the limited right to the use of Documents, at Owner’s sole risk, subject 

to the provisions of the Ownership and Use of Project Documents section of this Agreement. 

 

Consultant may terminate the Agreement upon not less than fifteen (15) days written notice to the 

Owner should the Owner fail substantially to perform in accordance with the terms of this Agreement, 

through no fault of the Consultant. 

 

Force Majeure.   

 

Consultant shall not be liable for delays, nor shall be considered in breach of this Agreement, due to 

failure to perform its obligations under this Agreement as a result of an event or circumstances not 

within the reasonable control of Consultant; including any acts of God, strikes, unavailability of labor or 

supplies, war, riot, civil commotion, acts of civil or military authority, terrorist act, malicious damage, 

epidemics, pandemics, quarantines, fire, flood, storm or natural disaster, or disruption or outage of 

communications, power or other utility.  Consultant shall not be liable for delays due to failure of the 

Owner to comply with its obligations per the Agreement.   

 

Disputes. 

 

Claims, disputes, or other matters in question between the parties to this Agreement shall initially 

attempt to be resolved through good faith efforts.  If resolution through good faith efforts by the parties 

does not arise within thirty (30) days, either party may pursue any legal remedies available. 

 

Severability/Waiver. 

 



Page 8 of 8 
 

If any provision of this agreement is held invalid or unenforceable, the remaining provisions shall be 

valid and binding upon the parties. The waiver of any breach of any term or condition in this Agreement 

shall not be deemed a waiver of any prior or subsequent breach. Failure to object to a breach shall not 

constitute a waiver. 

 

Jurisdiction/Venue. 

 

The construction, interpretation, and enforcement of this Agreement shall be governed by the laws of the 

State of Wyoming. The Courts of the State of Wyoming shall have jurisdiction over this Agreement and 

the parties, and the venue shall be the Sixth Judicial District, Campbell County, Wyoming. The parties 

intend and agree that Campbell County does not waive governmental immunity by entering into this 

Agreement and specifically retains governmental immunity and all defenses available pursuant to 

Wyoming Statutes §§ 1-39-101 through 1-39-121 and all other applicable law. 

 

Entire Agreement.   

 

This document referenced exhibits and any duly executed amendments represent the entire and 

integrated agreement between Owner and Contractor and may be amended only by a written instrument; 

signed by the authorized representatives of both parties. 

 

Signatures. 

 

The parties to this Agreement, either personally or through their duly authorized representatives, have 

executed this Agreement on the dates set out below, and certify that they have read, understood, and 

agreed to the terms and conditions of this Agreement. 

 

The effective date of this Agreement is the date of the signature last affixed to this page. 

 

 

CAMPBELL COUNTY  

 

 

________________________________________    __________ 

Owner’s Authorized Representative      Date 

D.G. Reardon        

Chairman, Campbell County Board of Commissioners 

 

 

CONSULTANT COMPANY NAME  

 

 

______________________________________________   __________ 

Consultant Authorized Representative     Date 

Name        

Title 



Page 1 of 7 

 

Exhibit A 

 
SCOPE OF WORK 

 

HDR is pleased to provide this scope of work for the Southern Campbell County Arterial Road 

Reconstruction AML Project. HDR has studied scope provided by the County and we have 

developed the following scope of work as requested. 

 

 

Project Description:  Campbell County Public Works (County) has requested HDR to provide 

professional design services for the Southern Campbell county Arterial Road Reconstruction 

AML Project (Project). The Project will include improved drainage infrastructure and a new 

gravel section on 12,000 feet of road within an existing rural neighborhood immediately south of 

the Town of Wright. 

 

Campbell County has secured a state of Wyoming DEQ Abandoned Mine Land Public Facilities 

grant to upgrade subdivision roads in the area just south of the Town of Wright. The exhibit from 

the RFP showing the project area is attached to the end of this scoping document for reference. 

The roads in the project area need major reconstruction to facilitate safe, efficient and adequate 

access for the local residents, emergency response vehicles, mineral industry traffic and school 

buses. An Improvement and Service District was formed in the area for the future maintenance 

of the roads. Campbell County will act as the owner for this project and will administer the 

project through the Public Works Department. 

 

The Project includes upgrading approximately 1500 feet of Chad Road, 4100 feet of Duffy Road, 

3900 feet of Noonan Road and 2300 feet of Hicks road. The improvements will provide an 

upgraded roadway from the Town of Wright through the subdivision to the intersection of 

Highway 59 and 450. 

 

The Wyoming Department of Environmental Quality, AML Division, is performing a NEPA 

study on the proposed corridor(s). This study will run concurrently with the design, and the 

bidding cannot occur until the NEPA study is complete and the Project area is cleared. As an 

update, the completed NEPA study has already been provided to the County by the DEQ. 

 

1. Design Phase 

 

 

1.1. Project Management 

 

1.1.1. Act as project manager to coordinate production of a complete set of contract 

plans and documents within the time period established by the project schedule. The 

project schedule is anticipated for bid in winter 2020 and construction the season of 

2021. Set up project files, projectsite safety plan for field work and a QC plan and 

schedule. Coordinate with sub-consultant AET on safety plan and QC plan. Provide 



Page 2 of 7 

 

project invoicing, including a Project Deliverable Completion Statement to indicate 

the percentage complete for the lump sum billing of the design and bidding phases. 

 

1.1.2. Coordinate Team Progress Meetings during the design phase and coordinate with 

the owner for an update to the progress meetings, or inclusion if desired by the 

County. 

 

1.1.3. Hold a team kick off meeting with the owner. This would be the first of three 

meetings requested in the RFP to be held with the owner and project stakeholders. 

The meeting can be in person, or on Webex as best fits the team. The Kick off 

meeting will discuss project goals, schedule and the newest information prior to 

the start of field work. 

 

Assumptions:  

• HDR assumes that invoicing will be performed once monthly 

• Meetings will be held at the County or the HDR office, and those not in 

Gillette can attend remotely  

Deliverables: 

• Monthly invoice for work performed  

• Meeting minutes 

  

 

1.2. Data Collection 

 

1.2.1. HDR will provide a Professional Land Surveyor to lead the topographic survey for 

the project. The team will use GPS survey equipment to collect data to build an 

existing ground surface and base file for the design. The team will call for utility 

locates using the One-Call system and survey the location of all identified utilities. 

The team will also survey locate all existing drainage infrastructure that is found to 

document drainage flow on the base map. Property corners that are found during 

the survey will be tied and included in the base map file. The team will tie all fence 

lines and corners in the project area and assume that they are lines of occupation. 

 

Assumptions:  

• HDR assumes that we will not be surveying on private property and that no 

ROW will be acquired on the project. We will not need to obtain permission 

to survey or produce exhibits for land acquisition or easements. 

 

 

1.3. Geotechnical Investigation 

 

1.3.1. HDR will partner with American Engineering Testing (AET) to perform the 

geotechnical investigation for the project. AET has provided a proposal that is 

available upon request. The geotechnical investigation will perform a total of 9 

borings, to a depth of 10 feet each. The anticipated lab work will include natural 



Page 3 of 7 

 

moisture content, dry density, Atterberg Limits, sieve analysis, moisture density 

relationship (Proctor Test), California Bearing Ratio Tests and Soil Chemistry 

Tests. A final report will be provided that will provide gravel surfacing section 

and construction recommendations. The construction consideration will address 

geotechnical issues concerning the earthwork, subgrade preparation, 

geosynthetics (if warranted), drainage, culvert CR numbers and any other 

applicable considerations. 

 

Assumptions:  

• HDR assumes that Campbell County will provide all necessary traffic 

counts/data to be used for design purposes. 

• AET will use One Call for locates on all public utilities but One Call will 

not locate private utilities. It is our assumption that Campbell County will 

provide any information that they currently have on private utilities in the 

project area. If the County would like HDR and AET to hire a private 

utility locator, it would be considered as additional work and would be 

handled by an amendment to the contract. 

• If groundwater is found in the soil borings, it will be documented in the 

final report. A specific investigation for ground water is not included in 

this scope. 

Deliverables: 

• Geotechnical Report sealed by a Professional Engineer 

 

1.4. Drainage Study 

 

1.4.1. HDR will provide a Hydrology study for the project area to determine the 

flows of the water where it crosses the roads. The Hydraulics will be 

analyzed to size the culverts under the roadway to meet the County criteria. 

A final technical memo will be produced to document the process of the 

H&H study and final recommendations for pipe sizing. 

Assumptions:  

• HDR assumes that the drainage study will be performed using existing 

available topographic data, updated with the survey information from the 

topo survey inside the project limits. 

Deliverables: 

• H&H Technical Memo 

 

1.5.  Road Design 

 

1.5.1. Road Design and Software -  The HDR team will prepare a road design that 

will improve the flow of drainage in the project area and elevate the roadway 

to improve conditions for both storm water and blowing snow. The 

information determined in the kick off meeting with the owner and the 

stakeholders will serve as the goals for a successful project and will guide the 

design. The team will use AutoCadd Civil 3D to perform the design work. 



Page 4 of 7 

 

The design standards will be determined in the project kick off meeting. 

 

1.5.2. Project Documents – The plan set that is produced for the project will 

include a title sheet, typical sections, project summaries, plan and profile 

sheets, cross sections and plan details. The Project Manual will be produced 

using the County’s standard template for project manuals and will include 

documents that are required by the Funding Agency (AML) requirements. 

 

1.5.3. At approximately 50% completion of the project, the design team will host 

the second of three requested meetings with the project stakeholders. This 

meeting will be to review the project alignment, profile and typical sections 

and the overall direction of the project prior to moving on into the final 

design portion of the work. Plans will be provided prior to the meeting to 

allow for redline comments by all parties. Meeting minutes will be kept to 

document the decisions that are made during the meeting.   
 

1.5.4. Upon completion of the 50% review meeting, the team will move forward to 

the final design of the project, making adjustments and design edits as 

determined in the meeting. The project earthwork will be completed to 

attempt to reach a balance condition and project summaries will be produced 

to document the project quantities. 
 

1.5.5. At approximately 90% completion, HDR will host the third of three 

requested project meetings with the County and the stakeholders. This 

meeting will serve as a final review meeting. The intent will be to receive 

final comments, review the final cost estimate and the bidding documents. 

All comments will be documented in meeting minutes. 
 

1.5.6. Final revisions and completion of the plan set and project documents will be 

completed upon receiving comments at the final review meeting. The design 

report will be completed as well as a final project cost estimate. 
 

1.5.7. HDR will include a maintenance schedule with anticipated cost estimates at 

the end of the design phase to be provided to the I&S District. 
 

1.5.8. HDR will utilize their internal QC program to perform QC reviews on all 

deliverables, in particular reports, technical memos and plan set 

deliverables. HDR will document the QC review as well as document all 

comment responses as they are implemented into the designs and/or 

documents. 

 



Page 5 of 7 

 

Assumptions:  

• HDR assumes the project deliverables submitted for review and the 

project documents for final submittal and bidding will be submitted in 

electronic format. 

• HDR assumes questions or approvals for alignments, typical sections, 

surfacing sections etc can be submitted for approval as needed prior to the 

review meetings. Getting approval on these type of decisions will keep the 

design process moving and minimize rework. 

• HDR assumes the project manual will use the standard County template 

and that federal funding documents required to be included in the project 

manual can be provided by the funding agency. 

Deliverables: 

• 60% plan review set, preliminary cost estimate 

• 90% plan review set, cost estimate 

• Final plans, cross sections, project manual and final cost estimate 

• Final Design Report 

• Meeting Minutes 

 

 

2. Bidding Phase   

 

2.1.1. HDR will assist the County with the bidding process. If the County would 

prefer, HDR will host the project documents on its bidding website for 

bidding purposes. HDR will attend the pre-bid meeting to assist the 

County. HDR will answer contractor questions and perform up to 2 

addenda if necessary. 

2.1.2. Once the bids are received, HDR will compile bid tabulations into a 

spreadsheet and produce a bid recommendation for the County to use in 

the award of the project 

Assumptions:  

• No more than two addenda will be needed 

• HDR assumes that only one project showing will be required to show 

contractors the project. This would likely happen during the pre-bid 

meeting. Individual contractor showings are not anticipated  

Deliverables: 

• Bid Tabulations 

• Addenda (up to 2 if necessary) 

• Bid Award Recommendation 

 

3. Construction Administration 

 

3.1. Provide Full Time Construction Inspection 

 

3.1.1. HDR will provide a full time construction inspector for this project. It is 

anticipated the construction effort will last for 10 weeks, as identified in the RFP. 



Page 6 of 7 

 

The HDR inspector will monitor the project for compliance with the project 

specifications as well as answer questions from the contractor. The inspector will 

also be the initial point of contact for the public, the contractor and the owner in 

regards to the project. The inspector will keep a daily field report that documents the 

weather conditions, work effort and other aspects of the project, including project 

visitors and construction photos. The inspector will also track project quantities 

daily and coordinate with the contractor’s Superintendent to agree on the work 

performed each day. A weekly summary of work completed will also be produced. 

Each week, the daily construction reports, construction photos and quantity 

summary will be submitted to the County for information and records. The inspector 

will also verify and process monthly pay applications from the contractor and 

provide a monthly project summary to meet the needs of the funding agency. 

Assumptions:  

• Construction is estimated at a ten week duration HDR has estimated the 

inspector to work eleven hours per day, five days per week. This would 

include travel time to the project site. 

• HDR assumes inspection is needed only at the project site and not supplier 

/ crusher locations 

• HDR assumes that all documents can be submitted electronically in pdf 

format 

• HDR assumed that an as-constructed topographic survey would not be 

necessary. 

Deliverables: 

• Daily Construction Reports, including photos and a weekly summary of 

quantities 

• Weekly or biweekly progress report meeting minutes 

• Field orders, Change Orders and Work Change Directives as needed 

• Approved Pay Requests, submitted by the contractor and verified and 

approved by HDR 

• Monthly progress report to submit to funding agency on project status 

• Final project report containing test results, daily reports, etc. along with a 

statement that the project meets the project specifications and 

requirements. 

 

 

3.2. Provide Construction Material Testing 

 

3.2.1. HDR has partnered with AET to provide the construction material testing for the 

project. AET will test the compaction of earthwork for subgrade using a nuclear 

density guage based on moisture density (Proctor) curves. AET will also test the 

compaction of granular base that is constructed on the project in the same manner. 

AET has estimated that they will perform these services based on 3 hours per trip, 3 

trips per week for 8 weeks. It is recommended to review the material testing needs 

after the design is completed and a schedule is understood, prior to bidding. 

Assumptions:  



Page 7 of 7 

 

• 3 hours per trip for testing (including travel time), 3 trips per week for 8 

weeks) 

• AET will test density on subgrade and base 

• AET will expect at least a 24 hour notice to schedule material testing 

• Field staff for AET will incur overtime charges in excess of 8 hours per 

day or non-standard hours and weekends 

• AET’s proposal does not include the cost of equipment needed to gain 

specialty access to materials testing (scaffold, scissor lifts, ladders, trench 

shoring etc.) 

Deliverables: 

• Daily test reports and construction reports for each trip made to the project 

site 

• Monthly invoice for services provided 

 
3.3. Provide Construction Staking 

 

3.3.1. HDR will provide construction staking for the project. HDR will provide slope 

staking, blue top staking on embankment and blue top staking on crushed base. 

HDR will also stake sign locations and pipe ends for contractor installation as 

needed. Improvements and accuracy in GPS controlled equipment have reduced the 

need for field staking and Campbell County may find better use of these dollars on 

other aspects of the construction inspection which can be discussed during the kick 

off meeting for the project. 

Assumptions:  

• HDR will slope stake the project at an interval of 200’ in the tangents and 

50’ in the curves 

• HDR will blue top the sub-grade and crushed base at intervals of 200’ in 

the tangents and 50’ in the curves 

• HDR would like to have 48 hours notice for staking needs, which should 

be discussed weekly at the progess meetings. For blue-topping HDR 

would like to have at least 0.5 miles of roadway available to stake. 

• Re-staking of work that is damaged by the contractor, lost to the weather 

etc. would be considered additional work. 

Deliverables: 

• Slope Stakes, blue top stakes in the ground on the project site. 

• As-Built plans for the project 

 
 

 



Exhibit B

Task Description Begin Date End Date Duration

Notice To Proceed August 24, 2020 1 Day

Kick Off Meeting August 27, 2020 1 Day

Preliminary Survey August 31, 2020 September 18, 2020 3 Weeks

Geotechnical Investigation August 31, 2020 September 30, 2020 4 Weeks

Design 0%-30% September 15, 2020 October 15, 2020 4 Weeks

30% Review October 15, 2020 October 30, 2020 2 Weeks

Design 30% - 90% November 1, 2020 December 1, 2020 4 Weeks

90% Design Review December 1, 2020 December 15, 2020 2 Weeks

Desgin 90% - 100% December 15, 2020 January 10, 2021 3 Weeks

Bidding January 15, 2021 February 28, 2021 6 Weeks

Award and Contracts March 1, 2021 March 15, 2021 2 Weeks

Construction April 15, 2021 June 30, 2021 10 Weeks



Level of Effort and Fee Estimate

Campbell County Public Works

Southern Campbell County Arterial Road Reconstruction

Mgr Principal PM Design Lead Designer CADD H&H Survey Lead Surveyor Surveyor Utility Lead H&H Eng Con Inspect Resource 5 Admin Accounting HDR Labor Subconsultant

Work Task Turbiville Oakley Mattson Anderson Oakley Yerdon Anderson Fraser Williams Van Wyhe Messick Starck Dickson Morrison Total

Contract Billing Rate 225.00$        205.00$        165.00$        115.00$        115.00$        165.00$        150.00$        120.00$        120.00$        180.00$        115.00$        145.00$        -$              70.00$          95.00$          

1.0 Project Management $0 $0

1.1 Project Set Up, Project Guide, File Structure 2 16 20 $3,470 $0

1.2 Team Progress Meetings, Owner Coordination 16 16 16 16 4 4 4 4 $11,680 $0

1.3 Kick Off Meeting with Owner 4 2 4 2 2 $2,270 $0

2.0 Data Collection $0 $0

2.1 Topographic Survey / Basemap 12 16 60 80 10 $24,100 $0

2.2 Geotechnical Investigation 8 8 2 $2,740 $4,950

$0 $0

3.0 Preliminary Design and Plan Production 2 $450 $0

3.1 Produce Alignments, Profiles and Sheet Set Up 4 8 16 32 $7,660 $0

3.2 Produce Corridor / Model 4 6 24 10 $5,720 $0

3.3 Typical Section, Cover Sheet, Legend, Details 4 16 24 $5,420 $0

3.4 Hydrology 14 54 $8,520 $0

3.5 Culvert Layout 2 2 8 8 8 4 $4,080 $0

3.6 Produce Cross Sections 2 2 8 24 $4,420 $0

3.7 60% Review Submittal / Meeting 8 12 8 $3,940 $0

3.8 Preliminary Cost Estimate 2 6 $1,100 $0

3.9 Utility Adjustment Coordinate 12 24 24 16 16 $12,780

$0

4.0 Final Design 2 $450 $0

$0

4.1 Alignment and Profile Revisions 6 8 16 16 $6,230 $0

4.2 Corridor Update 4 24 16 $5,260 $0

4.3 Summaries 16 32 16 $8,800 $0

4.4 Project Manual and Design Report 8 8 24 16 $6,840 $0

4.5 90% Review Submittal / Meeting 8 12 12 $4,400 $0

4.6 Comment Revisions 8 16 16 $5,320 $0

$0 $0

5.0 Bidding $0

5.1 Bidder Questions, Coordination 6 8 $2,150

5.2 Pre-Bid Meeting 5 8 $1,945

5.3 Addenda ( 1 estimated) 2 4 2 $1,100

5.4 Bid Opening, Bid Tabulation and Award Reccomendation 2 2 4 $920

$0

6.0 Construction Administration / Material Testing $0

6.1 Daily Construction Inspection ( 10 weeks, 11 hours a day) 40 80 550 $97,150 $10,500

6.2 Slope Staking, Blue Top Staking, signs and pipes 8 100 60 $20,120

6.3 Progress Meetings (Weekly) 40 40 $12,800

6.4 Progress Reports, Submittals Close Out Docs 16 40 10 16 $11,350 $0

6.5 Substantial and Final Completion Walk Throughs 8 16 24 $6,960 $0

Total Labor Hours per Team Member 6 243 56 464 250 14 66 208 70 22 62 594 0 42 20 290,145$                  15,450$                     

Total Labor Charges per Team Member 1,350$                49,815$              9,240$                53,360$              28,750$              2,310$                9,900$                24,960$              8,400$                3,960$                7,130$                86,130$              -$                    2,940$                1,900$                

Direct Costs / Expenses

Technology Charge 0 hours x -$              $/hr No Charge

Mileage 2500 miles x 0.575$          $/mile 1,438$                      

Lodging nights x -$              $/night -$                          

Meals meals x -$              $/meal -$                          

Copies/Photocopies 300$                         

Postage / Public Notices -$                          

Travel/Airfare Charges -$                          

Miscellaneous 500$                         

Mileage: HDR Vehicle 6000 miles x 0.75$            $/mile 4,500$                      

GPS/Robotic Survey Equipment 200 hours x 50.00$          $/hour 10,000.00$                

Expenses Subtotal 16,738$                    

Subconsultant Fees 16,995.00$                

TOTAL FEE 323,878$           

0

100

200

300

400

500

600

700

$0
$10
$20
$30
$40
$50
$60
$70
$80
$90

$100

L
a
b

o
r 

H
o

u
rs

$
, 
T

h
o

u
s
a
n

d
s

Labor Charges/Hours per Team Member



Jan 22, 2020 Feb 4, 2020 January 20, 2021 February 2, 2021

Feb 19, 2020 Mar 3, 2020 February 17, 2021 March 2, 2021

Mar 18, 2020 April 7, 2020 March 24, 2021 April 6,2021

Apr 22, 2020 May 5, 2020 April 21, 2021 May 4, 2021

May 20, 2020 June 2, 2020 May 19, 2021 June 1, 2021

June 17, 2020 July 7, 2020 June 23, 2021 July 6, 2021

July 22, 2020 Aug 4, 2020 July 21, 2021 August 3, 2021

Aug 19, 2020 Sep 1, 2020 August 18, 2021 September 7, 2021

Sep 23, 2020 Oct 6, 2020 September 22, 2021 October 5, 2021

Oct 21, 2020 Nov 3, 2020 October 20, 2021 November 2, 2021

Nov 18, 2020 Dec 1, 2020 November 17, 2021 December 7, 2021

Dec 23, 2020 Jan 5, 2021 December 22, 2021 January 4, 2022

The Board approval dates are Tuesdays and the checks will be mailed out by Friday after approval.

Wendy Balo

Senior Financial Specialist

Campbell County Public Works

307-687-6341

WML08@ccgov.net

2020 2021

Invoice due to 

Public Works

Invoice due to 

Public Works

Board approval 

date

Board approval 

date

Campbell County Public Works Construction Contracts Accounts Payable 
Schedule



 

*Individuals wishing to provide public comment are asked to sign in prior to the start of the meeting, provide 
contact information and the topic(s) to be discussed. 

 
 
The following page(s) contain the backup material for Agenda Item: 9:45 Memorandum of Understanding, 
Guardian Ad Litem  












	Home
	09:00 MEETING CALLED TO ORDER
	PLEDGE OF ALLEGIANCE

	CONSENT AGENDA 
	Consent Agenda
	Min Library Brd Mtg 072720.pdf (1 page)
	Min Regular Mtg 080420.pdf (15 pages)
	Min Directors Wkshp 080320.pdf (2 pages)
	Monthly Reports 081820.pdf (8 pages)
	County Salaries 081820.pdf (14 pages)
	941TaxReport-2ndQtr 081820.pdf (5 pages)
	WorkersComReport-2ndQtr 081820.pdf (3 pages)
	CouncilCommSvcs 1% Agmt 081820.pdf (2 pages)
	Cowboy State Games 1% Agmt 081820.pdf (2 pages)
	Predator Management 1% Agmt 081820.pdf (2 pages)
	Salvation Army 1% Agmt 081820.pdf (2 pages)
	Senior Center 1% Agmt 081820.pdf (2 pages)
	2020 Computer & Monitor Purchase 081820.pdf (3 pages)
	Catering Permit 081820.pdf (1 page)
	Line Item Transfers 081820.pdf (1 page)
	Position Vacancy Justifications 081820.pdf (2 pages)


	PUBLIC COMMENT
	9:05 For the Good of the County*

	REGULAR BUSINESS
	9:15 Request for State Airport Aid, NAVAIDS 2020
	2020 NAVAIDS Grant App 081820.pdf (2 pages)

	9:20 Memorandum of Understanding, Maternal & Child Health Services 
	MOU-MCH Svcs 081820.pdf (29 pages)

	9:25 Ary Simple Subdivision 
	Ary Simple Subdivision 081820.pdf (40 pages)

	9:30 Collins Simple Subdivision 
	Collins Simple Subdivision 081820.pdf (22 pages)

	9:35 Chapter 4 Rules Proposed Amendments
	CHAPTER 4 Rules-Amend 080420.pdf (30 pages)

	9:40 Southern Campbell County Arterial Road Reconstruction AML Project
	So Campbell Co AML Contract 081820.pdf (19 pages)

	9:45 Memorandum of Understanding, Guardian Ad Litem 
	MOU-Guardian Ad Litem 081820.pdf (5 pages)


	EXECUTIVE SESSION
	ADJOURN 
	Consent Agenda
	MINUTES
	MONTHLY REPORTS
	AGREEMENTS - OPTIONAL ONE PERCENT FY 2020-21
	CONTRACTS
	CATERING PERMITS
	LINE ITEM TRANSFERS
	POSITION VACANCY JUSTIFICATIONS
	HAND WARRANTS


