N YN\
Campbell County

wyoming

Chapter 4

Rules Regulating
Construction

Amended August 2020



CERTIFICATE OF ADOPTION OF RULES

Adopting Entity:

Rules Adopted:

Summary of Amendments:

Statutory Authority:
Date Rules Proposed &
Available for Inspection:

Copies mailed to all on
the mailing list:

Date of Public Hearing:

Date of Final Adoption:

Effective Date:

Campbell County Board of County Commissioners

Chapter 4, Rules Regulating Construction (These are amended
rules)

Clarification of current language for Roof Snow Load design
standards and small wastewater systems (no change to current
requirements), update the National Electric Code to the 2020
edition as required by state statute, and amend the International
Plumbing Code to ease requirements of when drinking fountains
are deemed necessary.

W.S. 18-5-201
W.S. 35-9-121

June 16, 2020

Yes

August 4, 2020

August 18, 2020

Immediately upon filing with the County Clerk

| hereby certify the attached rules are a true and correct copy of rules adopted by the

Campbell County Board of

County Commissioners in accordance with the WWyoming

Administrative Procedure Act.

Gfertes’e

D.G. Reardon, Chairman
Board of Commissioners

G Ty

Susdn Saunders, County Clerk



Section 1.

CHAPTER 4
RULES REGULATING CONSTRUCTION
Amended August 2020

Authority.

This Chapter is adopted pursuant to the authority granted by W.S. 18-5-105, W.S. 35-9-121 and
W.S. 35-11-304 and supersedes all previous Rules Regulating Construction.

Section 2.

Definitions.

As used in this Chapter, the following definitions apply:

A

B.

“Applicant” means the owner or authorized agent making application for a permit.

“Automatic Sprinkler System” is an integrated system of a water source, piping, and heat
activated fire suppression devices designed in accordance with fire protection engineering
standards as fully defined in 2015 IFC Chapter 2.

“Average Daily Demand” means the total annual water use divided by the number of days
the system was in operation. A minimum average daily demand of four hundred (400)
gallons per day per Water Service Connection shall be used, unless the annual water use is
available. Comparable records may be used if approved by the Building Code Official.

“Building Division” means the division of the Campbell County Department of Public Works
responsible for issuing Building, Electrical, Mechanical and Plumbing Permits and
performing inspections on that work.

“Building Code Appeals Board” means a Board created by the Campbell County
Commissioners (Resolution 1449) to hear and decide appeals of orders, decisions or
determinations made by the Building Code Official or Fire Code Official relative to the
application and interpretation of this code.

“Building Code Official” means the officer or other designated authority or a duly authorized
representative charged with the administration and enforcement of this code. The position of
Building Code Official is also referred to as the “Administrative Authority”, “Authority
Having Jurisdiction”, “Code Official”, and “Fire Code Official” as those titles are used to
refer to the individual responsible for administration and enforcement of the codes adopted in
this Chapter.

“Building Permit” means an official certificate of authorization by the Building Division for
construction, enlargement or alteration of a building in accordance with Section 6.

. “Central Stations” means a system or a group of systems in which the operations of circuits

and devices are transmitted automatically to, recorded in, maintained by, and supervised
from a listed central station that has competent and experienced servers and operators who,
upon receipt of a signal, take such action as calling the local dispatch (fire or law
enforcement).

4-1



“Commercial Building” means all buildings not included in the definition of Residential
buildings.

“Community Water System” means a water supply system that has no more than nine (9)
Water Service Connections and serves fewer than twenty-five (25) individuals with water for
human consumption, which is permitted through the Campbell County Public Works
Department and Chapter 4, Rules Regulation Construction.

. “Cross Connection” means any actual or potential connection between a potable water supply
and any other source or system through which it is possible to introduce contamination into
the system.

. “Delegation Agreement” means the current agreement between the Wyoming Department of
Environmental Quality and Campbell County in accordance with W.S. 35-11-304 by which
Campbell County has assumed authority for the enforcement and administration of the
permitting of Small Wastewater Systems, publicly owned and controlled sewage collection
facilities, and publicly owned and controlled water distribution facilities.

. “Electrical Wiring Permit” means an official certificate of authorization issued by the
Building Division in accordance with W.S. 35-9-120(e) and 35-9-121 and Section 7.

. “Engineer” means a professional engineer licensed with the State of Wyoming Board of
Professional Engineers and Professional Land Surveyors. In Section 13, any item required to
be completed by an Engineer may also be completed by a professional geologist licensed
with the Wyoming State Board of Professional Geologists.

. “Farm or Ranch Operation” means that the primary use of the property where the structures
are located, along with any leased or owned property adjacent to or in close proximity to the
subject parcel, is to produce agricultural products or to graze livestock for monetary profit as
a primary source of income.

. “Flood Damage Prevention Resolution” is a resolution adopted by the Campbell County
Commissioners on January 2, 2008 for the purpose of minimizing losses due to flooding in
specific areas of the county.

. “Looped Water System” means a water distribution system whereby any Water Service
Connection can receive water from two (2) directions.

. “Mechanical Permit” means an official certificate of authorization by the Building Division
for heating, ventilation, air conditioning and gas line work in accordance with Section 8.

. “Meter Pits” must be Mueller single- or double-meter pits or an approved equal and shall
contain backflow prevention and shut-off valves. Approval shall be made by the Building
Code Official.

. “Owner” means the person holding title to real property.

. “Platted Subdivision” means any parcel or lot created through the subdivision plat process
and where a map, drawn to scale by a licensed surveyor, showing how a portion of land is

4-2



divided into blocks and lots, and showing streets, alleys and easements, common areas,
dedications and other attributes, pursuant to the requirements of Campbell County Chapter 6,
Subdivision Regulations and W.S. 18-5-306, is recorded in the land vault of the County
Clerk’s Office. Parcels created through a Record of Survey or subdivision exemption
process shall not be considered part of a platted subdivision.

“Plumbing Permit” means an official certificate of authorization issued by the Building
Division in accordance with Sections 9 and 10 for domestic or commercial water supplies,
sewage disposal, and all piping and materials necessary to complete these activities.

. “Potable Water” means water meeting EPA Primary Drinking Water Standards.

“Remodeling” includes repairing, altering, or expanding a building or its plumbing,
mechanical or electrical systems.

“Residential” means a building where more than half of the floor area is used for dwelling
purposes.

“Rules Regulating Construction” means this document as adopted by the Board of
Commissioners.

AA. “Small Wastewater System” means any sewage system, disposal system, or treatment

works having simple hydrologic and engineering needs which is intended for wastes
originating from a single Residential unit serving no more than four (4) families or which
distributes two thousand (2,000) gallons or less of domestic sewage per day.

BB. “Water Service Connection” means any water line or pipe connected to a distribution

Section 3.

A

Section 4.

A

supply main or pipe for the purpose of conveying water to a water user’s system.
Applicability of Rules Regulating Construction.

The provisions of this Chapter shall apply to any construction or installation for which an
application for a Building Permit, Electrical Wiring Permit, Mechanical Permit or Plumbing
Permit is required by the Building Division.

The provisions of this Chapter shall not apply to any construction or installation that
Campbell County is preempted by state or federal law from regulating or permitting.

This Chapter shall supersede all previous rules and regulations, resolution, or building codes
adopted by Campbell County.

Enforcement of Rules Regulating Construction.

The Building Division shall enforce the Rules Regulating Construction prescribed in Chapter
4 for that portion of Campbell County lying outside of the corporate limits of the City of
Gillette and the Town of Wright.

The Building Code Official shall have the authority to render interpretations and enforce the
Rules Regulating Construction.

4-3



C. Violation penalties, re-inspection fees, and appeals.

1. Persons who violate a provision of any of the Rules Regulating Construction or fail to
comply with any of the requirements thereof or who shall erect, install, alter, repair or do
work in violation of the approved construction documents or directive of the Building
Code Official, or of a permit or certificate issued under provisions of any of the Rules
Regulating Construction, shall be subject to a fine of $250 per day. Each day that a
violation continues after due notice has been served shall be deemed a separate offense.

2. Upon issuance of a stop work notice from the Building Code Official, work that is being
done contrary to the provisions of any of the Rules Regulating Construction or in a
dangerous or unsafe manner shall immediately cease. Such notice shall be in writing and
shall be given to the owner of the property, or to the owner’s agent, or to the person
performing the work. The notice shall state the condition under which work is authorized
to resume. Where an emergency exists, the Building Code Official shall not be required
to give a written notice prior to stopping the work. Any person who shall continue any
work in or about the structure after having been served with a stop work order, except
such work as the person is directed to perform to remove a violation or unsafe condition,
shall be subject to the penalties set forth in Section 4.C.1.

3. The first two (2) inspections for each portion of construction or type of work are
performed free of charge. Each additional re-inspection that is needed due to incorrect
work will be assessed a fee of $60. The fee must be paid in person at the Building
Division office prior to scheduling the reinspection.

4. The first two (2) commercial plan reviews will be completed free of charge. A $250 fee
will be assessed and added to the cost of the Building Permit for each subsequent review
which is needed due to incorrect material.

5. A $60 fee will be assessed when any work commences prior to obtaining a required
permit.

6. Appeals from the decision or actions of the Building Code Official shall be to the
Building Code Appeals Board in accordance with its established rules and procedures.

7. The Building Code Official reserves all other rights and remedies available under the law
to enforce the Rules Regulating Construction.

Section 5. General Permit Requirements.
A. All applications for permits under this Chapter require the following:
1. Zoning Certificate. For zoned parcels, an approved Zoning Certificate from the Planning
and Zoning Division shall be required prior to issuance of any permit. Refer to Chapter

7, Zoning Regulations for requirements.

2. An approved site plan. The site plan shall be a drawing, to scale or clearly dimensioned,
showing the uses and structures (existing or proposed) for a parcel of land. The plan

4-4



Section 6.

A.

shall include a north arrow, property lines, streets, location of all buildings, wells (water
and methane), septic tank and leach field, as well as the location for a future replacement
leach field, easements/rights-of-way, and the location of utilities including electrical
service lines, water lines, sewer/septic lines, natural gas and propane & LPG lines, etc.
(existing and proposed). The Building Code Official, per IBC 107.2.5, may also require
a grading plan and/or spot elevation to address topographical and drainage issues on a site
by site basis.

a) Culverts are required for new driveway approaches that cross drainage ditches.
Culvert installation shall be as specified in the subdivision disclosure statement, or as
approved by the Building Code Official. Minimum size is twelve (12) inches in
diameter. Driveway and culvert installation may be subject to approval by the
subdivision Improvement and Service District or Homeowners Association.

3. Plans to verify compliance with the Rules Regulating Construction. Plans shall be
drawings that show the shape, size, and location of important details relating to the
construction of all buildings. The plans shall clearly indicate the nature and extent of the
work proposed and show, by details or other means, that the work will conform to the
Rules Regulating Construction.

The Building Code Official shall issue permits under this Chapter after determining that the
proposed project will comply with the Rules Regulating Construction.

The applicant shall maintain a copy of all permits, approved plans, job sign off sheet, and
plan review documents available on the job site.

Per the current Campbell County Chapter 8, Addressing Standards, all properties must
display the assigned address with address numbers which are clearly visible from the
roadway. Inspection by the Building Division will not be performed upon the property until
those assigned address numbers are posted.

1. Campbell County Public Works shall issue a new address for all properties not currently
assigned a valid address, and shall re-assign property addresses as applicable, upon
review. No properties shall obtain a building permit without a valid County issued
address.

Building Permits.
Except as provided in subsection C of this section, before performing any work, any person

constructing or remodeling a residential dwelling, public, commercial, or industrial building
shall apply to the Building Division to obtain a Building Permit.

. For all public, commercial or industrial buildings, a Commercial Site Plan Review

application and meeting shall be required prior to applying for a Building Permit. The
application and submittal schedule for Commercial Site Plan Review meetings can be found
in the Public Works Office or on the county website.

4-5



C. A Building Permit shall not be required for:

1. A public, commercial, or industrial building associated with the extraction of oil, gas,
coal or other minerals.

2. Structures located on parcels used exclusively for Farm and Ranch Operations as defined
within Section 2. Definitions of this document.

3. One- and two-family residential dwelling located outside a Platted Subdivision.
4. Any Manufactured home designed and constructed per HUD Standards.

D. A $250 fee will be charged for all new Commercial Building Permits. Reinspection fees may
apply per Section 4(C)(3).

E. For homes built off site to IRC standards, onsite inspections are required per Section 11. In
addition, a third-party inspection report is required from the manufacturer.

Section 7. Electrical Wiring Permits.

A. Except as provided in subsection B. of this section, before performing any work, any person
installing electrical equipment in new construction or remodeling of a building, mobile home,
or premises shall apply to the Building Division to obtain an Electrical Wiring Permit.

B. An Electrical Wiring Permit shall not be required for:

1. Structures located on parcels used exclusively for Farm and Ranch Operations as defined
within Section 2, Definitions of this document. Electrical contractors performing work
on parcels of deeded land forty (40) acres or greater shall comply with W.S. 35-9-123(b).

2. Any installation associated with the extraction of oil, gas, coal or other minerals.

Section 8. Mechanical Permits.

A. Except as provided in subsection B. of this section, before performing any work, any person
installing a heating or air conditioning system or gas lines in a building or structure shall
apply to the Building Division to obtain a Mechanical Permit.

B. A Mechanical Permit shall not be required for:

1. Structures located on parcels used exclusively for Farm and Ranch Operations as defined
within Section 2. Definitions of this document.

2. Buildings and structures associated with the extraction of oil, gas, coal, or other minerals.



Section 9.

A.

Section 10.

A.

Section 11.

A

B.

Plumbing Permits.

Except as provided in subsection B. of this section, before performing any work, any person
installing plumbing in a building or structure, or modifying or installing a Community Water
System, or Small Wastewater System, shall apply to the Building Division to obtain a
Plumbing Permit.

. A Plumbing Permit shall not be required for:

1. Structures located on parcels used exclusively for Farm and Ranch Operations as defined
within Section 2, Definitions of this document.

2. Buildings or structures associated with the extraction of oil, gas, coal, or other minerals.

No Plumbing Permits for new Residential or any Commercial construction will be issued
until the applicant provides proper verification that a potable water source will be provided to
the project.

1. For on-lot wells a copy of the valid State Engineer’s Office well permit for the proposed
use shall be required.

2. For shared wells, a valid Shared Well Agreement shall be submitted along with a copy of
the State Engineer’s Office well permit for the proposed use.

3. For connections to Community or Public Water Systems, written verification shall be
submitted from the owner of the system indicating the system has adequate capacity and
that permission is granted to make the connection.

Plumbing Permit for Small Wastewater System.

Any person installing a Small Wastewater System shall apply to the Building Division to
obtain a Plumbing Permit prior to starting work. All wastewater systems shall comply with
Appendix 2 to Chapter 4 Regulations.

1. Any system for which Campbell County does not have current delegated authority
from DEQ to permit shall be permitted through DEQ.

2. Prior to re-energizing any home or business on a parcel where no information on the
Small Wastewater System is on file, the septic tank shall be pumped to verify
minimum capacity, as required by Appendix 2 to Chapter 4 Regulations.

Inspections.

The Building Division shall perform required inspections during the normal course of
construction and notify the Owner and builder of any violations found during any inspection.

If an inspection reveals that a life-threatening code violation exists, or that a project has
commenced before the required permits have been obtained, the Building Division or
Building Code Official shall issue a violation notice and a stop work order to the Owner.

4-7



C. Upon completion of a project requiring a permit under this Chapter, and prior to occupancy,
the Building Division shall perform a final inspection to determine conformance with the
approved plans and codes. When there are no violations, a certificate of occupancy shall be
issued.

Section 12.  Adoption of Rules Regulating Construction.

A. The following documents are adopted by reference into Chapter 4, Rules Regulating
Construction for Campbell County, Wyoming:

1. International Fire Code, 2018 Edition, including Appendices A, D, E, F, G and B (B only
applies in certain circumstances as outlined below).

Appendix B only applies in areas with access to a water supply capable of supplying the
required fire flows.

a) The following amendments to the International Fire Code, as adopted by Section
12(A)(1) above, are hereby made a part of this rule.

(1) Section 101.1 of the International Fire Code is amended to read as follows:

101.1 Title. These regulations shall be known as the Fire Code of Campbell
County hereinafter referred to as “this code”.

(2) Section 108, Board of Appeals, is repealed in its entirety.
(3) Section 401.3.2 Alarm Activations, the following is added:

401.3.2.1 Central Stations. Central stations shall immediately notify the
Campbell County Sheriff’s Office Dispatch for dispatch of the fire department of
alarm signals initiated by any fire alarm, fire extinguishing system or equipment.
Supervisory signals shall be relayed to the Campbell County Sheriff’s Office
Dispatch for dispatch of the fire department. The fire department must be notified
by faxed or electronic report of all trouble signals which exist for greater than a
single 6-hour time period. Campbell County Sheriff’s Office Dispatch, for the
fire department, shall be contacted prior to notification of the subscriber.

(4) Section 505.1, Address Numbers, amended to read as follows:

505.1 New and existing building shall have approved address numbers, building
numbers or approved building identification placed in a position that is plainly
legible and visible from the street or road fronting the property. If the structure is
not visible from the roadway because of terrain, trees or other obstruction, the
address numbers shall be posted on both sides of a post which shall be a minimum
of four (4°) feet and maximum of seven (7’) feet in height above the ground in a
visible location within twenty (20”) feet of a public road at the Access Drive to
the structure. These numbers shall contrast with their background. Address

4-8



numbers shall be Arabic numerals or alphabet letters. Numbers shall be a
minimum of 4 inches high with a minimum stroke width of 0.5 inch.

Exceptions: Structures within twenty-five (25”) feet of a public road may place
the addresses on the structure.

(5) Section 506.1, Where Required. Delete the first sentence and amend the section
as follows:

Key boxes (Knox Box) shall be provided for Fire Department entry for all
Commercial occupancies. The key boxes shall be installed on all new businesses
before occupancy is granted. Any existing business that obtains a permit to do
any work or change of use or occupancy shall be required to install a key box
before the work can be completed and approved and occupancy resumed. The
key box shall be located within 10 feet of the front doors, a minimum of 6 feet
above the ground level and not to exceed 7 feet in height unless approved in
writing by the Building Code Official. The Building Division has the ordering
forms for key boxes. The key box shall be of an approved type and shall contain
items necessary to gain access as required by the Fire Department.

(6) Section 507.1, Required water supply. Amended to read as follows:

For areas with access to a water supply capable of supplying the required fire
flows, fire protection shall be provided. For areas that do not have a water supply
capable of providing fire flows, the Campbell County Fire Department tanker-
shuttle system will be utilized as the fire protection method.

(7) Section 507.1.1, Building, or portions of buildings which are hereafter constructed
or moved into the jurisdiction which are required to be equipped with an
Automatic Sprinkler System shall have access to an approved water system
capable of providing the required Automatic Sprinkler System fire flows or shall
provide an approved on-site water storage and delivery system capable of
providing such flows.

(8) Section 507.5.1, Where Required. Amended to read as follows:

For areas with access to a water supply system capable of supplying required fire
flows, fire hydrants providing the required fire flows shall be located within 500
feet of the building as measured by an approved route around the exterior of the
facility or building.

(9) Section 901.4.6.1, Clearances of the International Fire Code, a new section is
added to read as follows:

901.4.6.1 Clearances. Fire Protection Equipment shall not be obstructed or
concealed. Fire Protection Equipment includes, but is not limited to, the
following: fire sprinkler control valves, risers, hose stations, standpipes, and fire
alarm panels. A minimum of eight (8”) inches on each side and a clear access

4-9



width of three (3”) feet shall be maintained in front of the fire protection
equipment.

(10) Section 903.2.8 is amended to include an exception to read as follows: Group R-3
(one- and two-family dwellings) shall not be required to install an automatic
sprinkler system.

2. International Building Code; 2018 Edition, including Appendixes C and J;

a) The following amendments to the International Building Code, as adopted by Section
12(A)(2) above, are hereby made a part of this rule:

(1) Section 101.4.1 Gas. The provisions of the International Fuel Gas Code shall
apply to gas piping systems extending from the point of delivery to the inlet
connections of appliance and installation and operation of residential and
commercial gas appliances and related accessories.

(2) Section 101.42 Mechanical. The provisions of the International Mechanical Code
shall apply to the installation, alterations, repair and replacement of mechanical
systems including equipment, appliances, fixtures, fittings and/or appurtenances,
ventilation, heating, cooling, air-conditioning and refrigeration systems,
incinerators and other energy-related systems.

(3) Section 101.4.3 Plumbing. Amended to read as follows:

The provisions of the International Plumbing Code shall apply to the installation,
alteration, repair and replacement of plumbing systems including equipment,
appliances, fixtures, fittings and appurtenances where connected to a water or
sewage system, and all aspects of a medical gas system. The provisions of the
Delegation Agreement shall apply to private sewage disposal systems.

(4) Section 101.4.4 Property Maintenance. Amended to read as follows:

The provisions of the International Property Code are adopted; only to the extent
as it applies to fire and life-safety issues for Commercial and Residential
Structures.

(5) Section 101.4.5 Fire Protection. The provisions of the International Fire Code
shall apply to matters affecting or relating to structures, processes and premises
from the hazard of fire and explosions arising from storage, handling or use of
structures, materials or devices; from conditions hazardous to life, property or
public welfare in the occupancy of structures or premises; and from the
construction, extension, repair, alteration or removal of fire suppression,
automatic sprinkler systems and alarm systems or fire hazards in the structure or
on the premises from occupancy or operation.

(6) Section 101.4.6 of the International Building Code is repealed.

(7) Section 102.6 Existing Structures. Amended to read as follows:

4-10



The legal occupancy of any structure existing on the date of adoption of this code
shall be permitted to continue without change, except as is specifically covered in
this code, the International Fire Code, or as is deemed necessary by the Building
Code Official for the general safety and welfare of the occupants and the public.

(8) Section 103.3 Deputies. Amended to read as follows:

In accordance with the prescribed procedures of this jurisdiction and with the
concurrence of the appointing authority, the Building Code Official shall have the
authority to appoint a deputy-building official, related technical officers,
inspectors, plan examiners, and other employees. Such employees shall have
powers as delegated by the Building Code Official.

(9) Section 109 Fees is repealed.

(10)
(11)
(12)

(13)

Section 113 Board of Appeals is repealed in its entirety.

Section 114.3 Prosecution of Violation is repealed in its entirety.

Chapter 13 Energy Efficiency is repealed in its entirety.

Section 1608.2 Ground Snow Load. Repeal in its entirety and replace with:

Minimum roof snow loads: 1:12 pitch and flatter roofs (4.76 degrees) shall be
designed for a minimum balanced roof snow load of 35 pounds per square
foot with no reductions. The effects of unbalanced snow, drifting, sliding
snow, and ponding shall be considered in addition to the balanced snow load
where applicable.

Greater than 1:12 pitch roofs (4.76 degrees) shall be designed for a minimum
balanced roof snow load of 30 pounds per square foot with no reductions.
The effects of unbalanced snow, drifting, sliding snow, and ponding shall be
considered in addition to the balanced snow load where applicable.

4-11



(14)  Section 1609.3 Basic Design Wind Speed. Amended to read as follows:
Basic Design Wind Speed 115, Nominal Wind Speed 90 Exposure C
Climatic and Geographical Design Criteria
Minimum | Basic Seismic | Subject to Damage From Winter | Ice Barrier Flood Air Mean
Roof Design | Design - - Design | Underlayment | Hazards | Freezing | Annual
Snow Wind Category Weathering E‘fgzt Termite Temp | Requirements Index Temp
Load (psf) | Speed D'e h ) ©f
Per IBC 7 n‘;
1609.3 '
Wind
Speed
115
Nom.
90 mph
30-35* Exp.C B Severe 42 Slight / -5 Yes Jan. 02 2000 45
moderate 2008
*1:12 pitch and flatter, 35 psf. 1:12 pitch and greater, 30 psf.
(15) Section 1612 Flood Loads is repealed in its entirety and replaced with the
following:
The Flood Damage Prevention Resolution. All new construction of buildings,
structures, and portions of buildings and structures, including substantial
improvements and restoration of substantial damage to buildings and
structures shall comply with the above document.
(16) 1803.5.3 Expansive Soils.
The Building Code Official shall require soil tests to be performed for all
commercial and industrial buildings.
(17)  Section 1809.4 Depth of Footings. Amended to read as follows:
The minimum depth of footings below the undisturbed ground surface shall be
42” inches; or protected from frost with an approved method.
(18) 1904.3 Sulfate exposures is added and reads as follows:

Concrete that will be exposed to sulfate-containing solutions or soils shall
comply with the maximum water-cementitious materials ratios, minimum
specified compressive strength and be made with the appropriate type of
cement in accordance with the provisions of ACI 318, Section 4.3.

Exception: Unless the owner or applicant supplies results from a soils
investigation containing data on sulfates, the owner or applicant must use a
concrete mix design meeting the following specifications:

Use Type V cement or increase the amount of Type Il Modified cement in
concrete to obtain a maximum water-to-cement ratio of 0.45 (by weight,

4-12



3.

normal weight concrete) and a minimum compressive strength fc of 4000
pounds per square inch (psi).

(19) Section 2901.1 Scope. Amended to read as follows:

The provisions of this Chapter and the International Plumbing Code shall
govern the erection, installation, alteration, repairs, relocation, replacement,
addition to, use or maintenance of plumbing equipment and systems. Toilet
and bathing rooms shall be constructed in accordance with Section 1209 of the
IBC 2018. Plumbing systems and equipment shall be constructed, installed,
and maintained in accordance with the International Plumbing Code. Small
Wastewater Systems shall conform to the Delegation Agreement.

International Residential Code, 2018 Edition, including Appendixes A, B, C and E.

The International Residential Code (IRC) is adopted for the purpose of providing
standards for residential construction, including plumbing and mechanical codes on
Platted Subdivision Lots. Electrical provisions are obtained from the currently adopted
NEC. To obtain a Certificate of Occupancy all applicable portions of the IRC shall

apply.

(a) The following amendments to the International Residential Code, as adopted by

Section 12(A)(3) above, are hereby made a part of this rule:

(1)  Section R104.10.1 Areas Prone to Flooding is repealed and replaced with the
following:

All residential construction in areas prone to flooding shall comply with Flood
Damage Prevention Resolution.

(2)  Section R105.2 Work Exempt from Permit is amended to read as follows:
Work Exempt from Permit.
Exemption from permit requirements of this code shall not be deemed to grant
authorization for any work to be done in any manner in violation of the provisions
of this code or any other laws or ordinances of this jurisdiction.
Permits shall not be required for the following:

Building: Numbers 1 through 10 remain unchanged, add number 11 as follows:

(11) Non-habitable accessory structures including, but not limited to, pole barns
and similar structures that meet the following requirements:

1. There shall be clear separation distance of seven (7°) feet between the
structure and any dwelling;

4-13



2. The structure shall not be attached to a dwelling with a breezeway or other
form of connecting structure; and

3. The clear roof span is less than 61 feet.

(3)  Section R108 Fees is repealed.
(4)  Section R109.1.3 Flood Plain Inspections. Amended to read as follows:
For construction in areas prone to flooding, as established in Flood Damage
Prevention Resolution.
(5)  Section R112 Board of Appeals is repealed.
(6)  Section 112.2 is added to read as follows:
Criteria for issuance of a variance for areas prone to flooding shall be in
accordance with Article 1V, Section C of the Flood Damage Prevention
Resolution.
(7)  Section R114.2 Unlawful Continuance is repealed.
(8) Table R301.2(1) replaced with the following:
Climatic and Geographical Design Criteria
Minimum | Basic Seismic | Subject to Damage From Winter | Ice Barrier Flood Air Mean
Roof Design | Design : - Design | Underlayment | Hazards | Freezing | Annual
Snow Wind Category Weathering Eﬁzt Termite Temp | Requirements Index Temp
Load (psf) | Speed Denth (°f) °H
Per IBC (inF;
1609.3 '
Wind
Speed
115
Nom.
90 mph
30-35* Exp.C B Severe | 42 Slight / 5 Yes Jan.02 | 2000 45
moderate 2008
*1:12 pitch and flatter, 35 psf. 1:12 pitch and greater, 30 psf.
(9) Table R302.1(2) of the International Residential Code is repealed.
(10) Section R302.13 of the International Code is repealed.
(11) Section R309.5 of the International Residential Code is repealed.
(12) Sections R310.2.3.2 & R310.3.2.1 Drainage of the International Residential

Code is amended to read as follows:

R310.2.3.2 & R310.3.2.1 Drainage. Window wells and Bulkhead enclosures
shall be designed for proper drainage by connecting to the building’s

4-14




(13)

(14)

(15)

(16)
(17)

(18)

(19)

(20)

foundation drainage system required by Section 405.1 or by an approved
alternative method.

Section R313.1 & R313.2 of the International Residential Code is repealed.

Sections R313.1.1 & R313.2.1 of the International Residential Code is
amended to read as follows:

Sections R313.1.1 & R313.2.1 When provided, automatic residential fire
sprinkler systems for buildings covered under the International Residential
Code shall be designed and installed in accordance with IRC Section P2904 or
NFPA 13D.

R401.4 Soil tests.

In areas likely to have expansive, compressible, shifting or other unknown soil
characteristics, the Building Code Official shall require a soil investigation to
determine the soil’s characteristics at a particular location.

Exception: In lieu of a soil investigation, the owner shall submit to the
Building Code Official a signed and sealed letter from an Engineer stating that
the soils are adequate for the proposed application. The letter shall reference
Table R401.4.1 from the International Residential Code and specify the
appropriate Class of Material to be used for the foundation design.

Chapter 11 Energy Efficiency is repealed in its entirety.
M1411.8 Locking access port caps is repealed in its entirety.
M1502.4.2 Duct Installation repealed in its entirety and replaced with:

Duct Installation. Dryer exhaust ducts shall be supported at intervals not to
exceed 4 feet and shall be secured in place. The insert end of the duct shall
extend into the adjoining duct or fitting in the direction of airflow. Exhaust
duct joints shall be sealed in accordance with Section M1601.4.1. Ducts shall
not be joined with screws or similar fasteners.

M1701.2.1 Exhaust and ventilation system, add a new section to the IRC. All
dwellings shall have make-up air for the exhaust systems provided in the
following manner:

Piping for the make-up air shall come from the exterior of the dwelling to the
return-air duct of the HVAC system, or to an opening in a laundry room or
other acceptable location. A four (4”’) inch minimum diameter pipe shall be
used.

Section G2406.2 Prohibited Locations. Exceptions 3 & 4 are repealed and
replaced with the following:

4-15



(21)

(22)

(23)

(24)

(25)

(26)

(27)

Unvented fuel burning equipment shall not be installed, used, or maintained
within a dwelling unit.

Section G2444.1 Unit Heaters. This section is repealed.
Section G2445.2 Prohibited Use. Amended to read as follows:

Unvented room heaters shall not be used in attached or detached garages
unless protected by a carbon monoxide detection system and equipped with an
oxygen-depletion safety system.

Section G2445.4 Unvented Room Heaters, Prohibited Locations. Amended to
read as follows:

The location of unvented room heaters shall comply with Section G2406.2 as
amended in this document.

Section P2503.5.1 Rough Plumbing. Drain, waste and venting systems shall
be tested on completion of the rough piping installation by water or by air with
no evidence of leakage. Either test shall be applied to the drainage system in
its entirety or in sections after rough piping has been installed, as follows:

1. Water test. Each section shall be filled with water to a point not less than
10 feet above the highest fitting connection in that section, or to the highest
point in the complete system. Water shall be held in the section under test
for a period of 15 minutes. The system shall prove leak free by visual
inspection.

2. Air Test. The portion under test shall be maintained at a gauge of 5 pounds
per square inch (psi). This pressure shall be held without introduction of
additional air for a period of 15 minutes.

Section P2601.3 Flood Hazard Area. Amended to read as follows:

In areas prone to flooding as established by Flood Damage Prevention
Resolution, plumbing fixtures, drains, and appliances shall be located or
installed in accordance with Article V Section A of the above document.

Section P2602.2 Flood Resistant Installation. Amended to read as follows:

In areas prone to flooding as established by the Flood Damage Prevention
Resolution: Remainder of the section unchanged.

Section P2603.5.1 Sewer Depth. Amended to read as follows:

Building sewers that connect to private sewage disposal systems shall be a
minimum of thirty-six (36”) inches below finished grade at the point of septic
tank connection. All building sewer piping shall be a minimum of thirty-six
(36”) inches below grade.

4-16



(28) Section P2603.5 Freezing. Amend the last sentence to read:

All water service lines and exterior water pipes shall be installed not less than
five-foot six (5°6”) inches below grade.

Exception: Lawn watering systems need not be installed at the above depth.
Add the following language to the end of this section:
Water services for mobile/manufactured homes shall use a Woodford
Thermaline, or equivalent water connector, or shall be placed in a 12” diameter
by 5 ft. deep pipe located up under the home.

(29) Section P2705.1 Installation, item #3 is repealed.

(30) Section P3001.3 Flood-resistant Installation. Amended to read as follows:
In areas prone to flooding as established by the Flood Damage Prevention
Resolution, drainage, waste, and vent systems shall be located and installed to
prevent infiltration of floodwaters into the systems and discharges from the

systems into floodwaters.

(31) Delete Chapters 34 through 42 (Electrical Provisions) of the International
Residential Code and replace with the 2020 NEC.

(32) Add Appendix E, Section AE101 General. Amended to read as follows:
Section AE101.1 General. These provisions shall be applicable to all
manufactured homes used as a single dwelling unit and shall apply to the

following: Remainder of this section unchanged.

(33) Section AE304 Fees is repealed. There are no fees for plan review or
inspections. Re-inspection fees may apply per Section 4. C. 3.

4. International Mechanical Code, 2018 Edition, including Appendix A.

a) The following amendments to the International Mechanical Code, as adopted by
Section 12(A)(4) above are hereby made a part of this rule.

(1) Section 106.5 Fees is repealed. There are no fees for plan review or inspections.
Re-inspection fees may apply per Section 4. C. 3.

(2) Section 108.4 Violation Penalties is repealed.
(3) Section 108.5 Stop Work Order is repealed.

(4) Section 109 Means of Appeal is repealed in its entirety.

4-17



(5) Section 301.2 Energy Utilization is repealed.

(6) Section 303.3 Prohibited Locations. Amended to read as follows:

Except in attached or detached garages protected with a carbon monoxide
detection system and equipped with an oxygen-depletion safety system, unvented
fuel burning equipment shall not be installed, used, maintained, or permitted to
exist in any building.

(7) Table 403.3.1.1 shall be amended to include footnote i. Footnote i shall read as
follows: For repair garages, the required 0.75 cfm per square ft. of exhaust
airflow may be achieved by providing 0.25 cfm of continuous airflow per sqg. ft.
with an additional 0.50 cfm of intermittent airflow per sq. ft. when installed in
accordance with Section 404.

(8) Section 501.3 Outdoor Discharge. The air removed by every mechanical exhaust
system shall be discharged at a point where it will not cause a nuisance and from
which it cannot again be readily drawn in by a ventilating system. An attic not
used for make-up air may have exhaust ducts terminate in the attic. The exhaust
duct shall extend to a minimum of six (6”’) inches above the insulation.

(9) Section 604.1 General. Delete the reference to the International Energy
Conservation Code. The rest of the section to remain as is.

5. The International Plumbing Code, 2018 Edition, including Appendix A and B:

a) The following amendments to the International Plumbing Code, as adopted by
Section 12.A.5 above, are hereby made a part of this rule.

(1) Section 106.6 Fees is repealed. There are no fees for plan review or inspections.
Re-inspection fees may apply per Section 4.C.3.

(2) Section 108.4 Violation Penalties is repealed.

(3) Section 108.5 Stop Work Orders is repealed.

(4) Section 109 Means of Appeal is repealed in its entirety.

(5) Section 305.4 Freezing. The last sentence is amended to read as follows:

Exterior water supply system piping shall be installed below the frost line and not
less than five-foot six (5°6”) inches below grade.

Exception: Lawn watering systems need not be installed at the above depth.

Add the following language to the end of this section:

4-18



Water services for mobile/manufactured homes shall use a Woodford Thermaline,
or equivalent water connector, or shall be placed in a 12” diameter by 5 ft. deep
pipe located up under the home.

(6) Section 305.4.1 Sewer Depth is amended to read as follows:

Building sewers that connect to private sewage disposal systems shall be a
minimum of 36” inches below finished grade at the point of septic tank
connection. Building sewers shall be a minimum of 36” inches below grade. All
sewer lines will be required to have a full-size end of line cleanout.

(7) Section 312.3 Drainage and Vent air test. Drain, waste, venting systems shall be
tested on completion of the rough piping installation by water or by air with no
evidence of leakage. Either test shall be applied to the drainage system in its
entirety, or in sections after the rough piping has been installed, as follows:

Water test. Each section of piping shall be filled with water to a point not less
than 10 feet above the highest fitting connection in that section, or to the highest
point in the completed system. Water shall be held in the test section (under test)
for a period of 15 minutes. The system shall prove leak free by visual inspection.

Air Test. The portion under test shall be maintained at a gauge of 5 pounds per
square inch (psi). This pressure shall be held without introduction of additional
air for a period of 15 minutes. A contractor using air to test plastic pipe shall be
aware of the risk.

(8) 602.1 General. WATER REQUIRED is amended to read as follows:
602.1 General.

Every structure equipped with plumbing fixtures and utilized for human
occupancy or habitation shall be provided with a potable supply of water in the
amounts and at the pressures specified in this Chapter. All shared wells shall be
required to install a dual check valve on each water service line. If all
Community Water System regulations are met, the system requirements in
Section 13 of this document may be used in place of those prescribed in the 2018
International Plumbing Code.

(9) Section 701.2 Sewer Required is amended to read as follows:

Every building having plumbing fixtures installed and all premises having
drainage piping shall be connected to a public sewer, where available, or an
approved private sewage disposal system in accordance with the Delegation
Agreement.

(10)  Section 708.1.1.2 Base of stack is added to read as follows:

A full-size cleanout shall be provided at each end of the line base waste or soil
stack.

4-19



(11) Section 903.2 Frost Closure shall be amended to the following:
Vent extensions through a roof or wall shall not be less than 3 inches in
diameter. Any increase in size of the vent shall be made not less than 1 foot
below the roof line.

(12)  Section 410.2 Small Occupancies shall be amended as follows:

Drinking fountains shall not be required for an occupant load of 30 or fewer.

6. The National Electrical Code, 2020 Edition; as copyrighted by the National Fire
Protection Association, including Article 80, also known as Annex H.

a) The following amendments to the National Electrical Code, as adopted by Section
12(A)(6) above, are hereby made a part of this rule.

(1) Section 80.1(2) of the National Electric Code is repealed.

(2) Section 80.15 Electric Board of the National Electric Code is renamed Building
Code Appeals Board.

(3) Section 80.15(A) of the National Electric Code is repealed.

(4) Sections (B) through (H) of Section 80.15 of the National Electric Code are
repealed.

(5) Sections 80.23(B)(3) of the National Electric Code is repealed.
(6) Section 80.27 Inspectors Qualifications:

(@) Inspectors qualifications as required by W.S. Statute 35-9-121(a)(iv) for
Home Rule requirements only. For Local enforcement, all Inspectors
employed by Campbell County can/will do Electrical Inspections.

(b) Sections 80.27(B), (C) and (D) are repealed.

(7) Sections 80.33 and 80.35 are repealed.
(8) Section 230.70(A)(1) Readily Accessible Location is amended to read as follows:

The service disconnecting means shall be installed at a readily accessible location

outside of a building or structure. (Note: Mobile Homes and Manufactured

Homes shall comply with Article 550 of the National Electrical Code.)

(9) Section 230.79(C) of the National Electrical Code is amended to read as follows:

4-20



(a) One- and Two-Family Dwellings and Townhouses. For a one-family, two-
family or townhouse dwelling, the service disconnecting means shall have a
rating of not less than 200 amperes, 3-wire.
(10)  Section 250.53(A)(2) Exception shall be repealed in its entirety.
7. The International Existing Building Code 2018;

a) The following amendments to the International Existing Building Code, as adopted
by Section 12.A.7 above, are hereby made a part of this rule.

(1) Section 101.4.2 Building previously occupied, reference to the International
Property Maintenance Code is removed.

(2) Section 1401.2 Conformance, reference to the International Property Maintenance
Code is removed.

8. The International Fuel Gas Code 2018 Edition, including all Appendices;

a) The following amendments to the International Fuel Gas Code, as adopted by Section
12(A)(8) above, are hereby made a part of this rule.

(1) Section 106.6, Fee Schedule, is repealed. There are no fees for plan review or
inspections. Re-inspection fees may apply per Section 4.C.3.

(2) Section 108.4, Violation Penalties is repealed.

(3) Section 108.5, Stop Work Orders is repealed.

(4) Section 109, Means of Appeal is repealed in its entirety.

(5) Section 303.3, Exceptions #3 and #4 are deleted.

(6) Section 621.4 Prohibited Locations is amended to read as follows:
Except in attached or detached garages protected with a carbon monoxide
detection system and equipped with an oxygen-depletion safety system, unvented
room heaters shall not be installed with occupancies in Groups A, B, E, F, H, I, M
or R.

9. The Liquefied Petroleum Gas Code (NFPA 58), 2014 Edition, including all Appendices.

10. The Flood Damage Prevention Resolution.

11. Wyoming DEQ, Water Quality Rules and Regulations, Chapter 25 as amended in
Appendix 1 to Chapter 4, and supplemented as follows:

a) There shall be a maximum of one (1) septic system per any un-zoned parcel 10 acres
or less in size and no more than one (1) septic system per each un-zoned ten (10)

4-21



acres area on larger parcels. Multiple septic systems shall be spaced a minimum of
600 feet apart.

Section 13. Community Water Systems.

A

Scope. The provisions of this section shall apply to the minimum design and installation
requirements for a Community Water System.

Purpose. The purpose of these standards is to:

1.

2.

Protect the health, safety, and welfare of the users of the water system.

Provide an alternative method for providing water in lieu of using Chapter 6 of the
2018 International Plumbing Code.

Applicability.

1.

The system must have no more than nine (9) Water Service Connections and must
serve fewer than twenty-five (25) individuals with water for human consumption.

A Community Water System shall not be used when serving an average of at least 25
people with water for human consumption for at least 60 days a year. These systems
qualify as Public Water Systems per EPA (Environmental Protection Agency) and
requirements related to them are found in Wyoming DEQ Water Quality Rules and
Regulations Chapter 12.

For all new systems with four (4) or more Water Service Connections, a Community
Water System is required.

For multi-unit apartment complexes on single parcels, the requirements in Section 13
based on numbers of Water Service Connections regarding flow, pressure, pipe
sizing, etc. do not apply as written and must be modified accordingly.

Design Parameters and System Requirements.

1.

Community Water Systems shall comply with Wyoming DEQ Water Quality Rules
and Regulations, Chapter 12, except as amended below:

(@) Level of Treatment. Treatment shall be provided to produce a potable water
supply that is bacteriological, chemically, radiologically, and physically safe as
determined by an Engineer.

(b) Surface Water Supplies. Surface water shall not be used for potable water
sources.

(c) Ground Water Supplies. Disinfection equipment shall not be required unless the

above level of treatment cannot be obtained. When disinfection equipment is
necessary it shall be designed by an Engineer.

4-22



(d) Treatment. When treatment is required, one treatment unit capable of the
maximum demand shall be required and shall be designed by an Engineer.

(e) Equipment Providing Required Flows. Multiple pumping and/or treatment
equipment shall not be required. However, equipment needs shall be determined
by an Engineer.

(F) Alternative Power. Alternative power shall not be required unless fire protection
is provided.

(9) Flow and Pressure Requirements.
(1) Pressure shall be reviewed by an Engineer and included in the design report.

(2) The design flow for the system shall be 7 gallons per minute (gpm) for each
Water Service Connection plus an additional 10 gpm.

(3) When the design flow from (2) is proportioned to the 1/3 of the locations with
the highest head loss, a minimum of forty (40) psi shall be met at those
locations.

(4) When the design flow rate from (2) is proportioned to the % of the locations
with the highest head loss, a minimum of twenty-five (25) psi shall be met at
those locations.

(h) Finished Water Storage.

(1) Storage shall not be required if a twenty-four (24) hour pump test of the yield
and drawdown of the well taken as described in DEQ Chapter 12
demonstrates the well can produce a minimum of ten (10) gpm per Water
Service Connection and that a submersible pump has been installed which can
provide pressures as called for in g(3) and g(4).

(2) When the above criteria cannot be met, finished water storage shall be
provided in the amount of two (2) times the average daily demand for the
system.

(i) Pumping Units. Single pumping units as necessary shall be provided. Alarms are
not required at attended pump stations.

. A design report, plans, and hydraulic analysis shall be provided by an Engineer.

. The Community Water System shall be subject to all applicable codes, permits, and
inspections required by the Building Division.

. Backflow prevention in accordance with the 2018 International Plumbing Code shall
be installed.

4-23



10.

11.

Piping material shall be any material allowed for potable water piping in Table 605.4
of the 2018 International Plumbing Code.

When providing potable water to four (4) to six (6) Water Service Connections, a
looped supply line of no smaller than two (2) inches in diameter shall be provided. A
water service line shall be extended to the property line for each parcel.

When providing potable water to seven (7) to nine (9) connections a looped supply
line no smaller than three (3”) inches in diameter shall be provided. A water service
line shall be extended to the property line for each parcel.

Pressure tanks shall be provided in accordance with pump manufacturers
recommendations. Minimum volumes shall be three (3) gallons per Water Service
Connection for variable speed drive pumps and fifteen (15) gallons per Water Service
Connection for conventional pumps.

In addition to the above requirements, forty (40°) feet of surface casing shall be
installed and the annual space between the borehole and the surface casing shall be
filled with cement, grout, or bentonite slurried material. The well bore shall not
continue until the surface casing is installed.

Flushing hydrants shall be provided as determined by an Engineer.

Water wells shall be placed at a maximum density of two (2) per forty (40) acres and
shall provide a minimum of two (2) gpm per Water Service Connection.

. Construction Requirements.

1.

Permitting is required. Contract Public Works Engineering Division for permit forms
and general requirements prior to construction.

During construction, inspections are required by an Engineer to verify that the project
is being built according to the approved and permitted design, and that all
requirements are being met.

During construction, inspection is required by Campbell County Public Works
Engineering Division. Forty-eight (48) hour notice must be given prior to any work
being done.

The entire Community Water System shall be disinfected and flushed in accordance
with the Wyoming Public Works Standard Specifications prior to water samples
being taken.

Water samples shall be taken at the curb stop for each Water Service Connection and
shall be tested.

4-24



F. Closeout and Documentation Requirements.

1.

The Engineer shall provide ‘as constructed plans’ for the Community Water System
within thirty (30) days of completion.

Maintenance of a Community Water System shall be provided for by a water well
agreement or home/landowner association documents filed at the Campbell County
Clerk’s Office.

Access and utility easements shall be provided for the water well and storage tanks.
Easements shall be filed at the Campbell County Clerk’s Office.

A copy of the U.W.5 Water Well Permit from the State Engineer’s Office shall be
provided.

Water well ‘as-constructed’ data shall be provided by an Engineer demonstrating the
water well was constructed in accordance with the current Wyoming State Engineer’s
Office Water Well Minimum Construction Standards.

At a minimum, water quality testing shall be conducted and reviewed by an Engineer
for the following: Total Dissolved Solids (TDS), Nitrate & Nitrite as N, Total
Coliform, Sulfates, Calcium, Magnesium, Sodium, Chloride, Iron, Zinc, Lead,
Fluoride, Manganese, Copper, Arsenic, pH, and E-Coli. SAR (Sodium Absorption
Rate) and/or other constituents to be reviewed as considered as necessary.

The test results from the water samples taken at each Water Service Connection shall
be submitted with the record documents.

A written report from an Engineer analyzing EPA Primary Drinking Water Standards
is required.

A map from an Engineer or professional land surveyor shall be provided for all

Community Water Systems that identifies bearings & distances from property corners
to the distribution lines.

4-25



List of Appendices

Appendix 1: DEQ Chapter 25 Amended

Appendix 2: Campbell County Small Wastewater System Permit Workbook and Application

4-26



APPENDIX 1: DEQ CHAPTER25 amended

SEPTIC TANKS, SOIL ABSORPTION SYSTEMS, AND OTHER SMALL
WASTEWATER SYSTEMS

Section 1. Authority.

This rule is promulgated pursuant to Wyoming Statutes (W.S.) 35-11-101 through 35-11-
1904, specifically 35-11-302(a)(ii1).

Section 2. Objective.

This Chapter contains the minimum standards for the design and construction of small
wastewater systems that are defined by W.S. 35-11-103(c)(ix). In addition, this Chapter contains
the minimum standards for the design and construction of Underground Injection Control (UIC)
Class V facilities 5C1-5C3, 5C6, 5D1, 5E1, SE3-5ES5 as defined in Chapter 27, Appendices C
and D.

The following situations will require the application package to be sealed, signed, and
dated by a professional engineer (PE): non-domestic wastewater from commercial and industrial
facilities, high strength wastewater, individual permits to construct, or standard soil absorption
systems with a soil percolation rate that is either less than 5 minutes per inch (mpi) or more than
60 minutes per inch (mpi).

These standards pertain to permits required pursuant to Chapters 3 and 25, Wyoming
Water Quality Rules and Regulations. The installation of all components of a small wastewater
system require a permit to construct. Permits to construct are specified throughout this chapter as
general permits, described in Chapter 3, Section 7; permit by rule, described in Chapter 3,
Section 8; or as individual permits to construct, described in Chapter 3, Section 6.

Section 3. Timing of Compliance with These Regulations.

Any Chapter 3 permit-to-construct issued for facilities subject to this chapter prior to the
effective date of these regulations, and any facility authorized under the Division’s “General
Permit to Construct, Install, Modify or Operate a Small Wastewater Facility” shall remain
covered under those permits. New construction or modification of existing facilities following
the effective date of this regulation must obtain authorization under a new permit.

Section 4. Definitions

(a) “100 year floodplain” means a tract of land throughout a watershed that has a one-
in-one hundred chance or occurrence of flooding in any given year or a return period of once
every 100 years , as determined by the United States Geological Survey (USGS), Federal
Emergency Management Agency (FEMA) or a local planning and development authority.

(b) “Absorption surface” means the interface where treated effluent infiltrates into

APX1-1


cmm08
Typewritten Text

cmm08
Typewritten Text

cmm08
Typewritten Text

cmm08
Typewritten Text

cmm08
Typewritten Text
APPENDIX 1: DEQ CHAPTER 25 amended

cmm08
Typewritten Text

cmm08
Typewritten Text


native or fill soil.

() “Bed” means a soil treatment and dispersal system where the width is greater than
three (3) feet.

(d) “Bedrock” means geological layers, of which greater than fifty percent (50%) by
volume consist of unweathered in-place consolidated rock or rock fragments. Bedrock also
means weathered in-place rock that cannot be hand augered or penetrated with a knife blade.

(e) “Bedroom” means any room that is or may be used for sleeping.
® “Blackwater” means water containing fecal matter and/or urine.
(2) “Five day biochemical oxygen demand (BODS5)” means a measurement of the

dissolved oxygen used by microorganisms in the biochemical oxidation of organic matter during
a five (5) day period.

(h) “Building sewer” means the pipe that carries wastewater from the building.

(1) “Chamber” means a domed open bottom structure that is used in lieu of
perforated distribution pipe and gravel media.

() “Delegated small wastewater program” means a local governmental entity,
delegated by the Administrator, with the authority to administer the provisions of W.S. 35-11-
301(a) (ii1) for small wastewater systems pursuant to the provisions of W.S. 35-11-304.

(k) “Direct human consumption food crops” are crops consumed directly by humans.
These include but are not limited to fruits, vegetables, and grains grown for human consumption.

) “Domestic wastewater” means a combination of the liquid or water-carried wastes
from residences, business buildings, institutions, and other establishments arising from normal
living activities.

(m)  “Domestic septage” means liquid or solid material removed from a waste
treatment vessel that has received only wastes from residences, business buildings, institutions,
and other establishments arising from normal living activities.

(n) “Dosing tank™ means a tank equipped with an automatic siphon or pump designed
to discharge effluent on an intermittent basis.

(o)  “Effluent” means liquid flowing out of a septic tank, other treatment vessel, or
system.

(p) “Effluent filter” means a removable, cleanable device inserted into the outlet

piping of a septic tank or other treatment vessel designed to trap solids that would otherwise be
transported to the soil absorption system or other downstream treatment components.

APX1-2



) “Evapotranspiration” means the combined loss of water from soil by evaporation
from the soil or water surface and by transpiration from plants.

(r) “Greywater” means untreated wastewater that has not been contaminated by any
toilet discharge; that is unaffected by infectious, contaminated, or unhealthy bodily wastes; and
does not present a threat from contamination by unhealthful processing, manufacturing, or
operating wastes. “Greywater” includes but is not limited to wastewater from bathtubs, showers,
washbasins, clothes washing machines (unless soiled diapers are serviced), laundry tubs, and
kitchen sinks.

(s) “Grease interceptor” means a device designed to separate fats, oils, and grease
from wastewater.

(1) “Groundwater” means subsurface water that fills available openings in rock or
soil materials such that they may be considered water saturated under hydrostatic pressure.

(u) “High groundwater” means seasonally or periodically elevated levels of
groundwater.

(v) “High strength wastewater” means a wastewater stream with a BODS5 higher than
200 mg/L.

(w)  “Holding tank” means a watertight receptacle designed to receive and store
wastewater.

(x) “Manifold” means a non-perforated pipe that distributes effluent to individual
distribution pipes.

(y) “Mound system” means an onsite wastewater system where any part of the
absorption surface is above the elevation of the existing site grade and the absorption surface is
contained in a mounded fill body above the grade.

(2) “Mulch basin” means an excavated area that has been refilled with a highly
permeable media, organic and inorganic materials intended to distribute greywater to irrigate

vegetation.

(aa)  “Pathogens” are disease-causing organisms. These include, but are not limited to
certain bacteria, protozoa, viruses, and viable helminth ova.

(bb)  “Percolation rate” means the time expressed in minutes per inch required for
water to seep into saturated soil at a constant rate.

(cc)  “Pipe invert” means the bottom of the internal surface of the pipe.

(dd)  “Percolation test” means the method used to measure the percolation rate of water

APX1-3



into soil as described in Appendix A.

(ee)  “Permit by rule” means an authorization included in these rules that does not
require either an individual permit or a general permit. A facility that is permitted by rule must
meet the requirements found in this chapter, but is not required to apply for and obtain a permit
to construct and operate the facility.

(ff)  “Pressure distribution” means a network of pipes in which effluent is forced
through orifices under pressure.

(gg) “Restrictive layer” means a nearly continuous layer that has one or more physical
or chemical properties that significantly impede the movement of water and air through the soil
or that restrict roots or otherwise provide unfavorable root conditions. Examples are bedrock,
cemented layers, and dense layers.

(hh)  “Septage” means liquid or solid material removed from a waste treatment vessel
that has received wastes from residences, business buildings, institutions, and other

establishments.

(i1) “Septic tank” means a watertight tank designed and constructed to receive and
treat raw wastewater

(4)) “Serial distribution” means a group of trenches arranged so that the total effective
absorption area of one trench is used before liquid flows into the next trench.

(kk)  “Service provider” means a person authorized and trained by a system
manufacturer or their vendor to operate and maintain any proprietary system.

) “Soil absorption system” means a shallow, covered, excavation surface, or mound
made in unsaturated soil into which wastewater effluent from the septic tank is discharged
through distribution piping for application onto absorption surfaces through porous media or
manufactured components.

(mm) “Trench” means an absorption surface with a width of three (3) feet or less.

Section 5. Design Flows.

The volume of wastewater shall be determined by one of the following:

(a) Tables 1 and 2 provided in this section.

(b) Metered water supply data from the facility.

(c) Metered water supply data from another facility where similar water demands
have been demonstrated.

APX1-4



Table 1. Residential Design Flow Rates per Bedroom (gallons per day, gpd)!
1 bedroom 180
2 bedrooms 320
3 bedrooms 460
4 bedrooms 550
5 bedrooms 630
6 bedrooms 720

' An unfinished basement is considered two (2) additional bedrooms.

’The design flow shall be increased by eighty (80) gpd for each additional bedroom over six (6).

Table 2. Non-Residential Wastewater Design Flow Rates!
Facility Unit Flow (gallons/unit/day)
Airports person 4
Apartment bedroom 120
Automobile Service Station vehicle served 10
Bars seat 20
Bathhouses and swimming pools person 10
Campgrounds (w/ toilets only) person 25
Campgrounds (w/shower facility) person 45
Church person 4
Country Club member 25
Day School, Office Building, Retail Store,
Warehouse (no showers) person 15
Hospital bed 250
Industrial Building (sanitary waste only) employee 20
Laundry (self-service) machine 450
Mobile Home bedroom see table 1
Motel, Hotel, Resort bedroom 140
Recreational Vehicle each 100
Rest Home, Care Facility, Boarding School | bed 100
Restaurant meal 10
Restaurant ( kitchen waste only) meal 6
Theater seat 3

'Values shown in the above table are the typical flow rates from Wastewater Engineering

APX1-5




Treatment and Reuse, Metcalf and Eddy, 2003.
Section 6. Systems Not Specifically Covered by This Rule.

This section is provided to encourage new technology and equipment and provide a
process for evaluating and permitting designs that deviate from this rule. The proposed
construction of facilities and processes not in compliance with this rule may be permitted
provided that the facility, when constructed and operated, meets the objective of these rules.

(a) Each application for a permit to construct shall include an engineering design
report, detailed construction plans, and technical specifications for all piping, tanks, and
equipment. All of the documents shall have a suitable title showing the owner’s name and the
Wyoming registration number, seal, and signature of the engineer.

(b) Each application for a permit to construct will be evaluated on a case-by-case
basis using the best available technology. The application shall include at least one of the
following:

(1) Data obtained from a full scale, comparable installation that demonstrates
the acceptability of the design.

(i1))  Data obtained from a pilot plant operated under the design condition for a
sufficient length of time to demonstrate the acceptability of the design.

(ii1))  Data obtained from the theoretical evaluation of the design that
demonstrates a reasonable probability the facility will meet the design objectives.

(iv)  An evaluation of the flexibility of making corrective changes to the
constructed facility in the event it does not function as planned.

() If an applicant wishes to construct a pilot plant to provide data necessary to show
the design will meet the purpose of the act, a permit to construct must be obtained.

Section 7. Site Suitability.

(a) Small wastewater systems must be located where the surface drainage is sufficient
to allow proper operation of the small wastewater system. Avoid depressions and bases of slopes
and areas in the path of runoff from roofs, patios, driveways, or other paved areas unless surface
drainage is provided. Small wastewater systems shall not be located beneath buildings, parking
lots, roadways, driveways, irrigated landscaping, or compacted areas.

(b) The site must include area for both the proposed soil absorption system and a
future replacement soil absorption system. Both the proposed and replacement soil absorption
systems shall be sized to receive one-hundred (100%) percent of the wastewater flow. If a trench
system is used, the replacement soil absorption system may be located between the trenches of

APX1-6



the proposed soil absorption system if there is at least nine (9) feet of spacing between trench
sidewalls.

(c) For standard soil absorption systems, effective suitable soil depth shall extend at
least four (4) feet below the bottom of the soil absorption system to any restrictive layer,
fractured rock, or highly permeable material.

(d) The depth to high groundwater shall be at least four (4) feet below the bottom of
the absorption surface for all treatment systems except pressure distribution. For pressure
distribution systems, the depth to high groundwater shall be at least three (3) feet below the
bottom of the absorption surface if the percolation rate of the soil is five (5) minutes per inch or
greater (5-60 mpi).

(e) Slope

(1) Table 3 shows the maximum permissible slopes of the site on which an
absorption system may be constructed

Table 3. Slope and Percolation Rates for Absorption Systems
Percolation Rate (minutes/inch) Maximum Slope!
5 25%
6-45 20%
46-60 15%

! Flatter slopes may be required where the effluent surfaces downslope.

(11) Serial distribution, with the use of drop boxes or approved fittings, is the
preferred installation method for sloping terrain. The bottom of individual trenches shall be level
and the trenches shall be constructed to follow the contours of the land.

(i11))  The placement of multiple trenches, with each subsequent trench down
slope of the previous trench shall be avoided when the addition of effluent to the soil absorption

system trenches may lead to either an unstable slope or seepage down slope.

(iv)  All absorption surfaces must be located at least 15 horizontal feet from the
top of any break in slope that exceeds the maximum slope allowed.

® Soil Exploration Pit and Percolation Tests

(1) Delegated small wastewater programs shall require a percolation test in
addition to the soil exploration pit.

(11) A minimum of one soil exploration pit within the proposed soil absorption

system location shall be excavated to a minimum depth of four (4) feet below the bottom of the
proposed soil absorption system to evaluate the subsurface conditions.

APX1-7



(ii1))  The percolation test shall be performed in accordance with Appendix A of
this chapter. An evaluation of the soil texture, in the proposed soil absorption system location,
by a person experienced in soils classification, may be used as an additional tool to confirm the

percolation rate.

(2) Minimum horizontal setback distances (in feet) are as follows:

Table 4. Minimum Horizontal Setbacks for Domestic Wastewater in Feet!>2

From EZuSizzi[iei;rank Or To Absorption System
Wells (includes neighboring wells) | 50 100
Public Water Supply Well 100 2002
Property Lines 10 10
Foundation Wall (w/o drains) 5 10
Foundation Wall (with drains) 5 25
Potable Water Pipes 25 25
Septic Tank N/A 10
Surface Water, Spring (including

seasonal and intermittent) >0 >0
Cisterns 25 25

! For disposal of non-domestic wastewater, the setback distance shall be determined by a
hydrogeological study in accordance with Section 17(b) of Chapter 3, but shall not be less than
the distances shown in Table 4.

2 Small wastewater systems that discharge to the same aquifer that supplies a public water
supply well and are located within Zone 1 or 2 (Attenuation) of the public water supply well, as
determined by Wyoming Department of Environmental Quality Source Water Assessment Project
(2004) or as established in Section 2 of the Wyoming Wellhead Protection Guidance Document
(1997), shall provide additional treatment. These systems will be required to obtain an
individual permit to construct and will require that a PE sign, stamp, and date the application, as
stated in Section 2 of this chapter. The additional treatment shall be in accordance with Chapter
3 Section 2(b)(ii). The treatment system shall be designed to reduce the nitrates to less than 10
mg/L of NOs- as N and provide 4-log removal of pathogens before the discharge leaves the
property boundary of each small wastewater system.

Section 8. Soil Absorption System Sizing.

(a) The total infiltration surface area of a soil absorption system shall be calculated
by dividing the design flow rates (gpd) from Table 1 or Table 2 by the loading rate (gpd/ft?)
found in Table 5.

APX1-8


http://www.wrds.uwyo.edu/wrds/deq/whp/whpcover.html
http://www.wrds.uwyo.edu/wrds/deq/whp/whpcover.html

Table 5. Rates of Wastewater Application for Soil Absorption System Areas

Percolation Rate Loading Rate Percolation Rate Loading Rate
(mpi) (gpd/ft?) (mpi) (gpd/ft?)

5 0.80 21 0.45

6 0.75 22 0.44

7 0.71 23-24 0.43

8 0.68 25 0.42

9 0.65 26-27 0.41

10 0.62 28-29 0.40

11 0.60 30-31 0.39

12 0.58 32-33 0.38

13 0.56 34-35 0.37

14 0.54 36-37 0.36

15 0.52 38-40 0.35

16 0.50 41-43 0.34

17 0.49 44-46 0.33

18 0.48 47-50 0.32

19 0.47 51-55 0.31

20 0.46 56-60 0.30

(b) The total infiltration area shall be defined as follows:
(1) For standard trenches the total infiltration area shall be calculated based on

the following formula:
A=L(W +25)

A = Total infiltration area

L = Total length of trench

W = Bottom width

S = Sidewall height of 12 inches or less

(A)  The sidewall height is the depth below the flowline of the pipe to
the bottom of the trench.

(B)  The maximum credit for sidewall height shall not exceed twelve
(12) inches even if the actual sidewall height exceeds twelve inches.

(i1))  For chamber trenches, the total infiltration area shall be calculated based
on the following formula:
A=L(E +25)

A = Total infiltration area

APX1-9



L= Total length of trench

E = Effective bottom width (Multiply width of the chamber by factor
of 1.43 to get effective bottom width)

S=  Sidewall height of 12 inches or less

(A)  The factor of 1.43 incorporates a thirty percent (30%) reduction of
the bottom area.

(B)  The maximum credit for sidewall height shall not exceed twelve
(12) inches even if the actual sidewall height exceeds twelve (12) inches.

(C)  The sidewall height is the height of the slotted sidewall of the
chamber or depth below the flow line of the inlet pipe, whichever is less.

(D)  The total length of the trench is the number of chambers in a row
multiplied by the length of one piece of chamber.

(iii))  For standard bed systems, the total infiltration area shall be calculated
based on the following formula:

A=LW

A = Total infiltration area
L = Total length of bed

W = Width of the bed

(A)  The sidewall credit shall not be used in calculating the total
infiltration area for a bed system.

(iv)  For chamber bed systems, the total infiltration area shall be calculated
based on the following formula:

A= L(ExR)
A= Total infiltration area
L= Total length of bed

E = Effective bottom width of the chamber (Multiply width of the
chamber by factor of 1.43 to get effective bottom width)

R= Number of chamber rows (Multiply effective bottom width of

APX1-10



chamber by number of chamber rows to get effective bottom width of bed.)

(A)  The factor of 1.43 incorporates a thirty percent (30%) reduction of
the bottom area.

(B)  The total length is the number of chambers in a row multiplied by
the length of one piece of chamber.

@) Coarse sand or soils having a percolation rate less than one (1) minute per inch
(mpi) are unsuitable for subsurface effluent disposal. These soils may be used if a one (1) foot
layer of fine sand or loamy sand is placed below the constructed soil absorption system. The soil
absorption system shall be sized based on the percolation rate of the fill material.

Section 9. Building Sewer Pipes.

All building sewers shall be installed in accordance with the 2018 International Plumbing
Code (IPC). In the absence of a locally approved plumbing code, and in addition to the IPC, the
building sewer shall comply with the following:

(a) Suitable building sewer pipe materials are polyvinyl chloride (PVC) or
acrylonitrile-butadiene-styrene (ABS). The septic tank inlet and outlet pipes shall be schedule
40 PVC or ABS pipe and shall span the excavations for the septic tank and/or dosing chamber.
American Society for Testing and Materials (ASTM) D-3034 Standard Dimension Ratio (SDR)
35 plastic pipe may be used if the void at the tank’s side is filled with material that is granular,
clean, and compacted.

(b) Building sewer pipes shall be sized to handle the peak hourly flow from the
building and shall not be smaller than four (4) inches in diameter. When two different sizes or
types of sewer pipes are to be connected, a proper type of fitting or conversion adapter shall be
used.

(c) Sewer pipe shall not decrease in size flowing downstream.

(d) Building sewer pipes shall be laid at a standard slope of 1/4 inch per foot, and
shall not be flatter than 1/8 inch per foot.

(e) Cleanouts shall be provided between the structure and the tank, at branch
connections, every change in alignment, and at least every 100 feet in straight runs.

6] All sewer piping shall be laid on a firm bed throughout its entire length. It shall
be protected from damage due to rocks, hard lumps of soil, debris, and the like.

(2) Special care shall be used to prevent lateral movement or deformation during
backfill. The backfill material shall be compacted to a density at least equivalent to the trench
walls. Backfill over the pipe shall be of sufficient depth to protect the pipe from expected traffic
loads and the wastewater from freezing.

APX1-11



Section 10.  Septic Tanks and Other Treatment Tanks.
(a) Septic Tanks

(1) Septic tanks shall be fabricated or constructed of concrete, fiberglass,
thermoplastic or an approved material. Tanks shall be watertight and fabricated to constitute an
individual structure, and shall be designed and constructed to withstand anticipated loads. As
part of the application review process, Department of Environmental Quality, Water Quality
Division (DEQ/WQD) or the delegated small wastewater program shall review the design of
prefabricated septic tanks for compliance with applicable construction standards.

(i1) The septic tank shall be placed on a level grade and a firm bedding to
prevent settling. Where rock or other undesirable protruding obstructions are encountered, the
opening for the septic tank shall be over excavated, as needed, and backfilled with sand, crushed
stone, or gravel to the proper grade.

(A)  Septic tanks shall not be buried deeper than the tank
manufacturer’s maximum designed depth for the tank. The minimum depth of soil cover over
the top of the tank is six (6) inches.

(B)  Backfill around and over the septic tank shall be placed in such a
manner as to prevent undue strain or damage to the tank or connected pipes.

(C)  Septic tanks shall not be placed in areas subject to vehicular traffic
unless engineered for the anticipated load.

(iii)  Size
(A)  The minimum liquid volume of a septic tank shall be 1000 gallons
for residences up to a four (4) bedroom capacity. Additional capacity of 150 gallons per
bedroom shall be provided for each bedroom over four (4).
(B)  Septic tanks for high strength wastewater or non-residential units
shall have a minimum effective liquid capacity sufficient to provide at least 48 hour retention at
design flow or 1,000 gallons, whichever is greater.

(iv)  Configuration

(A)  Single compartment septic tanks shall have a length to width ratio
of no less than two (2) to one (1), or be partitioned to protect against short circuiting flow.

(B)  For septic tanks with two (2) compartments or more, the inlet
compartment shall not be less than one-half (1/2) of the total capacity of the tank.

(C)  The liquid depth shall be between three (3) feet and six (6) feet.

APX1-12



(D)  The tank partition shall allow the venting of gases between
compartments and out through the vent stack on the plumbing system of the house.

(E)  The inlet and outlet on all tanks or tank compartments shall be
provided with open-ended sanitary tees or baffles made of approved materials constructed to
distribute flow and retain scum in the tank or compartments.

)] The tees or baffles shall extend above the liquid level a
minimum distance of five (5) inches.

(IT)  The inlet tees or baffles shall extend below the liquid level
at least eight (8) inches but no more than 40% of the liquid level. The outlet tees or baffles shall
extend below the liquid level at least ten (10) inches but no more than 45% of the liquid level.

(III) A minimum of one (1) inch of clear space shall be provided
over the top of the baffles or tees for venting.

(IV)  The inlet pipe shall be at least two (2) inches higher than
the outlet pipe. The outlet elevation shall be designed to provide a minimum distance of nine (9)
inches or twenty (20) percent of the liquid depth between the top of the liquid and the bottom of
the septic tank cover for scum storage and the venting of gases.

(v) If additional septic tank capacity over 1,000 gallons is needed, it may be
obtained by joining tanks in series provided the following requirements are met:

(A)  The inlet of each successive tank shall be at least two (2) inches
lower than the outlet of the preceding tank, and shall have no tee or baffle except for the inlet to
the first tank and the outlet for the last tank.

(B)  The first tank or the first compartment of the first tank shall be
equal to fifty percent (50%) or larger of the total septic tank system volume.

(vi)  An access opening shall be provided to each compartment of the septic
tank for inspection and cleaning.

(A)  The access opening(s) in the cover/lid of the tank shall have a
minimum diameter of twenty (20) inches. Both inlet and outlet devices shall be accessible.

(B)  The riser from the access opening shall terminate at a maximum of
six (6) inches below the ground surface. Riser covers terminating above grade shall have an
approved locking device.

(vii)  Land application of domestic septage in remote areas that meet the

conditions found in Appendix B will be permitted as a permit by rule. Delegated small
wastewater programs may issue individual permits.

APX1-13



(viii)  An effluent filter with an opening of 1/8-inch or smaller shall be provided
on the outlet of a septic tank or other tank that precedes a small diameter pressure distribution
system.

(b) Dosing Tanks

(1) Dosing tanks shall meet the same material and installation requirements as
septic tanks. Dosing tanks shall have a minimum 20-inch diameter access opening and it shall
have a riser from the access opening to the ground surface. The following table shall be used to

calculate the size of the dosing tank:

Table 6.

Dosing Tank Volume (gallons)

Average Design Flows (gpd) | 0-499 | 500-999 | 1000-1499 | 1500-2000
Between Pump “off” and Tank Inlet | 350 700 1000 1300
Between Tank Inlet and Alarm 200 400 600 800
Switch

Between Alarm switch and Pump 50 100 100 100

“On”

Between Pump “on” and Pump “off” | 100 200 300 400
Recommended Pump Capacity 10 20 30 40

(gpm)

(i)  High water alarms shall be provided for all tanks that use pumps or
siphons. The alarm device shall be an audible alarm or an indoor illuminated alarm or both.

(ii1))  The minimum effluent level shall achieve complete submergence of the
pump.

(iv)  Dosed systems using a siphon shall have a dose counter installed to check
for continued function of the siphon.

() Holding Tanks

(1) Holding tanks shall meet the same material requirements as septic tanks.
Holding tanks shall have a twenty (20)-inch minimum diameter access opening. A riser shall be
brought to ground surface from the access opening.

(i)  Holding tanks shall not be used for residential systems when other
alternative systems are available, except on a temporary, seasonal or intermittent basis, or when
used to correct a failed soil absorption system when other alternatives are unavailable.

(ii1))  Holding tanks must be located in an area readily accessible to the pump

truck and where the tank itself will not float due to high groundwater. If seasonal high
groundwater may be present, the tank shall be properly anchored.

APX1-14



(iv)  The minimum liquid volume shall be the greater of 1,000 gallons or seven
(7) days storage based upon flow rate determined from Section 5.

(v) All holding tanks shall be equipped with a high-water level alarm. The
device shall be an audible alarm or an indoor illuminated alarm or both. The device shall be
installed so that the alarm is triggered when the water level reaches 3/4 of the tank capacity.

(vi) A design package for holding tanks is provided online at the Division’s
website to assist the applicant in submitting a completed application for coverage under the
general permit for small wastewater systems. The worksheet and calculations were prepared by
a registered professional engineer employed by the Wyoming Department of Environmental
Quality, Water Quality Division. The general design requirements stated in this section are
incorporated into the worksheets such that by properly completing the forms and installing the
components, the system will comply with these requirements.

(d) Grease Interceptors

(1) A commercial or institutional food preparation facility with a waste stream
containing fat, oil, and grease (FOQ) in excess of 25 mg/L shall install an exterior grease
interceptor or a device approved by the delegated health department or county. Facilities that
typically have waste streams high in FOG are, but not limited to, restaurants, cafeterias,
slaughterhouses, and institutional kitchens.

(i1) Waste streams high in FOG shall be plumbed separately and directly to a
grease interceptor prior to the waste treatment process.

(ii1))  Waste streams from sanitary facilities such as bathrooms, toilets, urinals,
or other similar fixtures shall not be discharged into the grease interceptor. These sources must
be connected at least four to six (4-6) feet downstream of the grease interceptor’s discharge. The
design shall prevent any backflow from the sanitary sources into the grease interceptor.

(iv)  Only one source facility per grease interceptor shall be allowed.

(v) Grease interceptors shall be located so that they are easily accessible for
inspection, cleaning, and removal of the collected wastes. The interceptor shall not be closer
than fifteen (15) feet from the last discharging fixture and no further away than thirty-five (35)
feet.

(vi)  Grease interceptors shall have at least two (2) compartments with a 20-
inch minimum diameter access opening for each compartment for cleanout. Each access opening
shall have a riser brought to the surface and have a sealed lid that is rated for any anticipated
load. There shall be a means provided to sample the effluent.

(vii)  There shall be no internal cleanout tees or bypasses.

APX1-15



(viii) The inlet and outlet of the grease interceptor shall be vented. The vent
pipe shall be at least two (2) inches in diameter. The inlet and outlet vents shall not be
interconnected.

(ix)  The outlet pipe invert shall be no more than two (2) inches lower than the
inlet invert.

(x) The dividing wall between compartments shall be the same height as the
other walls and the cover should contact the top of the dividing wall. If the partition/dividing
wall does not contact the cover, the outlet tee or baffle shall extend below the liquid level, 40-
50% of the total liquid depth.

(xi)  The effluent from each compartment shall be drawn from the bottom of a
riser pipe that terminates at least eighteen (18) inches below the inlet pipe invert of that same
compartment.

(xii)  Grease interceptors shall be accessible during normal business hours
without interrupting normal business operations.

(xiii) Grease interceptors shall be installed in accordance with the
manufacturer’s instructions and applicable requirements of this section. A copy of the
manufacturer’s instructions shall be submitted with every permit to construct application
submitted to DEQ/WQD.

(xiv) Grease interceptors shall be sized according to the following:

Kitchens (grease, garbage)

Number of Waste . Interceptor size
Retention Storage | _ .

meals per peak | X | Flow X s X e | = | (liquid
time factor .

hour rate™ capacity)

*Waste flow rate — see Table 2.
**Retention times

Kitchen waste:
Dishwasher and/or disposal 2.5 hours
Single service kitchen:
Single serving with disposal | 1.5 hours

***Storage factors

Fully equipped commercial 8 hr. operation: 1
kitchen 16 hr. operation: 2

24 hr. operation: 3
Single service kitchen: 1.5

(A)  The minimum interceptor size (liquid capacity) shall be 750
gallons.

APX1-16



(e) Other Interceptors

(1) Interceptors are required for oil, grease, sand, and other substances
harmful or hazardous to the building drainage system, or the small wastewater treatment system.

(A)  Laundries

)] Commercial laundries, laundromats, and dry-cleaners shall
be equipped with an interceptor in order to reduce the quantity of lint and silt that enter the
collection system.

(IT)y ~ The system must be of adequate size and design to allow
for cool-down of wastewater so that separation can be more readily achieved.

(IIT)  The interceptor shall be installed with a wire basket or
similar device. The wire basket or similar device shall be removable for cleaning and shall
prevent passage into the drainage system of solids 1/2 inch (12.7 mm) or larger in size, such as
string, rags, buttons, or other materials that are detrimental to the waste treatment system.

(IV)  Sizing must be in accordance with the following formula:

Laundries (grease, lint. silt)

Total gallons per Cycles per Retention Storage | _
cycle X hour X time* X factor** Interceptor
*Retention times
Institutional laundries 2.5 hours
Standard commercial laundry 2.0 hours
Light commercial laundry 1.5 hours

**Storage factors
8 hours of operation 1.0
12 or more hours of operation | 1.5

(B)  Car Washes

D Where automobiles are washed (including detail shops
using hand-wash practices), separators shall have a minimum capacity of 1000 gallons for the
first bay, with an additional 500 gallons of capacity for every other bay.

(I)  Additionally, wash racks must be constructed to eliminate
or minimize the impact of run-off from rain/storm events. Minimum requirements are roofed
structures with at least two walls and appropriate grading to prevent stormwater infiltration into
the sanitary sewer.

APX1-17




(IIT)  An effluent sampling point is required.
) Abandonment of Septic and Holding Tanks

The following is the procedure to abandon septic tanks and holding tanks when the
system is upgraded, equipment replacement is necessary, or central sewer lines are made
available:

(1) The abandoned tank should be pumped and the septage hauled to a
licensed facility approved to receive the waste or the septage pumped into the newly constructed
septic or holding tank. Discharging to a central sewer requires coordination with, and the
approval of, the owner/operator of the sewer system.

(i1) Once the abandoned tank is empty, it should be removed and the
excavation backfilled. As an alternative to removing the tank, the access covers can be removed;
the bottom drilled or broken up sufficient to drain; and the tank filled with native soil, pit run, or
sand.

(ii1))  If the abandoned tank is part of a Class V UIC facility, the abandonment
must also be in compliance with Chapter 27, Section 17.

Section 11.  Effluent Distribution Devices.

Distribution boxes and flow divider tees are suitable for level or nearly level ground and
are installed before the soil absorption system with the goal of splitting flows equally between
soil absorption system laterals. Drop boxes are suitable for sloping ground and are installed to
achieve serial loading.

(a) Distribution Boxes

(1) The distribution box shall be installed on a level, stable base to prevent
tilting or settling, and to minimize movement from frost heave.

(i1) Boxes shall be watertight and constructed of concrete or other durable
material.

(ii1))  Boxes shall be designed to accommodate the inlet pipe and the necessary
distribution lines. The inlet piping to the distribution box shall be at least one (1) inch above the

outlet pipes and all pipes shall have a watertight connection to the distribution box.

(iv)  The box shall be protected against freezing and made accessible for
observation and maintenance.

(v) Boxes shall have flow equalizers installed on each outflow.

APX1-18



(b) Flow divider tees may be used in place of distribution boxes.

() Drop boxes are suitable for sloping ground and are installed to achieve serial
loading. The drop boxes shall meet the requirements in paragraphs (a)(i through v) of this
section.

Section 12.  Standard Soil Absorption Systems.
(a) General Design Requirements:

(1) All soil absorption systems shall be designed in such a manner that the
effluent is effectively filtered and retained below the ground surface. The absorption surface
accepts, treats, and disperses wastewater as it percolates through the soil.

(i1) Soil absorption systems shall not be excavated when the soil is wet enough
to smear or compact easily. Open soil absorption system excavations shall be protected from
surface runoff to prevent the entrance of silt and debris. All smeared or compacted surfaces shall
be raked to a depth of one (1) inch, and loose material removed before filter or filler material is
placed in the soil absorption system excavation.

(ii1))  Soil absorption systems shall be designed to approximately follow the
ground surface contours so that variation in excavation depths will be minimized. The trenches
may be installed at different elevations, but the bottom of each individual trench shall be level
throughout its length.

(iv)  Shallow soil absorption system depths are encouraged to promote
treatment and evapotranspiration. The minimum soil cover depth over the soil absorption system
is one (1) foot. The maximum depth to the bottom absorption surface of a soil absorption system
is five (5) feet. Finished grading shall prevent ponding and promote surface water runoff.

(v) Pipes, chambers or other products shall be bedded on firm, stable material.
Heavy equipment shall not be driven in or over soil absorption systems during construction or
backfilling.

(vi)  Standard trenches refer to perforated pipe embedded in aggregate-filled
trenches that shall conform to the following:

(A)  The perforated pipe shall have a minimum diameter of 4 inches.
Suitable pipe materials include: ASTM D-2729-11 PVC, ASTM D-3034-08 PVC, Schedule 40
PVC ASTM d1784-11, and ASTM F810-07 PE.

(B)  The aggregate shall be crushed rock, gravel or other acceptable,
durable and inert material that is free of fines, and has an effective diameter between %2 inch and
2- Y5 inches.

(C)  Prior to backfilling, the aggregate shall be covered throughout with
a woven/non-woven geotextile material or a three (3) inch layer of straw.

APX1-19



(D)  Aggregate shall extend the full width and length of the soil
absorption system to a depth of at least twelve (12) inches with at least six (6) inches of drain
gravel under the distribution pipe and at least two (2) inches over the distribution pipe.

(E)  Maximum width of trench excavation is three (3) feet.

(F)  Minimum spacing of trenches (wall to wall) is three (3) feet.
Trench spacing shall be increased to nine (9) feet when the area between each trench is
considered as reserve area. For clay loam soils that have percolation rates greater than 60 min/in.,
the nine (9) foot spacing shall also be required but it is not considered as reserve area.

(vil)  Standard beds shall conform to the same pipe and aggregate requirements
for trenches as found in subparagraphs (vi)(A through D) of this section. Standard beds shall
also conform to the following:

(A)  The soils shall have percolation rates less than 60 minutes per inch
(5-60 mpi). The bottom of the bed must be level, therefore the site shall be relatively flat,
sloping no more than one (1) foot from the highest to the lowest point in the installation area.

(B)  Distribution laterals within a bed must be spaced on not greater
than six (6) feet centers. Sidewalls shall not be more than three (3) feet from a distribution
lateral.

(C)  Beds must not be wider than twenty-five (25) feet if gravity
distribution is used. Multiple beds must be spaced at one-half the bed width.

(D)  Rubber tired vehicles must not be driven on the bottom surface of
any bed excavation.

(viii) Chambered trenches, when used in lieu of perforated pipe and aggregate,
shall be installed in conformance with the manufacturer recommendations. No cracked,

weakened, modified, or otherwise damaged chamber units shall be used in any installation.

(A)  All chambers shall be an open, arch-shaped structure of durable,
non-degradable design, suitable for distribution of effluent without filter material.

(B)  All chamber endplates shall be designed so that the bottom
elevation of the inlet pipe is at least six (6) inches from the bottom of the chamber.

(C)  Inlet and outlet effluent sewer pipes shall enter and exit the
chamber endplates. Inspection ports shall be installed at all outlet effluent sewer pipes.

(D)  All chambers shall have a splash plate under the inlet pipe or
another design feature to avoid unnecessary channeling into the trench bottom.

APX1-20



(E)  The maximum width of the bottom absorption surface for a
chambered trench is three (3) feet. The excavation to install a chambered trench may exceed
three (3) feet.

(F) Minimum spacing of trenches (wall to wall) is three (3) feet.
Trench spacing shall be increased to nine (9) feet when the area between each trench is
considered as reserve area. For clay loam soils that have percolation rates greater than 60 min/in.,
the nine (9) foot spacing shall also be required but it is not considered as reserve area.

(ix)  Chambered beds shall conform to the same requirements for chambered
trenches as found in subparagraphs (viii)(A through D) of this section. Aggregate, as specified
in subparagraph (vi)(B) of this section, or native soil shall be used to fill the space between the
chambers.

(x) Serial Sidehill Trench:

(A) A minimum of six (6) feet of undisturbed soil shall be maintained
between adjacent trench or bed side walls.

(B)  The bottom of each serial trench or bed system shall be level.

(C)  The overflow pipe between serial soil absorption systems shall be
set no higher than the mid-point of the upstream distribution pipe. The overflow pipe shall not
be perforated.

(b) A design package for standard soil absorption systems is provided online at the
Division’s website to assist the applicant in submitting a completed application for coverage
under the general permit for small wastewater systems. The worksheet and calculations were
prepared by a registered professional engineer employed by the Wyoming Department of
Environmental Quality, Water Quality Division. The general design requirements stated in this
section are incorporated into the worksheets such that by properly completing the forms and
installing the components, the system will comply with these requirements.

Section 13.  Pressure Distribution Systems.
(a) General Design Requirements:

(1) The basic elements of a pressure distribution system include a dosing tank,
filter, and a means to deliver specified doses to a small diameter pipe network within a soil
absorption system. Pressure distribution is required for mound systems or for bed systems with a
width greater than twenty-five (25) feet.

(11) Pumps must be sized to match the distribution system curve or demand.

Pumps shall be designed for sewage pumping applications and be accessible from the ground
surface.

APX1-21



(ii1))  The control system for the pump and dosing tank shall, at a minimum,
consist of a “pump off” switch, a “pump on” switch, and a “high liquid alarm”.

(A)  All electrical connections must be made outside of the chamber in
either an approved weatherproof box or an explosion-proof junction box.

(B)  The wiring from the junction box to the control box must pass
through a sealing fitting to prevent corrosive gases from entering the control panel.

(C)  All wires must be contained in solid conduit from the dosing
chamber to the control box.

(iv)  The pressure transport piping between the tank and the soil absorption
system shall be designed to prevent freezing.

(A)  The ends of lateral piping shall be constructed with long sweep
elbows or an equivalent method to bring the end of the pipe to finished grade. The ends of the
pipe shall be provided with threaded plugs, caps, or other devices to allow for access and
flushing of the lateral.

(B)  All joints in the manifold, lateral piping, and fittings shall be
solvent-welded using the appropriate joint compound for the pipe material. Pressure transport
piping may be solvent-welded or flexible gasket jointed.

(C)  Where automatic siphons or other devices are used, they shall be
designed to empty the dosing tank in less than ten (10) minutes.

(v) The pressure distribution system shall have a combination of at least three
(3) vertical feet of filter sand and/or unsaturated native soil above the high groundwater level.
The filter sand shall conform to ASTM C-33, with less than 2% passing the #200 sieve.

(b) A design package for pressure distribution systems is provided online at the
Division’s website to assist the applicant in submitting a completed application for coverage
under the general permit for small wastewater systems. The worksheet and calculations were
prepared by a registered professional engineer employed by the Wyoming Department of
Environmental Quality, Water Quality Division. The general design requirements stated in this
section are incorporated into the worksheets such that by properly completing the forms and
installing the components, the system will comply with these requirements.

Section 14. Sand Mound Systems.

The sand mound consists of a sand fill, an aggregate bed and a soil cap.

(a) Selection Criteria:

The high groundwater level, bedrock, or impervious clay layer is less than four (4) feet

APX1-22



below the bottom of the soil absorption system excavation.
(b) Site Requirements:

(1) A minimum of one (1) foot of vertical separation of the native soil is
required between the bottom of the sand fill and the top of the high groundwater level, any
restrictive layer, or any highly permeable material.

(i1) The percolation rate of the native soil at the interface of the sand fill shall
be greater than five (5) and less than sixty (60) minutes per inch (5-60 mpi). The percolation
shall be measured in the top twelve (12) inches of native soil.

(c) General Design Requirements:
(1) Sand Layer

(A)  Filter sand shall conform to ASTM C-33, with less than two
percent (2%) passing through the #200 sieve.

(B)  The minimum depth of sand below the aggregate bed surface shall
be one (1) foot.

(C)  The sand mound shall have a combination of at least four (4)
vertical feet of filter sand and unsaturated native soil above the high groundwater level.

D For sand mounds using pressure distribution systems, the
depth to high groundwater shall be three (3) feet below the bottom of the absorption surface if
the percolation rate of the soil is five (5) minutes per inch or greater (5-60 mpi).

(D)  The top of the sand layer under the aggregate bed shall be level in
all directions.

(E)  The sand layer shall fill around the perimeter of and to the top of
the aggregate bed.

(F) The slope of all sides shall be three (3) horizontal to one (1)
vertical or flatter. The side slopes shall be graded to prevent seepage and/or ponding at the
bottom of the slope.

(G)  The infiltration area, which is the bottom of the sand fill, shall be
calculated by dividing the design flowrates (gpd) from Table 1 or Table 2 by the loading rate
(gpd/ft?) found in Table 5.

(i)  Aggregate Bed

(A)  The aggregate shall be crushed rock, gravel or other acceptable,

APX1-23



durable and inert material that is free from fines, and has an effective diameter between one-half
(1/2) inch and two and one half (2 '2) inch.

(B)  The aggregate bed depth shall not be less than nine (9) inches with
a minimum of six (6) inches of clean aggregate placed below the distribution pipe and two (2)
inches above the distribution pipe. The aggregate shall be covered with an approved geotextile
material after installation and testing of the pressure distribution system.

©) The design shall be a long, narrow bed design with a maximum
width of twenty-five (25) feet.

(D)  The infiltration area, which is the bottom of the aggregate bed,
shall be calculated by dividing the design flowrates (gpd) from Table 1 and Table 2 by the
loading rate of 0.8 gpd/ft2.

(ii1))  Soil Cover

(A)  The soil cap shall be constructed of a sandy loam, loamy sand, or
silt loam. The depth of the soil cap shall be at least six (6) inches at the edges to twelve (12)
inches at the center. The slope of all sides shall be three (3) horizontal to one (1) vertical or
flatter.

(B) A layer of top soil at least six (6) inches thick shall be placed over
the entire sand mound area. The sand mound should be planted with vegetation that does not
require watering and will not establish deep roots. Native grasses are commonly used.

(d) A design package for sand mound systems is provided online at the Division’s
website to assist the applicant in submitting a completed application for coverage under the
general permit for small wastewater systems. The worksheet and calculations were prepared by
a registered professional engineer employed by the Wyoming Department of Environmental
Quality, Water Quality Division. The general design requirements stated in this section are
incorporated into the worksheets such that by properly completing the forms and installing the
components, the system will comply with these requirements.

Section 15.  Small Wastewater Lagoons.
(a) Selection Criteria:

(1) Lagoons shall only be considered in areas of Wyoming where the annual
evaporation exceeds the annual precipitation during the active use of the lagoon.

(11) Lagoons shall only be allowed when the percolation rate exceeds sixty
(60) minutes per inch and the soil extends vertically down at least two (2) feet from the bottom

of the lagoon to the seasonal high groundwater table or bedrock formations.

(111)) A lagoon shall not be constructed within the 100 year floodplain.

APX1-24



(b) General Design Requirements:

(1) Beyond the horizontal setback distances requirements specified in Section
7(g) of this rule, the lagoon shall not be placed within one hundred (100) feet of the owner’s
property line.

(i1) The use of a septic tank that meets the specifications in Section 9 of this
rule shall be required before the small wastewater lagoon.

(ii1))  The lagoon shall be located and constructed so it will not receive surface

runoff water.

(iv)  The slope of the lagoon site shall not exceed five percent (5%).

(V) The lagoon site must be located in an area of maximum exposure to sun
and wind.

(vi)  The lagoon shall be designed for complete retention.

(vil)  The area of the lagoon shall be calculated based on the following formula.

2 584 x Q
~ (365xS8)+ (E-P)
A = Area of the lagoon (in square feet) at the maximum operating depth of five (5)

feet.

QO = Average daily sewage flow, gallons per day. (Multiply values from Table 1 or 2
by 0.6 to get average daily flow.)

E = Average annual lake evaporation in inches per year. (Note: lake evaporation is
less than pan evaporation; lake evaporation equals pan evaporation times a pan coefficient of
0.7)

P = Average annual precipitation rate in inches per year.
S = Seepage rate in decimal form, in inches per day.

(viii) The slopes of the dikes shall not be steeper than three (3) horizontal to one
(1) vertical. The minimum width of the top of the dike shall be four (4) feet.

(ix)  All fill shall consist of impervious material that is well compacted and free
of rocks, frozen soil, or other large material.

(x) The minimum operating depth shall be two (2) feet. The dikes shall
provide a minimum freeboard of two (2) feet.

APX1-25



(xi)  The floor of the lagoon shall be level and maintained free of all vegetation.
(xii)  The influent line into the lagoon must discharge near the center.

(xiii) A cleanout, with a tightly fitting cap, or manhole shall be provided in the
influent line near the dike.

(xiv) The area around the small wastewater lagoon shall be fenced to preclude
the entrance of livestock, pets, and humans. The fence shall be equipped with a locking gate.
The gate shall have a sign indicating “NO TRESPASSING — WASTEWATER LAGOON™.

(c) A design package for a small wastewater lagoons is provided online at the
Division’s website to assist the applicant in submitting a completed application for coverage
under the general permit for small wastewater systems. The worksheet and calculations were
prepared by a registered professional engineer employed by the Wyoming Department of
Environmental Quality, Water Quality Division. The general design requirements stated in this
section are incorporated into the worksheets such that by properly completing the forms and
installing the components, the system will comply with these requirements.

Section 16.  Privies or Outhouses.

Privies or outhouses that meet the requirements of this section are permitted by rule. A
permit by rule requires the owner to submit the information contained in paragraph (g) of this
section to the Wyoming Department of Environmental Quality, Water Quality Division prior to
constructing or installing the facility. By submission of the required information, the owner

acknowledges and certifies they will comply with the requirements contained in this section.

Pre-fabricated privies or outhouses shall be sealed, water-tight vaults and shall meet the
following conditions:

(a) The horizontal setback distance requirements for sealed privies or outhouses shall
comply with Section 7(g) for septic tanks.

(b) The depth to seasonally high groundwater from the bottom of a water tight vault
shall be sufficient to prevent floatation of the empty vault.

() The vault must have sufficient capacity for the dwelling served, and must have at
least 27 cubic feet or 200 gallons of capacity.

(d) Privies or outhouses must be insect tight; must have a self-closing door; the privy
or outhouse seat must include a cover; and all exterior openings, including vent openings, shall
be screened.

(e) Privies or outhouses must be adequately vented.

® Privies or outhouses shall not be constructed within the 100 year floodplain.

APX1-26



(2) Owner’s name, address, phone number, legal description of privy or outhouse
(address, latitude/longitude, or % 74 section), and the date construction or installation will begin.

Section 17.  Greywater Systems.

Greywater systems that meet the requirements of this section are permitted by rule. A
permit by rule requires the owner to submit the information contained in paragraph (e) of this
section to the Wyoming Department of Environmental Quality, Water Quality Division prior to
constructing, modifying, or installing the system. By submission of the required information, the
owner acknowledges and certifies they will comply with the requirements contained in this
section.

(a) Greywater Operation and Requirements

(1) Restrictions

(A)  Greywater shall not leave the property on which it is generated.
Ponding or runoff is prohibited.

(B)  Greywater systems shall not be installed in a delineated floodplain.

(C)  The volume of greywater shall not exceed an average of 2000
gallons per day.

(D)  Greywater shall not come in direct contact with or adversely
impact surface or groundwater.

(E)  Food crops for direct human consumption should not be harvested
for 30 days after application of greywater.

(i1) Odor control of the greywater system shall meet the requirement of
Wyoming DEQ Air Quality Regulations Chapter 2, Section 11.

(ii1))  If the greywater system is to be used during the winter, the greywater
system shall be designed to prevent freezing.

(b) Estimating Greywater Discharge
(1) The greywater discharge for single family and multi-family dwellings
shall be calculated by estimates of greywater use based on water use records, or the following

procedure:

(A)  The number of occupants of each dwelling unit shall be calculated
as 2 occupants per bedroom.

APX1-27



(B)  The estimated greywater flows of each occupant shall be
calculated in gallons per day (gpd) as follows:

Showers, bathtubs and wash basins — 25 gpd/occupant
Laundry — 15 gpd/occupant
(i1) The total number of occupants shall be multiplied by the applicable
estimated greywater discharge as provided above and the type of fixtures connected to the
greywater system.

(c) Greywater System Configurations

(1) All greywater systems shall have means to direct greywater to either the
blackwater system or the greywater system.

(i1) Diverter valves shall not have the potential to allow backflow from the
blackwater system into the greywater system.

(ii1))  Greywater used for surface irrigation should be disinfected. The
disinfection should achieve a fecal coliform level of 200 cfu/100 mL or less.

(d) Setbacks

(1) A 30 foot buffer zone is required between the greywater application site
and adjacent property lines and any public right-of-way.

(i1)) A 30 foot separation distance is required between greywater application
sites and all surface waters.

(1i11)) A 100 foot separation distance is required between greywater application
sites and all potable water supply wells.

(e) Owner’s name, address, phone number, legal description of greywater system
(address, latitude/longitude, or % 74 section), and the date construction or installation will begin.

Section 18.  Operation and Maintenance.

(a) For any system that disposes of wastewater through land application or subsurface
filtration, the owner shall not add any chemical or biochemical additive to the system that would
adversely affect the quality of the groundwater as stated in the WDEQ Water Quality Rules &
Regulations, Chapter 8.

(b) Septic tanks shall be pumped as needed to prevent solids carryover into the soil
absorption system.

APX1-28



() Holding tanks and sealed vaults shall be pumped prior to reaching their maximum
capacity.

(d) Any service provider that pumps septic tanks, holding tanks, or sealed vaults,
shall dispose of the wastewater contents at a permitted wastewater treatment facility or in a
manner approved by the Division or delegated authority.

(e) Damaged fittings and broken, crushed or plugged piping associated with any
small wastewater system shall be replaced in a timely manner.

§)) Composting or non-discharging toilets, where permitted, shall have their waste
disposed of at a permitted wastewater treatment facility or landfill, or in a manner approved by
the Division or delegated authority.

Section 19. Commercial and Industrial Wastes and/or Domestic Wastes Greater
Than 2000 Gallons per Day.

(a) Commercial/industrial wastewater systems or combination commercial/industrial
and domestic wastewater systems are subject to applicable requirements listed in sections 1
through 15 of this chapter, in addition to requirements in this section.

(b) If the wastewater is classified as, or determined to be hazardous, toxic, and/or
contain petroleum products, the applicant shall demonstrate to the Administrator that any
discharge or seepage from the wastewater facility will not cause a violation of the surface and/or
groundwaters of the state in accordance with Chapter 1, “Quality Standards for Wyoming
Surface Waters” and Chapter 8, “Quality Standards for Wyoming Groundwaters.”

(c) If the impact of the hazardous, toxic, and/or petroleum products cannot be
determined and mitigated, disposal of the wastewater using a soil absorption system shall be
prohibited.

(d) Pre-treatment of the wastewater to remove the hazardous, toxic, and/or petroleum
products shall be required prior to disposal if deemed necessary to protect the Groundwater(s)
and Surface Water(s) of the State.

(e) The minimum horizontal setback distances (in feet) shown in Table 7 shall be
maintained for commercial and industrial wastes and/or wastes greater than 2000 gallons per day

but less than 10,000 gallons per day.

Table 7. Minimum Horizontal Setbacks for Commercial and Industrial Wastes in Feet!

To Septic Tank Or .
From Equivalent To Absorption System
Wells (includes neighboring 50 200
wells)
Public Water Supply Well | 100 5002

APX1-29



To Septic Tank Or .

From Equivalent To Absorption System
Property Lines 10 10
Foundation Wall (w/o

. 5 10
drains)
Foqndatlon Wall (with 5 50
drains)
Potable Water Pipes 25 50
Septic Tank N/A 10
Surface Water, Spring
(including seasonal and 50 100
intermittent)
Cisterns 50 50

! For systems larger than 10,000 gallons per day, the isolation distance shall be determined by a
hydrogeological study in accordance with Section 17(b) of Chapter 3, but shall not be less than
those shown in Table 7.

2 Wastewater systems that discharge to the same aquifer that supplies a public water supply well
and are located within Zone 1 or 2 (Attenuation) of the public water supply well, as determined
by Wyoming Department of Environmental Quality Source Water Assessment Project (2004) or
as established in Section 2 of the Wyoming Wellhead Protection Guidance Document (1997),
shall provide additional treatment. These systems will be required to obtain an individual permit
to construct and will require that a PE sign, stamp, and date the application, as stated in Section 2
of this chapter. The additional treatment shall be in accordance with Chapter 3, Section 2(b)(ii).
The treatment shall reduce the nitrates to less than 10 mg/L of NO;_ as N and provide 4-log
removal of pathogens before the discharge leaves the property boundary of each small
wastewater system.

APX1-30



APPENDIX A Percolation Test Procedure
Section 1. Purpose

(a) Percolation tests are used to determine absorption system site suitability and to
size the absorption system.

Section 2. Procedure
(a) General Requirements:

(1) Percolation tests shall not be conducted in test holes that extend into
groundwater, bedrock, or frozen ground.

(i1) The percolation test shall be conducted only after the soil exploration pit
has been dug and examined.

(ii1)) A minimum of three (3) percolation test holes are required.

(iv)  The percolation test holes shall be spaced uniformly over the proposed soil
absorption system site.

(b) Preparation

(1) A twelve (12) inch diameter hole shall be dug or bored to the proposed
depth of the soil absorption system.

(i1) The walls shall be vertical, with the natural soil surface exposed without
smearing.

(ii1))  The sides and bottom shall be scarified with a sharp pointed instrument
and the loose material shall be removed from the hole.

(iv)  Two (2) inches of gravel or coarse sand shall be placed in the bottom of
the hole to prevent it from scouring and sealing during water addition.

() Presoaking

(1) The purpose of presoaking is to have the water conditions in the soil reach
a stable condition similar to that which exists during continual wastewater application. The
minimum time of presoaking varies with soil conditions but must be sufficiently long so that the
water seeps away at a constant rate. The following presoaking instructions are usually sufficient
to obtain a constant rate.

(A)  Fill each hole with clear water to a level at least eighteen (18)
inches above the gravel or coarse sand. If the eighteen (18) inches of water seeps away in

APX1-31



eighteen (18) minutes or less, add eighteen (18) inches of water a second time. If the second
filling of eighteen (18) inches of water seeps away in eighteen (18) minutes or less, this indicates
the soil is sandy and is excessively permeable. The soil absorption system shall meet the
requirements of Section 8 (c).

(B)  [Ifeither the first or second fillings of eighteen (18) inches of water
does not seep away in ninety (90) minutes, eighteen (18) inches of water must be maintained in
the hole for at least four (4) hours to presoak the test hole. After the four (4) hours of water
contact time, wait at least twelve (12) hours before starting the percolation rate measurement.

(d) Percolation Rate Measurement

(1) Fill each test hole with twelve (12) inches of water and allow the soil to
rehydrate for fifteen (15) minutes prior to any measurements.

(i1))  Establish a fixed reference point to measure the incremental water level
drop at constant time intervals. The water level drop should be measured to the nearest s of an
inch and the minimum time interval is ten (10) minutes.

(ii1))  Refill the test hole to twelve (12) inches above the gravel before starting
the measurements. Continue to measure the incremental water level drop at a constant time
interval until a consistent incremental water level drop is achieved. A consistent water level drop
is achieved when three (3) consecutive water level drops are within 's inches of each other.

(iv)  Before the water level drops below one (1) inch above the gravel, refill the
test hole to twelve (12) inches and continue to measure the incremental water level drop.

(v) The percolation rate is calculated for each hole using the following
formula:
Time Interval (Minutes) = Percolation Rate
Final Water Level Drop (inches) (minutes/inch)

(vi)  If only three to five percolation tests are performed, the design percolation
rate for the absorption system is the largest rate from all the holes tested. If six or more
percolation tests are performed, the design percolation rate for the absorption system is the
average of all the holes tested as determined by the above formula.

(e) The following information shall be recorded:
(1) Date(s) of test(s);
(i1))  Location, diameter, and depth of each test hole;

(iii)  Duration of presoak;

(iv)  Time of day for beginning and end of each water-level drop interval;

APX1-32



(v) Each water-level drop measurement;

(vi)  Calculated percolation rate;

(vii)  Name and signature of person performing test;
(viii)) Name of owner or project name; and

(ix)  Certification that the percolation test was done in accordance with
Wyoming Water Quality Rules and Regulations Chapter 25 Appendix A.

APX1-33



APPENDIX B Land Application of Domestic Septage in Remote Areas
Section 1. Restrictions and Requirements

To qualify for the land application of domestic septage in remote areas, the following
conditions must be met:

(a) Location restrictions:

(1) Domestic septage generated on a specific property may be land applied on
said property, and shall not be transported to another location for land application.

(i1) No land application of domestic septage shall occur within 1,000 feet of
all adjacent properties.

(ii1))  No land application of domestic septage shall occur within 300 feet of a
public road, permanent surface water body, or intermittent stream.

(b) Site restrictions:

(1) The land application of domestic septage shall only occur on those sites
with established vegetation such as rangeland, pasture or hay meadows.

(i)  No more than 5,000 gallons of domestic septage per acre per year shall be
land applied.

(ii1))  No land application of domestic septage shall occur where the site’s slope
exceeds five percent (5%) or where the depth to groundwater is less than four (4) feet.

(iv)  The land application of domestic septage shall not occur between
November 1 and May 1, or any other time when frozen or saturated ground conditions exits.

(v) No public access shall be allowed to any site where domestic septage has
been applied for at least one (1) year following application.

(vi)  No grazing animals shall be allowed access to any site where domestic
septage has been land applied for at least thirty (30) days following application.

() Crop restrictions:

(1) No root crops shall be harvested from soils where domestic septage has
been land applied for at least thirty-eight (38) months following application

(1))  No truck crops (harvested parts touch land surface) shall be harvested

from soils where domestic septage has been land applied for at least fourteen (14) months
following application.

APX1-34



(ii1))  No commodity crops (other food, feed, and fiber crops whose harvested
parts do not touch land surface) from soils where domestic septage has been land applied shall be
harvested for at least thirty (30) days following application.

(iv)  No turf shall be harvested from soils where domestic septage has been
land applied for at least one (1) year following application.

(d) Reporting Requirements:

(1) The property owner shall notify the appropriate Department of
Environmental Quality, Water Quality Division (DEQ/WQD) District Engineer prior to the land
application of domestic septage to confirm the requirements and to arrange a possible
DEQ/WQD inspection of the land application.

(i1) All records related to each septage application will be maintained for at
least five (5) years.

(iii))  There is a worksheet provided online at the Division’s website that must

be completed, signed, and returned to the DEQ/WQD, or the appropriate delegated local
permitting authority, within 15 days of the land application.

APX1-35



500 South Gillette Avenue APPENDIX 2 /\/ /—\
Suite 1500 Campbell County
Gillette, Wyoming 82716 wyoming

(307) 682-1970

Campbell County Public Works

SMALL WASTEWATER SYSTEM PERMIT WORKBOOK AND APPLICATION

This application package is for conventional systems (septic tank and leach field) only. In order to use
this application, systems must meet all the following criteria:
e Wastewater flow of less than 2,000 gallons per day of waste containing domestic sewage;
e Standard trench or bed type disposal systems, using either stone and pipe or chambers;
e Seasonal high groundwater, bedrock, or impervious clay layers must be four feet or more below
the bottom of the proposed leach field;
e Soil percolation rates must be FSIiSI iKI-y'5 minutes per inch and {544 (KIy'60 minutes per inch.

Description of Work (new, repair, pertinent remarks):

Address of Facility:

Applicant Email Address:

Name of Property Owner:

Owner Address: Owner Phone/Email:

Name of Installer:

Installer Address: Installer Phone/Email:
Building Type/Use: [ Residential O Commercial
Residential Number of Bedrooms: Unfinished Basement? [Yes [ No

Commercial Number of Employees/Users:

Water Supply/Source:

Lot Description (size, shape, pertinent information):

pg. M 2T HH
Campbell County Small Wastewater System


cmm08
Typewritten Text
APPENDIX 2

cmm08
Typewritten Text


500 South Gillette Avenue P !

Suite 1500 Campbell County
Gillette, Wyoming 82716 wyoming
(307) 682-1970

Campbell County Public Works Building Division

RESIDENTIAL AND COMMERCIAL SMALL WASTEWATER SYSTEM
Steps

A. Perform the 8-step design process identified below.

B. Bring the completed packet into Public Works Building Division to obtain
permit.

C. Install tank and field per approved permit, leaving tank, pipe, infiltrators,
and rock exposed for inspection.

D. Contact Building Division at 682-1970 to schedule inspection.

E. After passing the on-site inspection, backfill the system.

(The Building Division is happy to help, please contact the staff for explanation or
assistance, if needed)

Design Process

1. Determine correct location for the septic tank and leach field based on the layout and setback
requirements on page 5. Leave room for a replacement leach field. The leach field should not
have structures, pavement, or decks placed above it. It should be located where vehicles will
not be parked or driven over it.

2. Determine the correct elevation of the bottom of the leach field or infiltration surface. (This is
the native ground where the wastewater will sit as it soaks into the ground). This is the
elevation where the percolation tests will be taken (the bottom of the percolation test hole
needs to be at this elevation). Refer to page 4 for layout, slope, and depth requirements. Due

pg. 2 2T HH
Campbell County Small Wastewater System



500 South Gillette Avenue /\/ /—\

Suite 1500 Campbell County
Gillette, Wyoming 82716 wyoming
(307) 682-1970

to the constraints of the elevation of the leach field, lift stations are likely necessary for
structures with basements if there is not a significant grade drop on the property. A lift station
can be installed to pump the sewage from the basement up to the septic tank or to pump the
septic tank outflow up to the leach field. There are several controlling geographic factors in
selecting this elevation:

a. This elevation must be even for the entire length of the leach field.

b. This elevation must be set low enough so that the drain lines coming from the structure
to the tank and from the tank to the leach field can slope at 2% (% inch per foot), as well
as accommodate the drop from the inlet of the tank to the outlet. See page 4 for
spacing requirements.

c. This elevation must be no more than 5 feet below the finished dirt grade above the
leach field after installation. [Cover needs to be kept to a mI-EIY @Y of 5 feet to
adequately reaerate the soil and satisfy the daily oxygen demand of the applied
wastewater. Delivery of oxygen to the infiltration zone is most likely when soil
components are shallow. If sufficient oxygen is not present, the metabolic processes of
the microorganisms can be reduced or halted and both treatment and infiltration of the
wastewater will be adversely affected (EPA Onsite Wastewater Treatment Systems
Manual Feb 2002 p 4-4, p 4-6.)].

3. Draw asite plan, using page 5 as a guide. Show setbacks from related items and indicate depth
from finished grade to the infiltration surface.

4. Dig a pitin the center of the proposed leach field at least 4 feet below the infiltration surface to
check for groundwater or adverse solid components. Answer all the questions on page 6 related
to the test pit.

5. Select a septic tank, using paged 7 YRy as a guide.
6. Perform the percolation tests, per page 9. Enter the information in the spreadsheet on page 10.
7. Size the leach field, per page 11.

8. Determine which type of system to install. Refer to page 12. Fill out the worksheet that
matches the type of system being used.

pg. 3 2T HH
Campbell County Small Wastewater System



AN FN
Campbell County

wyoming

STRUCTURE CLEAN OUT HUMPED TO
’T/ SHED WATER

FLAT ACROSS ENTIRE

l 2% SLOPE— o .
r . 2% SLOPE— o

5
MIN. SEPTIC 10°
TANK MIN.

INFILTRATION—"]
= = SURFACE

4’ MIN.

~——100" MAX | LENGTH——

BEDROCK OR OTHER
IMPERVIOUS LAYER

NOT TO SCALE

Campbell County Small Wastewater System pg. 4 of 22


AutoCAD SHX Text
STRUCTURE

AutoCAD SHX Text
2% SLOPE

AutoCAD SHX Text
2% SLOPE

AutoCAD SHX Text
SEPTIC TANK

AutoCAD SHX Text
INFILTRATION  SURFACE

AutoCAD SHX Text
HUMPED TO  SHED WATER

AutoCAD SHX Text
GROUND WATER

AutoCAD SHX Text
BEDROCK OR OTHER IMPERVIOUS LAYER

AutoCAD SHX Text
ROCK

AutoCAD SHX Text
NOT TO SCALE

AutoCAD SHX Text
FLAT ACROSS ENTIRE LENGTH

AutoCAD SHX Text
CLEAN OUT

cmm08
Typewritten Text

cmm08
Typewritten Text
Campbell County Small Wastewater System

cmm08
Typewritten Text
pg. 4 of 22

cmm08
Typewritten Text

cmm08
Typewritten Text

cmm08
Typewritten Text

cmm08
Typewritten Text
 

cmm08
Typewritten Text


AN YN
. . Campbell County
Site Plan Drawing wyoming

Attach a sketch of your site as a separate sheet, showing each of the items in the table below if applicable.

Required Required
Check Box Setback Setback Is the Setback
If Shown Element Distance To | Distance To Distance
On Site Plan Septic Tank Leachfield Satisfied?
(feet) (feet)

O Property lines 10 10 dYes [INo
O All buildings, roads, and driveways — — —
O Setback to buildings w/out a foundation drain 5 10 OYes [ No
O Setback to buildings with a foundation drain 5 25 OvYes [ONo
O Private wells (including neighbors) 50 100 OvYes [ONo
O Public water supply wells 100 200 dYes [INo
O Potable water supply lines 25 25 dYes [INo
O Surface water (ditch, pond, Intermittent waterways, etc.) 50 50 ] Yes ] No
O Septic tank — 10 dYes [INo
O Break in slope (where slope gets abruptly steeper) 15 15 OvYes [ONo
O Cisterns 25 25 OYes [No
O Leachfield & Replacement Leachfield 10 — COYes [ONo
O North arrow - — -
] Slope (arrow pointing downslope) — — —
] Location of numbered percolation test holes (numbered) — — —
] Location of soil exploration pit — — —
] Location of cleanout port(s) — — —

Example site plan:

//,/—\/ Indicate depth from finished ground
OPEN WATER Q

to infiltration surface on site plan
/ p

BREAK IN

:_ /1 /‘ SLOPE
WATE | i
/ 5!

LINE

P

| HOUSE |
REPLAGEMENT
LEACHFIELD

* CLEANOUTS
® PERCOLATION TEST LOCATION |
Il SOIL EXPLORATION PIT

e o e e e e e

%
| %
T

COUNTY ROAD

Campbell County Small Wastewater System pg. 5 2T HH


http://wdeq.maps.arcgis.com/apps/webappviewer/index.html?id=4d6a6e4a5d9547c59d6edff01b0c9145
cmm08
Typewritten Text
            


cmm08
Typewritten Text

cmm08
Typewritten Text

cmm08
Typewritten Text

cmm08
Typewritten Text
Indicate depth from finished ground to infiltration surface on site plan

cmm08
Typewritten Text

cmm08
Rectangle

cmm08
Typewritten Text


Site Suitability Campbsll CoUnTy
wyoming

The owner must be aware of the depth of any impermeable soil layers, high groundwater levels, and slope when

considering the septic system location. The questions below will ensure you have gathered the information

necessary to determine if a conventional septic system is appropriate.

Does the soil exploration pit lie within the area of the proposed leachfield? |:| Yes I:l No
Was the bottom of the required soil exploration pit at least 4 feet below the bottom of the I:l Yes I:l No
g proposed leachfield, usually a minimum of 7-8 feet total depth? This is required.
.g_
g Depth of the excavation?
3]
o
Who conducted the excavation?
Date:
2
o Did the excavator observe a rock layer below the surface? |:| Yes I:l No
)
—
% If yes, at what depth below the ground surface?
©
(4]
g Did the excavator observe a clay layer below the surface? |:| Yes I:l No
(]
Qo
g If yes, at what depth below the ground surface?
Was groundwater present in the excavation? |:| Yes I:l No
e
% If yes, at what depth below the ground surface?
-E Does the soil have an alkali crust at the surface, a rotten egg smell, or a blue-gray or I:l Yes I:l No
§ greenish-gray (gley) color that may indicate frequent/continuous saturation?
o
S
2 If yes, at what depth below the ground surface?
60
I Does the soil have a mottled appearance with areas around roots or cracks that look like
rust, or is the soil stained a dark red-black or red-brown color, which may indicate periods |:| Yes I:l No
of saturation?
If yes, at what depth below the ground surface?
What is the estimated slope of the proposed leachfield area?
()
5
»» | How far away is the nearest break in slope (the side of a hill or where the slope becomes
abruptly steeper) from the proposed leachfield area?
How far away is the nearest surface water body, such as a lake, river, pond, creek, ditch, or
wetland from the proposed leachfield area?
How far away are areas where the soil may be compacted by vehicles, such as roads or parking
@ | spaces, from the proposed leachfield area?
<
6 How far away are water supply wells (drinking or irrigation wells), cisterns, or water supply lines
from the proposed leachfield area?
Do surface drainage features (ditches, depressions, or swales) direct runoff from paved areas |:| Yes |:| No
such as roofs, patios, or driveways, away from the leachfield?

Campbell County Small Wastewater System pg. 6 2T HH



Septic Tank and Piping Worksheet

a iy a
Campbell County

wyoming

Septic Tank

Manufacturer:

Model No./Number of
Chambers:

Size (gallons):

Tank Material: [ Concrete

[ Fiberglass [J Thermoplastic [ Other (please describe):

Is this septic tank on the approved list? O Yes [ No

0 Don’t Know

If no, provide a tank diagram from the manufacturer. If you cannot locate a diagram from the manufacturer, complete the
following 3 rows. See Page Yy for septic tank design requirements and a diagram of a septic tank.

% s | Internal Dimensions: Length (in): Width (in): Height (in):
- = »
a o =
°
g z 9| Liquid Depth Amount of Air Space Between Top of Liquid
e £ g_ (in): and Chamber Ceiling (in)
T
6 8  Operating | ( * * )+231= gallons
Capacity Length (in) Width (in) Liquid Depth (in) Operating Capacity

Depth of backfill over tank

.. ” . Number of bedrooms, if a residence:
(minimum of 6” required)

C20NSHRSyiI- 38405 Y & (KS {1-y7 OFLII-OG@ &K It 6S mnnn 312y F20 diL (2 n 6SRI22Y 4 Lifdza Iy
IFRRI2Y1£ mpn AI-E2yE LISH 6SRI22Y 721 SI-0K bedroom 248N no

C2 02Y Y SHoH£ a8aiSY & dKS 1y O1-LIONi@ &K It 0S H 1Y Sa (KS RS&i3y Tt2& 20 mnnn J1-t2yAl
SKIOKSHSN & FUSI-iSHo

Does the tank have a 20-inch access opening in EACH compartment of the tank and a riser

from the access opening that terminates a max\Y'@zY" of 6 inches below the ground &dzifI-0SK |:| Yes |:| No
Is septic tank installed on a level grade, with firm bedding to prevent settling, and without I:l Yes |:| No
rock or other obstructions touching the tank?

If installing two tanks in a series, install the downstream tank a minimum of 2 inches lower I:l Yes |:| No
than the first to insure proper flow. Will the installer use a series of tanks as described?

What is the proposed
pipe size (diameter)?

What will the piping material between the
house and the septic tank be?

Will the installer lay the pipe from the house to the septic tank in a straight line? I:l Yes |:| No
If no, will the installer include the required cleanout ports at any alignment change greater
than 22.5 degrees? |:| Yes |:| No
Will the pipe from the house to the septic tank be more than 100 feet long? |:| Yes I:' No
b0
g If yes, will the required cleanout ports be spaced along the line every 100 feet or less? |:| Yes I:' No
&
DEQ recommends a cleanout port facing each direction between the building and the tank. [0 Toward Building
If only one is used, which direction does the required cleanout port face? 0 Toward Tank
Will the piping have a minimum slope of % inch per foot (2%)? I:l Yes |:| No
If the installer uses more than one trench, they must use a distribution box or flow divider |:| Yes I:l No
tee to equalize flow. Will the system include a distribution box or flow divider tee?
Will the leachfield trenches be less than 100 feet long? This is required. I:l Yes |:| No
Campbell County Small Wastewater System pg. 7 2T HH



P
Cc:/\mbeu{:_o}wy
Basic Design Requirements for Septic Tanks wyoming
1. Tanks must have a minimum of a 1,000-gallon capacity for residences with up to four bedrooms; add 150 gallons
of capacity for each additional bedroom.
2. The tank must be watertight, including all joints and connections, and constructed of a durable, non-corrodible
material such as concrete, fiberglass, thermoplastic or other approved material. DEQ regulations do not allow

steel tanks.
3. The liquid depth shall be between three (3) and six (6) feet deep.
4. Asingle chamber tank shall have at least a 2:1 length to width ratio or be partitioned to prevent short-circuiting.
5. The first chamber in any two-chambered tank must accommodate at least 50 percent of the capacity.
6. Each chamber must have an access opening with a minimum dimension of 20 inches, from which both inlet and
outlet tees shall be accessible.
7. Each chamber must have a cleanout riser that extends to a maximum of six (6) inches below the ground surface.

8. The inlet and outlet tees should be 4-inch diameter, schedule 40 PVC or equivalent, and should extend into
undisturbed soil.

9. Install tanks used in a series such that the inlet to each successive tank shall be at least two (2) inches below the
outlet of the preceding tank.

Diagram of a Typical Two-Chambered Septic Tank

77N 777777777 W
o [fIT7]] IFFETEE
Scum layer -
Inlet < | Outlet
Clear zone -
Sludge layer B

Drawing modified from CIDWT. 2009. Installation of Wastewater Treatment Systems. Consortium of Institutes for
Decentralized Wastewater Treatment (CIDWT). lowa State University, Midwest Plan Service. Ames, IA.

Campbell County Small Wastewater System pg. 8 2T HH


cmm08
Typewritten Text
 


Percolation Test Instructions

In order for a septic system to perform properly, the
wastewater must move through the soil at an ideal
rate, neither too fast nor too slow. A percolation test
estimates the rate at which the water will percolate,
or move, through the soil. The information provided
by percolation tests is necessary to design leachfields
correctly. Follow the steps below to complete a
percolation test.

1. Location of Percolation Test Holes. The
percolation (perc) test holes must be spaced uniformly
over the proposed leachfield site. A minimum of three
(3) test holes are required, although you can use more
if desired.

2. Test Hole Preparation. Dig or bore each hole 12
inches wide and as deep as the proposed depth of the
leachfield (usually between 30 and 40 inches). Make
sure the sides are vertical and scrape the sides and
bottom of the hole with a sharp pointed instrument to
restore a natural soil surface. Remove loose soil from
the hole and place 2 inches of course sand, washed
gravel, or crushed stone in the bottom in order to
prevent scouring or sealing.

3. Presoaking. Presoaking is absolutely required to
get valid percolation test results. Presoaking allows
the water conditions in the test hole to reach a stable
condition that is similar to a leachfield. Presoaking
time varies with soil conditions, but presoak holes for
at least 4 hours. Maintain at least 18 inches of water
in the test holes for at least 4 hours, then allow the soil
to swell for 12 hours (overnight is good) before
starting the perc test.

For sandy or loose soils, add 18 inches of water above
the gravel or coarse sand. If the 18 inches of water
seeps away in 18 minutes or less, add 18 inches of
water a second time. If the second filling of 18 inches
of water seeps away in 18 minutes or less, the soil is
excessively permeable and the site is unsuitable for a
conventional disposal system. If this is the case,
contact the Building Division.

Campbell County Small Wastewater System

AN YN
Campbell County

wyoming

4. Perc Rate Measurements. Fill each hole with 12
inches of water and let the soil re-hydrate for 15
minutes prior to taking any measurements. Establish
a fixed reference point such as a flat board placed
across the top of the hole to measure the incremental
water level drop at the constant time intervals.
Measure the water level drop to the nearest 1/8 of an
inch with a minimum time interval of 10 minutes.
Normal time intervals are usually 10 or 15 minutes.

Refill the test hole to 12 inches above the gravel before
starting the measurements. Measure down to the
water from the fixed reference point. Record this
value on the first line in the perc test data sheet (Page
9). Take another measurement after the time
interval has elapsed and record on the second line of
the table. Calculate the water level drop and record in
the table.

Continue the test until the water level drop rate has
stabilized, i.e. three consecutive measurements within
1/8 inch of each other. Before the water level drops
below 1 inch above the gravel, refill the test hole to 12
inches. Some test holes may take longer to stabilize
than others. If the drop rate continues to fluctuate,
use the smallest drop rate out of the last six intervals
for your calculations.

Yard stick just touching water
Board to provide measuring point \ o . -

i
« £
[ Bs]
£ E
9 Starting water depth
9oy
T m Lo .
o Water depth after elapsed time
2
0 —
as
© Refill test hole to 12

inches before the water

J level drops below 1 inch
L DN ¢ BT
| P 2" washed gravel or

12 inches crushed stone

pg. 9 2T HH



AL XN

Campbell Count
Percolation Test Data Sheet Fv?y oming ¥

Owner/Project Name: Date:

Test holes were pre-soaked for: (hours/minutes) Time Interval: min

Do not perform percolation test if ground is frozen or if groundwater is present in holes. Holes must be 12 inches in diameter
and evenly spaced over the leachfield area. Roughen sides and bottoms of holes and place 2 inches of gravel in each hole.

Hole #1 Hole #2 Hole #3 Hole #4 Hole #5 Hole #6
(Required) (Required) (Required) (Optional) (Optional) (Optional)
Depth of Hole:
Measure to Measure to Measure to Measure to Measure to Measure to
Time Time | nearest1/8inch | nearest1/8inch | nearest 1/8 inch | nearest 1/8 inch | nearest 1/8 inch | nearest 1/8 inch
of Day | (Min) | Water Water Water Water Water Water
Level Drop Level Drop Level Drop Level Drop Level Drop Level Drop

| —|
Time Interval

(minutes)
Final Interval
Drop (inches)

Perc Rate

(min/inch)

Design Perc Rate
(min/inch)

To calculate drop: Subtract the water level measurement at the start of your time interval from the water level
measurement at the end. The “Drop” is how far the water level went down during the stated time interval. Time intervals
must be consistent for each hole throughout the test.

Leachfield percolation (Perc) rate: If 3 to 5 holes were tested, use the slowest (highest number) rate of the holes tested. If
six or more holes were tested, use the average rate.

Helpful Conversions: 1/8=0.125 1/4=0.25 3/8=0.375 1/2=0.50 5/8=0.625 3/4=0.75 7/8=0.875

To calculate perc rate (minutes per inch): Time Interval (min) + Final Interval Drop (in)

Time Interval (min) 10 min min
Example Perc Rate = —; — = =89 —
Final Interval Drop (in) 1 1. in
8

mn
| certify that this perc test was done in accordance with the instructions on the previous page.

Test Performed by: Signature:

Campbell County Small Wastewater System pg. 10 2T HH



AN YN\

Campbell County

Leachfield Sizing Worksheet

wyoming

Leachfield
Sizing (ft?)

How many bedrooms does
the residence have?

bedrooms

Enter the number of gallons per day (gpd) of
wastewater generated that corresponds
with the number of bedrooms in Box 1

Required Leachfield Area (ft?)
Divide design flow (Box 1) by loading
rate (Box 2). Round up to the nearest

whole number.

below.
g Does the residence have an 1 bedroom 180 gpd
. 5
= . . . unfinished basement? 2 bedrooms 320 gpd
== 2 Residential Building
o 5 |:| (Including Mobile 3 bedrooms 460 gpd
= = Homes) |:| Yes |:| No 4 bedrooms 550 gpd
?, S 5 bedrooms 630 gpd
= g 6 bedrooms 720 gpd
n’:n 3 If yes, add 2 more bedrooms &p
@ s toth ber above.
s = © the humber above Add 80 gpd for each bedroom over 6
Total bedrooms
I:l Non-residential Building Refer to Page 22
Design Fl d): Box 1
gn Flow (gpd):
Enter value from cells above:
s Perc. Rate Loading Rate Perc. Rate Loading Rate Perc. Rate Loading Rate
- min/inch gpd/ft? min/inch gpd/ft? min/inch gpd/ft?
6o
©
s O s 0.80 O 16 0.50 O 3031 0.39
()]
£ O 0.75 O 17 0.49 O 3233 0.38
©
& OF, 0.71 O 1s 0.48 O 3435 0.37
& g
g | & O s 0.68 O 19 0.47 O 3637 0.36
° 2
S § O 0.65 O 2 0.46 O 3840 0.35
o] o
g | £ O 10 0.62 Oxn 0.45 O 4143 0.34
©
(]
& £ On 0.60 O » 0.44 O aa46 0.33
-] b
§ ° O 0.58 O 2324 0.43 O a7-50 0.32
T
§ O 13 0.56 O 2 0.42 O 5155 0.31
()]
5| Ou 0.54 O 26-27 0.41 O s6-60 0.30
(]
S O 15 0.52 O 28-29 0.40
Loading Rate (gpd/ft?): Box 2
Enter loading rate for your percolation rate from above table.

Design Flow (Box 1) + Loading Rate (Box 2) = Leachfield Area (Box 3)

Example: 300 gpd + 0.62 gpd/ft?= 483.87 or 484 ft?

Box 3

Campbell County Small Wastewater System

pg. 11 2T HH


cmm08
Typewritten Text
Add 80 gpd for each bedroom over 6

cmm08
Typewritten Text

cmm08
Typewritten Text


AN TN
Campbell County
Leachfield Design Instructions wyoming

Arrange conventional septic system leachfields using either a trench or a bed layout. Construct either trench or bed
layouts using either perforated pipe or open-bottom chamber systems. DEQ prefers trench layouts because they
provide more surface area for absorption of wastewater into the soil. Trenches also treat wastewater more efficiently
because the undisturbed soil between the trenches allows more oxygen to reach the microbes that break down and
treat the wastewater. For this reason, trenches are also more effective when soils have lower or “slower” percolation
rates. Use bed layouts where space for a leachfield is limited and only where soils have higher or “faster” percolation
rates. DEQ considers trenches spaced less than three (3) feet apart as bed layouts.

To design your leachfield, follow these steps:
1) Choose either a trench or a bed layout.
2) Choose either perforated pipe or open-bottomed chambers for your leachfield.
3) Fill out the layout worksheet and diagram that correspond to your selection. This worksheet will determine how
many trenches you need or how large to make your bed.
4) Submit only the worksheet and diagram that you completed.

Trench Leachfield System: Bed Leachfield System:
Perforated Pipe Trench Layout Worksheet, Page 1nmvMp Perforated Pipe Bed Layout Worksheet, Page 1ymMp
Chambered Trench Layout Worksheet, Page 1CiMT Chamber Bed Layout Worksheet, Page HNTHM

Install leachfields to ensure equal distribution of wastewater effluent among all the trenches. Equal distribution allows
the use of the entire infiltrative surface of the leachfield and prevents overloading part of the leachfield.

Use either a piping header or distribution box (D-box) to distribute wastewater effluent equally among the trenches of
a leachfield. A piping header system conveys wastewater effluent to each disposal trench using a network of solid
piping. Split the discharge line from the septic tank using a T-pipe fitting (see example below). If there is an odd number
of trenches in the leachfield, use a distribution box to divide wastewater effluent evenly among the trenches (see
example below). Distribution boxes are typically made of concrete or wastewater-grade plastics and are watertight with
a single inlet set at a higher elevation than the outlets. Construct outlets so that their elevations are equal relative to
one another.

Examples of Septic Systems Where the Effluent is Distributed Equally.

DEQ does not require installation of leachfield trenches in a straight line. In fact, it is always preferable to follow the
contour of the land. Additionally, never install the leachfield in floodways, at the base of slopes, or in depressions where
runoff water could flood the leachfield. Construct leachfields in areas with good surface drainage, where the water
cannot pond over the leachfield.

Campbell County Small Wastewater System pg. 12 2T HH



A PR
Campbell County

wyoming

Table 1. Chamber System Equivalent Areas

Nominal Dimensions Effective Dimensions Equivalent Area
Ch:lr:sbser Chamber Name Length | Width | Height | Length | Width® | Height? I:/Zﬂ: L:yi)dut
(ft) (in) (in) (ft) (in) (in) (sf/unit) | (sf/unit)
Quick4 High Capacity 4.4 34 16 4.0 34 115 23.9 16.2
High Quick4 Plus High Capacity 4.4 34 14 4.0 34 8.0 215 16.2
Capacity Arc 36 High Capacity 5.3 34 16 5.0 34 10.5 29.0 20.3
BioDiffuser 16" High Capacity 6.3 34 16 6.2 34 11.2 36.7 25.1
Quick4 Standard 4.4 34 12 4.0 34 8.0 21.5 16.2
Quick4 Plus Standard 4.4 34 12 4.0 34 8.0 21.5 16.2
Standard
Arc 36 53 34 13 5.0 34 7.0 26.1 20.3
BioDiffuser 11" Standard 6.3 34 11 6.2 34 5.8 31.1 25.1
Standard Quick4 Plus Standard LP 4.4 34 8 4.0 34 3.3 18.4 16.2
Low Profile Arc 36 LP 5.3 34 8 5.0 34 3.8 23.4 20.3
Quick4 Equalizer 36 4.4 22 12 4.0 22 6.0 14.5 10.5
Narrow Arc 24 5.6 22 12 5.0 22 6.3 18.3 13.1
BioDiffuser Bio 3 7.3 22 12 7.2 22 6.4 26.5 18.9
Narrow LP Quick4 Plus Equalizer 36 LP 4.4 22 8 4.0 22 3.3 12.7 10.5
Quick4 Equalizer 24 4.4 16 12 4.0 16 6.0 11.6 7.6
Ni':rrgw Arc 18 5.6 16 12 5.0 16 6.3 14.7 9.5
BioDiffuser Bio 2 7.3 16 12 7.2 16 6.4 21.3 13.7
Ultra- Quick4 Equalizer 24 LP 4.4 il 8 4.0 il 2.0 9.0 7.6
Narrow LP

1The equivalent areas calculation used the outside width of the chamber.
2The effective height is the height of the slotted sidewall of the chamber or depth below the flow line of the inlet pipe, whichever
is less.

Campbell County Small Wastewate pg. 10 2T HH



AANE N
Campbell County

Perforated Pipe Trench Layout Worksheet bt Y
Required Leachfield Area Box 1
(Page 1M, Box 3)
Depth of Trench Below Box 2
Pipe (ft)
Box 3
- Width of Trench (ft)
.20
3 Box 4
o Absorptive Area Per Linear
Foot of Trench (ft?/ft) + + =
Trench Depth (Box 2) Trench Depth (Box 2)  Trench Width (Box 3) Absorptive Area
Box 5
Total Trench Length (ft) - =
Required Leachfield Area (Box 1) Absorptive Area (Box 4) Total Trench Length
Total Trench Minimum Number Box 6
- Length (ft) of Trenches
g (from Box 5) to Use Number of Trenches to Use =
5 Number of Trenches to <101 1
-_=| Use 101-200 2 Length of Trenches =
2 201-300 3*
v 301-400 4 *A distribution box, or D-box, is required
= 401-500 5* when an odd number of trenches is used.
501-600 6

Please fill in the boxes on the diagram below.

MOUND TO PREVENT PONDING STABLISH
AND PROMOTE RUNOFF el L S—
TOPSOIL
GEOTEXTILE
ACTUAL TREN MATERIAL 12" MIN COVER
slépm = OR 3" OF NATIVE BACKFILL
STRAW
FT 5'(60") MAX g 1
i - ACTUAL
GRAVEL DEPTH : 47 MIN ooy
BELOW PIPE 12" MIN
= 4" TO 24" CRUSHED & 5 IN
IN i = 68" MIN
ROCK OR GRAVEL G2 WA !
36" MAX——=
| |
ACTUAL TRENCH WDTH! . .
| | DISTANCE
IN REQUIRED FROM
=7 i
« Ny,
£ e SEASONAL HiGH | DEPTH TO SEASONAL HIGH
i s G | ZONE OF | GROUNDWATER | GROUNDWATER OR
i i g OR MPERVIOUS | IMPERVIOUS LAYER FROM
| I LAYER GROUND SURFACE
[ WYOMING |
DRAWN BY:RKM
DATE: 12/2016 |_ ¥ | FTOR>4FT

Campbell County Small Wastewater System pg. 1n 2T HH



Example Layout Diagram

Perforated Pipe Trench Layout Diagram

ACTUAL LENGTH ACTUAL LENGTH
FT FT
——{ENGTH OF PERFORATED PIPE: I‘_gNg'T':
(PIPE LENGTHS SHOULD NOT EXCEED 100%)
r | B
— s e N
L S B
ACTUAL WDTH
3 MINIMUM WIDTH =
(5 WIDTH RECOMMENDED) FT & .
\\
— o LOW
I , L1 DIVIDER
— Y : TEE (TYP)
L _\_c _ _ L _ ___1
AP END (TYP.) i
r— — — = = 7 7
e s m I
L - _ _ _ _ R SCHEDULE
40 PVC PIPE
TRENCHED BOUNDARIES WITH i L
WASHED STONE OR GRAVEL 1
r— - — = 7 = - U0
A — s e ;
L - - - - - - - - _

| WYOMING __|
DRAWN BY:RKM

DATE: 12/2016

Draw your perforate pipe trench layout below or attach a separate sheet.

Campbell County Small Wastewater System

AL TN
Campbell County

wyoming

pg. 1p 2T HH



Chambered Trench Layout Worksheet

AN YN\

Campbell County

wyoming

Chamber
(See Table 1, Page 13)

Manufacturer

Model

Nominal Length (ft)

Nominal Width (in)

Nominal Height (in)

Effective Length (ft) Box 1
Required Leachfield Area Box 2
(Page 1m, Box 3)
& | Equivalent Area Per Unit Box 3
9 (See Table 1, Page 10)
o Box 4
Number of Chambers -
Required Leachfield Area (Box 2) Equivalent Area Per Unit (Box 3) Number of Chambers (Round Up)
Box 5
Total Trench Length (ft) *
Number of Chambers (Box 4) Effective Length (Box 1) Total Trench Length
:5; Total Trench Minimum Number Box 6
> Length (ft) Of Trenches
- (from Box 5) to Use Number of Trenches to Use =
=
3] <60 1
§ Number of Trenches to Use 61-120 2 Length of Trenches =
- 121-180 3*
181-240 4 *A distribution box, or D-box, is required
241-300 5* when an odd number of trenches is used.
301-360 6
Please fill in the boxes on the diagram below.
MOUND TO PREVENT PONDING STABLISH VEGETATIVE
AND PROMOTE RUNOFF COVER
&‘ﬁ;wmm,.,,%%
& ~'y| ACTUAL _
i <y, 5 COVER |
DEPTH
s 12" MIN COVER
DRAWN BY: RKM IN NATIVE BACKFILL
DATE: 12/2016 [
TOTAL i
TRENCH
DEPTH 12" T0 16"
IN ‘
2" TO 4" WIDER |
THAN CHAMBER
ACTUAL TRENCH WIDTH 4’ MINIMUM
DISTANCE
DEPTH TO SEASONAL IN REQUIRED FROM
HIGH GROUNDWATER OR BOTTOM OF
IMPERVIOUS LAYER FROM TRENCH TO
GROUND SURFACE ZONE OF SEASONAL HIGH
TREATMENT GROUNDWATER
FTOR > 4 FT SUITABLE SOIL OR IMPERVIOUS
LAYER
v |
Campbell County Small Wastewater System pg. 1C 2T HH




P A"

Chambered Trench Layout Diagram
Campbell County

Example Layout Diagram wyoming
OF CHAMBERS ACTUAL LENGTH
T FT

ENGTH OF CHAMBERS lcE)Ng'II':
CHAMBER LENGTH SHOULD NQT EXCEED so)

-1 1|li ||cm

El! ltﬂl

|
l'»‘
4" DIAMETER
F..' SCHEDULE

PVC PIPE

3' MINMUM WIDTH
(5 WIDTH RECOMMENDED)

S/

lr:li
ltl!

cl]

1' [I cl

Hl”- DTH

Eiﬁih Mill

df
g

r:l]
Ell

W YOMING
DRAWN BY:RKM
DATE 12/2016

Ill II

1

Draw your chambered trench layout below or attach a separate sheet.

Campbell County Small Wastewater System pg. 1T 2T HH



Perforated Pipe Bed Layout Worksheet

AN YN\

Campbell County

wyoming

Box 1
Required Leachfield Area
c (Page 1M, Box 3)
oo
fi
(= Total Excavated Depth (ft)
Depth below pipe (ft)
Bed Width (ft) Box 2
Bed Length (ft) Box 3
Box 4
'§ Bed Total Square feet * =
5‘ Bed Width (Box 2) Bed Length (Box 3) Total Bed Area
—
g Is Box 4 greater than or equal I:' Ves |:| No
o0 toBox 1
I:' If No, adjust Bed Width (Box 2) and Bed Length (Box 3) until Box 4 is greater than Box 1
I:' If Yes, Complete bottom of {Ki& LJI-3S
Please fill in the boxes on the diagram below.
MOUND TO PREVENT PONDING Do VEEINTHE
AND PROMOTE RUNOFF
TOPSOIL
=
ALl J AL 12"MIN COVER
SoveR i e MATERIAL OR
IN
DEP'!'H NA“VE BACKF'LL 3" OF STRAW
ACTUAL 4 MN_ 1o hin GRAVEL
GRAVEL IN 4" TO 24" CRUSHED ROCK OR GRAVEL 68" MIN DEPTH
DEPTH o v vs vy BELOW
NUHE!ALCF o i
BED ,
4 MINIMUM
LATERALS WIDTH DISTANCE
DEPTH TO SEASONAL FT REQUIRED FROM i,
HIGH GROUNDWATER ——— BOTTOM OF P )
OR IMPERVIOUS BED TO i \3
LAYER FROM TREATMENT SEASONAL HIGH HE S !
GROUND SURFACE SUITABLE SOIL GROUNDWATER
OR IMPERVIOUS]
FTOR >4 FT LAYER EETT e
DATE: 1 2/ﬁm 6
Y
Campbell County Small Wastewater System pg. 18 2T HH



Campbell County
Example Layout Diagram wyoming

Perforated Pipe Bed Layout Diagram

ACTUAL LENGTH OF PIPE

LF_

|— ~—— ENGTH OF PERFORATED PIPE——— _|
(PIPE LENGTH SHOULD NOT EXCEED 100 FT)
[

| ...................................................... I~ |

" DIAMETER

SCHEDULE
= 40 PVC PIPE

| e I |

WIDTH | T ,f |
OF BED B

:"’{mqu B ool [ L "
"DmAép (5 FT MAX SPACING) I

BED | e —— N |

SPACE BETWEEN PIPE AND BED WALL IFT
|_ (MUST BE 30 INCHES MAX) J o
_| - - - - - _ - - - | DRAWN BY:RKM
{ ENGTH OF BED DATE: 12/2016

FT

ACTUAL LENGTH OF BED
Draw your layout below or attach a separate sheet.

Campbell County Small Wastewater System pg. 19 2T HH



AN YN\

Campbell County

Chambered Bed Layout Worksheet wyoming
Manufacturer
G}
> Model
= o0
o O .
9 2 | Nominal Length (ft)
€ <
2 % Nominal Width (in)
o2
& | Nominal Height (in)
wv)
Effective Length (ft) Box 1
Required Leachfield Area Box 2
(Page 1M, Box 3)
£ | Equivalent Area Per Unit Box 3
'g (See Table 1, Page 10)
o Box 4
Number of Chambers - =
Required Leachfield Area (Box 2) Equivalent Area Per Unit (Box 3) Number of Chambers (Round Up)
Box 5
Total Chamber Length (ft) * =
Number of Chambers (Box 4) Effective Length (Box 1) Total Chamber Length
- Total Chamber Minimum Number Box 6
g Length (ft) of Chamber Rows
: (from Box 5) to Use Number of Chamber Rows to Use =
-
o Number of Chamber Rows <60 !
o umbero w 61-120 2 Length of Rows =
o to Use
121-180 3*
181-240 4 *A distribution box, or D-box, is required
241-300 5* when an odd number of trenches is used.
301-360 6

Please fill in the boxes on the diagram below.

MOUND TO PREVENT PONDING
AND PROMOTE RUNOFF

STABLISH
VEGETATIVE COVER

TOTALWTH &&&&&&&&&&& ST TOPSOIL
Sl R R e R R .. 12" MIN
NATIVE BACKFILL L

g alalaVaVaValcs

[ 2 TO 4 WDER_]
DEPTH TO SEASONAL [“THAN CHAMBER
HIGH GROUNDWATER AT N ACTUAL BED \\mu ECOMMENDED AT+ MINMUM DISTANCE
OR IMPERVIOUS LAYER| of ROWS ZONE OF LEAST 6 INCH BOTTOM OF BED TO
FROM GROUND mﬁ TREATMENT |:| FT SPACING BETWEEN ™ 'spagoNAL HIGH

SURFACE SUITABLE SOIL  (gax 25 FT)  CHAMBERS GROUNDWATER OR

I:I" oR > 4 FT IMPERVIOUS LAYER

v

Campbell County Small Wastewater System pg. 20 2T HH



Chambered Bed Layout Diagram N
Campbell County

Example Layout Diagram wyemine
ACTUAL LENGTH
OF CHAMBERS ACTUAL LENGTH
FT FT
NGTH OF CHAMBERS————= = il
_ CHAMBER LENGTH SHOULD NOT EXCEED 80) _ LENGTH

& 'BIEIIEH il

1H

R —

I’EHEII

Y g el Ie!
1El= lll! I !II Eﬁi'lllhllihllj;:." — ISTRIBU'I;gQ
e 15}: TR V
'H 1“““ i'lll'lllhlllﬁni
‘-"-“-"-"-‘-"‘- SCHEDULE:

H rcu e 0 EPE
" L LR l""II
'H “'III i'lll'lllhlllﬁni

Draw your chambered bed layout below or attach a separate sheet.

Yr;u
1f1!

cl|

u g

4"
DIAMETER

h:u
1f1!

| _wyoming |
DRAWN BY:RKM
DATE: 12/2016

gl

u g

/1°YLI6SE /72dyie {Y It =1-aiSa1-iSh {2aiSY LJ30 HM 2 HH


cmm08
Typewritten Text


Design flows for Non-residential buildings

If the building has multiple areas with distinct uses shown in table 1,
fill out a separate sheet for each different use and add the results in Box 5 together

Expected # of users
(usually employee number) Box 1
Building size
(gross square feet) Box 2

Table 1 Occupant load factor

building use 33% IBC table 1004.5
Business/office areas 450
Retail 180
Industrial areas 300
Warehouses 1500

Minumum Calculated users

Building size (Box 2) Occupant load factor Box 3
from Table 1 roundup to nearest
whole number

larger of Expected users (Box 1) vs. Minimum

Design user number calculated users (Box 3)
Box 4
Table 2 Non residential wastewater flowrates
Building use flow (gal/person/day)
Business/Office 15
Industrial building 20
Warehouses 15 (For uses not shown here, refer to Table 2 of DEQ
Retail store 15 chapter 25 I'Y'Y'SYRSR located in appendix M to
g?;c:g? ;45 /KI-L1iSI n wizfS& Regulating Construction)
Campground toilets only 25
Campground with showers 45
Design flow X -
Flowrate from Table 2 Design user # (Box 4) Box 5

enter this result into
Boxlonpgll

Campbell County Small Wastewater System pg. 22 of 22


cmm08
Typewritten Text
Campbell County Small Wastewater System                                                             pg. 22 of 22

cmm08
Typewritten Text

cmm08
Typewritten Text

cmm08
Typewritten Text

cmm08
Typewritten Text

cmm08
Typewritten Text

cmm08
Typewritten Text

cmm08
Typewritten Text


	Appendix 2.pdf
	DEQ pages.pdf
	Introduction
	Small Wastewater Treatment Facility Application for Permit to Construct
	Site Suitability
	Site Plan Drawing
	Septic Tank and Piping Worksheet
	Basic Design Requirements for Septic Tanks
	Percolation Test Instructions
	Percolation Test Data Sheet
	Leachfield Sizing Worksheet
	Leachfield Design Instructions
	Table 1.  Chamber System Equivalent Areas
	Attachment 1. Table 2 Excerpted from Water Quality Rules and Regulations, Chapter 25.


	SEPTIC-XSECTION.pdf
	Sheets and Views
	Layout1






